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CRS-2, Cationic Emulsion, Rapid Setting, THD #300  (price per gallon)
Delivery Points, Fees, and 

Minimum Quantity
Cleveland Asphalt 

Products Inc.                      
Shepherd, TX

Martin Product Sales, 
LLC                                             
dba                                                                            

Martin Asphalt Co.                                          
Houston, TX

P Squared Emulsion 
Plants, LLC                                  

Elm Mott, TX

Minimum Gallon Quantity 5000 Gallons 5500 Gallons No Bid
Rosenberg $2.74 $2.64
Crabb $2.74 $2.64
Fresno $2.74 $2.64
Needville $2.74 $2.64
Richmond $2.74 $2.64
Plant $2.60 $2.50
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
     each add'l mile
 Restocking Fee  1/2 freight if delivery is 

returned 
Laydown Charge
Demurrage Charge  $80.00/hr after 2 free 

hours 
 $70.00/hr after 2 free 

hours  
Plant Location 100 Asphalt Lane, 

Shepherd, TX 77371
300 ChristyPL, South 

Houston, TX 

Fees and Minimum 
Quantity

Cleveland Asphalt 
Products Inc.                      
Shepherd, TX

Martin Product Sales, 
LLC                                             
dba                                                                            

Martin Asphalt Co.                                          
Houston, TX

P Squared Emulsion 
Plants, LLC                                 

Elm Mott, TX

Undiluted Delivered  $2.74  No Bid $2.24 
Diluted 12:1 Delivered $1.60 $1.97 
Minimum Gallon Quantity 5000 Gallons 5000 Gallons
Demurrage Charge  $80.00/hr after 2 free 

hours 
 $80.00/hr after 2 free 

hours 

Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 23-028

Term Contract for Purchase and Hauling of Chemical Road Materials

Term:  April 1, 2023 through March 31, 2024 

Recommendation:  All Bidders Meeting Specifications

Prime Seal/Dust Control (price per gallon)           

27C

03-16-2023 Original (E) sent to Olivia Rios, Purchasing dept.



2

Delivery Points, Fees, and 
Minimum Quantity

Cleveland Asphalt 
Products Inc.                      
Shepherd, TX

Martin Product Sales, 
LLC                                           
dba                                                                            

Martin Asphalt Co.                                          
Houston, TX

P Squared Emulsion 
Plants, LLC                             

Elm Mott, TX

Minimum Gallon Quantity 5000 Gallons 5500 Gallons  No Bid 
Rosenberg $2.74 $2.64
Crabb $2.74 $2.64
Fresno $2.74 $2.64
Needville $2.74 $2.64
Richmond $2.74 $2.64
Plant $2.60 $2.50
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
     each add'l mile
 Restocking Fee  1/2 freight if delivery is 

returned 
Demurrage Charge  $80.00/hr after 2 free 

hours 
 $70.00/hr after 2 free 

hours 
Plant Location 100 Asphalt Lane, 

Shepherd, TX 77371
300 Christy PL, South 

Houston, TX 

Delivery Points, Fees, and 
Minimum Quantity

Cleveland Asphalt 
Products Inc.                      
Shepherd, TX

Martin Product Sales, 
LLC                                          
dba                                                                            

Martin Asphalt Co.                                          
Houston, TX

P Squared Emulsion 
Plants, LLC                                 

Elm Mott, TX

Minimum Gallon Quantity  No Bid  No Bid 5000 Gallons
Rosenberg $2.96 
Crabb $2.96 
Fresno $2.96 
Needville $2.96 
Richmond $2.96 
Plant $2.68 
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
     each add'l mile
 Restocking Fee $1.30 
Demurrage Charge  $80.00/hr after 2 free 

hours 
Plant Location 516 South McLennan 

Loop, Elm Mott, TX 76640

P2 Road Stabilizer (price per gallon) or equal to:                

SS-1 Emulsion used for dust control (price per gallon)                  
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Delivery Points, Fees, and 
Minimum Quantity

Cleveland Asphalt 
Products Inc.                      
Shepherd, TX

Martin Product Sales, 
LLC                                             
dba                                                                            

Martin Asphalt Co.                                          
Houston, TX

P Squared Emulsion 
Plants, LLC                                       

Elm Mott, TX

Minimum Gallon Quantity  No Bid  No Bid 5000 Gallons
Rosenberg $3.29 
Crabb $3.29 
Fresno $3.29 
Needville $3.29 
Richmond $3.29 
Plant $3.01 
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
     each add'l mile
 Restocking Fee $1.30 
Laydown Charge
Demurrage Charge  $80.00/hr after 2 free 

hours 
Plant Location 516 South McLennan 

Loop, Elm Mott, TX 76640

Delivery Points, Fees, and 
Minimum Quantity

Cleveland Asphalt 
Products Inc.                      
Shepherd, TX

Martin Product Sales, 
LLC                                             
dba                                                                            

Martin Asphalt Co.                                          
Houston, TX

P Squared Emulsion 
Plants, LLC                                  

Elm Mott, TX

Minimum Gallon Quantity  No Bid  No Bid 5000 Gallons
Rosenberg $3.10 
Crabb $3.10 
Fresno $3.10 
Needville $3.10 
Richmond $3.10 
Plant $3.01 
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
     each add'l mile
 Restocking Fee $1.30 
Demurrage Charge  $80.00/hr after 2 free 

hours 
Plant Location 516 South McLennan 

Loop, Elm Mott, TX 76640

Chip Seal Emulsion "CWE-2" (price per gallon)

ROC-P2 Road Over Coat
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_____ _______________ ____14 March 23

14th March 23



























Controlling
Name of Interested Party

4
Nature of interest

City, State, Country (place of business)
Intermediary

(check applicable)

CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES 1295FORM
1 of 1

1

OFFICE USE ONLY

2 02/15/2023

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place
of business.
Cleveland Asphalt Products, INC.
Shepherd, TX United States
Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is
being filed.

Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

3

Fort Bend County

Chemical Road Materials
Bid 23-028

2023-983897

03/14/2023

Date Filed:

Date Acknowledged:

Certificate Number:

CERTIFICATION OF FILING

6

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

My name is _______________________________________________________________,

UNSWORN DECLARATION

Check only if there is NO Interested Party.5
X

My address is _______________________________________________, _______________________,

and my date of birth is _______________________.

Executed in ________________________________________County,

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

(street) (state) (zip code) (country)

(year)(month)

 _______, ______________, _________.

State of ________________, on the _____day of ___________, 20_____.

(city)

(Declarant)

Version V3.5.1.3ac88bc0www.ethics.state.tx.usForms provided by Texas Ethics Commission



Controlling
Name of Interested Party

4
Nature of interest

City, State, Country (place of business)
Intermediary

(check applicable)

CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES 1295FORM
1 of 1

1

OFFICE USE ONLY

2 02/09/2023

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place
of business.
Martin Asphalt Company
HOUSTON, TX United States
Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is
being filed.

Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

3

FORT BEND COUNTY

CHEMICAL ROAD MATERIALS
B23-028

2023-981763

03/14/2023

Date Filed:

Date Acknowledged:

Certificate Number:

CERTIFICATION OF FILING

6

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

My name is _______________________________________________________________,

UNSWORN DECLARATION

Check only if there is NO Interested Party.5
X

My address is _______________________________________________, _______________________,

and my date of birth is _______________________.

Executed in ________________________________________County,

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

(street) (state) (zip code) (country)

(year)(month)

 _______, ______________, _________.

State of ________________, on the _____day of ___________, 20_____.

(city)

(Declarant)

Version V3.5.1.3ac88bc0www.ethics.state.tx.usForms provided by Texas Ethics Commission



Controlling
Name of Interested Party

4
Nature of interest

City, State, Country (place of business)
Intermediary

(check applicable)

CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES 1295FORM
1 of 1

1

OFFICE USE ONLY

2 02/07/2023

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place
of business.
P Squared Emulsion Plants, LLC
Elm Mott, TX United States
Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is
being filed.

Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

3

Ft. Bend County

Chemical Road Materials
23-028

2023-980257

03/14/2023

Date Filed:

Date Acknowledged:

Certificate Number:

CERTIFICATION OF FILING

6

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

My name is _______________________________________________________________,

UNSWORN DECLARATION

Check only if there is NO Interested Party.5
X

My address is _______________________________________________, _______________________,

and my date of birth is _______________________.

Executed in ________________________________________County,

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

(street) (state) (zip code) (country)

(year)(month)

 _______, ______________, _________.

State of ________________, on the _____day of ___________, 20_____.

(city)

(Declarant)

Version V3.5.1.3ac88bc0www.ethics.state.tx.usForms provided by Texas Ethics Commission
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