
Materials Description  Conroe Wood Products,                         
Willis, TX                                                              

Unit Bid Price               
50' Piling 12" Butt No Bid
45' Piling 12" Butt
40' Piling 12" Butt
35' Piling 12" Butt
30' Piling 12" Butt 
25' Piling 12" Butt 
20' Piling 12" Butt
30' Piling 8" Top 
25' Piling 8" Top 
20' Piling 8" Top 
18' Piling 8" Top 
16' Piling 8" Top 
14' Piling 8" Top 
12' Piling 8" Top 

Materials Description  Conroe Wood Products,                                                                                     
Unit Bid Price               

50' Piling 12" Butt No Bid
45' Piling 12" Butt
40' Piling 12" Butt
35' Piling 12" Butt
30' Piling 12" Butt 
25' Piling 12" Butt 
20' Piling 12" Butt
30' Piling 8" Top 
25' Piling 8" Top 
20' Piling 8" Top 
18' Piling 8" Top 
16' Piling 8" Top 
14' Piling 8" Top 
12' Piling 8" Top 

Term:  through March 31, 2023 

Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 23-006

Term Contract for Bridge Materials

10.1  Southern Yellow Pine Bridge Piling 8" Top:  12 lb. Creosote                                
(price per each)

10.2  Southern Yellow Pine Bridge Piling 8" Top:                                                             
12 lb. Creosote Tested and Certified to AWPA Standards                                                                     
(price per each)

Recommendation:  Conroe Wood Products

41K

10/27/2022 Original (e) sent to C. Krejci, O. Rios, K. Sanchez, Purchasing dept.
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Materials Description  Conroe Wood Products,                                                                                     
Unit Bid Price               

50' Piling 12" Butt No Bid
45' Piling 12" Butt
40' Piling 12" Butt
35' Piling 12" Butt
30' Piling 12" Butt 
25' Piling 12" Butt 
20' Piling 12" Butt
30' Piling 8" Top 
25' Piling 8" Top 
20' Piling 8" Top 
18' Piling 8" Top 
16' Piling 8" Top 
14' Piling 8" Top 
12' Piling 8" Top 

Materials Description  Conroe Wood Products,                                                                                     
Unit Bid Price               

2" X 4"-20' No Bid
2" X 8"-12'
2" X 8"-14' 
2" X 8"-16' 
2" X 8"-20'
2" X 8"-24' 
3" X 8"-12'
3" X 8"-14'
3" X 8"-16' 
3" X 8"-18' 
3" X 8"-20'
3" X 8"-22' 
3" X 8"-24' 
3" X 8"-26' 
3" X 8"-28' 
4" X 4"-12' 
4" X 12"-14' 
4" X 12"-16' 
4" X 12"-18' 
6" X 16"-14'  
6" X 16"-16'
6" X 16"-18'  

10.3  Southern Yellow Pine Bridge Piling 8" Top: 0.60 CCA Treated                          
(price per each)

10.4  No. 2 or better Southern Yellow Pine Rough Bridge Timber                                             
8 lb. Creosote                                                                                                                         
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Materials Description  Conroe Wood Products,                                                                                     
Unit Bid Price               

2" X 4"-20' 21.47$                                                        
2" X 8"-12' 23.65$                                                        
2" X 8"-14' 27.59$                                                        
2" X 8"-16' 32.70$                                                        
2" X 8"-20' 42.93$                                                        
2" X 8"-24' 55.04$                                                        
3" X 8"-12' 38.11$                                                        
3" X 8"-14' 44.46$                                                        
3" X 8"-16' 51.52$                                                        
3" X 8"-18' 61.13$                                                        
3" X 8"-20' 70.12$                                                        
3" X 8"-22' 70.84$                                                        
3" X 8"-24' 82.56$                                                        
3" X 8"-26' 92.56$                                                        
3" X 8"-28' 102.48$                                                      
4" X 4"-12' 23.65$                                                        
4" X 12"-14' 87.70$                                                        
4" X 12"-16' 100.22$                                                      
4" X 12"-18' 115.13$                                                      
6" X 16"-14'  254.24$                                                      
6" X 16"-16' 290.56$                                                      
6" X 16"-18'  326.88$                                                      

10.5  No. 2 or better Southern Yellow Pine Rough Bridge Timber                                        
0.60 CCA Treated                                                                                                                            
(price per each)
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Materials Description  Conroe Wood Products,                                                                                     
Unit Bid Price               

2" X 4"-20' No Bid
2" X 8"-12'
2" X 8"-14' 
2" X 8"-16' 
2" X 8"-20'
2" X 8"-24' 
3" X 8"-12'
3" X 8"-14'
3" X 8"-16' 
3" X 8"-18' 
3" X 8"-20'
3" X 8"-22' 
3" X 8"-24' 
3" X 8"-26' 
3" X 8"-28' 
4" X 4"-12' 
4" X 12"-14' 
4" X 12"-16' 
4" X 12"-18' 
6" X 16"-14'  
6" X 16"-16'
6" X 16"-18'  

10.6  No. 2 or better Southern Yellow Pine Rough Bridge Timber                                       
0.23 MCA                                                                                                                               
(price per each)
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Materials Description  Conroe Wood Products,                                                                                     
Unit Bid Price               

8" X 8"-16'  No Bid
8" X 10"-16'  
10" X 10"-14'  
10" X 10"-24' 
10" X 10"-26'  
10" X 10"-28'  
10" X 12"-14'  
10" X 12"-16'  
10" X 12"-24'  
10" X 12"-26' 
10" X 12"-28'  
12" X 12"-16'  
12" X 12"-20'  
12" X 12"-24'  
12" X 12"-26'  
12" X 12"-28'

Materials Description  Conroe Wood Products,                                                                                     
Unit Bid Price               

8" X 8"-16'  126.12$                                                      
8" X 10"-16'  163.52$                                                      
10" X 10"-14'  178.85$                                                      
10" X 10"-24' 344.00$                                                      
10" X 10"-26'  385.67$                                                      
10" X 10"-28'  427.00$                                                      
10" X 12"-14'  210.70$                                                      
10" X 12"-16'  249.60$                                                      
10" X 12"-24'  486.72$                                                      
10" X 12"-26' 555.88$                                                      
10" X 12"-28'  614.04$                                                      
12" X 12"-16'  299.52$                                                      
12" X 12"-20'  386.40$                                                      
12" X 12"-24'  584.06$                                                      
12" X 12"-26'  667.06$                                                      
12" X 12"-28' 736.85$                                                      

10.7  No. 2 or better Southern Yellow Pine Rough Bridge Timber                                                         
12 lb. Creosote                                                                                                                           
(price per each)

10.8  No. 2 or better Southern Yellow Pine Rough Bridge Timber                                     
0.60 CCA Treated                                                                                                                    
(price per each) 
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Materials Description  Conroe Wood Products,                                                                                     
Unit Bid Price               

10" X 12" - 16' 249.60$                                                      
4" X 12" - 14' 87.70$                                                        
4" X 12" - 16' 100.22$                                                      
3" X 8" - 16' 51.52$                                                        
2" X 8" - 16' 32.70$                                                        

Materials Description  Conroe Wood Products,                                                                                     
Unit Bid Price               

2" X 8" - 16' No Bid
2" X 6" - 16' 
2" X 6" - 12' 
2" X 6" - 20' 
2" X 4" - 12' 
2" X 4" - 16' 
2" X 4" - 18' 
2" X 4" - 20' 
4" X 4" - 8' 
4" X 4" - 12'

Materials Description  Conroe Wood Products,                                                                                     
Unit Bid Price               

6-1/2' POST - 3-1/2" - 4" Top  $                                                          9.74 
8' POST - 6" Top 24.67$                                                        
8' POST - 7" Top 34.26$                                                        
8' POST - 8" Top 46.51$                                                        
10' POST - 8" Top 59.56$                                                        

10.11  0.40 CCA Treated materials, Round Post Southern Yellow Pine                                
(price per each)

10.9  Rough Bridge Timber:  0.60 CCA Treated                                                                    
(price per each)

10.10  0.14 MCA Treated materials, No 2 or better S4S Southern Yellow Pine 0.40 
(price per each)
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Materials Description  Conroe Wood Products,                                                                                     
Unit Bid Price               

50' Piling 12" Butt 483.71$                                                      
45' Piling 12" Butt 462.72$                                                      
40' Piling 12" Butt 401.93$                                                      
35' Piling 12" Butt 375.91$                                                      
30' Piling 12" Butt 361.85$                                                      
25' Piling 12" Butt 353.44$                                                      
30' Piling 8" Top No Bid
25' Piling 8" Top No Bid
20' Piling 8" Top 344.06$                                                      
18' Piling 8" Top 194.37$                                                      
16' Piling 8" Top 186.09$                                                      
14' Piling 8" Top 181.64$                                                      
12' Piling 8" Top 177.24$                                                      

Materials Description  Conroe Wood Products,                                                                                     
Unit Bid Price               

50' Piling 12" Butt No Bid
45' Piling 12" Butt
40' Piling 12" Butt 
35' Piling 12" Butt
30' Piling 12" Butt
25' Piling 12" Butt
30' Piling 8" Top 
25' Piling 8" Top 
20' Piling 8" Top
18' Piling 8" Top
16' Piling 8" Top
14' Piling 8" Top
12' Piling 8" Top

10.13  0.80 Treated Piling materials: 0.80 CCA tested and certified to AWPA 
standards                                                                                                                                     
(price per each) 

10.12  0.80 CCA Treated Piling materials                                                                                 
(price per each)































25 October 22

25th December 22







































Controlling
Name of Interested Party

4
Nature of interest

City, State, Country (place of business)
Intermediary

(check applicable)

CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES 1295FORM
1 of 1

1

OFFICE USE ONLY

2 10/18/2022

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place
of business.
Conroe Wood Products, Inc.
Willis, TX United States
Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is
being filed.

Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

3

Fort Bend County

supply wood products
B23-006

2022-945606

10/25/2022

Date Filed:

Date Acknowledged:

Certificate Number:

CERTIFICATION OF FILING

MULLER, CHARLINE XConroe, TX United States

6

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

My name is _______________________________________________________________,

UNSWORN DECLARATION

Check only if there is NO Interested Party.5

My address is _______________________________________________, _______________________,

and my date of birth is _______________________.

Executed in ________________________________________County,

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

(street) (state) (zip code) (country)

(year)(month)

 _______, ______________, _________.

State of ________________, on the _____day of ___________, 20_____.

(city)

(Declarant)

Version V3.5.1.8b4250f1www.ethics.state.tx.usForms provided by Texas Ethics Commission
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