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CRS-2, Cationic Emulsion, Rapid Setting, THD #300  (price per gallon)
Delivery Points, Fees, and 

Minimum Quantity
Cleveland Asphalt 

Products Inc.                      
Shepherd, TX

Martin Product Sales, 
LLC                                             
dba                                                                            

Martin Asphalt Co.                                          
Houston, TX

P Squared Emulsion 
Plants, LLC                                  

Elm Mott, TX

Minimum Gallon Quantity 5000 gallons 5500 gallons No Bid
Rosenberg  $                                 2.34  $                                 2.21 
Crabb  $                                 2.34  $                                 2.21 
Fresno  $                                 2.34  $                                 2.21 
Needville  $                                 2.34  $                                 2.21 
Richmond  $                                 2.34  $                                 2.21 
Plant  $                                 2.20  $                                 2.10 
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
     each add'l mile
 Restocking Fee 
Laydown Charge
Demurrage Charge  $80.00 per hour after 2 

free hours 
 $70.00 per hour after 2 

free hours 
Plant Location 100 Asphalt Lane, 

  
300 Christi Pl, South 

 

Fees and Minimum 
Quantity

Cleveland Asphalt 
Products Inc.                      
Shepherd, TX

Martin Product Sales, 
LLC                                             
dba                                                                            

Martin Asphalt Co.                                          
Houston, TX

P Squared Emulsion 
Plants, LLC                                 

Elm Mott, TX

Undiluted Delivered   $                                 2.34  No Bid  $                                 1.98 
Diluted 12:1 Delivered  $                                 2.18  $                                 1.49 
Minimum Gallon Quantity 5000 5000
Demurrage Charge  $80.00 per hour after 2 

free hours 
 $80.00 per hour after 2 

free hours 

Prime Seal/Dust Control (price per gallon)           

Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 22-050

Term Contract for Purchase and Hauling of Chemical Road Materials

Term:  1 April 2022 through 31 March 2023 

Recommendation:  All Bidders Meeting Specifications

34R

3/24/2022 Original (e) sent to Cheryl Krejci/O. Rios/K. Sanchez, Purchasing dept.
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Delivery Points, Fees, and 
Minimum Quantity

Cleveland Asphalt 
Products Inc.                      
Shepherd, TX

Martin Product Sales, 
LLC                                           
dba                                                                            

Martin Asphalt Co.                                          
Houston, TX

P Squared Emulsion 
Plants, LLC                             

Elm Mott, TX

Minimum Gallon Quantity 5000 gallons 5500 gallons  No Bid 
Rosenberg  $                                 2.34  $                                 2.21 
Crabb  $                                 2.34  $                                 2.21 
Fresno  $                                 2.34  $                                 2.21 
Needville  $                                 2.34  $                                 2.21 
Richmond  $                                 2.34  $                                 2.21 
Plant  $                                 2.20  $                                 2.10 
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
     each add'l mile
 Restocking Fee 
Demurrage Charge  $80.00 per hour after 2 

free hours 
 $70.00 per hour after 2 

free hours 
Plant Location 100 Asphalt Lane, 

 
300 Christi Pl, South 

 

Delivery Points, Fees, and 
Minimum Quantity

Cleveland Asphalt 
Products Inc.                      
Shepherd, TX

Martin Product Sales, 
LLC                                          
dba                                                                            

Martin Asphalt Co.                                          
Houston, TX

P Squared Emulsion 
Plants, LLC                                 

Elm Mott, TX

Minimum Gallon Quantity  No Bid  No Bid 5000
Rosenberg  $                                 2.69 
Crabb  $                                 2.69 
Fresno  $                                 2.69 
Needville  $                                 2.69 
Richmond  $                                 2.69 
Plant  $                                 2.69 
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile  $                                 2.44 
     each add'l mile
 Restocking Fee  $                                 1.30 
Demurrage Charge  $80.00 per hour after 2 

free hours 
Plant Location 516 S.McLennan Loop, 

P2 Road Stabilizer (price per gallon) or equal to:                

SS-1 Emulsion used for dust control (price per gallon)                  
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Delivery Points, Fees, and 
Minimum Quantity

Cleveland Asphalt 
Products Inc.                      
Shepherd, TX

Martin Product Sales, 
LLC                                             
dba                                                                            

Martin Asphalt Co.                                          
Houston, TX

P Squared Emulsion 
Plants, LLC                                       

Elm Mott, TX

Minimum Gallon Quantity  No Bid  No Bid 5000
Rosenberg  $                                 2.99 
Crabb  $                                 2.99 
Fresno  $                                 2.99 
Needville  $                                 2.99 
Richmond  $                                 2.99 
Plant  $                                 2.74 
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
     each add'l mile
 Restocking Fee  $                                 1.30 
Laydown Charge
Demurrage Charge  $80.00 per hour after 2 

free hours 
Plant Location 516 S.McLennan Loop, 

Delivery Points, Fees, and 
Minimum Quantity

Cleveland Asphalt 
Products Inc.                      
Shepherd, TX

Martin Product Sales, 
LLC                                             
dba                                                                            

Martin Asphalt Co.                                          
Houston, TX

P Squared Emulsion 
Plants, LLC                                  

Elm Mott, TX

Minimum Gallon Quantity 5000
Rosenberg  $                                 2.85 
Crabb  $                                 2.85 
Fresno  $                                 2.85 
Needville  $                                 2.85 
Richmond  $                                 2.85 
Plant  $                                 2.60 
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
     each add'l mile
 Restocking Fee  $                                 1.30 
Demurrage Charge  $80.00 per hour after 2 

free hours 
Plant Location 516 S.McLennan Loop, 

Chip Seal Emulsion "CWE-2" (price per gallon)

ROC-P2 Road Over Coat

















































Contract Sheet 

Bid 22-050 

THE STATE OF TEXAS 
COUNTY OF FORT BEND 

This memorandum of agreement made and entered into on the __ day of ________ _  � 20 __ , 

by and between Fort Bend County in the State of Texas (hereinafter designated County), acting herein 

by County Judge KP George, by virtue of an order of Fort Bend County Commissioners Court, 

and Cleveland Asphalt Products, INC. (hereinafter designated Contractor). 
(company name) 

WITNESSETH: 

The Contractor and the County agree that the bid and specifications for the Chemical Road Materials

Are hereto attached and made a part hereof, together with this instrument and the bond 

(when required) shall constitute the full agreement and contract between parties and for furnishing the 

items set out and described; the County agrees to pay the prices stipulated in the accepted bid. 

It is further agreed that this contract shall not become binding or effective until signed by the parties hereto 

and a purchase order authorizing the items desired has been issued. 

Executed at Richmond, Texas this _____ day of _______________ 20 ____ _ 

Fort Bend County, Texas 

By: __________________ -,-----
County Judge, KP George 

--z::::--z-� 
Signature of Contractor 

By:_�C�la�y�to�n�M�o�o�r�e,�S�a=l�es�R=ep�-�------------
Printed Name and Title 

24 

22 March 22

22nd March 22







































































22 March 22

22nd March 22































































22 March 22

22nd March 22





























Controlling
Name of Interested Party

4
Nature of interest

City, State, Country (place of business)
Intermediary

(check applicable)

CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES 1295FORM
1 of 1

1

OFFICE USE ONLY

2 02/09/2022

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place
of business.
Cleveland Asphalt Products, INC.
Shepherd, TX United States
Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is
being filed.

Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

3

Fort Bend County

Chemical Road Materials
B22-050

2022-848835

03/22/2022

Date Filed:

Date Acknowledged:

Certificate Number:

CERTIFICATION OF FILING

6

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

My name is _______________________________________________________________,

UNSWORN DECLARATION

Check only if there is NO Interested Party.5
X

My address is _______________________________________________, _______________________,

and my date of birth is _______________________.

Executed in ________________________________________County,

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

(street) (state) (zip code) (country)

(year)(month)

 _______, ______________, _________.

State of ________________, on the _____day of ___________, 20_____.

(city)

(Declarant)

Version V1.1.191b5cdcwww.ethics.state.tx.usForms provided by Texas Ethics Commission



Controlling
Name of Interested Party

4
Nature of interest

City, State, Country (place of business)
Intermediary

(check applicable)

CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES 1295FORM
1 of 1

1

OFFICE USE ONLY

2 02/07/2022

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place
of business.
Martin Asphalt Company
HOUSTON, TX United States
Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is
being filed.

Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

3

FORT BEND COUNTY

CHEMICAL ROAD MATERIALS
B22-050

2022-847820

03/22/2022

Date Filed:

Date Acknowledged:

Certificate Number:

CERTIFICATION OF FILING

6

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

My name is _______________________________________________________________,

UNSWORN DECLARATION

Check only if there is NO Interested Party.5
X

My address is _______________________________________________, _______________________,

and my date of birth is _______________________.

Executed in ________________________________________County,

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

(street) (state) (zip code) (country)

(year)(month)

 _______, ______________, _________.

State of ________________, on the _____day of ___________, 20_____.

(city)

(Declarant)

Version V1.1.191b5cdcwww.ethics.state.tx.usForms provided by Texas Ethics Commission



Controlling
Name of Interested Party

4
Nature of interest

City, State, Country (place of business)
Intermediary

(check applicable)

CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES 1295FORM
1 of 1

1

OFFICE USE ONLY

2 02/09/2022

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place
of business.
P Squared Emulsion Plants, LLC
Elm Mott, TX United States
Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is
being filed.

Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

3

Fort Bend County

Chemical Road Materials
B22-050

2022-849047

03/22/2022

Date Filed:

Date Acknowledged:

Certificate Number:

CERTIFICATION OF FILING

6

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

My name is _______________________________________________________________,

UNSWORN DECLARATION

Check only if there is NO Interested Party.5
X

My address is _______________________________________________, _______________________,

and my date of birth is _______________________.

Executed in ________________________________________County,

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

(street) (state) (zip code) (country)

(year)(month)

 _______, ______________, _________.

State of ________________, on the _____day of ___________, 20_____.

(city)

(Declarant)

Version V1.1.191b5cdcwww.ethics.state.tx.usForms provided by Texas Ethics Commission
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