
RESOLUTION APPROVING PETITION FOR AN EMERGENCY SERVICES 

DISTRICT SEEKING TO CREATE 

FORT BEND COUNTY EMERGENCY SERVICES DISTRICT NO. 9, IN PRECINCT 1 

WHEREAS, the County Judge of Fort Bend County, Texas, has received and has filed with the 

County Clerk of Fort Bend County, Texas, for submission to the Commissioners Court of Fort 

Bend County the PETITION FOR AN EMERGENCY SERVICES DISTRICT SEEKING TO 

CREATE FORT BEND COUNTY EMERGENCY SERVICES DISTRICT NO. 9, IN PRECINCT 

1 [the "Petition"], signed by more than one hundred (100) qualified voters who own taxable real 

property within the district to be known as FORT BEND COUNTY EMERGENCY SERVICES 

DISTRICT NO. 9 [the "District"]; which Petition set forth and met all the requisites of Chapter 

775 of the Texas Health & Safety Code, as amended;  

WHEREAS, upon being presented the Petition, the Commissioners Court considered the same on 

the 8th day of June, 2021, and set a hearing to be held at 1:00 p.m. on the 28th day of September, 

2021, in the Fort Bend County Commissioner’s Courtroom, 2nd Floor, County Courthouse, 401 

Jackson St, Richmond, Texas, on the matters brought before it in the Petition; and the Court further 

ordered the posting and publication of this hearing as required by law;   

WHEREAS, pursuant to this notice, a full and complete hearing was held on the Petition and the 

Court considered testimony pertinent to the issues concerning the creation of the District; and 

WHEREAS, the Fort Bend County Commissioners Court finds that: 

1. The Petition is in due form, was properly executed and was duly presented to the

Commissioners Court of Fort Bend County, Texas;

2. The notice of hearing on the Petition was given in the time and in the manner provided by

law;

3. The creation of Fort Bend County Emergency Services District No. 9, with the boundaries

hereinafter fixed by the Court, is feasible and will promote the public safety, welfare, health, and

convenience of persons residing in the proposed district;

4. The creation of the proposed Fort Bend County Emergency Services District No. 9 does

not overlap with the boundaries of any existing emergency services district providing fire

prevention, suppression and extinguishment, emergency medical services (EMS) hazardous

material incident responses, and EMS first responder and rescue services;

5. The boundaries of the district are hereby fixed, as set forth in the attached Exhibit “A”; and

6. The district would include territory in the municipal corporate boundaries and/or the

extraterritorial jurisdictions of Needville, Texas and Rosenberg, Texas; where each municipality

has consented to the inclusion of the respective corporate boundaries and/or extraterritorial

jurisdictions of the respective municipality in the proposed district.
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7. As required by Texas Health and Safety Code Section 775.017 (a), the Fort Bend County

Commissioners Court makes the following findings:

A. Creation of the District would still promote the public safety, welfare, health, and

convenience of persons residing in the proposed district if the territory in Rosenberg’s

limits or extraterritorial jurisdiction were excluded

B. Creation of the District would still promote the public safety, welfare, health, and

convenience of persons residing in the proposed district if the territory in Needville’s limits

or extraterritorial jurisdiction were excluded

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED THAT: 

As authorized by Texas Health and Safety Code Sec. 775.017, the PETITION FOR AN 

EMERGENCY SERVICES DISTRICT SEEKING TO CREATE FORT BEND COUNTY 

EMERGENCY SERVICES DISTRICT NO. 9, IN PRECINCT 1 is hereby GRANTED by the 

Fort Bend County Commissioners Court.    

APPROVED this 28th day of September 2021. 

_______________________________ 

          KP George, County Judge 

_______________________________ 

          Date 

ATTEST: 

__________________________________ 

Laura Richard, County Clerk 

(SEAL) 

9-28-2021



EXHIBIT “A” 

Boundary Description for Fort Bend County Emergency Services District No. 9 



Exhibit" A" 

Description of Proposed Fort Bend County Emergency Services District No. 9 

Boundary Description 

Beginning at the point of intersection of the Fort Ben<I-Wharton County line with the southernmost 
comer of the boundary of Fort Bend County Emergency Services District No. 8, thence north and 
easterly along the boundary of Fort Bend County Emergency Services District No. 8 to the point 
of intersection with the boundary of Fort Bend County Emergency Services District No. 6, thence 
south and easterly along the boundary of Fort Bend County Emergency Services District No. 6 to 
the point of intersection with eastern right-of-way line of State Highway 36, thence southerly along 
the eastern right-of-way line of State Highway 36 to the point of intersection with the northeast 
right-of-way line of Jeske Road, thence south and easterly along the northeast right-of-way line of 
Jeske Road to the point ofintersection with the northwest right-of-way line ofRoesler Road, thence 
north and easterly along the northwest right-of-way line of Roesler Road to the point ofintersection 
with the northeast right-of-way line of Oberrender/Zamanek Road, thence south and easterly along 
the northeast right-of-way line ofZamanek Road to the point ofintersection with the northwestern 
right-of-way line of FM 1994; then north and easterly along the northwest right-of-way line of FM 
1994 to the point of intersection with the northeast right-of-way line of Davis Estate Road extended 
across FM 1994; thence easterly along the north right-of-way line of Davis Estate Road to the 
point of intersection with the west right-of-way line of Tadpole Road/County Road 762; thence 
northerly along the west right-of-way line of Tadpole Road/County Road 762 to the point of 
intersection with the north right-of-way line of Sawmill Road extended across Tadpole 
Road/County Road 762, thence easterly along the north right-of-way line of Sawmill Road to the 
point of intersection with the north property line of that certain 2188.48 acre tract owned by the 
State of Texas in the Barrett & Harris Survey and known as Brazos Bend State Park, thence easterly 
along the north boundary line of Brazos Bend State Park to the Fort Bend-Brazoria County Line, 
thence southerly and westerly along the Fort Bend-Brazoria County Line to the point of 
intersection of the Fort-Bend Brazoria County Line with the Fort Bend-Wharton County Line; 
thence north and westerly along the Fort Bend-Wharton County Line to the point of beginning. 
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