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Fort Bend County, Texas

Carmen P, Tires, MDA (281) 341-3710
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DATE: July 23, 2021
TO: County Judge KP George

Commissioner Vincent Morales
Cornmissioner Grady Prestage
Commissioner Andy Meyers
Commissioner Ken R DeMerchant
County Attorney Bridgette Smith-Lawson

FROM: Amber DeSpain ao
Chief of Property Taxes

Re: Waiver of Penalty and Interest — Bonnie Zhang: Account #4601-01-002-0450-907, 2020
Tax Year; Legal Description: Magnolia Plantation Sec 1, Block 2, Lot 45; Situs Address: 2206
Gray Moss Ct., Sugar Land, TX 77478-5450

Precinct 4

Bonnie Zhang is requesting a waiver of penalty and interest for the 2020 tax year, stating she
processed a bill pay through Chase Bank on 11/27/2020 but the payment was never received in
the Tax Office.

Tax Office records and research indicate:

e November 20, 2020 - 2020 Certified Tax Statement was mailed to Zhang Baokun at 2706
Gray Moss Ct., Sugar Land, TX 77478-5450.- This Statement Was Not Returned By
The Post Office

e November 2020 - February 2021 — No record of any call from Zhang Baokun claiming to
have issues with on-line payment transmission.

e March 29, 2021 - County Judge received request for waiver of penalty and interest for the
2020 property taxes.




e March 23, 2021 ~ The Fort Bend County Tax Office received payment of $5,449.37. This
payment was posted using postmark date on the envelope payment was received on,
3/9/2021.

s FtBend ISD & City of Sugar Land have authorized Fort Bend County Tax Office to
handle the processing of the waiver of penalty and interest and allow the Fori Bend
County Commissioners Court to make the determination based on Section 33.011 of the
State Property Tax Code.

Breakdown of Taxes Paid:

2020 Tax Year
Tax Unit Base Penalty & Total Waiver Request
Interest
Ft Bend ISD $3,157.67 | $284.19 $284.19
City Of Sugarland $827.98 $74.52 $74.52
FBC $1,003.77 | $91.24 $91.24
Total $4,99942 | §449.95 $449.95

Total Penalty & Interest: $449.95
I do recommend waiver of penalty and interest for 2020 tax year.

« Taxpayer has provided sufficient evidenee fo support that the payment was timely
mailed or received in the Tax Office prior to the delinquency date.

e There is evidence to cause the Tax Office to recommend waiver of penalty and
interest. This waiver is not statutorily allowed because of the taxpayer’s failure to
comply with the requirements of Texas Code Section 33.011.




Fuentes, Soledad

M

From: FBC.Judge

Sent: Monday, March 29, 2021 10:51 AM

To: Payero, Olga

Subject: FW: Urgent: Request for Waiver of Penalties & Interest-A/C# 4601-01-002-0450-907
Attachments: Request for Waiver Pg. 1,jpeg; Request for Waiver Pg. 2. jpeg; Support Doc Pg. 1jpeg;

Support Doc Pg. 2,jpeg; Support Doc Pg. 3 jpeg; Supporting Doc Pg. 4.jpeg; Supporting
Doc Breakdown List,jpeg

Fuances Desmand

Project Managet - Grants
Office of the Fort Bend County Judge

Frances.desmond@fortbendcountytx.gov | (281) 633-7769

From: Bonnie Zhang <bonniezhang4538@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, March 29, 2021 1:55 AM

To: FBC.Judge <FBC.Judge@fortbendcountytx.gov>

Subject: Urgent: Request for Waiver of Penalties & Interest-A/C# 4601-01-002-0450-907

To Whom it may concern,

Greeting from Bonnie!

My property account number is 4601-01-002-0450-907.

I have submitted the original tax payment, in the amount of $4,999.42 through an on-line payment via my Chase bank
debit card on 11/27/2020. However, I received a credit return from Chase bank and was informed that the tax payment
has been returned on 3/3/2021. I am in good faith to pay for the original tax amount electronically in the proper manner
before the delinquency date, however, I really don't know the reason for this credit return. I'have re-submitted the tax
amount including penalties and interest, in the amount of $5449.37 with Chase bank's check # 1056 on 3/12/2021. 1
would like to request for a waiver of penalties and interest, in the amount of $449.95. Would you please kindly review
my request and advise? Enclosed please find the Waiver Request form and the supporting documents.

Look forward to your response soon, Thank you and wish you a nice day.

Sincerely

Bonnie Zhang
Contact Number:832-610-7135



























