
Description                                             Lawson 
Number

Rounds 
per                  
Box

 Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box 

Rounds 
per                  

Case

 Bid Price 
per                 

Case 

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

Lawson 
Number

Rounds 
per                  
Box

 Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box 

Rounds 
per                  

Case

 Bid Price 
per                 

Case 

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

9.1:  9-MM Luger 
L9MM2, 23718,  124 

 Manufacturer Name and Number of or equal to product below:

9.2:  9-MM Luger TP, 
29351, GSB9MMD 124 

 

50  N/A 500  $  364.76 90-270 
days

50  $     15.66 500  $   156.60 150 days

Manufacturer Name and Number of or equal to product below:
Remington GSB9MMD

9.3:  38 SPL L38S11 158 
GR., LRN, L3855, 23724

Manufacturer Name and Number of or equal to product below:

9.4:  5.56 NATO,  53 
GR, GMX #81275, TAP 
Patrol 

20  N/A 200  $  219.02 60-120 
days

 No Bid 

Manufacturer Name and Number of or equal to product below:
HORNADY 81275

Vendor

Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 21-093

Law Enforcement Ammunition

Term:  through September 30, 2022

Recommendation:  Low Bidder per Item

TXAT, Inc.G T Distributors, Inc. 

Aguila Ammunition  1E092112  9mm  117 Grain Jacketed 
Hollow Point

Item Removed

Item Removed

29D

08/06/2021 Original (e) sent to Megan Griffin, Purchasing dept.



Description                                             Lawson 
Number

Rounds 
per                  
Box

 Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box 

Rounds 
per                  

Case

 Bid Price 
per                 

Case 

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

Lawson 
Number

Rounds 
per                  
Box

 Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box 

Rounds 
per                  

Case

 Bid Price 
per                 

Case 

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

9.5:  308 win. #80965, 
168GR, A-MAX Tap

20  N/A 200  $  262.63 60-120 
days

 No Bid 

HORNADY         No Sub
9.6:  308 win. #80715, 
168GR, ELD Tap AR

20  N/A 200  $  262.63 60-120 
days

 No Bid 

HORNADY         No Sub
9.7:  9MM LUGER tP 
#90225,  135  GR, 
Critical Duty

50  N/A 500  $  276.38 60-120 
days

 No Bid 

HORNADY         No Sub
9.8:  5.56mm NATO 
M193, 55 GR, FMJ

20  N/A 500  $  218.83 60-120 
days

 No Bid 

HORNADY         No Sub

G T Distributors, Inc. TXAT, Inc.

Vendor
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3 August 21







Vendor Name:
Rounds 

per                  
Box

 Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box 

Rounds 
per                  

Case

 Bid Price 
per                 

Case 

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

Number    
of Cases 

Purchased 
in 2020 
Budget 
Year

9.1:  9-MM Luger 
L9MM2, 23718,  124 

 

50.00  $      9.50 1000.00  $  190.00 120 days NA

REMINGTON 
Provide Manufacturer Name and Number of or equal to product below:
Aguila Ammunition  1E092110  9mm  124 Grain Full Metal Jacket  
9.2:  9-MM Luger TP, 
29351, GSB9MMD 124 

 

50.00  $    15.66 500.00  $  156.60 150 days NA

REMINGTON 
Provide Manufacturer Name and Number of or equal to product below:
Aguila Ammunition  1E092112  9mm  117 Grain Jacketed Hollow Point
9.3:  38 SPL L38S11 158 
GR., LRN, L3855, 23724

50.00  $    16.48 1000.00  $  329.60 120 days NA

REMINGTON 
Provide Manufacturer Name and Number of or equal to product below:
Aguila Ammunition   1E382521  38 Special   130 Grain Round Nose Full Metal Jacket 
9.4:  5.56 NATO,  53 
GR, GMX #81275, TAP 
Patrol 

 NO BID 500

REMINGTON 
Provide Manufacturer Name and Number of or equal to product below:

9.5:  308 win. #80965, 
168GR, A-MAX Tap
Manufacturer:
HORNADY         No Sub
9.6:  308 win. #80715, 
168GR, ELD Tap AR
Manufacturer:
HORNADY         No Sub
9.7:  9MM LUGER tP 
#90225,  135  GR, 
Critical Duty
Manufacturer:
HORNADY         No Sub
9.8:  5.56mm NATO 
M193, 55 GR, FMJ
Manufacturer:
HORNADY         No Sub

Fort Bend County Pricing Form
Bid 21-093

Law Enforcement Ammunition

Term:  through September 30, 2022

 (only 4 decimal places are permitted) 

Description                      
(no substitute)                            

NA

NA

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

NA

NA

 NO BID 

































Controlling
Name of Interested Party

4
Nature of interest

City, State, Country (place of business)
Intermediary

(check applicable)

CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES 1295FORM
1 of 1

1

OFFICE USE ONLY

2 07/13/2021

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place
of business.
G T DISTRIBUTORS, INC.
AUSTIN, TX United States
Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is
being filed.

Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

3

FORT BEND COUNTY

Law Enforcement Ammunition
B21-093

2021-777977

08/03/2021

Date Filed:

Date Acknowledged:

Certificate Number:

CERTIFICATION OF FILING

6

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

My name is _______________________________________________________________,

UNSWORN DECLARATION

Check only if there is NO Interested Party.5
X

My address is _______________________________________________, _______________________,

and my date of birth is _______________________.

Executed in ________________________________________County,

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

(street) (state) (zip code) (country)

(year)(month)

 _______, ______________, _________.

State of ________________, on the _____day of ___________, 20_____.

(city)

(Declarant)

Version V1.1.ceffd98awww.ethics.state.tx.usForms provided by Texas Ethics Commission



Controlling
Name of Interested Party

4
Nature of interest

City, State, Country (place of business)
Intermediary

(check applicable)

CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES 1295FORM
1 of 1

1

OFFICE USE ONLY

2 07/13/2021

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place
of business.
TXAT LLC
Houston, TX United States
Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is
being filed.

Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

3

Fort Bend County

Ammunition
B21-093

2021-778017

08/03/2021

Date Filed:

Date Acknowledged:

Certificate Number:

CERTIFICATION OF FILING

6

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

My name is _______________________________________________________________,

UNSWORN DECLARATION

Check only if there is NO Interested Party.5
X

My address is _______________________________________________, _______________________,

and my date of birth is _______________________.

Executed in ________________________________________County,

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

(street) (state) (zip code) (country)

(year)(month)

 _______, ______________, _________.

State of ________________, on the _____day of ___________, 20_____.

(city)

(Declarant)

Version V1.1.ceffd98awww.ethics.state.tx.usForms provided by Texas Ethics Commission
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