
Item #1:  DLZ-MSO Surfactant Plus Drift,                   
No Subs                                                                                   
price per gallon                                                                                                                           

 Helena Agri 
Enterprises 

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply

2.5 gallon container  $                    22.50  No Bid 
minimum order  25 gallons 
returnable  No 

Item #2:  Hardball, 2,4-D Acid,                                      
No Subs                                                                      
price per gallon                                                                                                                           

 Helena Agri 
Enterprises 

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply

2.5 gallon container  $                    35.00  No Bid 
minimum order  25 gallons 
returnable  No 
30 gallon container  $                    35.00  No Bid 
minimum order  30 gallons 
returnable  No 

Item #3:  Droplex Xtra,                                                   
No Subs                                                                                         
price per gallon                                                                                                                           

 Helena Agri 
Enterprises 

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply

2.5 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order
returnable

Item #4:  Vastlan,                                                                                       
price per gallon                                                                                                                           

 Helena Agri 
Enterprises 

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply

2.5 gallon container  $                    89.60  No Bid 
30 gallon container  $                    89.60  No Bid 
minimum order  30 gallons 
returnable  No 
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Item #5:  Trycera Selective Herbicide,                                    
No Subs                                                                                       
price per gallon                                                                                                                           

 Helena Agri 
Enterprises 

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply

2.5 gallon container  $                    85.00  No Bid 
minimum order  25 gallons 
returnable  No 
265 gallon container  $                    76.00  No Bid 
minimum order  265 gallons 
returnable  Yes 

Item #6:  EcoMIGHT,                                                       
No Subs                                                                        
price per gallon                                                            

 Helena Agri 
Enterprises 

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply

1 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order
2.5 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order
55 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order
Brand Bid

Item #7:  DLZ-MSO Surfactant Plus Drift,                    
or equal to                                                                            
price per gallon                                                                                                                           

 Helena Agri 
Enterprises 

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply

2.5 gallon container  $                    22.50  No Bid 
minimum order  25 gallons N/A
returnable  No No

Item #8:  Hardball, 2,4-D Acid,                                         
or equal to                                                                 
price per gallon                                                                                                                           

 Helena Agri 
Enterprises 

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply

2.5 gallon container  $                    35.00  $                    68.60 
minimum order  25 gallons (1) Lesco Three 

Way
returnable  No No
30 gallon container  $                    35.00  $                  784.13 
minimum order  30 gallons (1)Lesco Three Way

returnable  No No



Item #9:  Droplex Xtra,                                                     
or equal to                                                                                         
price per gallon                                                                                                                           

 Helena Agri 
Enterprises 

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply

2.5 gallon container  $                    20.00  No Bid 
minimum order  25 gallons 
returnable  No 

Item #10:  Vastlan,                                                             
or equal to                                                                                      
price per gallon                                                                                                                           

 Helena Agri 
Enterprises 

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply

2.5 gallon container  $                    89.60  $                  186.81 
30 gallon container  $                    89.60  $               2,203.84 
minimum order  30 gallons 1.00 
returnable  No Lesco Triclopyr

Item #11:  Trycera Selective Herbicide,                             
or equal to                                                                                      
price per gallon                                                                                                                           

 Helena Agri 
Enterprises 

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply

2.5 gallon container  $                    85.00  No Bid 
minimum order  25 gallons 
returnable  No 
265 gallon container  $                    76.00  No Bid 
minimum order  265 gallons 
returnable  Yes 

Item #12:  EcoMIGHT,                                                         
or equal to                                                                        
price per gallon                                                            

 Helena Agri 
Enterprises 

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply

1 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order
2.5 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order
55 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order
Brand Bid
Winfield Solutions dba Winfield United - Vendor withdrew bid response.
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Controlling
Name of Interested Party

4
Nature of interest

City, State, Country (place of business)
Intermediary

(check applicable)

CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES 1295FORM
1 of 1

1

OFFICE USE ONLY

2 04/19/2021

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place
of business.
Helena Agri Enterprises
College Station, TX United States
Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is
being filed.

Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

3

Fort Bend County

Herbicides
B21-073

2021-740017

05/25/2021

Date Filed:

Date Acknowledged:

Certificate Number:

CERTIFICATION OF FILING

6

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

My name is _______________________________________________________________,

UNSWORN DECLARATION

Check only if there is NO Interested Party.5
X

My address is _______________________________________________, _______________________,

and my date of birth is _______________________.

Executed in ________________________________________County,

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

(street) (state) (zip code) (country)

(year)(month)

 _______, ______________, _________.

State of ________________, on the _____day of ___________, 20_____.

(city)

(Declarant)

Version V1.1.ceffd98awww.ethics.state.tx.usForms provided by Texas Ethics Commission
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