
Vendor  Core 
Products

 LLC, 
Covington,     

LA 

 Custom 
Products 

Corporation
, Jackson,                    

MS 

 Dobie 
Supply, 
LLC.,                  

Austin,                   
TX 

 Newman 
Signs Inc, 

Jamestown,    
ND 

 Osburn 
Associates

 Logan,                
OH 

 Trantex 
Transportation 

Products
of Texas Inc.,  

Houston, 
TX 

 Vulcan 
Signs,
Foley, 

AL 

 Xcessories 
Squared 

Development 
& Mfg,                       
Auburn,           

IL 
Section 1:                              
Complete Signs

 No Bid  No Bid  $  13,480.00  $  12,500.00  No Bid  No Bid  $  13,467.00  No Bid 

Section 2:                              
Blanks

 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $217,036.25  $224,579.30  No Bid  $316,277.65  No Bid 

Section 3:                              
Posts & Accessories-
Telespar Sign Support 
System

 No Bid  No Bid  $311,925.00  No Bid  No Bid  $    260,855.00  $226,340.00  $277,895.00 

Section 4:                              
Construction Supplies

 No Bid  No Bid  $229,630.00  No Bid  No Bid  $    236,800.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Section 5:                              
Carsonite Products

 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $  39,750.00  $      17,925.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Section 6:                              
3M Products

 No Bid  Disqualified:  
Did not bid 
all items in 
Section as 
required. 

 $622,701.55  $518,897.53  No Bid  No Bid  $556,798.74  No Bid 

Section 7:                             
Avery Dennison 
Products

 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  Disqualified:  
Did not bid 
all items in 
Section as 
required. 

 No Bid  $320,491.34  No Bid 

Section 8:                              
Cutting Knives

 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $  11,525.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Section 9:                            
Banding Materials

 $       285.75  No Bid  No Bid  $       316.35  $       429.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Section 10:                            
Safety Vests

 No Bid  No Bid  $    9,240.00  No Bid  No Bid  $      10,290.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Section 11:                            
Stop/Slow Paddles

 No Bid  No Bid  $    1,064.50  $    1,185.00 1,672.10$    1,057.50$         No Bid  No Bid 

Section 12:                            
Miscellaneous

 No Bid  No Bid  $  95,150.00  No Bid  No Bid 70,415.00$       No Bid  No Bid 

Fort Bend County Tabulation
BID 21-048

Term Contract for Purchase of Traffic Signs, Posts and Supplies

Term:  April 1, 2021 through March 31, 2022

Recommendation:  Lowest Bidder per Section

32N

03/26/2021 Original (e) sent to Jessica Carabajal, Purchasing dept.



Newman Signs
 Bid Price       
per Each  

All way, 18 x 6, red white VIP diamond Grade (MUTCD
R1-4)

1794 5.00$                 

Watch for ice on bridge, 36 x 36, hinged with closure hook,
fluorescent yellow, diamond grade material

1795 85.00$               

Type III, 12x36, fluorescent yellow, DG3, (MUTCD OM-
3R)

10400 20.00$               

Type III, 12x36, fluorescent yellow, DG3, (MUTCD OM-
3L)

10401 20.00$               

BID 21-048
Term Contract for Traffic Signs, Posts and Supplies

Fort Bend County Tabulation

Recommendation:  Lowest Bidder per Section

Term:  April 1, 2021 through March 31, 2022

 Lawson 
Number 

Section 1: Complete Signs                                                               
Finished traffic signs must be .080 aluminum with faces, 
diamond grade, VIP, reflective sheeting.  Add 3M 
protective overlay film (series 1160) to each sign.



Newman Signs
 Bid Price             
per Each  

Blanks, rounded corners, diamond punch 18 x 18 1704 5.56$                 
Blanks, rounded corners, diamond punch 24 x 24 1797 9.89$                 
Blanks, rounded corners, diamond punch 30 x 30 1703 15.45$               
Blanks, rounded corners, diamond punch 36 x 36 1798 22.25$               
Blanks, octagon 30 x 30 1705 15.45$               
Blanks, octagon 36 x 36 10402 22.25$               
Blanks, pentagon 30 x 30 1799 15.45$               
Blanks, pentagon 36 x 36 1706 22.25$               
Blanks, rounded corners, rectangle 24 x 8 12539 3.30$                 
Blanks, rounded corners, rectangle 24 x 10 12540 4.12$                 
Blanks, rounded corners, rectangle 24 x 12 12541 4.94$                 
Blanks, rounded corners, rectangle 12 x 18 1707 3.71$                 
Blanks, rounded corners, rectangle 18 x 24 1709 7.42$                 
Blanks, rounded corners, rectangle 24 x 30 1710 12.36$               
Blanks, rounded corners, rectangle 24 x 36 1803 14.83$               
Blanks, rounded corners, rectangle 30 x 36 1802 18.54$               
Blanks, rounded corners, rectangle 24 x 48 1711 19.78$               
Blanks, rounded corners, rectangle 30 x 48 1804 24.72$               
Blanks, rounded corners, rectangle 36 x 18 1800 11.12$               
Blanks, rounded corners, square 18 x 18 1712 5.56$                 
Blanks, rounded corners, square 24 x 24 1805 9.89$                 
Blanks, rounded corners, street sign, flat, 9 x 30 1713 4.63$                 
Blanks, rounded corners, street sign, flat, 9 x 36 1714 5.56$                 
Blanks, rounded corners, street sign, flat, 9 x 42 1715 6.49$                 
Blanks, rounded corners, street sign, flat, 9 x 48 1716 7.42$                 
Blanks, round, 36" diameter 1806 22.25$               
Blanks, rounded corners, rectangle, 10 x 30 1787 5.15$                 
Blanks, rounded corners, rectangle, 12 x 30 1788 6.18$                 
Blanks, rounded corners, triangle, 30 12542 7.72$                 
Blanks, rounded corners, triangle, 36 14116 11.12$               
Blanks, extruded, 9 x 30 12543 7.46$                 
Blanks, extruded, 9 x 36 12544 8.81$                 
Blanks, extruded, 9 x 42 12545 10.15$               
Blanks, extruded, 9 x 48 12546 11.50$               
Blanks, extruded, 9 x 54 12547 13.50$               

 Lawson 
Number 

Section 2: Blanks                                                            
Blanks must be .080 aluminum



Vulcan
 Bid Price          
per Each  

12' Round 2.375 16 gauge galvanized post 14085 26.44$               
14’ 1-3/4”x1-3/4” square 12 gauge galvanized sign post 14086 42.48$               
12” round post cap flat blade for 2.375” round post 14087 8.73$                 
12” round post cap extruded for 2.375” round post 14088 8.73$                 
74‐5606 TRF RD RW 2.375 16 gauge Post, 12' 12548 26.44$               
75‐4892 TRF RD Taper 2.875 Poz Loc Sockets 12549 19.38$               
76‐6050 6603 RD Post Shim W/9/16” Hole  Wedges 12550 3.50$                 
Square sign post, 12 ft., 12 gauge, galvanized steel, pre-
punched, 1-3/4" x 1-3/4"

8801 37.18$               

U channel galvanized steel post 7 ft. 1.12 lbs. 1752 8.91$                 
Square post caps, 5-1/2" blade, flat with set screws 1753 3.37$                 
Square post caps, 5-1/2" blade, extruded with set screws 1754 3.37$                 
Round post caps for flat with set screws, 2-3/8" post OD for
5-1/2" blade

1790 3.37$                 

Round post caps for extruded with set screws, 2-3/8" post
   

1791 3.37$                 
Small corner bolts 1755 0.45$                 
Flanged nuts 1756 0.10$                 
Anchors: 1-7/8" x 1-7/8" x 36" 1757
Drive Rivets, 3/8" aluminum 1758 0.45$                 
Cross brackets for street signs, 5-1/2" blade holder with set
screws for flat

1718 3.37$                 

Cross brackets for street signs, 5-1/2" blade holder with set
screws for extruded

1717 3.37$                 

Cross brackets for street signs, 12" blade holder with set
screws for flat

1792 8.72$                 

Cross brackets for street signs, 12" blade holder with set
  

1793 8.72$                 
2-7/8" OD, rounded, for flat blades, 5-1/2" blade holder
with set screws

1807 3.37$                 

2-3/8" OD, round 12" post caps for flat blade with set 7698 8.72$                 
2-3/8" OD, round 12" post caps for extruded with set
screws

7699 8.72$                 

12" blade for flat street signs, square post cap, 1-3/4" 10403 8.72$                 
12" blade for extruded street signs, square post cap, 1-3/4" 7700 8.72$                 
2-3/8" post clamp with fasteners included with each clamp,
aluminum

10404 1.97$                 

Section 3: Posts and Accessories-Telespar Sign Support 
System                                                                                                 

 Lawson 
Number 



Dobie Supply
 Bid Price           
per Each  

Barricade, portable type I standard 36" plastic with
reflective DG3 diamond grade sheeting with aluminum legs

1719 62.50$               

Barricade, Type III collapsible, diamond grade reflective
sheeting, no-maintenance plastic boards, 8 foot, double
sided sheeting right and left with Telespar tubing for
upright support and legs, 1" thick x 8" tall board

1808 210.00$             

Barricade, Type III collapsible, diamond grade reflective
sheeting, no-maintenance plastic boards, 10 foot, double
sided sheeting right and left with Telespar tubing for
upright support and legs, 1" thick x 8" tall board

1809 285.00$             

Barricade, Type III collapsible, diamond grade reflective
sheeting, no-maintenance plastic boards, 12 foot, double
sided sheeting right and left with Telespar tubing for
upright support and legs, 1" thick x 8" tall board

1810 345.00$             

End of Road barricade boards, Type III with DG3 diamond
grade sheeting on no-maintenance plastic boards, 10', red
and white, 1" thick x 8" tall board, 3 right boards

9676 158.00$             

End of Road barricade boards, Type III with DG3 diamond
grade sheeting on no-maintenance plastic boards, 10', red
and white, 1" thick x 8" tall board, 3 left boards

11472 158.00$             

Barricade, two (2) "A" frames with two (2) 10' diamond
grade sheeted I-beams, molded no-maintenance plastic
boards, orange and white, right on one side and left on
other side

11473 232.50$             

Safety cones, 28", orange, 12# weight, 4” upper reflective
collars, with white diamond grade VIP reflective sheeting,
14-/34" x 14-3/4" base

10405 24.00$               

Safety cones, 28", orange, 12# weight, 6" upper reflective
collars, with white diamond grade VIP reflective sheeting,
14-/34" x 14-3/4" base

10406 24.00$               

Safety cones, 36", orange, 12# weight, 4” upper reflective
collars, with white diamond grade VIP reflective sheeting,
14-/34" x 14-3/4" base

10407 25.00$               

Safety cones, 36", orange, 12# weight, 6” upper reflective
collars, with white diamond grade VIP reflective sheeting,
14-/34" x 14-3/4" base

10408 25.00$               

 Lawson 
Number 

Section 4: Construction Supplies                                                                                                



Dobie Supply
 Bid Price                                   
per each                  

Vertical Panel with 20" x 28" black rubber rectangular
base, reflective panel 8" x 36", orange and white diagonal
sheeting, double sided, diamond grade reflective sheeting,

 

1730 47.75$               

Warning light, Colt RS-600, 6 volt type A 1731 18.00$               
Warning light spring battery, general purpose 6 volt type A 1732 5.00$                 
Delineator reflectors, 4" x 4", white aluminum with
diamond grade sheeting

1812 2.24$                 

Delineator reflectors, 4" x 4", fluorescent yellow aluminum
with diamond grade sheeting

1733 2.24$                 

Standard roll up construction signs, 48 x 48 reflective,
vinyl, plastic corner pockets with ribs with overlays,
fluorescent orange. All construction signs in the Texas
Manual on Uniform Traffic Control with carrying bags

1782 152.50$             

Standard roll up construction signs, 36 x 36 reflective,
vinyl, plastic corner pockets with ribs with overlays,
fluorescent orange. All construction signs in the Texas
Manual on Uniform Traffic Control with carrying bags

14089 124.00$             

DF3000W 12" Screwlock Roll-Up Sign Stand 14090 130.00$             
DF3003W 12" Screwlock Roll-Up Sign Stand 14091 130.00$             
DF3000S 12" Stablock Fold & Roll Sign Stand 14092 162.50$             
DF3003S 12" Stablock Fold & Roll Sign Stand 14093 162.50$             
DF4503 5" RUB3315 Roll-Up Sign Stand 14094 198.00$             
DF4700TX 7" RUB3315 Roll-Up Sign Stand 14095 220.00$             
Chip seal markers, white with cover, two sided 0.41$                 
Chip seal markers, yellow with cover, two sided 0.41$                 

Trantex
 Bid Price             
per Each  

Road markers, white, Carsonite CRM-375., flexible 3.75"
width x 62" length, with 3" x 12" fluorescent yellow
reflective diamond grade VIP installed

5457 11.95$               

 Lawson 
Number 

Section 4: Construction Supplies  (cont'd)                                                                                              

 Lawson 
Number 

Section 5: Carsonite Products or equal                                
(See Section 1.18 Name Brands)                                                                                       



Newman
 Bid Price  per 

Each  
Rolls, 30", red, reflective series DG3 cubed, pressure
sensitive

14096 787.50$             

Rolls, 30" x 50 yd., white, engineer grade, pressure
sensitive, #3200T

1846 354.38$             

Rolls, 36" x 50 yd., white, engineer grade, pressure
sensitive, #3200T 

1847 425.25$             

Rolls, 9", white, reflective, series DG3 cubed, pressure
sensitive

1759 236.25$             

Rolls, 24", white, reflective, series DG3 cubed, pressure
sensitive

1760 630.00$             

Rolls, 30", white, reflective series DG3 cubed, pressure
sensitive

1761 787.50$             

Rolls, 36", white, reflective series DG3 cubed, pressure
sensitive

11474 945.00$             

Rolls, 9", yellow, reflective, engineer grade, pressure
sensitive, #3200T

1849 106.31$             

Rolls, 9", yellow, reflective, series DG3 cubed, pressure
sensitive

1848 236.25$             

Rolls, 18", yellow, reflective, series DG3 cubed, pressure
sensitive

1850 472.50$             

Rolls, 24", yellow, reflective, series DG3 cubed, pressure
sensitive

1851 630.00$             

Rolls, 30", yellow, reflective, series DG3 cubed, pressure
sensitive

1852 787.50$             

Rolls, 36", yellow, reflective, series DG3 cubed, pressure
sensitive

1853 945.00$             

Rolls, 9", fluorescent yellow, reflective, series DG3 cubed,
pressure sensitive

10409 236.25$             

Rolls, 18", fluorescent yellow, reflective, series DG3 cubed, 
pressure sensitive

1762 472.50$             

Rolls, 24", fluorescent yellow, reflective, series DG3 cubed, 
pressure sensitive

1763 630.00$             

Rolls, 30", fluorescent yellow, reflective, series DG3 cubed, 
pressure sensitive

1764 787.50$             

Rolls, 36", fluorescent yellow, reflective, series DG3 cubed, 
pressure sensitive

1854 945.00$             

Rolls, 24", fluorescent yellow green, reflective, series DG3
cubed, pressure sensitive

1765 630.00$             

Rolls, 30", fluorescent yellow green, reflective, series DG3
cubed, pressure sensitive

1766 787.50$             

 Lawson 
Number 

Section 6: 3M Products                                                            



Newman
 Bid Price                  
per Each  

Rolls, 18", fluorescent orange, reflective, series DG3
cubed, pressure sensitive

1855 472.50$             

Rolls, 30", fluorescent orange, reflective, series DG3
cubed, pressure sensitive

1768 787.50$             

Rolls, 36", fluorescent orange, reflective, series DG3
cubed, pressure sensitive

1767 945.00$             

Rolls, 18", black, non-reflective, vinyl, clear synthetic liner 1834 141.75$             
Rolls, 24", black, non-reflective, vinyl, clear synthetic liner 1835 189.00$             
Rolls, 30", black, non-reflective, vinyl, clear synthetic liner 1836 236.25$             
Rolls, 36", black, non-reflective, vinyl, clear synthetic liner 1734 283.50$             
Rolls, 30", white, non-reflective, vinly, clear synthetic liner 10410 236.25$             
Rolls, 9", transfer tape, clear 1735 29.53$               
Rolls, 12", transfer tape, clear 1736 39.38$               
Rolls, 24", transfer tape, clear TPM5 transfer prepositioned 12551 78.75$               
Rolls, 30", transfer tape, clear TPM5 12552 98.44$               
Rolls, 36", transfer tape, clear TPM5 12553 118.13$             
24", E C film, brown, clear synthetic liner 1740 252.00$             
30", E C film, brown, clear synthetic liner 1741 315.00$             
24", E C film, green, clear synthetic liner 1742 252.00$             
30", E C film, green, clear synthetic liner 1743 315.00$             
24", E C film, blue, clear synthetic liner 1840 252.00$             
30", E C film, blue, clear synthetic liner 1841 315.00$             
24", E C film, red, clear synthetic liner 1744 252.00$             
30", E C film, red, clear synthetic liner 1745 315.00$             
36", E C film, red, clear synthetic liner 1839 378.00$             
2" roll, red/white, conspicuity marking, series DG3 cubed,
pressure sensitive, red/white block, 6" x 6", 983-32

1746 70.88$               

 Lawson 
Number 

Section 6: 3M Products  (cont'd)                                                          



Section 6: 3M Products  (cont'd)                                                          Newman
Faces (Faces only NOT complete signs, Does Not include 
blank)                                                                                              
Faces must  be pressure sensitive, series DG3 cubed, 
reflective sheeting and packaged with slip sheeting.  Must 
be packaged with plastic washers.  

 Bid Price             
per Each  

Faces: Stop ahead (symbol), 30" fluorescent yellow, series
DG3 cubed, material Symbol MUTCD W3-1A

1701 18.75$               

Faces: Stop sign, 30 x 30, series DG3 cubed, pre-cut
corners

1702 18.75$               

Faces: Stop sign, 36 x 36, series DG3 cubed, pre-cut
corners

10411 18.75$               

Faces:  Yield, 30 x 30 1796 18.75$               
Faces: Signals ahead, 30 x 30 fluorescent yellow, series
DG3 cubed, Symbol MUTCD W3-3

1843 18.75$               

Faces: White body raised pavement markings, one-way
white lens, 100 per carton

1856 18.75$               

Faces: White body raised pavement markings, two-way
white lens, 100 per carton

1857 18.75$               

Faces: White body raised pavement markings, two-way
white/red lens, 100 per carton

1770 18.75$               

Faces: Yellow body raised pavement markings, one-way
yellow lens, 100 per carton

1860 18.75$               

Faces: Yellow body raised pavement markings, two-way
yellow lens, 100 per carton

1862 18.75$               

Faces: One way pressure sensitive adhesive raised
pavement markers white lens, 100 per carton

1773 18.75$               

Faces: One way pressure sensitive adhesive raised
pavement markers yellow lens, 100 per carton

1858 18.75$               

Faces: One way pressure sensitive adhesive raised
pavement markers red lens, 100 per carton

1771 18.75$               

Faces: Two way pressure sensitive adhesive raised
pavement markers white lens, 100 per carton

1861 18.75$               

Faces: Two way pressure sensitive adhesive raised
pavement markers yellow lens, 100 per carton

1859 18.75$               

3M protective overlay film (series 1160), 30" x 50 yards
per roll

11475 18.75$               

3M protective overlay film (series 1160), 36" x 50 yards
per roll

11476 18.75$               

3M citrus base cleaner (aerosol)

 Lawson 
Number 

Item Removed



Section 6: 3M Products  (cont'd)                                                          Newman
Faces (Faces only NOT complete signs, Does Not include 
blank)                                                                                              

         

 Bid Price  per 
Each  

Faces must  be pressure sensitive, series DG3 cubed, 
reflective sheeting and packaged with slip sheeting.  Must 
be packaged with plastic washers.  Add 3M protective 
overlay film (series 1160) to each sign face.
Faces: Stop ahead (symbol), 30" fluorescent yellow, series
DG3 cubed, material Symbol MUTCD W3-1A

12558 33.09$               

Faces: Stop ahead (symbol), 36" fluorescent yellow, series
DG3 cubed, material Symbol MUTCD W3-1A

12558 47.66$               

Faces: Stop sign, 30 x 30, series DG3 cubed, pre-cut
corners

12559 33.09$               

Faces: Stop sign, 36 x 36, series DG3 cubed, pre-cut
corners

12560 47.66$               

Faces:  Yield, 30 x 30 12561 16.55$               
Faces:  Yield, 36 x 36 14097 23.83$               
Faces: Signals ahead, 30 x 30 fluorescent yellow, series
DG3 cubed, Symbol MUTCD W3-3

12562 33.09$               

Faces: White body raised pavement markings, one-way
white lens, 100 per carton

12563 130.28$             

Faces: White body raised pavement markings, two-way
white lens, 100 per carton

12564 130.28$             

Faces: White body raised pavement markings, two-way
white/red lens, 100 per carton

12565 130.28$             

Faces: Yellow body raised pavement markings, one-way
yellow lens, 100 per carton

12566 130.28$             

Faces: Yellow body raised pavement markings, two-way
yellow lens, 100 per carton

12567 130.28$             

Faces: One way pressure sensitive adhesive raised
pavement markers white lens, 100 per carton

12568 333.04$             

Faces: One way pressure sensitive adhesive raised
pavement markers yellow lens, 100 per carton

12569 333.04$             

Faces: One way pressure sensitive adhesive raised
pavement markers red lens, 100 per carton

12570 333.04$             

Faces: Two way pressure sensitive adhesive raised
pavement markers white lens, 100 per carton

12571 333.04$             

Faces: Two way pressure sensitive adhesive raised
pavement markers yellow lens, 100 per carton

12572 333.04$             

 Lawson 
Number 



Vulcan 
 Bid Price             
per Each  

Rolls, 30" x 50 yd., white, engineer grade, pressure
sensitive, #3200T

13543 292.50$             

Rolls, 36" x 50 yd., white, engineer grade, pressure
sensitive, #3200T

13544 351.00$             

Rolls, 9", white, reflective, series DG3 cubed, pressure
sensitive

13545 316.13$             

Rolls, 24", white, reflective, series DG3 cubed, pressure
sensitive

13546 843.00$             

Rolls, 30", white, reflective, series DG3 cubed, pressure
sensitive

13547 1,053.75$          

Rolls, 36", white, reflective, series DG3 cubed, pressure
sensitive

13548 1,264.50$          

Rolls, 9", yellow, reflective, engineer grade, pressure
sensitive, #3200T

13549 87.75$               

Rolls, 9", yellow, reflective, series DG3 cubed, pressure
sensitive

13550 316.13$             

Rolls, 18", yellow, reflective, series DG3 cubed, pressure
Sensitive

13551 632.25$             

Rolls, 24", yellow, reflective, series DG3 cubed, pressure
Sensitive

13552 843.00$             

Rolls, 30", yellow, reflective, series DG3 cubed, pressure
Sensitive

13553 1,053.75$          

Rolls, 36", yellow, reflective, series DG3 cubed, pressure
Sensitive

13554 1,264.50$          

Rolls,   9", fluorescent yellow, reflective, series DG3 cubed, 
pressure sensitive

13555 316.13$             

Rolls, 18", fluorescent yellow, reflective, series DG3 cubed, 
pressure sensitive

13556 632.25$             

Rolls, 24", fluorescent yellow, reflective, series DG3 cubed, 
pressure sensitive

13557 843.00$             

Rolls, 30", fluorescent yellow, reflective, series DG3 cubed, 
pressure sensitive

13558 1,053.75$          

Rolls, 36", fluorescent yellow, reflective, series DG3 cubed, 
pressure sensitive

13559 1,264.50$          

Rolls, 24", fluorescent yellow green, reflective, series DG3
cubed, pressure sensitive

13560 843.00$             

Rolls, 30", fluorescent yellow green, reflective, series DG3
cubed, pressure sensitive

13561 1,053.75$          

Rolls, 18", fluorescent orange, reflective, series DG3
cubed, pressure sensitive

13562 632.25$             

Rolls, 30", fluorescent orange, reflective, series DG3
cubed, pressure sensitive

13563 1,053.75$          

Lawson 
Number

Section 7: Avery Denison                                          



Vulcan 
 Bid Price             
per Each  

Rolls, 36", fluorescent orange, reflective, series DG3
cubed, pressure sensitive

13564 $1,264.50

Rolls, 24", black, non-reflective, vinyl, clear synthetic liner 13566 318.57$             
Rolls, 30", black, non-reflective, vinyl, clear synthetic liner 13567 398.20$             
Rolls, 36", black, non-reflective, vinyl, clear synthetic liner 13568 477.85$             
Rolls, 30", white, non-reflective, vinyl, clear synthetic liner 13569 398.20$             
Rolls, 9", transfer tape, clear 13570 65.25$               
Rolls, 12", transfer tape, clear 13571 87.00$               
24", E C film, brown, clear synthetic liner 13572 276.00$             
30", E C film, brown, clear synthetic liner 13573 345.00$             
24", E C film, green, clear synthetic liner 13574 276.00$             
30", E C film, green, clear synthetic liner 13575 345.00$             
24", E C film, blue, clear synthetic liner 13576 276.00$             
30", E C film, blue, clear synthetic liner 13577 345.00$             
24", E C film, red, clear synthetic liner 13578 276.00$             
30", E C film, red, clear synthetic liner 13579 345.00$             
36", E C film, red, clear synthetic liner 13580 414.00$             
2" roll, red/white, conspicuity marking, series DG3 cubed,
pressure sensitive, red/white block, 6" x 6", 983-32

13581 113.89$             

Lawson 
Number

Section 7: Avery Denison (cont'd)                                         



Section 7: Avery Denison (cont'd)                                         Vulcan 
Faces (Faces only NOT complete signs, Does Not include 
blank)                                                                                              
Faces must  be pressure sensitive, series DG3 cubed, 
reflective sheeting and packaged with slip sheeting.  Must 
be packaged with plastic washers.  

 Bid Price             
per Each  

Faces: Stop ahead (symbol), 30" fluorescent yellow, series
DG3 cubed, material Symbol MUTCD W3-1A

13582 18.98$               

Faces: Stop sign, 30 x 30, series DG3 cubed, pre-cut
corners

13583 17.94$               

Faces: Stop sign, 36 x 36, series DG3 cubed, pre-cut
corners

13584 25.83$               

Faces: Yield, 30 x 30 13585 9.13$                 
Faces: Signals ahead, 30 x 30 fluorescent yellow, series
DG3 cubed, Symbol MUTCD W3-3

13586 19.48$               

Faces: White body raised pavement markings, one-way
white lens, 100 per carton

13587 205.00$             

Faces: White body raised pavement markings, two-way
white lens, 100 per carton

13588 205.00$             

Faces: White body raised pavement markings, two-way
white/red lens, 100 per carton

13589 205.00$             

Faces: Yellow body raised pavement markings, one-way
yellow lens, 100 per carton

13590 205.00$             

Faces: Yellow body raised pavement markings, two-way
yellow lens, 100 per carton

13591 205.00$             

Faces: One way pressure sensitive adhesive raised
pavement markers white lens, 100 per carton

13592 205.00$             

Faces: One way pressure sensitive adhesive raised
pavement markers yellow lens, 100 per carton

13593 205.00$             

Faces: One way pressure sensitive adhesive raised
pavement markers red lens, 100 per carton

13594 205.00$             

Faces: Two way pressure sensitive adhesive raised
pavement markers white lens, 100 per carton

13595 205.00$             

Faces: Two way pressure sensitive adhesive raised
pavement markers yellow lens, 100 per carton

13596 205.00$             

Protective overlay film (series 1160), 30" x 50 yards 13597 517.50$             
Protective overlay film (series 1160), 36" x 50 yards 13598 621.00$             

Lawson 
Number



Section 8: Cutting Knives                                                        Osburn
 Bid Price             
per Each  

CB09UA-5 cutting knives for Western Graphtec cutting pro
300-100

1783 230.50$             

CB15U-5 cutting knives for Western Graphtec cutting pro
300-100

1864 230.50$             

Section 9: Banding Materials                                                                                         Core Products
 Bid Price             
per Each  

Stainless steel, 3/4" x 100' x .030 coil in dispensing box,
type 201 universal

41.25$               

3/4" wide stainless steel top split wing seal 0.22$                 
Flared leg stainless sign bracket with bolt & washer 1.40$                 

Section 10: Safety Vests                                                                                              Dobie Supply
 Bid Price           
per Each  

Safetey vests, ML Kishigo Ultra-Cool mesh, contrasting
#1056 (or equal), ANSI/ISEA 107 2010 Class 2 compliant,
zipper front closure, 2" wide reflective material with 4.5"
contrasting color, inside left chest 2-tier 4-division pencil
pocket, lower right inside patch pocket, with Mic Tab on
front left chest, with Road and Bridge imprinted on back,
Size: M

10412 12.90$               

Safetey vests, ML Kishigo Ultra-Cool mesh, contrasting
#1056 (or equal), ANSI/ISEA 107 2010 Class 2 compliant,
zipper front closure, 2" wide reflective material with 4.5"
contrasting color, inside left chest 2-tier 4-division pencil
pocket, lower right inside patch pocket, with Mic Tab on
front left chest, with Road and Bridge imprinted on back,
Size: L

10413 12.90$               

Safetey vests, ML Kishigo Ultra-Cool mesh, contrasting
#1056 (or equal), ANSI/ISEA 107 2010 Class 2 compliant,
zipper front closure, 2" wide reflective material with 4.5"
contrasting color, inside left chest 2-tier 4-division pencil
pocket, lower right inside patch pocket, with Mic Tab on
front left chest, with Road and Bridge imprinted on back,
Size: XL

10414 12.90$               

Lawson 
Number

Lawson 
Number

Lawson 
Number



Section 10: Safety Vests (cont'd)                                                                                               Dobie Supply
 Bid Price                  
per Each  

Safetey vests, ML Kishigo Ultra-Cool mesh, contrasting
#1056 (or equal), ANSI/ISEA 107 2010 Class 2 compliant,
zipper front closure, 2" wide reflective material with 4.5"
contrasting color, inside left chest 2-tier 4-division pencil
pocket, lower right inside patch pocket, with Mic Tab on
front left chest, with Road and Bridge imprinted on back,
Size: XXL

10415 12.90$               

Safetey vests, ML Kishigo Ultra-Cool mesh, contrasting
#1056 (or equal), ANSI/ISEA 107 2010 Class 2 compliant,
zipper front closure, 2" wide reflective material with 4.5"
contrasting color, inside left chest 2-tier 4-division pencil
pocket, lower right inside patch pocket, with Mic Tab on
front left chest, with Road and Bridge imprinted on back,
Size: XXXL

10416 12.90$               

Safetey vests, ML Kishigo Ultra-Cool mesh, contrasting
#1056 (or equal), ANSI/ISEA 107 2010 Class 2 compliant,
zipper front closure, 2" wide reflective material with 4.5"
contrasting color, inside left chest 2-tier 4-division pencil
pocket, lower right inside patch pocket, with Mic Tab on
front left chest, with Road and Bridge imprinted on back,
Size: 4XL

12554 14.00$               

Safetey vests, ML Kishigo Ultra-Cool mesh, contrasting
#1056 (or equal), ANSI/ISEA 107 2010 Class 2 compliant,
zipper front closure, 2" wide reflective material with 4.5"
contrasting color, inside left chest 2-tier 4-division pencil
pocket, lower right inside patch pocket, with Mic Tab on
front left chest, with Road and Bridge imprinted on back,
Size: 5XL

12555 14.00$               

Lawson 
Number



Section 11: Stop/Slow Paddles                                                                                               Trantex
 Bid Price                 
per Each  

Stop/slow paddles, 24" aluminum, Diamond Grade
reflective with 12" handle

10417 89.00$               

Extension handles, telescopic with 2 height settings for 6'
and 7' height

10418 16.75$               

Section 12: Miscellaneous                                                                                               Trantex
 Bid Price            
per Each  

Yellow water base traffic paint for stripping roads in 1775 $14.55
White water base traffic paint for stripping roads in gallons 1776 $14.35
Blue water base traffic paint for stripping roads in gallons 1777 $10.50
Red water base traffic paint for stripping roads in gallons 1778 $11.95
Black water base traffic paint for stripping roads in gallons 1779 $10.10
Glass beads, in pounds, 50 pounds per bag 1780 $0.82
Bitumem adhesive for raised pavement markings in pounds 1772 $0.40

Lawson 
Number

Lawson 
Number
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Controlling
Name of Interested Party

4
Nature of interest

City, State, Country (place of business)
Intermediary

(check applicable)

CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES 1295FORM
1 of 1

1

OFFICE USE ONLY

2 01/13/2021

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place
of business.
Core Products, LLC.
Covington, LA United States
Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is
being filed.

Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

3

Fort Bend County

Traffic Signs, Posts, Supplies
B21-048

2021-705799

03/23/2021

Date Filed:

Date Acknowledged:

Certificate Number:

CERTIFICATION OF FILING

6

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

My name is _______________________________________________________________,

UNSWORN DECLARATION

Check only if there is NO Interested Party.5
X

My address is _______________________________________________, _______________________,

and my date of birth is _______________________.

Executed in ________________________________________County,

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

(street) (state) (zip code) (country)

(year)(month)

 _______, ______________, _________.

State of ________________, on the _____day of ___________, 20_____.

(city)

(Declarant)

Version V1.1.ceffd98awww.ethics.state.tx.usForms provided by Texas Ethics Commission



Controlling
Name of Interested Party

4
Nature of interest

City, State, Country (place of business)
Intermediary

(check applicable)

CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES 1295FORM
1 of 1

1

OFFICE USE ONLY

2 03/15/2021

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place
of business.
Dobie Supply, LLC.
Austin, TX United States
Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is
being filed.

Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

3

Fort Bend County

Traffic Signs, Posts, Supplies.
B21-048

2021-727066

03/23/2021

Date Filed:

Date Acknowledged:

Certificate Number:

CERTIFICATION OF FILING

6

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

My name is _______________________________________________________________,

UNSWORN DECLARATION

Check only if there is NO Interested Party.5
X

My address is _______________________________________________, _______________________,

and my date of birth is _______________________.

Executed in ________________________________________County,

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

(street) (state) (zip code) (country)

(year)(month)

 _______, ______________, _________.

State of ________________, on the _____day of ___________, 20_____.

(city)

(Declarant)

Version V1.1.ceffd98awww.ethics.state.tx.usForms provided by Texas Ethics Commission



Controlling
Name of Interested Party

4
Nature of interest

City, State, Country (place of business)
Intermediary

(check applicable)

CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES 1295FORM
1 of 1

1

OFFICE USE ONLY

2 03/22/2021

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place
of business.
Newman Traffic Signs
Jamestown, ND United States
Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is
being filed.

Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

3

Fort Bend County

Traffic signs, posts, brackets, sheeting, etc.
45-0276348

2021-729125

03/23/2021

Date Filed:

Date Acknowledged:

Certificate Number:

CERTIFICATION OF FILING

6

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

My name is _______________________________________________________________,

UNSWORN DECLARATION

Check only if there is NO Interested Party.5
X

My address is _______________________________________________, _______________________,

and my date of birth is _______________________.

Executed in ________________________________________County,

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

(street) (state) (zip code) (country)

(year)(month)

 _______, ______________, _________.

State of ________________, on the _____day of ___________, 20_____.

(city)

(Declarant)

Version V1.1.ceffd98awww.ethics.state.tx.usForms provided by Texas Ethics Commission



Controlling
Name of Interested Party

4
Nature of interest

City, State, Country (place of business)
Intermediary

(check applicable)

CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES 1295FORM
1 of 1

1

OFFICE USE ONLY

2 03/15/2021

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place
of business.
Osburn Associates, Inc.
Logan, OH United States
Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is
being filed.

Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

3

Fort Bend County

Traffic Signs, Posts, Supplies
B21-048

2021-727034

03/23/2021

Date Filed:

Date Acknowledged:

Certificate Number:

CERTIFICATION OF FILING

6

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

My name is _______________________________________________________________,

UNSWORN DECLARATION

Check only if there is NO Interested Party.5
X

My address is _______________________________________________, _______________________,

and my date of birth is _______________________.

Executed in ________________________________________County,

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

(street) (state) (zip code) (country)

(year)(month)

 _______, ______________, _________.

State of ________________, on the _____day of ___________, 20_____.

(city)

(Declarant)

Version V1.1.ceffd98awww.ethics.state.tx.usForms provided by Texas Ethics Commission



Controlling
Name of Interested Party

4
Nature of interest

City, State, Country (place of business)
Intermediary

(check applicable)

CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES 1295FORM
1 of 1

1

OFFICE USE ONLY

2 01/05/2021

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place
of business.
Trantex Transportation Products of Texas Inc.
HOUSTON, TX United States
Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is
being filed.

Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

3

Fort Bend County

Traffic Signs, Posts, Supplies
B21-048

2021-702799

03/23/2021

Date Filed:

Date Acknowledged:

Certificate Number:

CERTIFICATION OF FILING

6

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

My name is _______________________________________________________________,

UNSWORN DECLARATION

Check only if there is NO Interested Party.5
X

My address is _______________________________________________, _______________________,

and my date of birth is _______________________.

Executed in ________________________________________County,

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

(street) (state) (zip code) (country)

(year)(month)

 _______, ______________, _________.

State of ________________, on the _____day of ___________, 20_____.

(city)

(Declarant)

Version V1.1.ceffd98awww.ethics.state.tx.usForms provided by Texas Ethics Commission



Controlling
Name of Interested Party

4
Nature of interest

City, State, Country (place of business)
Intermediary

(check applicable)

CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES 1295FORM
1 of 1

1

OFFICE USE ONLY

2 03/15/2021

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place
of business.
Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan Aluminum, dba Vulcan Signs
Foley, AL United States
Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is
being filed.

Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

3

Fort Bend County

Traffic Signs, Posts, Supplies
B21-048

2021-727085

03/23/2021

Date Filed:

Date Acknowledged:

Certificate Number:

CERTIFICATION OF FILING

6

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

My name is _______________________________________________________________,

UNSWORN DECLARATION

Check only if there is NO Interested Party.5
X

My address is _______________________________________________, _______________________,

and my date of birth is _______________________.

Executed in ________________________________________County,

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

(street) (state) (zip code) (country)

(year)(month)

 _______, ______________, _________.

State of ________________, on the _____day of ___________, 20_____.

(city)

(Declarant)

Version V1.1.ceffd98awww.ethics.state.tx.usForms provided by Texas Ethics Commission
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