
Section 10.1: CHEVRON PRODUCTS          A.J. Hurt Jr.           
dba                             

Reladyne 

 J.A.M. Distributing 
Company                                 

dba                                                         
Brenntag 

Lubricants Central 

 $                      49.74  No Bid 
 $                      16.58  No Bid 
 $                      74.18  No Bid 
 $                    845.79  No Bid 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 
 $                      49.74  No Bid 
 $                      16.22  No Bid 
 $                      80.49  No Bid 
 $                    749.73  No Bid 
 $                      13.74  No Bid 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 
 $                      49.74  No Bid 
 $                      16.58  No Bid 
 $                    110.15  No Bid 
 $                 1,168.13  No Bid 
 $                      20.05  No Bid 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 
 $                    103.09  No Bid 
 $                 1,088.81  No Bid 

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle
Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons

SAE 10W30 CJ-4/SM Delo 400 XLE

SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 Delo 400
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons
Per Gallon in Bulk 

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 

Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle

SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 Delo 400 XLE

Per Gallon in Bulk 

SAE 10 Delo 400
Per Pail of 5 Gallons

Per Drum of 55 Gallons

Per Drum of 55 Gallons

Fort Bend County Pricing Form
BID 21-047

Term Contract for Oil and Lubricants

Term:  1 April 2021 through 31 March 2022

Recommendation:  Low Bidder per Item

32K

03/29/2021 Original (e) sent to Jessica Carabajal, Purchasing dept.



Section 10.1: CHEVRON PRODUCTS (cont'd)         
 Reladyne  Brenntag 

 $                        4.07  No Bid 
 $                      65.49  No Bid 
 $                    770.08  No Bid 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 
 $                      72.95  No Bid 
 $                    822.07  No Bid 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 
 $                      53.16  No Bid 
 $                    547.79  No Bid 
 $                        8.93  No Bid 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 
 $                      45.42  No Bid 
 $                    547.79  No Bid 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 
 $                      70.83  No Bid 
 $                    742.20  No Bid 
 $                      12.62  No Bid 

Grease Ultra-Duty EP2  Reladyne  Brenntag 
 $                      36.70  No Bid 
 $                    132.65  No Bid 
 $                    452.67  No Bid 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 
 No Bid  No Bid 

 $                    104.13  No Bid 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 
 $                    104.13  No Bid 

Per Gallon in Bulk 

Per Case of 10, 14oz Tubes

Per 120# Container
Per 35# Container

Per 35# Container
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

Gear Oil, Universal 85-140 GL-5
Per 35# Container

Per Drum of 55 Gallons

Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons

Hydraulic Oil ISO-46 (Denison HF-2, Vickers I-268-S)
Per Pail of 5 Gallons

Gear Oil 85-140 GL-5

TDH Hydraulic/Tractor Fluid (Case MS-1207, John Deere J20C)
Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons

Per Quart in Quart Container
SAE 30 Delo 400

Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons

SAE 50 Heavy Duty Drive Train (Meets Cat’s TO-4 Specifications)
Per Pail of 5 Gallons

Per Drum of 55 Gallons
Per Gallon in Bulk 

Hydraulic Oil AW 68 (Denison HF-2, Vickers I-286-S)



Section 10.2: CONOCO/PHILLIPS
 Reladyne  Brenntag 

 $                      52.44  No Bid 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 
 $                      52.44  No Bid 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 
 $                      52.44  No Bid 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 
 $                      68.76  No Bid 
 $                      19.90  No Bid 
 $                      85.00  No Bid 
 $                    887.15  No Bid 
 $                      15.38  No Bid 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 
 $                      68.76  No Bid 
 $                      16.60  No Bid 
 $                    112.15  No Bid 
 $                    776.05  No Bid 
 $                      13.85  No Bid 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 
 $                    104.15  No Bid 
 $                 1,095.81  No Bid 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 
 $                      69.49  No Bid 
 $                    780.08  No Bid 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 
 $                      73.95  No Bid 
 $                    831.49  No Bid 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 
 No Bid  No Bid 

SAE 10W 76 T5X 10

Per Drum of 55 Gallons

Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons

SAE 5W-30 SM, GF-4 76 Super Synthetic Blend Motor Oil
Per Case of 12 Quart Containers

SAE 10W-30 SM, GF-4 76 Super Synthetic Blend Motor Oil

SAE 10W-30 Guardol FE

Per Drum of 55 Gallons
Per Gallon in Bulk 

Per Pail of 5 Gallons

SAE 30 76 T5X 30

SAE 50 Heavy Duty Drive Train 76 HT-4 50 (Meets Cat’s TO-4 Specification)

Synthetic Transoil 50 GL-1/MP-1 (Eaton Roadranger PS-164 Rev 7)

Per Pail of 5 Gallons

Per Case of 12 Quart Containers

Per Pail of 5 Gallons

Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons

Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Pail

SAE 5W-20 SM, GF-4  76 Super Synthetic Blend Motor Oil

SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 SM Guardol ECT Synthetic Blend

Per Case of 12 Quart Containers

Per Gallon in Bulk 

Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons

Per Case of 12 Quart Containers
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Pail

Per Case of 12 Quart Containers



Section 10.2: CONOCO/PHILLIPS (cont'd)  
 Reladyne  Brenntag 

 No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 
 $                      53.50  No Bid 
 $                    544.03  No Bid 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 
 $                      57.07  No Bid 
 $                    589.24  No Bid 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 
 $                      71.83  No Bid 
 $                    745.20  No Bid 
 $                      12.75  No Bid 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 
 $                      62.00  No Bid 
 $                    183.40  No Bid 
 $                    642.00  No Bid 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 
 $                      76.32  No Bid 
 $                    112.06  No Bid 
 $                    417.93  No Bid 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 
 $                      69.84  No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 
 No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 
 $                      69.84  No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 

Per Case of 10, 14oz Tubes

Per 120# Container

Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Case of 12 Quart Containers
Mercon V Automatic Transmission Fluid  

Per 35# Container

Hydraulic Oil AW 68 (Denison HF-2, Vickers I-286-S)

TDH Oil Hydraulic/Tractor Fluid (Case MS-1207, John Deere J20C)
Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons

Per Drum of 55 Gallons

Per Gallon in Bulk 

Gear Oil 85-140 GL-5/MP-1 76MP Gear Lube

Grease NLGI GC-LB Calcium Sulfonate

Per 35# Container

Hydraulic Oil ISO-46 (Denison HF-2, Vickers I-268-S)
Per Pail of 5 Gallons

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

Dexron VI Automatic Transmission Fluid

Per 120# Container

Mercon VI Automatic Transmission Fluid  
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons

ATF+4 Transmission Fluid  

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

Per Pail of 5 Gallons

Per Pail of 5 Gallons

Per Pail of 5 Gallons



Section 10.2: CONOCO/PHILLIPS (cont'd)  
 Reladyne  Brenntag 

 No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid 

Gear Oil 75W-140 Synthetic  Reladyne  Brenntag 
 No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid 

Per 35# Container

Per 35# Container

Gear Oil 75W-90 Synthetic 
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers



Section 10.3: ANTIFREEZE
Subsection 10.3.1

Multi-Vehicle Antifreeze, concentrated  Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
Chevron Universal A/F Coolant Concentrate

Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle  $                      11.44  Vendor withdrew 
Per Drum of 55 Gallons  $                    671.55  Vendor withdrew 

Subsection 10.3.2
Multi-Vehicle Antifreeze, ready-to-use  Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
Chevron Universal A/F Coolant Premix 50/50

Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle  $                        9.34  Vendor withdrew 
Per Drum of 55 Gallons  $                    458.70  Vendor withdrew 



Section 10.4: GENERIC 
Subsection 10.4.1 Chevron Products or Equal to
SAE 10W30 CJ-4/SM Delo 400 XLE  Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
Chevron Delo 400 XLE 10W-30

 $                      45.74  No Bid 
 $                      16.58  $                      18.06 
 $                      74.18  No Bid 
 $                    845.79  $                    714.45 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
AllFleet Syn Blend 15W-40 CK-4

 $                      34.69  $                      55.32 
 $                      41.60  $                      73.20 
 $                    418.86  $                    440.00 
 $                        6.77  $                        7.00 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
Chevron Delo 400 SAE 30

 $                      48.84  $                      52.44 
 $                      65.49  $                      76.25 
 $                    770.08  $                    811.25 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
Mobiltrans HD 50

 $                      72.95  $                      66.85 
 $                    822.07  $                    695.75 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
AllFleet Premium AW Hyd 46

 $                      33.43  $                      56.45 
 $                    305.92  $                    334.40 
 $                        4.60  $                        5.08 

Per Drum of 55 Gallons

Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons
Per Gallon in Bulk 

Per Case of 12 Quart Containers
Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons

SAE 50 Heavy Duty Drive Train (Meets Cat’s requiring TO-4 Fluids)

Per Pail of 5 Gallons

Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons, Mobile Delvac 1300 Super 10W30

SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 Delo 400

Hydraulic Oil ISO-46 (Denison HF-2, Vickers I-268-S)

Per Drum of 55 Gallons
Per Gallon in Bulk 

SAE 30 Delo 400

Per Case of 12 Quart Containers

Per Case of 12 Quart Containers
Per Pail of 5 Gallons

Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle



Subsection 10.4.1 Chevron Products or Equal to (cont'd)
 Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
AllFleet Premium AW Hyd 68

 $                      39.52  $                      56.45 
 $                    309.69  $                    334.40 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
ARM Econ Tractor Hyd

 $                      29.93  $                      61.55 
 $                    378.26  $                    451.00 
 $                        5.73  $                        7.20 

Grease Ultra-Duty EP2  Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
Mobilux EP 2

 $                      36.70  $                      29.80 
 $                    132.65  $                    115.15 
 $                    452.67  $                    387.84 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
Mobilux HD Plus 85W140

 $                    104.13  $                      76.00 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
Mobilux HD Plus 85W140

 $                    104.13  $                      76.00 

Per 35# Container

Per 35# Container

Gear Oil, Universal 85-140 GL-5

Per Pail of 5 Gallons

Per Gallon in Bulk 

Per Case of 10, 14oz Tubes
Per 35# Container
Per 120# Container

Gear Oil 85-140 GL-5

Per Drum of 55 Gallons

Hydraulic Oil AW 68 (Denison HF-2, Vickers I-286-S)

Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons

TDH Hydraulic/Tractor Fluid (Case MS-1207, John Deere J20C)



Subsection 10.4.2:  Conoco/Phillips or Equal to 
 Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
DurMax Syn Blend 5W-20

 $                      29.55  $                      38.76 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
DurMax Syn Blend 5W-30

 $                      30.13  $                      38.76 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
DurMax Syn Blend 10W-30

 $                      26.30  $                      38.76 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
AllFleet Premium Syn Blend 15W-40 CK-4

 $                      34.69  $                      55.32 
 $                      11.56  $                      16.68 
 $                      41.60  $                      73.20 
 $                    418.86  $                    385.00 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
Chevron Ursa Hyd 10W

 $                      78.71  $                      81.45 
 $                    914.00  $                    840.95 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
Puramax Non Detergent 30W

 $                    102.85  $                      88.20 
 $                 1,085.79  $                    750.20 

Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Pail
Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons, Navi-guard Premium Fleet 15W40/Mobil Delvac 1300 Super 15W40

SAE 5W-20 SM, GF-4  76 Super Synthetic Blend Motor Oil

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

SAE 10W 76 T5X 10

SAE 30 76 T5X 30

Per Pail of 5 Gallons

Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons, Mobil Hydraulic 10W

Per Drum of 55 Gallons

SAE 10W-30 SM, GF-4 76 Super Synthetic Blend Motor Oil

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 SM Guardol ECT Synthetic Blend

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

SAE 5W-30 SM, GF-4 76 Super Synthetic Blend Motor Oil

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers



Subsection 10.4.2: Conoco/Phillips or Equal to (cont'd)  
 Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
Mobiltrans HD 50

 $                      72.95  $                      66.85 
 $                    822.07  $                    695.75 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
Mobil Delvac 1 Trans 50

 $                    202.74  $                    201.25 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
DuraMax Global Syn ATF

 $                      36.04  $                      62.94 
 $                      71.31  No Bid 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
AllFleet Premium AW Hyd 46

 $                      33.43  $                      56.45 
 $                    305.92  $                    334.40 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
AllFleet Premium AW Hyd 68

 $                      39.52  $                      56.45 
 $                    309.69  $                    334.40 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
ARM Econ Tractor Fluid

 $                      29.93  $                      61.55 
 $                    378.26  $                    451.00 
 $                        5.73  $                        7.20 

Subsection 10.4.2: Conoco/Phillips or Equal to (cont'd)  

Per Pail of 5 Gallons                   
Per Drum of 55 Gallons
Per Gallon in Bulk 

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers
Per Pail of 5 Gallons                   

Per Drum of 55 Gallons

SAE 50 Heavy Duty Drive Train 76 HT-4 50 (Meets Cat’s TO-4 Specification)

Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons

Synthetic Transoil 50 GL-1/MP-1 (Eaton Roadranger PS-164 Rev 7)

Per Pail of 5 Gallons

Mercon V Automatic Transmission Fluid  

Hydraulic Oil ISO-46 (Denison HF-2, Vickers I-268-S)

Per Pail of 5 Gallons                   
Per Drum of 55 Gallons

Hydraulic Oil AW 68 (Denison HF-2, Vickers I-286-S)

Per Pail of 5 Gallons                   

TDH Oil Hydraulic/Tractor Fluid (Case MS-1207, John Deere J20C)



 Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
Mobil Centaur Moly 2

 $                      62.00  $                      44.87 
 $                    183.40  $                    151.44 
 $                    642.00  $                    514.31 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
Mobilube HD Plus 85W140Delo Gear EP-5 85W-140

 $                    104.13  $                      76.00 
 $                    360.00  $                    357.60 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
DuraMax Global Syn. ATF

 $                      36.04  No Bid 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
DuraMax Global Syn. ATF

 $                      36.04  No Bid 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
DuraMax Global Syn. ATF

 $                      36.04  $                      58.47 

 Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
Mobil 1 Syn Gear Lube LS 75W90

 No Bid  $                    121.35 

Gear Oil 75W-140 Synthetic  Reladyne  Brenntag 

List brand below 
Mobil 1 Syn Gear Lube LS 75W140

 No Bid  $                    173.28 

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

Grease NLGI GC-LB Calcium Sulfonate

Per Case of 10, 14oz Tubes
Per 35# Container
Per 120# Container

Mercon VI Automatic Transmission Fluid  

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

Gear Oil 85-140 GL-5/MP-1 76MP Gear Lube

Per 35# Container
Per 120# Container

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

Gear Oil 75W-90 Synthetic 

ATF+4 Transmission Fluid  

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

Dexron VI Automatic Transmission Fluid
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Controlling
Name of Interested Party

4
Nature of interest

City, State, Country (place of business)
Intermediary

(check applicable)

CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES 1295FORM
1 of 1

1

OFFICE USE ONLY

2 01/04/2021

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place
of business.
A.J. Hurt,Jr.,Inc. dba Reladyne
Houston, TX United States
Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is
being filed.

Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

3

Fort Bend County

Oil & Lubricants
21-047

2021-702632

03/23/2021

Date Filed:

Date Acknowledged:

Certificate Number:

CERTIFICATION OF FILING

6

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

My name is _______________________________________________________________,

UNSWORN DECLARATION

Check only if there is NO Interested Party.5
X

My address is _______________________________________________, _______________________,

and my date of birth is _______________________.

Executed in ________________________________________County,

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

(street) (state) (zip code) (country)

(year)(month)

 _______, ______________, _________.

State of ________________, on the _____day of ___________, 20_____.

(city)

(Declarant)

Version V1.1.ceffd98awww.ethics.state.tx.usForms provided by Texas Ethics Commission
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Controlling
Name of Interested Party

4
Nature of interest

City, State, Country (place of business)
Intermediary

(check applicable)

CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES 1295FORM
1 of 1

1

OFFICE USE ONLY

2 02/05/2021

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place
of business.
Brenntag Lubricants Central
Houston, TX United States
Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is
being filed.

Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

3

Fortbend County

Oil and Lubricants
B21-047

2021-714273

03/23/2021

Date Filed:

Date Acknowledged:

Certificate Number:

CERTIFICATION OF FILING

6

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

My name is _______________________________________________________________,

UNSWORN DECLARATION

Check only if there is NO Interested Party.5
X

My address is _______________________________________________, _______________________,

and my date of birth is _______________________.

Executed in ________________________________________County,

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

(street) (state) (zip code) (country)

(year)(month)

 _______, ______________, _________.

State of ________________, on the _____day of ___________, 20_____.

(city)

(Declarant)

Version V1.1.ceffd98awww.ethics.state.tx.usForms provided by Texas Ethics Commission
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