
 Rounds 
per                  
Box 

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

Rounds per                  
Case

Bid Price 
per                 

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

 Rounds 
per                  
Box 

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

Rounds 
per                  

Case

Bid Price 
per                 

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

9.1:  .223 HORNADY 
TAP 80265 75 GR.
Manufacturer:
HORNADY         No Sub
9.2:  .223 HORNADY 
TAP 83278 55 GR. FPD
Manufacturer:
HORNADY         No Sub
9.3:  .223 REM, L223R3 
55 GR. MC
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON     No Sub
9.4:  9-MM Luger 
L9MM3 115 GR. MC
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON     No Sub
9.5:  9-MM Luger 
L9MM2, 23718,  124 
GR. FMJ
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON     No Sub
9.6:  9-MM Golden Saber 
GS9MMB 124 GR. 
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON     No Sub

Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 21-046

Purchase of Ammunition

Term:  April 1, 2021 through March 31, 2022

Recommendation:  low bidder per item

 Vendor 
TXAT LLC

 No Bid  No Bid 
Precision Delta Corporation

 No Bid  No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 

 No Bid 

Description                      
(no substitute)                            

Lawson 
Number

 No Bid 

12945

12946

12947

12948

 No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

24C

02/12/2021 Original (e) sent to Jessica Carabajal, Purchasing dept.



 Rounds 
per                  
Box 

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

Rounds per                  
Case

Bid Price 
per                 

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

 Rounds 
per                  
Box 

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

Rounds 
per                  

Case

Bid Price 
per                 

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

9.7:  9-MM Luger TP, 
29351, GSB9MMD 124 

 Manufacturer:
REMINGTON     No Sub
9.8:  .40 S & W L40SW3 
180 GR. MC
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON     No Sub
9.9:  .40 Golden Saber 
GS40SWB 180 GR. 
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON     No Sub
9.10:  .357 SIG 
GSB357SB Golden Saber 
357 SIG 125GR BJHP
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON     No Sub
9.11:  .357 SIG L357S1 
UMC 125GR MC
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON     No Sub
9.12:  38 SPL L38S11 
130 GR. MC
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON   No Sub
9.13:  38 SPL L38S11 
158 GR., LRN, L3855, 
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON   No Sub
9.14:  45 Auto L45AP4 
UMC 45 ACP 230GR. 
MC
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON    No Sub

 No Bid  No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 

 Precision Delta Corporation  TXAT LLC 
 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 

 No Bid 

Description                                
(no substitute)                              

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 

 No Bid 

12952

12953

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

12949

Lawson 
Number

 No Bid 12954

12951

 No Bid 

12950



 Rounds 
per                  
Box 

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

Rounds per                  
Case

Bid Price 
per                 

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

 Rounds 
per                  
Box 

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

Rounds 
per                  

Case

Bid Price 
per                 

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

9.15:  45 Auto GS45APB
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON     No Sub
9.16:  12 GA. RR12BK8-
00 2 3/4" Buckshot 8 
pellets reduced recoil
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON    No Sub
9.17:  308 win. #80965, 
168GR, A-MAX Tap
Manufacturer:
HORNADY     No Sub
9.18:  308 win. #80715, 
168GR, ELD Tap AR
Manufacturer:
HORNADY     No Sub
9.19:  12 GA. RR12RSB 
12 GA 2 3/4" Foster slug 
reduced recoil
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON    No Sub

 No Bid  No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 

 TXAT LLC 
 No Bid  No Bid 

 Precision Delta Corporation 

 No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 

Description                                
(no substitute)                              

Lawson 
Number

 No Bid  No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 12957

12956

12955



 Rounds 
per                  
Box 

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

Rounds per                  
Case

Bid Price 
per                 

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

 Rounds 
per                  
Box 

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

Rounds 
per                  

Case

Bid Price 
per                 

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

9.20:  12 GA. GC127 2 
3/4" 7 1/2 target loads
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON    No Sub
9.21:  R30301 Core-Lokt, 
30-30 win. 150 gr. SPCL.
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON    No Sub
9.22:  Blank Popper, 
Winchester 12 GA. 2 3/4" 
smokeless power
Manufacturer:
WINCHESTER XP12

 No Bid  No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 

 TXAT LLC 
 No Bid  No Bid 

 Precision Delta Corporation 

 No Bid 

Description                                  
(no substitute)                                                        

Lawson 
Number

 No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 

 NA 250  $  112.00 180 +12961 25

12959

12960



 Rounds 
per                  
Box 

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

Rounds per                  
Case

Bid Price 
per                 

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

 Rounds 
per                  
Box 

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

Rounds 
per                  

Case

Bid Price 
per                 

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

9.23:  .223 HORNADY 
TAP 80265 75 GR.
HORNADY or Equal 
Winchester RA556M 
9.24:  .223 HORNADY 
TAP 83278 55 GR. FPD
HORNADY or Equal 
Winchester 
RA223BSTAY
9.25:  .223 REM, 
L223R3 55 GR. MC
REMINGTON or Equal 
AGUILA  1E223110
9.26:  9-MM Luger 
L9MM3 115 GR. MC
REMINGTON or Equal 
Winchester Q4172    
9.27:  9-MM Golden 
Saber GS9MMB 124 GR. 
BJHP
REMINGTON or Equal 
Winchester RA9BA
9.28:  .40 S & W 
L40SW3 180 GR. MC
REMINGTON or Equal 
Winchester Q4238 
9.29:  .40 Golden Saber 
GS40SWB 180 GR. 
REMINGTON or Equal 
Winchester RA40B  

60

 TXAT LLC 

60

60

No Bid

 $   274.60 

1000 $750.00 180+
 Precision Delta Corporation 

$725.00 90-180

12967

12962

90-180

20  NA 

100 $330.00

20  NA 

12965

12966 50

Description                             Lawson 
Number

50

90-180  No Bid 50

 NA 500 $113.00 90-180

500 $187.0012968

No Bid

50

 No Bid 

50  $       13.73 1000

 $   197.40  NA $96.00 180-2705000  $         9.87 1000

1000  $   350.40 50 NA 

12963

 $       17.52 20 90-12012964

1000

No Bid

 No Bid No Bid

 No Bid 

 NA 500 $177.50

 NA 

50



 Rounds 
per                  
Box 

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

Rounds per                  
Case

Bid Price 
per                 

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

 Rounds 
per                  
Box 

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

Rounds 
per                  

Case

Bid Price 
per                 

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

9.30:  .357 SIG 
GSB357SB Golden Saber 
357 SIG 125GR BJHP
REMINGTON or Equal 
Winchester RA357SB 
9.31:  .357 SIG L357S1 
UMC 125GR MC
REMINGTON or Equal 
Winchester Q4309
9.32:  38 SPL L38S11 
130 GR. MC
REMINGTON or Equal 
Winchester Q4171
9.33:  45 Auto L45AP4 
UMC 45 ACP 230GR. 
MC
REMINGTON or Equal 
Winchester Q4170
9.34:  45 Auto GS45APB
REMINGTON or Equal 
Winchester RA45B     
9.35:  12 GA. RR12BK8-
00 2 3/4" Buckshot 8 
pellets reduced recoil
REMINGTON or Equal 
Winchester RA120085  
9.36:  12 GA. RR12RSB 
12 GA 2 3/4" Foster slug 
reduced recoil
REMINGTON or Equal 
Winchester RA12RS15   

60

60

 $  114.00 

 Precision Delta Corporation 
50

500

120-180 

NA 500  $  129.00 

Description                             Lawson 
Number

NA 500  $  117.00 180 +

500

NA 250  $  125.00 120-180 

180 +

NA No Bid

No Bid12975 No Bid

12974

 $  250.00 180 +

NA

5

No Bid5 120-180 

50  $   307.20 

250

 $  220.00 NA5012973 No Bid No Bid

 $       15.36 10005012972

 No Bid 

12971 50  $       15.26 1000  $   305.20 

12970 50  No Bid 

NA
 TXAT LLC 

12969  No Bid  No Bid 

50

500

 $  175.00 180 +



 Bid               
Price                            
per              

Round           

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

Rounds per                  
Case

Bid Price 
per                 

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

 Bid               
Price              
per   

Round           

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

Bid                     
Price                        
per                  

Case

Rounds 
per     

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

9.37:  12 GA. GC127 2 
3/4" 7 1/2 target loads
REMINGTON or Equal 
AGUILA 1CHB1357
9.38:  R30301 Core-Lokt, 
30-30 win. 150 gr. SPCL.
REMINGTON or Equal 
Winchester X30306BP 
9.39:  Blank Popper, 
Winchester 12 GA. 2 3/4" 
smokeless power
REMINGTON or Equal 
Winchester  XP12   

 TXAT LLC 
60

 Precision Delta Corporation 

Description                             Lawson 
Number

No Bid

25 250 $ 0.20600  $         5.16  $     51.60 120-180 

12977 No Bid20 NA 20  $  198.00 120-180 

12976 25  $    62.00 

12978 25

NA

25  $  112.00 180+NA
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Controlling
Name of Interested Party

4
Nature of interest

City, State, Country (place of business)
Intermediary

(check applicable)

CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES 1295FORM
1 of 1

1

OFFICE USE ONLY

2 01/12/2021

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place
of business.
Precision Delta Corporation
Ruleville, MS United States
Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is
being filed.

Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

3

Fort Bend County

Ammunition
B21-046

2021-705179

02/09/2021

Date Filed:

Date Acknowledged:

Certificate Number:

CERTIFICATION OF FILING

6

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

My name is _______________________________________________________________,

UNSWORN DECLARATION

Check only if there is NO Interested Party.5
X

My address is _______________________________________________, _______________________,

and my date of birth is _______________________.

Executed in ________________________________________County,

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

(street) (state) (zip code) (country)

(year)(month)

 _______, ______________, _________.

State of ________________, on the _____day of ___________, 20_____.

(city)

(Declarant)

Version V1.1.ceffd98awww.ethics.state.tx.usForms provided by Texas Ethics Commission



Controlling
Name of Interested Party

4
Nature of interest

City, State, Country (place of business)
Intermediary

(check applicable)

CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES 1295FORM
1 of 1

1

OFFICE USE ONLY

2 02/02/2021

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place
of business.
TXAT LLC
Houston, TX United States
Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is
being filed.

Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

3

Fort Bend County

Ammunition
B21-046

2021-712860

02/09/2021

Date Filed:

Date Acknowledged:

Certificate Number:

CERTIFICATION OF FILING

TXAT LLC XHouston, TX United States

6

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

My name is _______________________________________________________________,

UNSWORN DECLARATION

Check only if there is NO Interested Party.5

My address is _______________________________________________, _______________________,

and my date of birth is _______________________.

Executed in ________________________________________County,

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

(street) (state) (zip code) (country)

(year)(month)

 _______, ______________, _________.

State of ________________, on the _____day of ___________, 20_____.

(city)

(Declarant)

Version V1.1.ceffd98awww.ethics.state.tx.usForms provided by Texas Ethics Commission
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