3310 Alice Street
Houston, TX 77021

Q R e I 2 Dyne® e o

www.reladyne.com

Fort Bend County
Purchasing Department
Travis Annex

301 Jackson,Suite 201
Richmond, Texas 77469

July 1,2019

Per Hurt/Reladyne contract with Fort Bend County Bid 19-034 General Requirements;1.35 escalation clause.
Hurt/Reladyne is requesting Commissioners Court approval to increase the contract price for awarded items.
| have attached a copy of price increase and increases from Reladyne suppliers as proof of increase,

Thank You,

Crayton MNelson

Consultant

713-826-2602
crayton.nelson@reladyne.com

Reladyne

Reliability in Motion.



A.JL.Hurt,Jr. Inc dba Reladyne
BED 19-034
Term Contract for Oil and Lubricants
August 1,2019

SECTION 10.1:CHEVRON PRODUCTS 4/1/2019 Percent  |Proposed

SAE 10W30 CJ-4/SM Delo 400 XLE Lawson Price Increase |{Price 08/01/2019
Per Quart in Quart Container 12573 |1 3§ 4.99 14% |3 5.69
Per Gallon in | Gallon Bottle 12574 | $ 13.83 14% $ 15.77
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 12575 | $ 12.55 14% |$ 14.31

Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 12576 | $ 12.16 14% 3 13.86
SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 Delo 400

Per Quart in Quart Container 1289 | § 3.79 14% 3 432
Per Gallon in 1 gallon Bottle 5341 $ 13.56 14% $ 15.46
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 1290 | 3 11.75 14% $ 13.40
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 5342 1'$ 10.88 4% |$ 12.40
Per Gallon in Bulk 5343 3 10.00 14% $ 11.40
SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 Delo 400 XLE

Per Quart in Quart Container 1280 1 § 4.99 14% |[$ 5.69
Per Gallon in 1 gallon Bottle 5341 |1 $ 19.69 14% |$ 22.45

Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 1290 | § 11.48 14% $ 13.09
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 5342 | $ 11.09 14% $ 12.64

Per Gallon in Bulk 5343 1'% 10.35 4% | $ 11.80
SAE 10 Delo 400

Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 3 13.76 14% $ 15.69
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum $ 12.50 14% | % 14.25

SAE 30 Delo 400

Per Quart in Quart Container 1305 | % 3.83 14% |[§ 4.37

Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 1306 $ 12.79 14% $ 14.58

Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 1307 | % 11.24 14% $ 12.81

SAE 50 Heavy Duty Drive Train (Meets Cat’s requiring TO-4 Fluids)Chevron Delo TorqForce 50

Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 1352 | § 1079 14% |S 12.30
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 1353 1'% 10.01 14% 3 11.41

Hydraulic Oil 150-46 (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-268-S)Chevron Hyd AW Lawson

Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 1330 | § 8.71 14% |$ 9.93

Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 1331 $ 7.32 14% $ 8.34

Per Gallon in Bulk 1332 | § 6.16 14% |$ 7.02

Hydraulic Oil AW 68 (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-286-S) Chevronn Hyd AW

Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 1359 | $ 8.71 14% $ 9.93

Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 1360 | § 7.32 14% $ 8.34
TDH Hydraulic/Tractor Fluid (Case MS-1207, John Deere J20C)Chevron 1000 Tractor Fluid

Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 5352 $ 11.36 14% 3 12.95

Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 5353 3 10.74 14% $ 12.24

Grease Chevron Ultra-Duty EP2

Per Tube 1380 1§ 355| 14% |$ 4.05

Per 120# Container 1382 | § 43050 | 14% |$ 490.77




Gear Oil 85-140 GL-5 Chevron Multigear EP-5
Per 35#Container 1383 1§ 95.07 14% |[$ 108.38
Gear 0Oil ,Universal 85-140 GL-5 Chevron MultiGear EP-5
Per 35# Container 13336 | $ 95.07 6% $ 108.38
SECTION 10.2: PHILLIPS 66 4/1/2019 Percent  |Proposed
SAE 5w-20 SN,GF-5 Shield Choice SW-20
Per Quart in Quart Container 3355 1 $ 2.86 20% $ 3.43
SAE 5w-30 SN,GF-5 Shield Choice SW-30
Per Quart in Quart Container 5358 | § 2.87 20% $ 3.44
SAE 10W-30 SN,GF-5 Shield Choice 10W-30
Per Quart in Quart Container 1369 1'% 247 20% |$ 2.96
SAE 10W30 CK-4 GUARDOL FE
Per Quart in Quart Container $ 4.43 20% | $ 5.32
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle $ 16.99 20% $ 20.39
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail $ 10.81 20% 3 12.97
Per Gailon in 55 Gallon Drum $ 11.24 20% 3 13.49
Per Gallon in Bulk $ 9.58 20% $ 11.50
SAE 15W-40,CK-4 GUARDOL ECT Syn Blend 15W-40
Per Quart in Quart Container 1293 $ 4.42 20% $ 5.30
Per Gallon in 1 Galion Bottle 5367 | % 13.70 20% 3 16.44
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 1294 1§ 1057 20% |3 12.68
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 1295 1 % 1069 20% |$ 12.83
Per Gallon in Bulk 5368 1§ 9.34 20% $ 11.21
SAE 10 Phillips 66
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 1302 | § 17.66 0% |9 21.19
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 1303 1% 9.58 20% 3 11.50
SAE 30 Phillps 66
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 5371 $ 12.11 20% 3 14.53
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 5372 1% 11.75 20% $ 14.10
SAE 50 Heavy Duty Drive Train (Meets Cat’s requiring TO-4 Fluids)PH66 HT-4 50
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum ﬁ 1356 | § 1279 20% |$ 15.35
Synthetic Transoil 50 GL 5§ MP 1(Eaton Roadranger PS -164 Rev 6)
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail | 531 | § 1854 | 20% |$ 22.25
Mercon V Automatic Transmission Fluid(Versatrans ATF)
Per Quart in Quart Container [ 1402 | § 519 20% |$ 6.23
Hydraulic Oil ISO-46 (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-268-S)PHG66 Hyd AW 46
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 1333 1 § 8.71 20% $ 10.45
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 1334 | § 7.32 | 20% $ 8.78
Hydraulic Oil AW 68 (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-286-S) PH 66 Hydraulic AW 68
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 5423 3 7.29 20% $ 8.75
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 5424 | $ 6.08 20% $ 7.30
TDH Oil Hydraulic/Tractor Fluid (Case MS-1207, John Deere J20C)PH66
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 5386 | § 8.63 20% $ 10.36
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 5387 | $ 7.78 20% $ 9.34
Per Gallon in Bulk 5388 $ 7.41 20% $ 8.89
Grease NLGI GGC-LB Calcium Sulfonate,PH66 Omniguard #2 Tt
Per Tube,in case lot 1387 | 3§ 415 20% $ 4.98
Per 35# Container 1388 1 % 149.33 | 20% $ 179.20
Per 120# Container 1389 | $ 502.32 20% $ 602.78
- 140 GL-S/MP-1 PH66 MP Gear Lube 85W-140
Per 35# Container 5389 1 % 74.34 20% $ 89.21
Per 120# Container 5390 | $ 280.80 20% $ 336.96
Dexron VI Automatic Transmission Fluid(Versatrans LV ATF)
Per Quart in Quart Container 10399 § $ 5.02 20% $ 6.02
Section 10.3: ANTIFREEZE
List brand: Chevron Havoline Universal Antifreeze/Coolant
Multi-Vehicle Antifreeze, concentrated Total




Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Pail 7690 | $ 11.24 14% $ 12.81
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 7691 | § 11.54 14% |8 13.16
Subsection 10.3.2

List brand: Chevron Havoline Universal Antifreeze/Coolant

Multi-Vehicle Antifreeze, ready-to-use

Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Pail 9036 |$ 056| 14% |$ 10.90
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 9037 | $ 8.21 14% $ 9.36
Section 10.4: GENERIC

Subsection 10.4.1: Chevron Products or Equal

Brand:SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 Delo 400/AllFleet Syn Blend 15W-40

Per Quart in Quart Container 13337 | § 3.10 14% |$ 3.53
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13338 | § 8.40 14% $ 9.58
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13339 | § 7.35 14% $ 8.38
Per Gallon in Bulk 13340 | § 658 | 14% |$ 7.50
|Brand: Hydranlic Oil IS0-46 (Denison HF-2, Vickers I-268-S)ALLFLEET PREM AW 46

Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13341 $ 6.00 14% $ 6.84
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13342 | § 563 14% $ 6.42
Brand: Hydraulic Oil ISO-68 (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-268-S)ALLFLEET PREM AW 68

Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13344 1§ 638 14% |§ 727
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13345 | § 6.00 14% |$ 6.84
TDH Hydraulic/Tractor Fluid (Case MS-1207, John Deere J20C)ARM Economy Tractor Hyd

Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13346 | B 7.21 14% $ 8.22
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13347 | § 6.30 14% $ 7.18
Per Gallon in Bulk 13348 | § 5.25 14% $ 5.99
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Wayne Ederer Chevron Lubricants

Chewron Products Company
) Manager, 55 5 Main Street
Lubricants Marketers, Suite 390
Sales i

Maperville, IL 60540

Tel: 830-28B-4004

Fax 630-388-4001
Waynseder@chevron com

April 19, 2019

Dear Valued Chevron Lubrication Marketer:

Chevron is updating its previously announced general price increase of up to 6% that was to be effective as of
May 6, 2019. Now, effective May 29, 2019, there will be a general price increase of up to 14% on all lubricating
oils and greases. In certain instances, specific products may increase in amounts that are outside of this range.
This change is refated to higher than expected increases in costs of raw materials impacting the manufacturing of
our products and will avoid the burden associated with administering two price increases.

We understand and appreciate the efforts required by our Marketers to communicate this increase to your
customers. Our posted price changes by material will be availabie in Business Point by Tuesday April 23™,2019.

Please note:

e To manage our order fulfiiiment and to provide the ability to meet the neads of all our customers, we wauld
appreciate that you place your orders consistent with historical order patterns. To serve all Marketers, we will
be limiting orders delivered between March 25" and May 28" to 110% of your average monthly volume over
the last twelve months. Marketers that exceed the above limit will be billed at the new posted price levels via
debit note for the difference between the current prices and new effective prices as of May 29" 2019.

s Your average monthiy valume is defined as your average monthly purchases from March 1%, 20180
February 28™, 2019. Details regarding your average monthly volume are available to you through your LBST
Cusiomer Sales Associate.

e Please plan accordingly as large order guantities placed the week prior to the increase will be reviewed and
may not be accepted by Chevran to better meet ali customers’ needs.

The Chevron Lubricants sales staff is committed to mesting your needs. Your Business Consultant will
contact you with more details and supporting information.

As always, thank you for your business.
Sincerely,

WR € dvw_

Wayne Ederer
Manager — Lubrication Marketers

This document may contain confidential information and is intended only for the use of the parties to whom it is addressed. If you
are not an intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution or use of any information in this
document is strictty prohibited. If you have received this document in error, please nolify the sender immediately at the e-mail
address indicated above,



April 23, 2019

Dear Phillips 66 Lubricants Marketer,

This letter is to advise you that Phillips 66% Lubricants will raise finished lubricants
prices up to 14% with an effective date of Wednesday, May 29, 2019. Pricing will
be evaluated on a product-by-product basis, and individual products may fall
outside of the price increase amount. This change is driven by recent increases in
raw material costs that have occurred despite our best efforts to limit their impact
on our product manufacturing.

We realize price increases impact both you and your customers. This notice is
intended to allow reasonable time for you to communicate to your customers. Your
prices will be available on Lubestream the week ending May 17, 2019.

Phillips 66 Lubricants remains committed to providing our customers with high
quality products at competitive prices. As always, we thank you for your continued
business, support and understanding.

Sincerely,

llr,J'J
gf(’.f AN

Dirk Macfarlane
Manager, Finished Lubricants

This document may contain confidential information and is intended only for the use of the
parties to whom it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby
notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution, or use of any information in this
document is strictly prohibited. If you have received this document in error, please natify
the sender.

CA, MX, All Export

CONTACT SUPPORT



6/19/2019 marketing.phillips66lubricants.com/index.php/email/emailVWebview

April 1, 2019

Dear Phillips 66 Lubricants Marketers,

This letter is to advise you that Phillips 66% Lubricants will raise finished lubricants
prices up to 6% with an effective date of Monday, May 6, 2019. Pricing will be
evaluated on a product-by-product basis and individual products may fall outside of
the price increase amount. This change is driven by recent increases in raw
material costs that have occurred despite our best efforts to limit their impact on our
product manufacturing.

We realize this price increase impacts both you and your customers. The advance
notice provided is intended to allow reasonable time for you to communicate to
your customers, as needed. Segment-specific price increases will be provided the
week ending April 26, 2019. New customer-specific prices and list prices
incorporating this increase will be available for download on Lubestream shortly
thereafter.

We expect increased demand prior to the price change. To ensure a fair order
fulfillment process, we will limit the volume Marketers can purchase to 110% of
their monthly base volume delivered from Friday, April 5, 2019, to Sunday,

May 5, 2019. Individual base volumes will be based on the average monthly
volume purchased during the period of March 2018 through February 2019 with
some products excluded from the base volume calculations. Any volume
purchased in excess of base volumes will be priced at the price increase amount.
Please contact your Territory Manager with any questions about your base volume.

To fairly meet the needs of all customers, we ask that Marketers place orders
consistent with the historical needs of their customers. Phillips 66 Lubricants
reserves the right to limit purchases of any product if deemed to be excessive.

Phillips 66 Lubricants remains committed to providing our customers with high
quality products at competitive prices. As always, we thank you for your continued
business, support and understanding.

Sincerely,

7
Mj}:ﬁ,{ A

marketing phiflips66lubricants. comfindex phplemailiemaifVebview 1/2



Fort Bend County Pricing Form
BID 19-034
Term Contract for Oil and Lubricants
Term: 1 April 2019 through 31 March 2020

Awarded 3/12/19:

Sections 10.1, 10.2 and 10.4 to Low Bidder per Item and Section 10.3 to Low Bidder per Subsection

Oil and Lubricants Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC Dallas Houston
Houston
Section 10.1: CHEVRON PRODUCTS Form 1295
SAE 10W30 CJ-4/SM Delo 400 XLE Yes Yes Yes
Per Quart in Quart Container 12573 $ 4.99 No Bid| $ 7.75
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle 12574 $ 13.83 No Bid| $ 20.85
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 12575 $ 12.55 No Bid| $ 19.32
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 12576 $ 12.16 No Bid| $ 16.70
SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 Delo 400 Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart in Quart Container 1289 $ 3.79 No Bid| $ 5.96
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle 5341 $ 13.56 No Bid| $ 19.85
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 1290 $ 11.75 No Bid| $ 18.95
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 5342 $ 10.88 No Bid| $ 15.39
Per Gallon in Bulk 5343 $ 10.00 No Bid| $ 13.16
SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 Delo 400 XLE Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart in Quart Container 13808 $ 4.99 No Bid N/A
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle 13809 | $ 19.69 No Bid| $ 30.86
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13810 $ 11.48 No Bid| $ 25.60
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13811 | $ 11.09 No Bid| $ 16.70
Per Gallon in Bulk 13812 $ 10.35 No Bid| $ 14.45
SAE 10 Delo 400 Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13813 $ 13.76 No Bid| $ 28.68
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13814 $ 12.50 No Bid| $ 19.63
SAE 30 Delo 400 Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart in Quart Container 1305 $ 3.83 No Bid| $ 5.99
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 1306 $ 12.79 No Bid| $ 18.12
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 1307 $ 11.24 No Bid| $ 15.67




Section 10.1: CHEVRON PRODUCTS (cont'd)

SAE 50 Heavy Duty Drive Train (Meets Cat’s TO-4 Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Specifications) Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 1352 $ 10.78 No Bid| $ 15.18
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 1353 $ 10.01 No Bid| $ 14.13
Hydraulic Oil 1SO-46 (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-268-S) Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 1330 $ 8.71 No Bid| $ 9.80
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 1331 $ 7.32 No Bid| $ 8.00
Per Gallon in Bulk 1332 $ 6.16 No Bid| $ 6.80
Hydraulic Oil AW 68 (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-286-S) Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 1359 $ 8.71 No Bid| $ 9.80
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 1360 $ 7.32 No Bid| $ 8.00
TDH Hydraulic/Tractor Fluid (Case MS-1207, John Deere Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
J20C) Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 5352 $ 11.36 No Bid| $ 23.68
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 5353 $ 10.74 No Bid| $ 13.61
Per Gallon in Bulk 5354 $ 10.58 No Bid| $ 9.64
Grease Ultra-Duty EP2 Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Tube 1380 $ 3.55 No Bid| $ 3.75
Per 35# Container 1381 $ 132.56 No Bid| $ 132.30
Per 120# Container 1382 $ 430.50 No Bid| $ 450.00
Gear Oil 85-140 GL-5 Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart in Quart Container NA No Bid NA
Per 35# Container 1383 $ 95.07 No Bid| $ 99.05
Gear Oil, Universal 85-140 GL-5 Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per 35# Container 13336 $ 95.07 No Bid| $ 99.05




Section 10.2: CONOCO/PHILLIPS

SAE 5W-20 SM, GF-4 76 Super Synthetic Blend Motor QOil Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart, in Quart Container 5355 $ 2.86 No Bid No Bid
SAE 5W-30 SM, GF-4 76 Super Synthetic Blend Motor Oil Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart, in Quart Container 5358 $ 2.87 No Bid No Bid
SAE 10W-30 SM, GF-4 76 Super Synthetic Blend Motor Oil | Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart, in Quart Container 1369 $ 2.47 No Bid No Bid
SAE 10W-30 Guardol FE Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart, in Quart Container 13815 $ 4.43 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Pail 13816 $ 16.99 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13817 $ 10.81 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13818 $ 11.24 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in Bulk 13819 $ 9.58 No Bid No Bid
SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 SM Guardol ECT Synthetic Blend Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart, in Quart Container 1293 $ 4.42 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Pail 5367 $ 13.70 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 1294 $ 10.57 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 1295 $ 10.69 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in Bulk 5368 $ 9.34 No Bid No Bid
SAE 10W 76 T5X 10 Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 1302 $ 17.66 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 1303 $ 9.58 No Bid No Bid
SAE 30 76 T5X 30 Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 5371 $ 12.11 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 5372 $ 11.75 No Bid No Bid
SAE 50 Heavy Duty Drive Train 76 HT-4 50 (Meets Cat’s Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
TO-4 Specification) Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail NA No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 1356 $ 12.79 No Bid No Bid




Section 10.2: CONOCO/PHILLIPS (cont'd)

Synthetic Transoil 50 GL-1/MP-1 (Eaton Roadranger PS- Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
164 Rev 7) Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13820 $ 18.54 No Bid No Bid
Mercon V Automatic Transmission Fluid Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart, in Quart Container 1402 $ 5.19 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail NA No Bid No Bid
Hydraulic Oil 1SO-46 (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-268-S) Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 1333 $ 6.69 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 1334 $ 6.32 No Bid No Bid
Hydraulic Oil AW 68 (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-286-S) Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 5423 $ 7.29 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 5424 $ 6.08 No Bid No Bid
TDH Oil Hydraulic/Tractor Fluid (Case MS-1207, John Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Deere J20C) Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 5386 $ 8.63 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 5387 $ 7.78 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in Bulk 5388 $ 7.41 No Bid No Bid
Grease NLGI GC-LB Calcium Sulfonate Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Tube, in Case lot 1387 $ 4.15 No Bid No Bid
Per 35# Container 1388 $ 149.33 No Bid No Bid
Per 120# Container 1389 $ 502.32 No Bid No Bid
Gear Oil 85-140 GL-5/MP-1 76 MP Gear Lube Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart, in Quart Container NA No Bid No Bid
Per 35# Container 5389 $ 74.34 No Bid No Bid
Per 120# Container 5390 $ 280.80 No Bid No Bid
Mercon VI Automatic Transmission Fluid Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart, in Quart Container 10399 $ 5.02 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail NA No Bid No Bid
ATF+4 Transmission Fluid Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart, in Quart Container NA No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail NA No Bid No Bid




Section 10.2: CONOCO/PHILLIPS (cont'd)

Dexron VI Automatic Transmission Fluid Lawson | A.J. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart, in Quart Container 10032 $ 5.02 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail NA No Bid No Bid
Gear Oil 75W-90 Synthetic Lawson | A.J. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart, in Quart Container NA No Bid No Bid
Per 35# Container NA No Bid No Bid
Gear Oil 75W-140 Synthetic Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart, in Quart Container NA No Bid No Bid
Per 35# Container NA No Bid No Bid




Section 10.3: ANTIFREEZE
Subsection 10.3.1

Multi-Vehicle Antifreeze, concentrated Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
CHV UNIVERSAL A/F CONCENTRATE
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle 7690 $ 11.12 No Bid 13.42
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 7691 $ 11.54 No Bid 17.30
Subsection 10.3.2
Multi-Vehicle Antifreeze, ready-to-use Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
CHV UNIVERSAL 50/50 AF
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle 9036 $ 9.56 No Bid 10.50
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 9037 $ 8.21 No Bid 8.70




Section 10.4: GENERIC
Subsection 10.4.1 Chevron Products or Equal to

SAE 10W30 CJ-4/SM Delo 400 XLE Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
PERFORMANCE PLUS
Per Quart in Quart Container No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle 13822 No Bid[ $ 13.57 No Bid
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13823 No Bid| $ 11.43 No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13824 No Bid| $ 11.04 No Bid
SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 Delo 400 Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
ALLFLEET SYN BLEND 15W40
Per Quart in Quart Container 13337 $ 3.10| $ 12.64 No Bid
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13338 $ 8.40| $ 8.89 No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13339 | $ 7.35| $ 8.58 No Bid
Per Gallon in Bulk 13340 [ $ 6.58| $ 7.06 No Bid
SAE 30 Delo 400 Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart in Quart Container No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid
SAE 50 Heavy Duty Drive Train (Meets Cat’s requiring TO-| Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
4 Fluids) Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
PERFORMANCE PLUS
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13825 No Bid[ $ 13.75 No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13826 No Bid| $ 12.64 No Bid
Hydraulic Oil 1SO-46 (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-268-S) Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail, ALLFLEET PRM AW 46 13341 [ $ 6.00( $ 6.52 No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum, ALLFLEET PRM AW 46 13342 | $ 5.63| $ 6.06 No Bid
Per Gallon in Bulk, PERFORMANCE PLUS 13343 [ $ 4971 $ 4.88 No Bid
Hydraulic Oil AW 68 (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-286-S) Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
ALLFLEET PRM AW 68
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13344 | $ 6.38] $ 6.76 No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13345 $ 6.00] $ 6.21 No Bid
TDH Hydraulic/Tractor Fluid (Case MS-1207, John Deere Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
J20C) Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
ARM ECON TRACTOR HYD
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13346 | $ 721 $ 7.88 No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13347 $ 6.30] $ 7.12 No Bid
Per Gallon in Bulk 13348 | $ 525| $ 5.77 No Bid




Subsection 10.4.1 Chevron Products or Equal to (cont'd)

Grease Ultra-Duty EP2 Lawson | A.J. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Tube No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per 35# Container No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per 120# Container No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gear Oil 85-140 GL-5 Lawson [ A.J. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per 35# Container No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gear Oil, Universal 85-140 GL-5 Lawson [ A.J. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per 35# Container No Bid No Bid No Bid




Subsection 10.4.2: Conoco/Phillips or Equal to

SAE 5W-20 SM, GF-4 76 Super Synthetic Blend Motor QOil Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
DURAMAX SB 5W20
Per Quart, in Quart Container 13349 $ 1.77] $ 1.92 No Bid
SAE 5W-30 SM, GF-4 76 Super Synthetic Blend Motor Oil Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
DURAMAX SB 5W30
Per Quart, in Quart Container 13350 $ 1.84| $ 1.92 No Bid
SAE 10W-30 SM, GF-4 76 Super Synthetic Blend Motor Oil | Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
DURAMAX SB 10W30
Per Quart, in Quart Container 13351 $ 1.77] $ 1.92 No Bid
SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 SM Guardol ECT Synthetic Blend Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
ALLFLEET SB 15W40
Per Quart, in Quart Container 13352 $ 3.10] $ 3.16 No Bid
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Pail 13353 $ 9.44] $ 9.50 No Bid
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13354 | $ 8.40| $ 8.89 No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13355 $ 7.35] $ 8.58 No Bid
SAE 10W 76 T5X 10 Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
CHEVRON URSA HYD 10W
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13356 $ 11.23 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13357 $ 10.46 No Bid No Bid
SAE 30 76 T5X 30 Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13358 $ 17.95 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13359 $ 11.33 No Bid No Bid
SAE 50 Heavy Duty Drive Train 76 HT-4 50 (Meets Cat’s Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
TO-4 Specification) Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail, CHVY TORQFORCE 50 13360 $ 10.78| $ 13.75 No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13361 $ 10.01] $ 11.93 Vendor withdrew
Synthetic Transoil 50 GL-1/MP-1 (Eaton Roadranger PS- Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
164 Rev 7) Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
CHV DELO SYN-TRANS HD SAE 50
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13362 $ 34.46 No Bid No Bid




Subsection 10.4.2: Conoco/Phillips or Equal to (cont'd)

Mercon V Automatic Transmission Fluid Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
DURAMAX GLOBAL SYN ATF
Per Quart, in Quart Container 13363 $ 3.03 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13364 [ $ 11.20 No Bid No Bid
Hydraulic Oil 1SO-46 (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-268-S) Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
ALLFLEET PRM AW 46
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13365 $ 6.00( $ 6.52 No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13366 [ $ 5.63]| $ 5.76 No Bid
Hydraulic Oil AW 68 (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-286-S) Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail, ALLFLEET PRM AW 68 13367 [ $ 6.38 $ 6.52 No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum, PERFORMANCE PLUS 13368 $ 6.00] $ 5.76 No Bid
TDH Qil Hydraulic/Tractor Fluid (Case MS-1207, John Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Deere J20C) Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
ARM ECON TRACTOR HYD FLD
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13369 [ $ 721 $ 7.67 No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13370 $ 6.30( $ 7.23 No Bid
Per Gallon in Bulk 13371 [ $ 525| % 5.71 No Bid
Grease NLGI GC-LB Calcium Sulfonate Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Tube, in Case lot No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per 35# Container No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per 120# Container No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gear Oil 85-140 GL-5/MP-1 76 MP Gear Lube Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per 35# Container NA No Bid No Bid
Per 120# Container NA No Bid No Bid
Mercon VI Automatic Transmission Fluid Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
DURAMAX GLOBAL SYN ATF
Per Quart, in Quart Container 13372 $ 3.03 No Bid No Bid
ATF+4 Transmission Fluid Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
DURAMAX GLOBAL SYN ATF
Per Quart, in Quart Container 13827 $ 3.03 No Bid No Bid




Subsection 10.4.2: Conoco/Phillips or Equal to (cont'd)

Dexron VI Automatic Transmission Fluid Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
DURAMAX GLOBAL SYN ATF
Per Quart, in Quart Container 13373 $ 3.03 No Bid No Bid
Gear Oil 75W-90 Synthetic Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart, in Quart Container No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gear Oil 75W-140 Synthetic Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart, in Quart Container No Bid No Bid No Bid

Atlantic Petroleum - Disqualified: Altered Pricing Form, and No required forms provided with response.
Houston Pasadena Apache Oil Company - Disqualified: No required forms provided with response.
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