


Description Caldwell 
Country 

Chevrolet    
Caldwell

Caldwell 
Country Ford    

Caldwell

Classic 
Chevrolet 

Sugar Land

Grapevine 
DCJ                         

Grapevine

Helfman 
Dodge                      

Houston

Helfman Ford             
Stafford

Proposed 
numbers for 

2019

Vehicle 3: Truck, 1/2 ton, Ext Cab,  SWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power (windows, 
locks), TTP

$21,998.00 $25,050.00 $23,959.00 Disqualiied:  
Does not meet 

minimum 
specifications

No Bid $22,477.22                               
within 3% from 
a local vendor

pursuant to 
§271.905

Vehicle 4: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, Crew Cab, SWB, with Hard Cover, Cloth Bucket, 
No Console,  Power (windows, locks, mirrors), TTP

$26,588.00 $32,216.00 $27,449.00 Disqualiied:  
Does not meet 

minimum 
specifications

No Bid $25,850.50 

Vehicle 5: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, Crew Cab, SWB, Cloth Bucket,  Power 
(windows, locks, mirrors),  TTP

$24,985.00 $26,569.00 $30,665.00 Disqualiied:  
Does not meet 

minimum 
specifications

No Bid $24,723.00 

Vehicle 6: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, Crew Cab, SWB, Cloth Bucket, No Console, 
Power (windows, locks, mirrors),  TTP

$24,975.00 $31,316.00 $26,355.00 Disqualiied:  
Does not meet 

minimum 
specifications

No Bid $24,723.00 

Vehicle 7: Truck, 1/2 ton, Reg Cab,  LWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power (windows, 
locks), TTP

$21,810.00 $24,239.00 $22,836.00 Disqualiied:  
Does not meet 

minimum 
specifications

No Bid $21,564.97 

Tabulation

Purchase of Vehicles
Bid 18-022

Awarded 10/24/2017:  Low Bidder Per Vehicle

kaminskd
Highlight



Description Caldwell 

Country 

Chevrolet    

Caldwell

Caldwell 

Country Ford    

Caldwell

Classic 

Chevrolet 

Sugar Land

Grapevine 

DCJ                         

Grapevine

Helfman 

Dodge                      

Houston

Helfman Ford             

Stafford

Form 1295 Yes Yes Yes N/A Yes Yes

Vehicle 1: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe with spotlight, without console and dual batteries $30,990.00 No Bid $32,999.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 2: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe with spotlight, console and dual batteries $31,445.00 No Bid $33,219.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 3: Truck, 1/2 ton, Ext Cab,  SWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power (windows, 

locks), TTP

$21,998.00 $25,050.00 $23,959.00 Disqualiied:  

Does not meet 

minimum 

specifications

No Bid $21,929.00 

Vehicle 4: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, Crew Cab, SWB, with Hard Cover, Cloth Bucket, 

No Console,  Power (windows, locks, mirrors), TTP

$26,588.00 $32,216.00 $27,449.00 Disqualiied:  

Does not meet 

minimum 

specifications

No Bid $25,220.00 

Vehicle 5: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, Crew Cab, SWB, Cloth Bucket,  Power 

(windows, locks, mirrors),  TTP

$24,985.00 $26,569.00 $30,665.00 Disqualiied:  

Does not meet 

minimum 

specifications

No Bid $24,120.00 

Vehicle 6: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, Crew Cab, SWB, Cloth Bucket, No Console, 

Power (windows, locks, mirrors),  TTP

$24,975.00 $31,316.00 $26,355.00 Disqualiied:  

Does not meet 

minimum 

specifications

No Bid $24,120.00 

Vehicle 7: Truck, 1/2 ton, Reg Cab,  LWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power (windows, 

locks), TTP

$21,810.00 $24,239.00 $22,836.00 Disqualiied:  

Does not meet 

minimum 

specifications

No Bid $21,039.00 

Tabulation

Purchase of Vehicles

Bid 18-022

Awarded 10/24/2017:  Low Bidder Per Vehicle



CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES
FORM 1295

lof 1

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 If there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

1 Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place
of business.

HELFMAN FORD

Stafford, TX United States

2 Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is
being filed.

FORT BEND COUNTY

OFFICE USE ONLY

CERTIFICATION OF FILING

Certificate Number:

2018-402910

Date Filed:

09/12/2018

Date Acknowledged:

09/25/2018

3 Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

18-022

VEHICLES

Name of Interested Party City, State, Country (place of business)

Nature of interest

(check applicable)

Controlling Intermediary

5 Check only if there is NO Interested Party.
0

6 UNSWORN DECLARATION

My name is and my date of birth is.

My address is.

(street)

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

Executed in County, State of.

(city) (state) (zip code)

on the day of.

(country)

20_

(montti) (year)

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity
(Deciarant)

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission www.ethics.state.tx.us Version Vl.0.6711
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