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OFFICE OF COUNTY PURCHASING AGENT
Fort Bend County, Texas

Term Contract Renewal Form

Solicitation#: Bid 15-023

Title: Term Contract for Vehicle Graphics

Contracted Vendor: Onsite Decals

Mr. or Ms. Burke,

plTe' Spplembar30.20l8 under the same terms and conditionsplease complete the informatton below and return this form along with a Form 1295 bv e-mail tn

FortV will then take the matter before the Commissioner's Court of^^nd County for their consideration. Please respond to this email by Tuesday. Augirst 22.2017. 12:00 PM
^  ̂ renewing our agreement with Fort Bend County under the same terms and conditions.

No, I do not wish to renew our agreement with Fort Bend County.

If Yes, please provide a Form 1295 along with this renewal form by replying to this email.

Effective January 1, 2016 all contracts executed by Commissioners Court, regardless of the dollar amount will

r2252%ST r'°"H T of Interested Putties", pet the new Govennnent Code Statute§2252.908. All vendore suhmittmg a response to a formal Bid, RPP, SOQ or any conttacls, conttact amendments

"f Texas b2
ilttp.s:/'/vvww.ethic.s.statc.tx.us/whatsncw/elf info ibrm 1295 htm

On-line instructions:

Name of governmental entity is to read: Fort Bend County

Identification number used by the governmental entity is: B15-023.

Description is to read: Term Contract for Vehide Graphics

ar^' 'sim'"Mllfn''"™ Tn"" Number and Date Filed, please print the form, have notarized.  Fom 1295 and this Term Conttact Renewal Form to
chervl.kreici/i/Tortbendcoiintvfv ,mv t^enewai horm to

MM7Signatuj^of Autho^^d R^resentativ
Date

IW^irW Ag vx-)r
Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative

19C

9-14-2017 Originals sent to Norma Weaver, Purchasing dept.



Emergency Medical Service                                  Description Lawson 
Number

3M                                           
7125              
and                
680

Oracal                
751/851/951 

and    
5600/5700 

EMS Support Vehicles Front Fenders 11054 1 No Bid * $        152.49

EMS Support Vehicles Front Fender 11055 1 * $        152.49

EMS Support Vehicles Driver Door 11056 1 * $        152.49

EMS Support Vehicles Passenger Door 11057 1 * $        152.49

EMS Support Vehicles Rear Driver Side Door 11058 1 * $        152.49

EMS Support Vehicles Rear Passenger Side Door 11059 1 * $        152.49

EMS Support Vehicles Rear Quarter Panels 11060 1 * $        152.49

EMS Support Vehicles Rear Quarter Panel 11061 1 * $        152.49

EMS Support Vehicles Deck Lid 11062 1 * $        152.49

EMS Support Vehicles Unit Number 11817 1 No Charge

EMS Support Vehicles Title Classificiation 11818 1 No Charge

EMS Support Vehicles Graphic Removal Fee Per Hour 11064 1 80.00$            

EMS Support Vehicles EMS Support Vehicle Full Decal Set 11065 2 ** $   1,422.40

EMS Support Vehicles SUV Rear Set 11066 1 * $        152.49

EMS Support Vehicles Crown Victoria Rear Set 11067 1 * $        152.49

EMS Support Vehicles Design set-up Fee 11063 1 320.00$          

EMS Ambulance Front Fenders 11068 1 * $        332.23

EMS Ambulance Front Fender 11069 1 * $        332.23

EMS Ambulance Driver Door 11070 1 * $        332.23

EMS Ambulance Passenger Door 11071 1 * $        332.23

EMS Ambulance Module Driver Side 11072 1 * $        332.23

EMS Ambulance Module Passenger Side 11073 1 * $        332.23

EMS Ambulance Module Front 11074 1 70.00$            

EMS Ambulance Module Rear Right Door 11075 1 * $        332.23

EMS Ambulance Module Rear Left Door 11076 1 * $        332.23

EMS Ambulance Deck Lid 11077 1 * $        332.23

EMS Ambulance Unit Number Set 11078 1 30.00$            

EMS Ambulance Title Classificiation 11818 1 No Charge

Awarded 10/28/14:  OnSiteDecals, LLC

Estimated 
Annual                                                                                                                                                                                                

Quantity 

OnsiteDecals, LLC 

Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 15-023

Term:  1 November 2014 through 30 September 2015

Vehicle Graphics

Renewal Term:  1 October 2016 through 30 September 2017
Renewal Term:  1 October 2015 through 30 September 2016

** Amended 10.04.16, *Amended 9.22.15



Emergency Medical Service                                  Description Lawson 
Number

3M                                           
7125              
and                
680

Oracal                
751/851/951 

and    
5600/5700 

EMS Ambulance Graphic Removal Fee Per Hour 11080 1 No Bid 80.00$            

EMS Ambulance EMS Ambulance Full Decal Set 11081 4 ** $   3,140.00

EMS Ambulance Design set-up Fee 11079 4 320.00$          
EMS Squad Truck Driver Door 11082 1 * $        164.69

EMS Squad Truck Passenger Door 11083 1 * $        164.69

EMS Squad Truck Rear Driver Side Door 11084 1 * $        164.69

EMS Squad Truck Rear Passenger Side Door 11085 1 * $        164.69

EMS Squad Truck Rear Quarter Panels 11086 1 * $        274.48

EMS Squad Truck Rear Quarter Panel 11087 1 * $        274.48

EMS Squad Truck Deck Lid 11088 1 * $        164.69

EMS Squad Truck Unit Number 11817 1 No Charge

EMS Squad Truck Title Classificiation 11818 1 No Charge

EMS Squad Truck Graphic Removal Fee Per Hour 11090 1 80.00$            

EMS Squad Truck Squad Truck Full Decal Set 11091 1 ** $  1,422.40

EMS Squad Truck Design set-up Fee 11089 1 320.00$          

EMS Roof Unit Number Only 12849 1 ** $       80.00

Constable Precinct 1 Description Lawson 
Number

3M                                           
7125              
and                
680

Oracal                
751/851/951 

and    
5600/5700 

Constable Precinct 1 Front Fenders 11092 1 No Bid 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 1 Front Fender 11093 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 1 Driver Door 11094 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 1 Passenger Door 11095 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 1 Rear Driver Side Door 11096 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 1 Rear Passenger Side Door 11097 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 1 Rear Quarter Panels 11098 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 1 Rear Quarter Panel 11099 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 1 Deck Lid 11100 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 1 Rear Set 11101 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 1 Unit Number 11817 1 No Charge

Constable Precinct 1 Title Classificiation 11818 1 No Charge

Constable Precinct 1 Graphic Removal Fee Per Hour 11103 1 80.00$            

Constable Precinct 1 Constable 1 Full Decal Set 11104
3

** $    500.00

Constable Precinct 1 Design set-up Fee 11102 1 320.00$          

Constable Precinct 1 Roof Unit Number Only 12850 1 ** $     80.00

OnsiteDecals, LLC 
Estimated 

Annual                                                                                                                                                                                                
Quantity 

Estimated 
Annual                                                                                                                                                                                                

Quantity 

OnsiteDecals, LLC 



Constable Precinct 2 Description Lawson 
Number

3M                                           
7125              
and                
680

Oracal                
751/851/951 

and    
5600/5700 

Constable Precinct 2 Front Fenders 11105 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 2 Front Fender 11106 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 2 Driver Door 11107 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 2 Passenger Door 11108 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 2 Rear Driver Side Door 11109 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 2 Rear Passenger Side Door 11110 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 2 Rear Quarter Panels 11111 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 2 Rear Quarter Panel 11112 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 2 Deck Lid 11113 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 2 Rear Set 11114 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 2 Unit Number 11817 1 No Charge

Constable Precinct 2 Title Classificiation 11818 1 No Charge

Constable Precinct 2 Graphic Removal Fee Per Hour 11116 1 80.00$            

Constable Precinct 2 Constable 2 Full Decal Set 11117 2 ** $    500.00

Constable Precinct 2 Design set-up Fee 11115 1 320.00$          

Constable Precinct 2 Roof Unit Number Only 12851 1 ** $       80.00

Constable Precinct 3 Description Lawson 
Number

3M                                           
7125              
and                
680

Oracal                
751/851/951 

and    
5600/5700 

Constable Precinct 3 Front Fenders 11118 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 3 Front Fender 11119 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 3 Driver Door 11120 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 3 Passenger Door 11121 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 3 Rear Driver Side Door 11122 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 3 Rear Passenger Side Door 11123 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 3 Rear Quarter Panels 11124 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 3 Rear Quarter Panel 11125 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 3 Deck Lid 11126 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 3 Rear Set 11127 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 3 Unit Number 11817 1 No Charge

Constable Precinct 3 Title Classificiation 11818 1 No Charge

Constable Precinct 3 Graphic Removal Fee Per Hour 11129 1 80.00$            

Constable Precinct 3 Constable 3 Full Decal Set 11130 1 ** $    500.00

Constable Precinct 3 Design set-up Fee 11128 1 320.00$          

Constable Precinct 3 Roof Unit Number Only 12852 1 ** $      80.00

Estimated 
Annual                                                                                                                                                                                                

Quantity 

No Bid

No Bid

OnsiteDecals, LLC 

OnsiteDecals, LLC 

Estimated 
Annual                                                                                                                                                                                                

Quantity 



Constable Precinct 4                                  Description Lawson 
Number

3M                                           
7125              
and                
680

Oracal                
751/851/951 

and    
5600/5700 

Constable Precinct 4 Front Fenders 11131 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 4 Front Fender 11132 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 4 Driver Door 11133 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 4 Passenger Door 11134 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 4 Rear Driver Side Door 11135 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 4 Rear Passenger Side Door 11136 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 4 Rear Quarter Panels 11137 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 4 Rear Quarter Panel 11138 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 4 Deck Lid 11139 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 4 Rear Set 11140 1 50.00$            

Constable Precinct 4 Unit Number 11817 1 No Charge

Constable Precinct 4 Title Classificiation 11818 1 No Charge

Constable Precinct 4 Graphic Removal Fee Per Hour 11142 1 80.00$            

Constable Precinct 4 Constable 4 Full Decal Set 11143 4 ** $   500.00

Constable Precinct 4 Design set-up Fee 11141 1 320.00$          

Constable Precinct 4 Roof Unit Number Only 12853 1 ** $      80.00

Estimated 
Annual                                                                                                                                                                                                

Quantity 

No Bid

OnsiteDecals, LLC 



Sheriff's Office Description Lawson 
Number

3M                                           
7125              
and                
680

Oracal                
751/851/951 

and    
5600/5700 

Sheriff's Office Front Fenders 11144 3 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Front Fender 11145 2 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Front Fenders 2 " Subdivision Name 11819 2 21.00$            

Sheriff's Office Front Fender 2 " Subdivision Name 11820 2 21.00$            

Sheriff's Office Front Fenders 2 " Mud 11821 2 21.00$            

Sheriff's Office Front Fender 2 " Mud 11822 2 21.00$            

Sheriff's Office Driver Door 11146 4 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Passenger Door 11147 2 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Rear Driver Side Door 11148 3 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Rear Passenger Side Door 11149 3 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Rear Quarter Panels 11150 1 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Rear Quarter Panel 11151 3 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Truck Front Fender, Livestock 11152 1 100.00$          

Sheriff's Office Truck Passenger Door, Livestock 11153 1 100.00$          

Sheriff's Office Truck Rear Passenger Door, Livestock  11154 1 100.00$          

Sheriff's Office Truck Rear Quarter Panel, Livestock 11155 1 100.00$          

Sheriff's Office Trailer Full Decal Set 11823 1 ** $     140.00

Sheriff's Office Trailer Sides 11824 1 15.00$            

Sheriff's Office Trailer Side 11825 1 15.00$            

Sheriff's Office Trailer Back Decals 11826 1 30.00$            

Sheriff's Office Trailer Back Decal 11827 1 30.00$            

Sheriff's Office Deck Lid 11156 1 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Rear Set 11157 1 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Unit Number 11817 1 No Charge

Sheriff's Office Title Classificiation 11818 1 No Charge

Sheriff's Office Graphic Removal Fee Per Hour 11159 1 80.00$            

Sheriff's Office Magnetic Patch 11160 1 25.00$            

Sheriff's Office Roof Unit Numbers 18" 11161 1 30.00$            

Sheriff's Office Windshield Numbers 1 1/2" 11828 1 No Charge

Sheriff's Office Windshield 3" Letters 11162 1 10.00$            

Sheriff's Office Sheriff's Office Full Decal Set Color 11163
20

** $    500.00

Sheriff's Office Design set-up Fee 11158 1 320.00$          

No Bid

OnsiteDecals, LLC 
Estimated 

Annual                                                                                                                                                                                                
Quantity 



Sheriff's Office (cont'd) Description Lawson 
Number

3M                                           
7125              
and                
680

Oracal                
751/851/951 

and    
5600/5700 

Sheriff's Office Front Fenders Ghost 11164 3 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Front Fender Ghost 11165 2 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Driver Door Ghost 11166 4 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Passenger Door Ghost 11167 2 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Rear Driver Side Door Ghost 11168 3 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Rear Passenger Side Door Ghost 11169 3 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Rear Quarter Panels Ghost 11170 1 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Rear Quarter Panel Ghost 11171 3 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Rear Set Ghost 11172 1 50.00$            

Sheriff's Office Unit Number Ghost 11829 1 No Charge

Sheriff's Office Title Classificiation Ghost 11830 1 No Charge

Sheriff's Office Magnetic Patch Ghost 11173 1 25.00$            

Sheriff's Office Roof Unit Numbers 18" Ghost 11174 1 30.00$            

Sheriff's Office Ghost Full Set 12422 1 ** $     500.00

Sheriff's Office Roof Unit Number Only 12854 1 ** $       80.00

No Bid

Estimated 
Annual                                                                                                                                                                                                

Quantity 

OnsiteDecals, LLC 



Office of Emergency 
Management

Description Lawson 
Number

3M                                           
7125              
and                
680

Oracal                
751/851/951 

and    
5600/5700 

OEM Autos Front Fender 11176 1 50.00$            

OEM Autos Driver Door 11177 1 50.00$            

OEM Autos Passenger Door 11178 1 50.00$            

OEM Autos Rear Driver Side Door 11179 1 50.00$            

OEM Autos Rear Passenger Side Door 11180 1 50.00$            

OEM Crown Vic & SUV Rear Quarter Panels 11181 1 50.00$            

OEM Crown Vic & SUV Rear Quarter Panel 11182 1 50.00$            

OEM Crown Vic Rear Set 11183 1 50.00$            

OEM Crown Vic Full Decal Set 11184 1 ** $     500.00

OEM Truck Rear Quarter Panels 11185 1 50.00$            

OEM Truck Rear Quarter Panel 11186 1 50.00$            

OEM Truck & SUV Rear Set 11187 1 50.00$            

OEM Truck & SUV Full Decal Set 11188 1 ** $     500.00

OEM Autos Unit Number 11817 1 No Charge

OEM CERT Trailer Full Decal Set 11190 1 360.00$          

OEM CERT Trailer CERT Trailer Driver Side 11191 1 120.00$          

OEM CERT Trailer CERT Trailer Passenger Side 11192 1 120.00$          

OEM CERT Trailer CERT Trailer Front 11193 1 60.00$            

OEM CERT Trailer CERT Trailer Rear 11194 1 60.00$            

OEM MVDR Unit 1 Full Decal Set 11195 1 **   $ 2030.00

OEM MVDR Unit 1 MVDR Unit 1 Trailer Driver Side 11197 1 810.00$          

OEM MVDR Unit 1 MVDR Unit 1 Trailer Passenger Side 11198 1 810.00$          

OEM Design Setup Fee 11831 1 320.00$          

OEM MVDR Unit 2 Full Decal Set 11202 1 **   $ 2030.00

OEM MVDR Unit 2 MVDR Unit 2 Trailer Driver Side 11203 1 810.00$          

OEM MVDR Unit 2 MVDR Unit 2 Trailer Passenger Side 11204 1 810.00$          

OEM MVDR Unit 2 MVDR Unit 2 Trailer Front 11205 1 180.00$          

OEM MVDR Unit 2 MVDR Unit 2 Trailer Rear 11206 1 180.00$          

OEM Regional Com Unit Communications Unit Driver Side 11207 1 517.50$          

OEM Regional Com Unit Communications Unit Passenger Side 11208 1 517.50$          

OEM Regional Com Unit Communications Unit Front 11209 1 172.50$          

OEM Regional Com Unit Communications Unit Rear 11210 1 172.50$          

OEM Roof Unit Number Only 12855 1 ** $      80.00

No Bid

Estimated 
Annual                                                                                                                                                                                                

Quantity 

OnsiteDecals, LLC 



County Seal w/Inlay Description Lawson 
Number

3M                                           
7125              
and                
680

Oracal                
751/851/951 

and    
5600/5700 

County Seal w/Inlay Graphic Removal Fee Per Hour 11212 1 80.00$            

County Seal w/Inlay County Seal Graphic 11213 1 15.00$            

County Seal w/Inlay Installation 11214 1 25.00$            

County Seal Design set-up Fee 11211 1 320.00$          

No Bid

Estimated 
Annual                                                                                                                                                                                                

Quantity 

OnsiteDecals, LLC 



CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES
FORM 1295

lot 1

Complete Nos. 1-4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3,5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

j 1 N^e of business entity flling ftwrn, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place
I  of business.

OnSiteDecaJs, LLC
Stafford, TX United States

12 of governmental entity or state agwicy that is a party to the contract for which ¥»e form is
O6in0 tllfid.

Fort Bend County

OFFICE USE ONLY

CERTIFICATION OF FILING

Certificate Number:

2017-251762

Date Filed:

08/18/2017

Date Acknowledged:

®  governmental entity or state agency to track or identiiy the contract, and provide idescription of fite services, goods, or ofiier property to be provided under the contract
B15-023

Term contract for vehicle graphics

u
1  Name of Interested Party City, State, Country (place of business)

Nature of interest 1
(check applicable} |

Controilinci 1 intermediarv 1

5 Check only if there is MO interested Paitv. H

16 Ai
«« I swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

.JANE ANN SHERIDAN S
1 tioTAmr Pu8i.sc. state of tf*a« Xmy cowmissiom expires K

JULY 15, 2018 J
o^thoriz&d agent of contracting business entity

AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL ABOVE

Sworn to and subscribed before me, by the said Kelly AnnBark^ .
20_i!2 , to certiiy which, witness my hand and seal of office.

'  Oo/ic Ann Shen'^rii^n

this the 0 . day of

.  . nn onerifxtn At^mintslT»rf|V6Ar36/slSignature of officer administering oath Printed name of officer administering oath Title of offlcer administering oatti

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission
www.ethics.state.tx.us Version Vl.0.883



CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES
FORM 1295

lof 1

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

1 Name of business entity filing form, and tfie city, state and country of the business entity's place
of business.

OnSiteDecals, LLC

Stafford, TX United States

2 Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is
being filed.

Fort Bend County

OFFICE USE ONLY

CERTIFICATION OF FILING

Certificate Number:

2017-251762

Date Filed:

08/18/2017

Date Acknowledged:

09/12/2017

3 Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

B15-023

Term contract for vehicle graphics

Name of Interested Party City, State, Country (place of business)

Nature of interest

(check applicable)

Controlling Intermediary

5 Check only if there is NO Interested Party.
0

6 AFFIDAVIT
I swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL ABOVE

Sworn to and subscribed before me, by the said

20 , to certify which, witness my hand and seal of office.

_, this the day of _

Signature of officer administering oath Printed name of officer administering oath Title of officer administering oath

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission www.ethics.state.tx.us Version Vl.0.883
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