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STATE OF TEXAS

COUNTY OF FORT BEND
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§  KNOWALLMENBYTHESEPRES^s! 2

INTERLOCAL PROJECT AGREEMENT

This Interlocal Project Agreement ("Project Agreement"), is made and entered into pursuant to the
Interlocal Cooperation Act, Chapter 791 of the Texas Government Code and Chapters 251.012
and 251.015 of the Texas Transportation Code, between Fort Bend County, Texas, ("County") a
body corporate and politic, acting by and through its Commissioners Court and the City of Sugar
Land ("Local Government") a county, municipality, special district, or other political subdivision
(including a corporate or political Local Government organized under State law), acting by and
through its City Council.

In consideration of the foregoing and further consideration of the mutual promises, covenants and
conditions herein, the parties hereby agree as follows:

BASIC TERMS

This Project Agreement is entered into pursuant to the Primary Interlocal Agreement ("Primary
Agreement") previously agreed to by the parties on November 3,2009. The terms of that Primary
Agreement are incorporated into this Project Agreement by reference for all purposes as if they
were set forth herein word for word.

County, by and through its Commissioners Court, hereby affirmatively finds that Fort Bend
County will receive a benefit as the result of this Project.

County, by and through its Commissioners Court, hereby affirmatively finds that the Project serves
a public purpose.

County, by and through its Commissioners Court, hereby affirmatively finds that County is
specifically authorized by law to individually and independently construct the Project on its own.

Local Government, by and through its City Coimcil, hereby affirmatively finds that Local
Government is specifically authorized by law to individually and independently construct the
Project on its own.

County and Local Government agree that, in performing the governmental functions contemplated
in this Agreement or in paying for the performance of those governmental functions, each party
will make that performance or those payments fi*om current revenues legally available to that party.

County and Local Government affirmatively find that the performance of this Agreement is in the
common interest of both parties, that undertaking this Agreement will benefit the public and that
the division of costs associated with the Project fairly and adequately compensate the performing
party for its services or functions performed under this Agreement.
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Neither County nor Local Government intends for any third party to obtain a right by virtue of this
Agreement.

Local Government agrees that County is relying upon Local Government for notice to proceed
with this Project, but that County shall not be required to perform this Agreement within any time
limit.

County and Local Government understand and agree that County is an Independent Contractor
and that at no time will County's employees, agents or asignees be deemed for any purpose to be
employees or agents of Local Government.

County and Local Government understand and agree that Local Government is an Independent
Contractor and that at no time will Local Government's employees, agents or asignees be deemed
for any purpose to be employees or agents of County.

II.

PURPOSE

The purpose of this Project is to mill and asphalt overlay Scenic River within the municipal
boundaries of the City of Sugar Land, Texas.

III.

TERM

The term of this Project Agreement will be from the date of execution by the last party hereto until
midnight on September 30,2017 or until the Project is completed, whichever is sooner. However,
either party may terminate this Agreement, with or without cause, by giving at least ten (10) days
written notice to the other party.

IV.

PRO.TECT DESCRIPTION

The Project contemplated by this Project Agreement is described as the milling of two inches
(2") of old asphalt and the subsequent overlaying of Scenic River with two inches (2") of
asphalt. ("Project").

Y.

PROJECT LOCATION

The location for the Project is Scenic River within the City of Sugar Land, ("Project Site").
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VI.

SCOPE OF WORK

COUNTY^S RESPONSIBILITIES:

County agrees to provide up to 342 equipment hours at $35.00 per hour, up to 369 man hours of
labor at $15.00 per hour, up to $0.00 in materials and up to $0.00 in cash to Local Government,
for a total expenditure not to exceed $17,505.00.

At County's sole expense. County will furnish the labor, equipment and materials necessary to
perform its responsibilities under this Agreement. If necessary, the County will load any excavated
material required by Local Government to be moved, onto trucks provided by Local Government.

LOCAL GOVERNMENT'S RESPONSIBILITIES:

Local Government agrees to assume all material costs and provide all traffic control.

At Local Government's sole expense. Local Government will furnish the labor, equipment and
materials necessary to perform its responsibilities under this Agreement. Local Government will
provide all appropriate supervisory personnel necessary to coordinate the efforts of County and
Local Government personnel. Local Government will direct and be solely responsible for the
overall Project. Local Government will furnish all necessary materials to the Project Site in a
manner that will be sufficient to allow County personnel to work in a continuous, uninterrupted
manner. If necessary. Local Government will provide sufficient labor and equipment to haul any
materials excavated and loaded onto Local Government trucks by County. The number of trucks
furnished by Local Government will be sufficient to allow County personnel to work in a
continuous, uninterrupted manner. Local Government will schedule its labor and equipment to
correspond to County's schedules.

If necessary. Local Government will, at its sole cost and expense, be responsible for the design of
the Project. If necessary. Local Government will furnish to County plans that establish grades and
the size of any channels and any associated structures County is responsible for constructing. If
necessary. Local Government will furnish to County the initial on-ground survey alignment, ditch
cross sections and one (1) or more elevation benchmarks on the Project Site prior to the
commencement of work.

Local Government will obtain at its sole expense any and all necessary and/or required permissions
and/or permits, including NPDES, and provide all personnel necessary to implement the provisions
of such permits.

Local Government agrees, at its sole expense, to furnish all necessary flagmen, barricades, traffic
devices and traffic control for the entire duration of the Project.

Local Government will notify County within ten (10) days of the completion of the Project of any
complaints that Local Government may have regarding the Project. Upon completion of the
Project, Local Government will, at its sole expense, be responsible for the maintenance of the
Project.
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VII.

MISCELLANEOUS

By entering into this Agreement, the parties do not intend to create any obligations, express or
implied, other than those specifically set out in this Agreement.

Nothing in this Agreement shall create any rights or obligations in any party who is not a signatory
to this Agreement.

Local Government agrees and understands that: by law. the Fort Bend County Attorney's Office
may only advise or approve contracts or legal documents on behalf of its clients; the Fort Bend
County Attorney's Office may not advise or approve a contract or other legal document on behalf
of any other party not its client; the Fort Bend County Attorney's Offices has reviewed this
document solely from the legal perspective of its client; the approval of this document by the Fort
Bend County Attorneys Office was offered solely to benefit its client; Local Government and other
parties should not rely on this approval and should seek review and approval by their own
respective legal counsel.

The Road Commissioner of Fort Bend County, at his sole discretion, shall decide any and all
questions that may arise as to the interpretation of this Agreement and any and all questions as to
the acceptable fulfillment of this Agreement.

It is expressly understood and agreed that this Agreement will have no force or effect until duly
executed by all parties.

Notices, correspondence, and all other communications shall be addressed as follows:

If to Fort Bend County:

Fort Bend County
Attn: County Judge
401 Jackson, L'Floor
Richmond, Texas 77469

If to City of Sugar Land:

City of Sugar Land. Texas
P.O. Box 110

Sugar Land, Texas 77487-0110
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IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties have executed this Project Agreement on the dates
indicated.

FORT BEND COUNTY:

Robert E. Hebert, County Judge

Attest:

Laura Ribbard, County Clerk

CITY OF .AMD:

f '^1

.-47

Mayor

Attest:

(ecretaiy

REVIEWED:

?//

Marc ©rant ^

Fort Bend County Road Commissioner

AUDITOR'S CERTIFICATE

I hereby certify that funds are available from current revenues legally available in the amount of
$17,505.00 to accomplish and pay the obligations of Fort Bend County under this Project
Agreement. .

Lobert Ed Sturdivant, County Auditor
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City Council

Agkm> \ Rkqi i st

Agenda Of: 06-20-17
Agenda

Request No:

Henry Vavrecka,

Initiated By: Street and drainage superintendent
Responsible

Department:
Public Works

Eric oscarson, assistant Director
Presented By: „ £rcj^

OF Public Worksc:^^-^

Robert Valenzuela, P.E.

Director: Director of Public Works

Additional Jessie, Li, Ph.D., P.E.
Approval: interim City Engineer

Subject/

Proceeding:

Authorize an Inter-Local Project Agreement with Fort Bend County for the

Scenic River Asphalt Rehabilitation and Authorize the Purchase of Asphalt

Materuls for the Project

Fort bend County Inter-Local agreement

Exhibits: Fort Bend County Term Contract Bid 17-050 Lawson # 12996

Area Map

Clearances APPRON AL

Assistant City Christopher Steubing P.E
Manager: ([i $

.  Shea Smith,
Legal:

Assistant City Attorney

Assistant City
Purchasing: Todd Reed,

Purchasing Manager

N/A
Manager:

Manag"r^ Allen Bogard
Justin Alderete,

BUDGET: „ ^
Budget Officer

BliD(;ET

Expenditure Required: S 55,000

Current Budget: S 100,000

Additional Funding: S 0

REC OMMENDED AC I ION

Authorize the execution of the Inter-Local Project Agreement with Fort Bend County for the Rehabilitation of
Scenic River Drive and the purchase of asphalt materials from American Materials in an amoimt of $55,000.



F\F,( I TlVr SlMMAKV

As a strategy, identified in the October 2016 Asphalt Pavement Condition Evaluation Study completed by HVJ
Associates, asphalt pavement rehabilitation methods were identified as a component for a corrective action to
extend the useful life of asphalt pavements. The HVJ study recommended various repairs to several roadways,
with Scenic River Drive being the roadway needing repairs first. Scenic River Drive was identified as having
major wheel lane rutting and requiring a 2-inch mill with a 2-inch overlay.

To accomplish the rehabilitation of Scenic River Drive, the Public Works Department plans to enter into an
Inter-Local Project Agreement with Fort Bend County. As part of the agreement. Fort Bend County will
provide the equipment and labor to perform the project, with the City of Sugar Land providing additional
equipment, labor as needed, all traffic control and purchase all of the materials needed for the project. The City
of Sugar Land will provide the asphalt utilized for the overlay. The City will purchase approximately 1,100 tons
of asphalt, via our inter-local purchasing agreement with the county, from American Materials.

The Inter-Local Project Agreement allows the City to leverage county tax dollars within the city limits of Sugar
Land. This agreement will become effective once approved and expire September 30, 2017. Funding for this
agreement is located within CIP ST1706.

The Public Works and Engineering Departments recommend approval of the Inter-Local Project Agreement
with Fort Bend County for the Rehabilitation of Scenic River Drive and the purchase of asphalt materials from
American Materials in an amount of $55,000.
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Fort Bend Coont}- TabnUHon

Bid 17-050

Tmn Contract for Purchase and Haoling of Earthen Ts'pe Road Materials

Term: Aprfll, 2017 through March 31,2018

Awarded 2J8.17: All bidders meeting specifications

Lawson 12985-

material

Lawson 12986-

laydown

mm\
Form 1295

PUntTWSi

Plant to Jobsite-

i St mile

Each add'l mile

American! Century

Materiak Asphalt

Yes Yes

54.00 51.90

3.25 3.00

0.20 0.20

No Bid 14.00

Mo Chy Rosenberg

Cheny Dnrwood

Crushed Greene

Concrete

Yes YesYes

Martin Sih-a Tarmac Vulcan Waller

Marietta Dhision Dhlsion Construction County

of of Materials Asphalt

James James

Coast. Const.

Yes Yes Yes

50.00

3.00

Plant Location

Minimum $5.25 haul

& 800 tons

500 tons

per day

c-i

Vulcan

Construction

Materials

Waller

County

Asphalt

Cheny Dnrwood Gulf

Crushed Greeue Coast

Concrete Stabilized

Materiak

Martin

Marietta

Siha

Dhision

of

James

Const.

Plant'Pit'Sidm

0.20

No Bid

0.20

14.00

RosenberPlant Location

Minimiffli $5.25 haul

& SOOtcHis

hr'r-'dM

Waller

County

Asphalt

hiartin

Marietta

Sih-a

Dh-ision

of

James

Const.

Dnrwood

Greene

Lhoist

North

I
0.20

No bid

Richmond

2.50

Plam/Pit/Si

Plant to Jobsite-

1st mile

Each addl mile

Wtt

Plant Location

Per 1/2 sack

cement



Lawson 12990-

Duterial

Lan-son 12991-

la}'down

mm\Plant Pit/Si

Plant to Jobsite-

Ut mil«

Each add'I mile

wn

Plant Location

Minimum

0.20

iSES

Centur}' Cberrj'

Asphalt Crushed

Concrete

17.00 17.50

2.90 1.74

0.20 0.20

No bid No bid

Katy Fresno

$5.00 haul 15 tons

Durwood Gulf Lhokt Martin Silva 1 Tarmac

Greene Coast North Marietta Dk-isioa Dh'lsion

Stabilized America of of

Materiak James James

Const. Const.

Asphalt

Houston Port

25 tcMis

exible Base, must be free of forrign materils (asphalt, base, dirt, wire.m any tmcommoii items), Ty|^;':'A", Grade "1", GmshedGencrrte wtth,^

Durwood Gnlf Lhokt Martin SOva Tarmac

Greene Coast North Marietta Divkioa Dhlsion

Stabilized America of of

Materiak James James

Const. Const.

Materiak Asphalt

Lawson 12992-

material

rTfWagTaSrnffM

Plant to Jobsite-

1st mile

Each addl mile 0.20

No bid

RichmondPlant Location

,-;-r

Lawson 12993-

material

Plant/Pit/Si

Plant to Jobsite-

1st mile

Each addl mile

Plant Location

American Centnrs*

Materiak Asphalt

CheiT}- Dnnrood

Crushed Greene

Concrete

Martin SOra Tarmac Vnlcan Waller

Marietta Dhririon Dtvirion Constraction County

of of Materiak Asphalt
James James

Const. Const.

18.50

Lawson 12994-

material

Lawson 12995-

lavdown

Plant to Jt^ite-

Istmile

Each addl mile

wn

Plant Location

Minimum

iSES

0.21

Simrmtai

0.26

Garwood

Tarmac Vulcan Waller

Division Construction Count}'

of Materiak Asphalt

Gulf Lhokt

Coast North

Stabilized America

Materiak

Concrete

James

Const.

56.00

3.00

56.00

3.00

63.

3.25

0.20

14.00

S5.25 haul

& 800 tons



c Concrete Paveinent, TXDOT 340, T^iie D mtb RAP, Sac B, PG, 64-22, Price Per Ton

Lairson 12996-

material

Lawson 12997-

laydown

PlanfPit/Sidin

Plant to Jobsite-

1st mile

Each addl mile

Martin

Marietta

Siha

Dhision

of

James

Const.

Tarmac

Dhision

of

James

Const.

4£.00

3.00

Vnlcan

CoDstmction

Materials

WaDer

Counts'

Asphalt

Gulf Lhoist

Coast North

Stabilized America

Materials

Cherry

Cmshed

Concrete

Dnrwood

Greene

0.20

14.00

Roseni

S5.25 haul

& 800 tons

0.20

No bid

MoCi mPlant Location

Minimum

'"a#'.';-'".
Lasrson 12S^8-

material

Hot Mix-Cold Laid, i

Cherry Dnrwood

Cmshed Greene

Concrete Materials Asphaltof

James

Const.

PlantPit'Sidin

Plant to Jobsite-

1st mile

Each add'l mile

Plant Location

Minimum

Lasrson 11999- American Centnry

material Materials Asphalt

Lawson 13000-

laydosvn

Plant/Pi t/'Sidi

Plant to Jobsite-

Istmile

Each addl mile

wn

Plant Location

Minimum

Lawson 13001- American

material Materials

Lawson 13002-

las'down

Precoated Coverstone, PB-3, Price

Golf Lhoist Martin Slhn Tarmac Vnlcan Waller

Coast North Marietta Division Division Constmction County

Stabilized America of of hfaterials Asphalt

Materials James James

Const. Const.

mm
Dabn

25 tons

Rosenber

erry Dnrwood

shed Greene

Crete

Marietta Division Division

of

James

Const.

80.00

3.00

PUofPit/Si

Plant to Jobsite-

1st mile

Each addl mile

Rosenberg Da

25 tons

Plant Location

Minimum



ExistiDe Asphalt and/or Base Road , Price Per Foot ' i v..

errs- Durssood Gulf Lboist Martio SUva Tarmac ^'ulcan Waller

shed Greene Coast North Marietta DMsion DlrisJon Construction Counts-

Up to 2" Depth
13003

Up to 4" Depth

13004

Up to 6" Depdi

13005

Up to 8" Depdi
13000

Up to 10" Depdi
13007

Up to 12" Depth

13008

Up to 14" Depth

13009

Pulverizing

Existing
13010

Contractor Credit

for Pulverized

Transported by
FBC

13011

Transported by

Contractors

13012

Stabilized America

Materials

Materials Asphalt

James James

Const. Const.

Lawson 13013-

material

Plant to JobsitC"

1st mile

Each adcfl mile

Plant Location

Minimnra

Cherry Dnrwood Golf Lhoist Martin SOva Tarmac Vnlcan Waller
Crushed Greene Coast North Marietta Division Dtvidon Constmction Connts-

Concrete Stabilized America of of Materials AsphaltStabilized America

Materials

Lawson 13014-

material

Plant/Pit'Si

Plant to Jobsite-

1st mile

Each addl mile

Plant Location

Gulf Lhoist Martin Sllva Taimac Vnlcan Waller

Coast North Marietta Division Division ConstmctloQ Connty

Stabilized America of of Materials Asphalt
Materials James James

Const. Coast.

12.

3.00

0.21

SimoQton



Amniean Centnry Cfcerry Dnrwood Gnlf Lhokt Martin SOva Tarmac

Materiak Asphalt Crashed Greene Coast North Marietta Division Dhision

Concrete i Stabilized

Matnials

America of

James

Const.

of

James

Const.

Volna Waller

^onstmetion County

MaterUk A^balt

Plant/Pit'Si

Plant to Jobsite-

ist mile

Each addl mile

Plant Location

Installatkm

Minimom

;j;r ■j-v;

Amn4can
Materiak

Ceatnry
Asphalt

Cherrj-
Crashed

Concrete

Dnrwood
Greene

Gnlf

Coast

Stabilized
Materials

Lhokt

North

America

Martin
Marietta

Sflva
Division

of

James

Const.

Tarmac
Divisioa

of

James
Const.

Plant to Jobsite-
1st mile

Each add'l mile
Plant Location
Installation

Materials Asphalt

Texas ASPPM Grade IV Cold Mix - Road repair ma
Lairson 13015- American

material Materials
Dnrwood Golf Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac
Greene Coast North Marietta Division Dhision

Stabilized America of of

Materiak James

Const.

James

Const.

Vnlcan Wafler
ronstmction Conntj*
Materials Asphalt

Plaat/Pit'Si
Plant to Jobsite-
1st mile

Each add'l mile

ESSSwn

Plant Location

— -»yJ .i ••'..L- 1/ I
American Centniy* Cherrj- Dnrwood Gnlf Lhokt Martin Sflva Taimac
Materiak Asphah Cmshed Greene Coast North IMarietta Division Division

Concrete Stabilized America of of
Materials James James

Const. Const.

Materiak Asphalt

Gtiir Lboist
Coast Norrii

StabiUxed America

Materials

Tarmac Vnlcan Waller
Dhision Constmction Counts*

of Materiak Asphalt
James

Const.



Lawson 13017

material

Plant/Pit'Si

Plant to Jobsite-

1st mile

Each add! mile

Plant Location

Waller

Connty

Asphalt

Gulf Lbolst

Coast North

Stabilized America

Materials

0.26

Rosenber

Lawson 13018-

material

American

Materials

Plant/Pit/Sidinf 75.00

Plant to Jobsite-

1st mile

3.25

Each add'l mile 0.20

Plant Location Mo City

Minimum

a

Dorwood Calf Lboist

Greene Coast North

Stabilized America

Materials

Silva

Dh'ision

of

James

Const.

Vnkan

Construction

Materiab

WaBcr

Coiuty
Asphalt

Martin

lilarietta

iassn
S5.2S haul

& 800 tons

Lasrson 13019-

material

American

Materials

iQsssz^sni
Plant to Jobsite"

1st mile

Eachaddl mile

Plant Location

Mtntmum

Gulf Lhoist

Coast North

Stabilized America

Materiab

1  1

Tarmac

Division

of

James

Const.

Vulcan

Construction

Materiab

Waller

Countj'

Asphalt

Lawson 13020-

material

Plant to Jobsite*

1st mile

Each addl mile

Plant Location

Minimum

Chcrrv Dnrwood Gulf Lbolst hlartin SDra Tarmac Vulcan Waller

Crushed Greene Coast North Marietta Division Division Construction Counts*

Concrete Stabilized America

Materiab

of of

James James

Const. Const.

Materiab Asphalt



Lasrson 13021- American

material Materials

Plant/Pit/Sidin^ 23.00

Plant to Jobsite- 3.25

1st mile

Each add'l mile 0.20

Plant Location MoCitv

In&tallatiott

Lawson 13022- American

material Materials

Plant/Pit/SidinjE 30.00

Plant to Jobsite* 3.50

1st mile

Each addl mile 0.25

Plant Location Mo City

Minimum

yi

Dnnrood Gulf Lboi$t

Greene Coast North

Stabilized America

Materials

Marttn Sih-a Tarmac

>h-idoB Diridoa

of of

James James

Const. Const.

Marietta Dhnaon

of

0.20

$5.00 haul

26.00 32.00

2.90 2.74

0.20 0.20

Katy Fresno

S5.00 haul 15 tCHIS

Martin Sura

Marietta DhisioB

of

James

Const.

Tarmac

Dfriston

of

James

Const.

Dnrwood Gnlf Lhmst

Greene Coast North

Stabilized America

Materials




