
Description                             Lawson 
Number

 Bid               
Price              
per   

Round 

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

Bid                     
Price                        
per                  

Case

Rounds 
per     

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

Bid               
Price              
per   

Round

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

 Bid      
Price                        
per                  

Case 

Rounds 
per            

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

 Bid               
Price              
per   

Round 

 Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box 

 Bid      
Price                        
per                  

Case 

Rounds 
per            

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

9.1:  .223 HORNADY 
TAP 80265 75 GR.
Manufacturer:
HORNADY         No Sub
9.2:  .223 HORNADY 
TAP 83278 55 GR. FPD
Manufacturer:
HORNADY         No Sub
9.3:  .223 REM, L223R3 
55 GR. MC
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON     No Sub
9.4:  9-MM Luger 
L9MM3 115 GR. MC
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON     No Sub
9.5:  9-MM Golden Saber 
GS9MMB 124 GR. 
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON     No Sub
9.6:  .40 S & W L40SW3 
180 GR. MC
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON     No Sub

Vendor Bailey's House of Guns, Inc.                                                 
Houston, TX

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 Yes Yes  Yes 

Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 17-027

Ammunition

Recommendation:  Low Bidder per Item

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 $0.21200  NA  $106.00 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 $0.35412  NA  $177.06 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 $137.65 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 $  77.76 

 $0.27530  NA 

12945

12946

12947

12948

12949

 $0.38882  NA ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

GT Distributors, Inc.                                                                              
Austin, TX

Precision Delta Corp                                      
Ruleville, MS

200

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 $0.74000 $14.80  $148.00 90

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 

Term:  through 31 March 2018

Form 1295

200

500

500

500



 Bid               
Price              
per   

Round 

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

Bid                     
Price                        
per                  

Case

Rounds 
per     

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

Bid               
Price              
per   

Round

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

 Bid      
Price                        
per                  

Case 

Rounds 
per            

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

 Bid               
Price              
per   

Round 

 Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box 

 Bid      
Price                        
per                  

Case 

Rounds 
per            

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

9.7:  .40 Golden Saber 
GS40SWB 180 GR. 
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON     No Sub
9.8:  .357 SIG 
GSB357SB Golden Saber 
357 SIG 125GR BJHP
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON     No Sub
9.9:  .357 SIG L357S1 
UMC 125GR MC
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON     No Sub
9.10:  38 SPL L38S11 
130 GR. MC
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON   No Sub
9.11:  45 Auto L45AP4 
UMC 45 ACP 230GR. 
MC
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON    No Sub
9.12:  45 Auto GS45APB
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON     No Sub
9.13:  12 GA. RR12BK8-
00 2 3/4" Buckshot 8 
pellets reduced recoil
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON    No Sub

 No Bid 

No Bid

 No Bid 

 $0.54706  NA  $136.76 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 $0.29766  NA  $147.33 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 $0.40588  NA  $202.94 

 $0.27059  NA  $135.29 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 NA  $147.02 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

No Bid

No Bid

ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 $156.40 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 $191.18 

12954

 $0.31280  NA 

 $0.38236  NA 

 $0.29412 

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Precision Delta Corp                                                               

500

500

250

500

500

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

No Bid

500

500

Bailey's House of Guns, Inc.                                                 GT Distributors, Inc.                                                                          

ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

Description                             Lawson 
Number

12950

12951

12952

12953

12955

12956



 Bid               
Price              
per   

Round 

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

Bid                     
Price                        
per                  

Case

Rounds 
per     

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

Bid               
Price              
per   

Round

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

 Bid      
Price                        
per                  

Case 

Rounds 
per            

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

 Bid               
Price              
per   

Round 

 Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box 

 Bid      
Price                        
per                  

Case 

Rounds 
per            

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

9.14:  12 GA. RR12RSB 
12 GA 2 3/4" Foster slug 
reduced recoil
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON    No Sub
9.15:  12 GA. GC127 2 
3/4" 7 1/2 target loads
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON    No Sub
9.16:  R30301 Core-Lokt, 
30-30 win. 150 gr. SPCL.
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON    No Sub
9.17:  Blank Popper, 
Winchester 12 GA. 2 3/4" 
smokeless power
Manufacturer:
WINCHESTER   No Sub

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

 $139.64 

 $0.30352  NA  $  75.88 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 $0.69824 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

GT Distributors, Inc.

ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 NA 

 $0.47223  NA 

30-90

Precision Delta Corp

ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 $0.50520  $12.63  $126.30 250 NA  $207.76 25012961  $0.83105 

500

250

200

Bailey's House of Guns, Inc.

 $118.05 

12959

12960

Description                             Lawson 
Number

12957



 Bid               
Price              
per   

Round 

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

Bid                     
Price                        
per                  

Case

Rounds 
per     

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

Bid               
Price              
per   

Round

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

 Bid      
Price                        
per                  

Case 

Rounds 
per            

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

 Bid               
Price              
per   

Round 

 Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box 

 Bid      
Price                        
per                  

Case 

Rounds 
per            

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

9.18:  .223 HORNADY 
TAP 80265 75 GR.
HORNADY or Equal 
WINCHESTER  
9.19:  .223 HORNADY 
TAP 83278 55 GR. FPD
HORNADY or Equal 
WINCHESTER  
RA223BSTA
9.20:  .223 REM, 
L223R3 55 GR. MC
REMINGTON or Equal 
HORNADY 9754EL
9.21:  9-MM Luger 
L9MM3 115 GR. MC
REMINGTON or Equal 
WINCHESTER Q4172
9.22:  9-MM Golden 
Saber GS9MMB 124 GR. 
BJHP
REMINGTON or Equal 
WINCHESTER RA9BA
9.23:  .40 S & W 
L40SW3 180 GR. MC
REMINGTON or Equal 
WINCHESTER Q4238
9.24:  .40 Golden Saber 
GS40SWB 180 GR. 
REMINGTON or Equal 
REMINGTON  

500 120-180 $182.00  $0.36400 

500

$25.50  $255.00  $18.20 90 $0.51000 

 $0.34000 

 $0.51000 

 $0.41000 

90

$20.50

90

$25.50  $255.00 500

 $117.50 500 Currently 
In Stock

 $205.00 90

$0.21200

120-180

 $0.23500  $11.75 

ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 $174.00 

ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 NA 500 $156.40 500$0.31280

 NA  $137.65 500

 $339.00 400

 $  9.45  $  94.50 

500

12967 $0.27530

ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 $0.34800  $17.40 

90

$17.00  $170.00 500

 $0.33900  $  6.78 300+

 NA 500 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 $0.18900 500 180+

$14.80

 $0.32000 $16.00  $160.00 

 $0.71900  $14.38  $143.80 

500 NA 

12963 No Bid  $0.74000 200 Currently 
In Stock

$0.38882

 $148.00 200 90

200 90-180+No Bid 90  $14.26  $142.60 

Bailey's House of Guns, Inc. GT Distributors, Inc. Precision Delta Corp

12962  $0.71300 

Lawson 
Number

 $0.74000 $14.80

ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 $106.00 

Description                           

 $148.00 200

 NA  $177.06 500

12964

12965

12966 $0.35412

 $  77.76 200

12968



 Bid               
Price              
per   

Round 

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

Bid                     
Price                        
per                  

Case

Rounds 
per     

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

Bid               
Price              
per   

Round

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

 Bid      
Price                        
per                  

Case 

Rounds 
per            

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

 Bid               
Price              
per   

Round 

 Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box 

 Bid      
Price                        
per                  

Case 

Rounds 
per            

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

9.25:  .357 SIG 
GSB357SB Golden Saber 
357 SIG 125GR BJHP
REMINGTON or Equal 
REMINGTON 
9.26:  .357 SIG L357S1 
UMC 125GR MC
REMINGTON or Equal 
REMINGTON 
9.27:  38 SPL L38S11 
130 GR. MC
REMINGTON or Equal 
REMINGTON 
9.28:  45 Auto L45AP4 
UMC 45 ACP 230GR. 
MC
REMINGTON or Equal 
WINCHESTER Q4170
9.29:  45 Auto GS45APB
REMINGTON or Equal 
REMINGTON  
9.30:  12 GA. RR12BK8-
00 2 3/4" Buckshot 8 
pellets reduced recoil
REMINGTON or Equal 
WINCHESTER 
9.31:  12 GA. RR12RSB 
12 GA 2 3/4" Foster slug 
reduced recoil
REMINGTON or Equal 
REMINGTON 

 $10.58 

Currently 
In Stock

Currently 
In Stock

Currently 
In Stock

 $0.53000  $  2.65  $132.50 250 $1.09000 

 $153.00 500

 $0.27900  $13.95 

 $105.80 250

 $0.59000  $0.43100  $21.55  $215.50 500 Currently 
In Stock

 $0.42320  $0.73000 $7.30  $  73.00 100 90

100 90

500 120-180

500 120-180

 $139.50 500

90

 $277.50 

 $185.50 

 $0.30600  $15.30 

 $0.55500  $27.75 

 $0.37100  $18.55 $23.50  $235.00 

 $0.62000 $31.00  $310.00 500 90

Description                           Lawson 
Number

500

No Bid

$29.50  $295.00 500

 NA  $118.05 250 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

90

 NA  $135.29 500 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 NA  $147.33 500 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 NA  $202.94 500 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 NA 

 $147.02 500 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

GT Distributors, Inc. Precision Delta Corp

 $0.47000 

 $0.46000 $23.00

500 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 NA 

12975  $0.47223 $5.45  $109.00 

12974

 $0.40588 

 $0.54706 

 NA 

 $136.76 250 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

12973

12972

 $0.27059 

 $0.29766  $230.00 500 90

Currently 
In Stock

12971

12970

$0.38236

 $0.29412 

 $191.18 

Bailey's House of Guns, Inc.

12969



 Bid               
Price              
per   

Round 

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

Bid                     
Price                        
per                  

Case

Rounds 
per     

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

Bid               
Price              
per   

Round

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

 Bid      
Price                        
per                  

Case 

Rounds 
per            

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

 Bid               
Price              
per   

Round 

 Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box 

 Bid      
Price                        
per                  

Case 

Rounds 
per            

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

9.32:  12 GA. GC127 2 
3/4" 7 1/2 target loads
REMINGTON or Equal 
WINCHESTER 
9.33:  R30301 Core-Lokt, 
30-30 win. 150 gr. SPCL.
REMINGTON or Equal 
REMINGTON
9.34:  Blank Popper, 
Winchester 12 GA. 2 3/4" 
smokeless power
REMINGTON or Equal 
WINCHESTER 38SBLP

 $0.73000  $14.60  $146.00 200 120

Currently 
In Stock

No Bid

 $703.00 1000 120

 $0.28720  $  7.18  $  71.80 250No Bid

No Bid  $0.70300  $35.15 

Description                           Lawson 
Number

 $  75.88 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 NA  $139.64 200 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

12978  $0.83105 

Bailey's House of Guns, Inc.

12977  $0.69824 

GT Distributors, Inc. Precision Delta Corp

12976  $0.30352 250

ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 NA 

 NA  $207.76 250


