\ S HeLFMAN FORD
| |

i

l September 15, 2016

Fort Bend County Purchasing

RE: Renewal Pricing

Helfman Ford is pleased to continue pricing thru 9/30/17 on
the following bids.

15-028 Vehicles # 4, 19 and 23
16-024 Vehicles #9, 10, 11, 12, 19, 20 and 21
Thank you,

Bill Chrisman, Fleet Manager

281-274-7204

-240-4147
: ‘ 12220 SOUTHWEST FRWY. FAX 281
281.240-5678 STAFFORD, TEXAS 77477 werwhelfmanford.com



CERTIFICATE OIE INTERESTEDVPARTIES

FORM 1295
lofl
Gomplete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties. . OFFICE USE ONLY
GComplete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties. CERTIFICATION OF FILING
1 Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place Certificate Number:
business. 2016-112810
ELFMAN FORD
fford, TX United States Date Filed:
ame of governmental entity of state agency that IS a party to the contract for which the form 1S 09/15/2016
jeing filed.
ORT BEND COUNTY Date Acknowledged:

Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a

3

lescriptlon of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

ID # 15-028

VEHICLES

i Nature of interest
Name of Interested Party City, State, Country (place of business) (check applicable)
Controlling | Intermediary

5

Check only if there is NO Interested Party. .

& Lualinm Bo B WWWams Rios  Noom

AFFIDAVIT

| swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosu}e is true and correct.

ELIZABETH A WILLIAMS RIOS )
My Commission.Expires
November 1, 2018

g 22—

~ Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

'b‘,' ““1’

AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL ABOVE

-

Sworn to and subscribed before me, by the said \ S N , this the \&0 dayof Sﬁ(i_

20 \Q , to certify which, witness my hand and seal of office.

-

Signature of officer administering oath Printed name of officer administering oath Title of officer administering oath

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission www.ethics.state.tx.us Version V1.0.277




CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES

FOrRM 1295

lofl

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

of business.
HELFMAN FORD
stafford, TX United States

1 Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place

being filed.
FORT BEND COUNTY

2 Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is

OFFICE USE ONLY
CERTIFICATION OF FILING

Certificate Number:
2016-112810

Date Filed:
09/15/2016

Date Acknowledged:
09/27/2016

3 Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

BID # 15-028
VEHICLES
Nature of interest
4 Name of Interested Party City, State, Country (place of business) {check applicable)
Controlling intermediary
5 Check only if there is NO Interested Party. .
6 AFFIDAVIT

| swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL ABOVE

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

Sworn to and subscribed before me, by the said , this the day of \
20 , to certify which, witness my hand and seal of office.
Signature of officer administering oath Printed name of officer administering oath Title of officer administering oath

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission www.ethics.state.tx.us

Version V1.0.277



Tabulation

Purchase of Vehicles

Bid 15-028

Awarded 10/14/14: Low bidder per item as highlighted
Renewal approved 9/8/2015 through 9/30/2016

Description Caldwell Classic Helfman Helfman Meador Randall Tommie

Country Chevrolet Dodge Ford Dodge Reed's Vaughn
Chevrolet | Sugar Land Houston Stafford Fort Worth [Prestige Ford Motors
Caldwell Garland Houston

Vehicle 4: Non-Police Package 4- $18,342.00 | Disqualified: No Bid $16,550.00 No Bid $17,300.00 No Bid

Door Sedan Not as

specified

Vehicle 11: Truck, 3/4 ton, Extended | $25,640.00 | $24,692.00 No Bid $22,765.00 No Bid $23,200.00 $23,789.77

Cab, SWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power

(windows, locks), TTP

Vehicle 12: Truck, 3/4 ton, Extended | $25,640.00 | $24,692.00 No Bid $22,850.00 No Bid $23,300.00 | $23,885.77

Cab, SWB, Cloth Split Bench, Power

(windows, locks), TTP

Vehicle 13: Truck, 3/4 ton, Extended | $25,490.00 $24,598.00 No Bid $22,100.00 No Bid $22,600.00 $23,227.67

Cab, LWB, Vinyl Split Bench, No

Power, TTP

Vehicle 15: Truck, 1 ton, 4-Door $28,545.00 | $27,327.00 No Bid $26,175.00 | Disqualified: | $26,850.00 | $27,451.77

Crew Cab, LWB, Vinyl Bench & Not as

Flooring, Power (windows,lock), TTP specified

Vehicle 19: Ford, Explorer Police No Bid No Bid No Bid $24,000.00 No Bid $24,950.00 No Bid

Inceptor Utility, Cloth, Power (seat,

windows, locks, mirrors), No

Spotlight, No Backup Camera

Vehicle 23: Ford, Explorer (or equal), No Bid No Bid No Bid $24,650.00 No Bid $25,400.00 | $29,012.56

Cloth, Power (windows, locks), TTP
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