
Fort Bend County Fire Code

Third Edition

Fort Bend County Fire Marshal's Office

Fort Bend County Fire Marshal: Mark Flathouse

Adopted: June 24, 2014

Effective: August 1, 2014

Amended: August 25, 2015_

Amended: September 13, 2016_

23A

9/15/2016 - Original sent to Mark Flathouse, Fire Marshal



PREFACE

Texas Local Government Code, Chapter 233, Section 233.061 authorizes certain counties to adopt a Fire

Code and the regulations necessary to administer and enforce the Fire Code. As the governing body of

Fort Bend County, Texas, the Commissioners Court finds that adopting a Fire Code and requiring permits

for the construction of commercial establishments, public buildings and multi-family residences in the

unincorporated areas of Fort Bend County will protect the health, safety and welfare of life and property

of the general public. The Fire Code requires periodic inspection of new and existing structures to

ensure safety standards are being maintained for the continued practice of life safety and property

conservation.



FORT BEND COUNTY FIRE CODE

Table of Contents

1.0 GENERAL PROVISIONS

2.0 ADOPTION AND ADMINISTRATION

3.0 TERMS

4.0 PERMITS

5.0 PERMIT HOLDER AND RESPONSIBIUTES

6.0 CERTIFICATE OF COMPLIANCE

7.0 APPEALS AND HEARING PROCEDURE

8.0 ENFORCEMENT AND VARIANCE

9.0 FORMS AND RECORDS

10.0 SERVABILITY AND CONSTRUCTION

4

4

5

6

8

8

8

9

10

10

EXHIBITS

EXHIBIT A: ADDITIONS, INSERTATIONS, DELETIONS, AND CHANGES TO INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE,

2012 EDITION

EXHIBIT B: CERTIFICATE OF COMPLIANCE

EXHIBIT C: FORT BEND COUNTY FIRE MARSHAL'S OFFICE FIRE CODE PROCESS

EXHIBIT D: FEE SCHEDULE



1.0 GENERAL PROVISIONS

1.1 Purpose: The purpose of the Fort Bend County Fire Code is the safe-guarding of life and

property from fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of

hazardous substances, materials and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or

property in the occupancy of buildings and premises in Fort Bend County.

A. The Fort Bend County Fire Code is intended to provide minimum requirements

for fire safety, with due regard to function, for the Design and Construction or

Substantial Improvements to any Public Buildings, Commercial Establishments,

and Multi-Family Dwellings with four or more units, as determined by the

current property designation identified by the Fort Bend County Tax Appraisal

District.

B. The Fort Bend County Fire Code is not intended to be a building code as

described in the Texas Local Government Code Chapter 214 and does not

evaluate structural, plumbing, electrical, and mechanical suitability, unless it is

directly related to fire safety.

C. The Fort Bend County Fire Code is not intended in any way to limit the statutory

authority of the Fire Marshal, and it is intended that such authority be retained

to the fullest extent that the law would authorize.

1.2 Authority: The Fort Bend County Fire Code is adopted by the Fort Bend County

Commissioners Court pursuant to Texas Local Government Code, Chapter 233, Section

233.061 which authorizes certain counties to adopt a Fire Code and the regulations

necessary to administer and enforce the Fire Code.

2.0 ADOPTION AND ADMINISTRATION

2.1 Except for the deletions and changes identified in Appendix A, Fort Bend County hereby

adopts the International Fire Code 2012 edition (hereinafter known as "IFC"), as the Fort

Bend County Fire Code. A complete copy of the IFC is on file in the Fort Bend County Fire

Marshal's Office.

2.2 The Fort Bend County Fire Marshal is responsible for the administration of this Fire Code,

issuance of permits required by this Fire Code, enforcement of this Fire Code and

maintenance of proper records.

2.3 The County Fire Marshal or the County Fire Marshal's designee may conduct inspections

provided for in this Fire Code or by Subchapter C of Chapter 233 of Subtitle B of Title 7 of

the Texas Local Government Code.

2.4 Below shall identify the scope of Fort Bend County Fire Code:

A. The Fort Bend County Fire Code shall apply to all new construction or

substantial improvement of all Public Buildings, Commercial Establishments, and



Multi-Family Dwellings with four or more units, as determined by the current

property designation identified by the Fort Bend County Tax Appraisal District.

B. The Fort Bend County Fire Code does not apply to any industrial facility that the

Fort Bend County Fire Marshal determines qualifies for the exception specified

in Section 233.062(b) of the Texas Local Government Code. The Fort Bend

County Fire Marshal shall have the authority to seek the assistance of the

Occupational Health and Safety Administration in making a determination

regarding an industrial facility.

C. Any construction that occurred before the effective date of the Fort Bend

County Fire Code will be governed by the preceding Fire Code that was effective

as of January 1, 2005; unless and until substantial improvement is made to the

property. Any construction that occurred before the effective date of an

amendment of the Fort Bend County Fire Code will be governed by the

preceding Fire Code that was effective prior to the Amendment.

D. Disclaimer of Liability - The degree of fire protection required by the Fort Bend

County Fire Code is considered reasonable for regulatory purposes and is

based on scientific and engineering considerations. Compliance with the Fort

Bend County Fire Code does not imply that any building or the uses permitted

within any building will be free from a fire hazard. The Fort Bend County Fire

Code shall not create liability on the part of Fort Bend County, any officer, or

employee thereof for any damages that may result from reliance on this Code

or any administrative decision lawfully made there under. The granting of a

permit or issuance of an Certificate of Compliance does not imply that the

building can be insured for fire coverage.

3.0 TERMS

3.1 Certificate of Compliance: A "Certificate of Compliance" means a certificate issued by the

County Fire Marshal indicating Construction or Substantial Improvement has been

completed in compliance with the Fort Bend County Fire Code as of a specific date and for a

specific occupancy.

3.2 Construction: Construction begins on the date that ground is broken for a building as

determined by the Fort Bend County Fire Marshal, or if no ground is broken, on the date

that:

A. The first materials are added to the original property;

B. Foundation pilings are installed on the original property; or

C. A manufactured building or relocated structure is placed on a foundation on the

original property

3.3 Fort Bend County Fire Marshal: means the holder of the statutory office of County Fire

Marshal for Fort Bend County, Texas or the employee(s) designated by the Fort Bend County

Fire Marshal to perform a task required by this Fire Code.



3.4 Fire Code: "Fire Code" means the Fort Bend County Fire Code as adopted in Section 1.3 of

this Code.

3.5 Fire Code Official: The term "Fire Code Official" as it appears in the IFC is synonymous with

the term "Fort Bend County Fire Marshal" or a designee of such individual; however, only

the Fort Bend County Fire Marshal has the authority to overrule his or her subordinates or

grant variances before applicants for permits or variances may request review by the Fort

Bend County Commissioners Court.

3.6 Substantial improvement: Substantial improvement occurs when:

A. The repair, restoration, reconstruction, improvement, or remodeling of a public

building, commercial establishment, or a multi-family residential dwelling

consisting of four or more units for which the cost exceeds 50% of the building's

value according to the certified tax appraisal roll for the county for the year

preceding the year in which the work was begun; or

B. A change in occupancy classification involving a change in the purpose or level

of activity in a building, including the renovation of a warehouse into a loft

apartment. For purposes of determining if an improvement is a Substantial

Improvement, the applicant for a permit must submit data reflecting cost of the

restoration, reconstruction, improvement or remodeling. Costs shall include the

value of all labor and materials. A permit is required prior to the start of any

Substantial Improvement. For purposes of this code, Substantial Improvement

begins on the date that the repair, restoration, reconstruction, improvement,

remodeling, the change in occupancy classification begins, or on the date

materials are first delivered for that purpose.

3.7 Unincorporated Area: Unincorporated Area means any real property in Fort Bend County,

Texas, which is not with in the city limits of a municipality.

4.0 PERMITS

4.1 Permit Required: No person shall start or authorize construction or Substantial

Improvement of a building or within an unincorporated area of Fort Bend County without

first securing a permit under the Fort Bend County Fire Code.

4.2 Application for Permit: The application for a permit will be on a form prescribed by the Fort

Bend County Fire Marshal and must be supported by the following:

A. A completed Fire Code Design and Compliance Review Sheet provided by the

Fort Bend County Fire Marshal and signed and sealed by a duly licensed

architect or engineer authorized to practice in the State of Texas;

B. A non-refundable permit review fee; and

C. Two (2) set of architectural, fire protection systems plans, or other required set

of plans must be submitted OR One (1) set of architectural, fire protection

systems plans, or other required set of plans in a hard copy format. AND one (1)

set of architectural, fire protection systems plans, or other required set of plans



must be submitted by electronic source (PDF). Must be on a readable disk and

handed in at time of permit submittal:

i. types of construction materials and class of interior finish;

ii. location of all exits with distances between exits called out - exit

width, type and any special requirement shall be stated; and The

location of any fire alarm equipment, automatic sprinklers,

emergency lighting, etc. required to meet this Fire Code;

4.3 The Fort Bend County Fire Marshal may require the submission of additional information,

drawings, specifications, or documents if needed to determine whether a permit should be

issued.

4.4 Determination of Permit Eligibility: After the application is filed, the Fort Bend County Fire

Marshal shall determine if the proposed building or substantial improvement meets the

requirements of the Fort Bend County Fire Code.

A. If it is determined that the proposed building or substantial improvement meets

the requirements, then a permit will be issued after the collection of the

appropriate fees as outlined in Section 4.5 - Fees, of this Fire Code, and as

referred to in EXHIBIT "D"- Fee Schedule.

B. If it is determined that the proposed building or substantial improvement does

not comply with the requirements of this Fire Code, then the application

package shall be returned to the applicant with an explanation of why it was not

approved.

4.5 Fees: Fees for permits and inspections are to be set by Commissioners Court. Fees shall be

paid by cashier's check, money order, or personal check. Should the check be returned for

insufficient funds, the permit(s) issued becomes null and void. Fees shall be paid at the time

plans are submitted for review unless other arrangement have been made and approved by

the County Auditor. The County shall deposit all fees received under this section in a special

fund in the County treasury, pursuant to Texas Local Government Code 233.0651, and

money in that fund shall be used only for the administration and enforcement of the Fire

Code. Fee Schedule is shown in Exhibit D.

4.6 Condition of Permit: Construction of a building or a substantial improvement must be

started within 180 calendar days of the date the permit is issued or the permit shall be null

and void. Upon written request to the Fort Bend County Fire Marshal, two (2) six-month

extensions of the permit may be obtained.

4.7 Lock Box Permit: The owner or owners association of a gated community or multi-unit

housing project must comply with the provision set forth by Local Government Code

Chapter 352, Subchapter E. The owner or owners association of a gated community or

multi-unit housing project must obtain a Lockbox Permit from the Fire Code Official.



5.0 PERMIT HOLDER RESPONSIBILITIES

5.1 All permit holders must post a copy of the permit on the jobsite in a place clearly visible

from the nearest road or street and in a manner meeting the requirements of the standards

for permanent numbers set forth in The International Fire Code 2012 - Section 105.3.5

5.2 The Fort Bend County Fire Marshal is authorized to make as many scheduled or unscheduled

inspections to the worksite as deemed necessary to enforce this Fire Code and the

conditions of the Permit.

5.3 Any permit holder that wishes to make a change to the proposed building or substantial
improvement, or to construct any building or substantial improvement other than that

authorized by the permit, must submit supplemental drawings and/or specifications to the

Fort Bend County Fire Marshal for review and approval. If a change complies with this Fire

Code and is approved, a copy of the supplemental drawings and/or specifications shall be

added to the Permit Holder's file, and the Fort Bend County Fire Marshal shall amend the

permit accordingly.

6.0 CERTIFICATE OF COMPLIANCE

6.1 A building may not be occupied until a conditional or partial certificate of compliance for the

building is issued by the Fire Marshal. The Fire Marshal shall notify the permit applicant in

writing of any limitations or restrictions necessary to keep the permit area safe.

6.2 The holder of a conditional or partial Certificate of Compliance shall proceed only to the

point for which approval has been given, at the permit holder's own risk and without

assurance that approval for the occupancy or the utilization of the entire premises,

equipment, or operation will be granted.

6.3 A "Certificate of Compliance" under this Fire Code shall not be construed as authorizing the

owner or operator of any building to afterward operate or maintain such building in such a

way as to create, cause or allow the existence of a fire or life safety condition, which

condition shall be subject to the independent enforcement authority of the County Fire

Marshal.

7.0 APPEALS AND HEARING PROCEDURE

7.1 By submitting an application for a permit, an Applicant waives the right to challenge this

Fire Code in a court of law without first timely exhausting the Fort Bend County Fire Code's

Appeals and Hearing Procedure

7.2 If a permit applicant is denied a permit, the applicant may appeal the denial as provided in

this Section. The term "Appellant" is used to refer to the appealing party.



i. To appeal the denial of a permit application by the Fire Marshal's designee,

Appellant must submit a written statement to the Fort Bend County Fire

Marshal setting forth the reasons why the permit application should be

approved. If the Fort Bend County Fire Marshal sustains the original denial of

the permit, the appellant may seek review of the decision by the Fort Bend

County Commissioners Court pursuant to Section 7.3 below.

ii. To appeal the denial of a permit application by the Fort Bend County Fire

Marshal, Appellant may request that the Fort Bend County Commissioners

Court review of the denial, as described in Section 7.3.

7.3 Review by Commissioner's Court-

i. An Appellant may request that the Fort Bend County Commissioners Court

review the County Fire Marshals' a denial of a permit application by sending a

written request to the County Judge's Office by certified mail.

ii. The request to review must be received by the County Judge's Office no later

than the tenth business day after the County Fire Marshal (not an appointee)

issues the written denial of the permit application.

iii. Filing a request to review does not stay the Fire Marshal's denial of the

application. The denial remains in effect unless and until Commissioners Court

reverses the decision of the Fire Marshal.

iv. The Fire Marshal's denial will be reviewed by Commissioners Court at a regularly

scheduled meeting, no later than thirty calendar days of receiving the written

request for review. Commissioners Court may either uphold or reverse the

decision of the Fort Bend County Fire Marshal.

v. The Fire Marshall will send written notification of the Commissioners Court date

to Appellant by certified mail to address application, unless Appellant specifies a

different address in the written request for review. This notice shall be sent no

later than seven calendar days prior to the Commissioners Court date.

8.0 ENFORCEMENT AND VARIANCE

8.1 Violation of Conditions of Regulations - Any person having knowledge of a violation of this

Code may file a written, sworn complaint with the County Fire Marshal

8.2 Civil Enforcement: If any person violates any provisions of the Fort Bend County Fire Code,

the County Fire Marshal may request that the County Attorney file a civil action in a court of

competent jurisdiction to recover from a person who violates the fire code a civil penalty in

an amount of up to $200 (or the maximum amount allowed by statute) for each day on

which the violation exists as allowed in Texas Local Government Code § 233.067.

8.3 Criminal Enforcement: If a building subject to the Fort Bend County Fire Code is occupied

without a an Certificate of Compliance, the County Fire Marshal may file a complaint with

the District Attorney's Office under Section 352.016 and Section 352.022 of the Texas Local

Government Code. An offense under this section is a Class B misdemeanor unless it is



shown on the trial of the offense that the defendant has been previously convicted two or

more times under this section, in which event the offense is a state jail felony.

8.4 Variances: A request for a Variance to the Fort Bend County Fire Marshal can be made in

writing to the Fort Bend County Fire Marshal.

A. The Fire Marshal shall review the request and deny or grant request for

Variance.

B. A Variance may be granted only if the following are met:

i. The applicant has shown good and sufficient cause;

ii. It has been determined that failure to grant the Variance would result in

an exceptional hardship to the applicant; and

iii. The granting of a Variance will not result in an increased risk of fire,

additional threats to public safety, extraordinary public expense, or

create nuisances, cause fraud or victimization of the public; and

C. Economic hardship shall not constitute the sole basis for granting a Variance.

D. The Fire Marshal's decision on a Variance Request may be appealed as

described in Section 7 of the Fort Bend County Fire Code.

9.0 FORMS AND RECORDS

9.1 Forms: Forms to be used in the administration of this Fire Code shall be promulgated by the

Fort Bend County Fire Marshal.

9.2 Maintenance of Records: The Fort Bend County Fire Marshal must maintain all applications

for, and file copies of, permits for a retention period of three (3) years. Drawings and

specifications on file with the Fort Bend County Fire Marshal may be destroyed after

completion of the structure, unless otherwise required by law.

SERVERABIUTY AND CONSTRUCTION

The provisions of this Fire Code are severable. If any word, phrase, clause, sentence, section, provision,

or part of this Fire Code should be invalid or unconstitutional, it shall not affect the validity of the

remaining portions and it is hereby declared to be the intent of the Commissioners Court that this Fire

Code would have been adopted as to the remaining portions, regardless of the invalidity of any part. In

the event that any provision of this Fire Code might be interpreted in such a way as exceeding the

County's authority, such provision should be construed to apply only to the extent authorized by law. In

the event of conflict, the Fort Bend County Fire Code approved on this date shall supersede any

conflicting fire regulations of the County, except for as provided in Section 2.4

10



PASSED AND APPROVED BY COMMISSIONERS COURT ON DATE; FIRST AMENDED ON DATE; SECOND

AMENDED ON DATE; THIRD AMENDED ON DATE AND LAST AMENDED ON THIS l3 DAY OF
SEPTEMBER, 2016.

(%ie<^U^~
er, Precinct 1

s Patterson, Commissioner, Precinct 4

Andy Meyers, Commiss/oner, Pr/cinct 3

#»%,

ii



Exhibit A

ADDITIONS, INSERTIONS, DELETION AND CHANGES

TO INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

2012 EDITION

The International Fire Code is adopted by Fort Bend County except as noted below:

CHAPTER 1 - Scope and Administration

Section 101 - General

101.1 Title.

These regulations shall be known as theFort Bend County Fire Code, hereinafter
referred to as "This Fire Code. "

102.3 Change of use or occupancy

Deleted in its entirety.

102.5 Application of Residential Fire Code.

Deleted in its entirety.

102.6 Historic buildings.

Deleted in its entirety

105.6 Required operational permits

Deleted in its entirety. All permits are addressed in Section 4.0, 5.0 and Exhibit D

105.7 Required Construction permits

This section is adopted except section 105.7.2 thru 105.7.5 and 105.7.8 thru 105.7.14 are
deleted. All permits are addressed with Section 4.0, 5.0 and Exhibit D

108 Board of Appeals

Deleted in its entirety.

109.4 Violations Penalty.

Persons who shall violate a provision ofthis Fire Code or shall fail to comply with any of
the requirements there ofor who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work in violation
of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official, or of a

12



permit or certificate used underprovisions of this Fire Code, shall be subject to Section
Eight ofthe Fort Bend CountyFire Code.

111 Stop Work Order

Deleted in its entirety.

112 Service Utilities

Deleted in its entirety.

503.1.1 Buildings andfacilities.

Approved fire apparatus access roads shall be provided for everyfacility, building or
portion ofa building hereafter constructedor moved into or within thejurisdiction. The
fire apparatus access road shall comply with the requirement of this section and shall
extend to within 150feet (45,720mm) ofall portions ofthefacility and all portions ofthe
exterior walls ofthefirst story ofthe building as measuredby an approvedroute around
the exteriorofthe building orfacility. The one-hundredfifty (150)feet shall be measured
along a ten (10) foot wide unobstructed level pathway not exceeding a slope of 5:1,
around the external walls ofthe structure. Theprovision ofthis section notwithstanding,
fire lanes may be requiredto be located within thirty (30)feet ofa building ifrequiredby
thefire code official to enableproperprotection ofthe building. An unobstructedfive- (5)
foot wide level pathway shall be provided through all barriers. A continuous row of
parking between thefire lane and the structure shall be considered a barrier. Fire lane
easements shall be provided to serve all buildings through parking areas, to service
entrances ofbuildings, loading areas and trash collection areas and other areas deemed
necessary to be available tofire and emergency vehicles. All commercial buildings shall
be provided with a minimum of two (2) points of access. The fire code official is
authorized to designate additional requirements for fire lanes where reasonably
necessary to provide access for fire and rescue personnel. Dead endfire lanes are not
allowed unless approved by thefire code official.

Exception to 503.1.1: Thefire code official is authorized to increase the dimension of150
feet (45 720 mm) where reasonable conditions exist to allow for a greater distance.

507.5.1.1 Hydrantfor Standpipe Systems.
Buildings equipped with a standpipe system installed in accordance with section 905
shall have afire hydrant within 100feet (30 m) ofthefire departmentconnection and the
fire sprinkler connection.

SECTION 604 - EMERGENCY AND STANDBY POWER SYSTEMS

604.1.2 Critical Operations Power Systems (COPS).
For Critical Operations Power Systems necessary to maintain continuous power supply
to facilities or parts offacilities that require continuous operation for the reasons of

13



public safety, emergency management, national security, or business continuity, see
NFPA 70.

604.2 Where required.
Emergency and standby power systems shall be provided for all Group E occupancies
and where required by Sections 604.2.1 through 604.2.18.4 or elsewhere identified in this
code or any other referenced code.

604.2.19 Fire pumps systems.
Emergency back-up power shall be provided for fire suppression systems with an
approvedfire pumpfor Group A and Group E occupancies, or as specified elsewhere in
this code, in accordance with Section 913: Fire Pumps.

Chapter 9 - Fire Protection Systems

903.2 Where required.
Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and structures shall beprovided
in the locations described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12. Buildings on the same lot
shall adhere to the combined aggregate sum of the total square feet. Separation on the
same lot does not qualify as separate square footage. Additional requirements for
automatic sprinkler systems:

1. A separated building and attached buildings must be separated by a UL listed
four-hour fire rated wall, without openings, and must be supplied with separate
utility connections to eliminatea requirement ofautomatic sprinkler system.
2. All new residential buildings classified by the International Building Code as
Group R-l, R-2 or R-4. This includes motels, hotels, condominiums, town-homes,
apartment buildings, dormitories, boarding houses, convents, fraternities,
sororities and monasteries.

3. AnyAssembly buildingnot accessible by an approvedaccess roadway.
4. Existing non-residential buildings when any addition creates a building space
totaling seven thousandfive hundred (7,500) squarefeet or more.
5. Existing non-residential buildings when the combining ofone (1) or more lease
spaces results in a lease space totaling twelve thousand (12,000) square feet or
more.

Exceptions: Automatic fire sprinklers are not required in the following
open structures: Pavilions, open gazebos, detached canopies or open
parking garages as defined by the Building Code. Except for parking
garages, open structures shall have a minimum of seventy (70) percent
clear opening on all sides. Parking garages shall be considered open
structures when they meet the criteriafor open parking garages as defined
by the Building Code

903.2.9.3 Self-service storagefacilities.
An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout all buildings containing a
GroupS-l self-service storage facility. A screen shall be installed at eighteen (18) inches
below the level ofthe sprinkler heads to restrict storage above that level. The screen shall

14



be a mesh ofnot less than one (I) inch nor greater than six (6) inches in size. The screen
and its supports shall be installed such that all elements are at least eighteen (18) inches
below any sprinkler heads.

903.4.2, Alarmsfor fire sprinkler.
Approved audible devices shall be connected to every automatic sprinkler system. Such
sprinkler waterflow alarm devices shall be activated by waterflow equivalent to theflow
of a single sprinkler of the smallest orifice size installed in the system. Alarm devices
shall be provided on the exterior of the building, in an approved location. When water
flow supervision is provided, alarm devices shall be located within the interior of the
building and for all provided spaces in order to provide an internal evacuation signal
throughout the building. Group R-l, R-2 and condominiums shall be provided with an
alarm signal device in each unit to provide an internal evacuation signal. Where a fire
alarm system is installed, actuation of the automatic sprinkler system shall actuate the
buildingfire alarm system.

Appendix A

Board ofAppeals IS DELETED

Appendix B

Fire-Flow Requirements for Buildings is adopted in its entirety, except Section B103.1,
B103.2 and B103.3, where the wording of "fire chief is used will be replaced with "fire

marshal".

Appendix C

Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution is adopted, except that in Sections CI 03.1 and
CI 05.1, the phrase "or the rules ofthejurisdiction in whose ExtraterritorialJurisdiction
(ETJ) the project is located, whichever is more stringent" is added behind the works
Table CI 05.1.

Appendix D

Fire Apparatus Access Roads, is adopted, except sections D103.1, D103.2, D 103.3,

Dl03.4 and Dl07.1.

Appendix E

Hazard Categories, IS DELETED

Appendix F

Hazard Ranking, IS DELETED

15



Appendix G

Cryogenic Fluids - Weight and Volume Equivalents IS DELETED.

Appendix H

Hazardous materials management Plan (HMMP) and Hazardous Materials Inventory

Statement (HMIS) Instructions IS DELETED.

Appendix I

Fire Protection Systems - Noncompliant Conditions, IS DELETED.

Appendix J

Building Information Sign, IS DELETED

16



Exhibit B

Fort Bend County Certificate of Compliance

1.Fort BendCountyFire Marshal Certificate Number

2. Property Name 3. Property Address 4. City, State,ZipCode

5.Typeof Construction

A. New Construction

B. Renovation

C.Change of Occupancy

6. Sprinkler System Required

Yes

No

7. Alarm SystemRequired

Yes

No

8. Building Codeand Edition

9. OccupiedArea 10.Designed Occupant Load

11.Typeof Construction 12.Description of Use

13.Special Stipulations orCode Modifications

This certificate ensures that all fire protection and life safety systems have been completed, inspected, successfully tested and approved for the specific area of the butlding

spedfied above to provide a reasonable degree of safety to the occupants from fire and similaremercenoes.

14.Name of Approval Official 15. Signature 16. Date

This certificate isvalid onlyforthe premises ofthe project address.

17



uH

a
a

a
>

i
—

?
«

*
«

"
—

i

1
1

R
e
v
*

«
v
,

P
e
m

tta
n

d

1
*

p
e
e
lon

P
e
s
t
s

.
.:»

i
t

P
ta

n
sfo

f

P
*

'"
il

R
e
^
e
a

^
d

P
*

«
*

F
ort

B
en

d
C

o
u

n
ty

F
ire

M
a

rsh
a

l's
O

ffice
F

ire
C

o
d

e
P

rocess

F
or

O
eta

ied
P

erm
its

and
Inspection

P
rocess,

R
eferen

ce
th

e
F

ort
B

en
d

C
o

u
n

ty
F

ireC
ode

i
^
t
a

r
a

t
c
-

B
eg

"'

im
rm

M
m

i
A

lo
v
p

ft^
M

d
fi*

p
ro

tectio
n

I
fvsta

rm
m

tftttK
*np*<

led
I

pear
tocerim

geaver
and

*
....

,t

C
o

rre
c
t

P
*ob*e*n|s)

and

P
-av

M
i1

ip
e
c
h

o
n

I
n

fir«
(M

)«
fftfiM

m
C

o
n

fla
tio

n
P

fB
tw

t
flo

w

S
u

frn
W

t

P
e
m

»
t

fcy^
P*iTiJ

\
^\A

porw
«d'/

r
.

*

R
*

v
u

e
*

n
fJ

R
e
n

u
I
t'll

P
la

n
s

i
.:

j
1

t

P
*

m
»

t

'
Pl»m

\
•<

.
S

A
p

O
O

IW
d

V

1*

R
#

v
n

e
*

>
d

R
«

J
u

t)n
i1

P
U

"
!

V
e
r
tc

a
)

io
m

tn
K

tia
n

I
1

I
U

e
SpnrfcJer

unlef|fO
uind

p<
w

nf
|

|
m

u
i

b
em

*
w

d
d

d
p

*
o

«
to

e/o
u

>
d

|
I

cove*
a

n
d

/o
r

tc
n

o
e
ie

p
o

u
*

|

I
P

rovided
h

ere
at

n
to

r
m

at«yt
only

'
I

See
F*eP*o*ctonPfot«»

above
|

f
'r

U
n

a

O
p

era
tio

n
a

l

C
o

rrect
f*

c*
*

em
ts|

a
n

d

pay
fe*

n
p

e<
tio

n
te

e

A

C
«

*
t#

iC
J
t*

O
f

f
a

m
p

J
u

rx
e

Issu
ed

b
y
F

v
e

M
a

rsh
a

f
s

O
ffc

*
C

O



Exhibit D
Fee Schedule

For all permits applied for beginning October 1, 2016

A. Fire Code Building Permit
The base fee for all submitted plans and issue of Certificate of Compliance is $25. This fee is for processing building
plans submitted for approval, andwill be paidat time of submission of the plans. Allprojects will usethe following
fee schedule:

***FEES MUST BE PAID WHEN PLANS ARE SUBMITTED***

PERMIT ADDITIONAL DETAILS FEE

Certificate of Compliance Fire Final Inspection or Certificate (for existing structure without

certificate)

$25.00

Fire Code Plan Review/Building Permit Per 1000 sq. ft. of Structure $125.00

Re-Submittal of Construction Plans Ifchanges are done after the initial plan review, the reviews of changes
are required.

$150.00

Outdoor Fireworks Stand Per Stand/Building $150.00

Indoor Fireworks Stand Per Stand/Building $250.00

Fireworks Display/Show Per Launch Site $200.00

Fire Sprinkler Systems Permit 1 to 20 heads $100.00

Fire Sprinkler Systems equipment 21 to 250 heads $175.00

Fire Sprinkler Systems equipment 251 to 499 heads $250.00

Fire Sprinkler Systems equipment >500 + ,50C/head additional $350.00

Automatic Fire-extinguishing Systems (Commercial
Cooking)

Fixed Systems $100.00

Fire Alarm/Detection Related Equipment Permit 1 to 10 devices $100.00

Fire Alarm/Detection Related Equipment 11 to 25 devices $175.00

Fire Alarm/Detection Related Equipment 26 to 150 devices $250.00

Fire Alarm/Detection Related Equipment 151 to 499 devices $350.00

Fire Alarm/Detection Related Equipment >500 + .50C/device additional $350.00

New Fire Pumps and Related Equipment for Fire
Sprinkler System

$100.00

Underground Fire Protection Submittal of underground water supply for fire protection system $150.00

New Spraying or Dipping Booths (Paint) Building/Booths $100.00

Re-Inspections Paid after corrections have been made from initial inspection $150.00

Electronic Entrance Gates $100.00

New Service Station Piping Plan $200.00

Work Without Permit 2 X Regular Permit Fee <**** **

Mass Gathering Permit $200.00

***FORMS OF PAYMENT ACCEPTED ARE: CHECK, CASHIERS CHECK OR MONEY ORDER***

B. License Inspection.
State license facilities that require an annual fire inspection for operational permits. (Non-profit or
governmental organizations are exempt from this section.)

• Commercial Day cares $100.00
• Nursing homes or care centers $100.00
• State or County licensed Inspections $100.00
• Hospitals $200.00
• Foster homes or adoption Exempt

Re-inspection fee for State or County licensed Inspection will be same amount
ofthe original permit paid prior to schedulingfor a re-inspection.

C. Taxing Entities Building Permit Fee. The no-fee for building plans submitted for approval by a taxing entity
authorized to impose taxes within and upon residents of Fort Bend County, Texas, are defined to include school
districts, emergency service districts, municipalities, or otherentities authorized bystate orfederal statute to levya tax
within and upon residents of Fort Bend County, Texas, for the purpose of yielding tax revenue to serve legitimate
public purposefor the benefit ofFort Bend Countytaxpayers.

19




