Fort Bend County Tabulation

Bid 16-010

Term Contract for Medical Supplies

Term: 1 October 2015 through 30 September 2016

Awarded 9/08/15: Low Bidder per Section
Rescind Award of Sections 1, 4, and 8 10/13/15

Description Bound Tree | Ever Ready | Henry Schein | Life-Assist, Mercury Midwest Moore Nashville Physio- Quadmed, Inc.
Medical First Aid Inc. Inc. Medical Medical Medical LLC Medical & Control, Inc.
Supply Co., EMS Products,
LLC Inc.
Section 1: Rescind Award due to due to Sole Source and Authorized Distributor Errors
Airways
Section 2: Disqualified:| $ 79,189.68| $ 121,210.89| Disqualified: No Bid $  44,014.08 | Disqualified: No Bid Disqualified: No Bid
1V, Syringes, Altered pricing Altered Pricing Altered Terms Altered Terms
Blood format Form and Conditions and Conditions
Section 3: Disqualified:| $ 5,511.20( $ 5,075.49 No Bid $ 4,236.24 Disqualified: $ 13,217.13
Bandages, Splints, | Altered pricing Substituted
Tape format
Section 4: Rescind Award due to due to Sole Source and Authorized Distributor Errors
EKG
Section 5: $  96,296.35 No Bid $ 49,463.10 No Bid $ 42,927.50 No Bid $ 45,605.94
EKG Cables
Section 6: $ 14,300.00( $ 27,800.00f $ 17,320.00 No Bid $ 18,560.00 No Bid $  18,240.00
Microflex
Freeform SE Latex
Free Powder Free
Nitrile Exam
Gloves
Section 7: $ 1,425.00| $ 3,385.00( $ 2,182.50 No Bid $ 2,237.50 No Bid $ 2,030.00
Microflex

Freeform EC
Latex Free Powder
Free Nitrile Exam
Gloves

Section 8:
Sterile Gloves

Rescind Award due to due to Sole Source and Authorized Distributor Errors




Description Bound Tree | Ever Ready | Henry Schein | Life-Assist, Mercury Midwest Moore Nashville Physio- Quadmed, Inc.
Medical First Aid Inc. Inc. Medical Medical Medical LLC Medical & Control, Inc.
Supply Co., EMS Products,
LLC Inc.

Section 9: $ 1448240 $ 22,031.80[ $ 16,135.10 Disqualified No Bid $ 20,094.30 Disqualified No Bid Disqualified| $ 18,660.50
AMBU PERFIT from entire bid: from entire bid: from entire bid:
Cervical Collars Altered Pricing Altered Terms Altered Terms
Section 10: $ 14,960.00( $ 18,520.001 $ 14,620.00 Form. No Bid $ 18,700.00| and Conditions No Bid and Conditions| $ 17,060.00
Head Immobilizers
Section 11: Disqualified:| $ 2,746.50 $ 4,919.58 No Bid $ 1,919.63 Disqualified: $ 12,253.91
Miscellaneous Altered pricing Did not Bid
Supplies format Entire Section
Section 12: $ 2,959.45( $ 1,212.10| $ 859.38 No Bid $ 938.49 No Bid $ 3,5654.20
Infection Control
Section 13: $ 25,871.18 Disqualified: Disqualified: No Bid Disqualified: No Bid $ 39,280.98
Capitals Did not Bid Did not Bid Did not Bid

Entire Section| _Entire Section Entire Section
Section 14: $  111,107.67 No Bid Disqualified: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Medication Unit price not

completed.




Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 16-010
Term Contract for Medical Supplies
Term: 1 October 2015 through 30 September 2016

Awarded 9/08/15: Low Bidder per Section
Rescind Award of Sections 1, 4, and 8 10/13/15

Section 1: Airways Lawson Unit
Item # Price
Vendor:
Rescind Award due to Sole Source and Authorized Distributor Errors
Section 2: 1V/Syringes/Blood Lawson Unit
Item # Price
Vendor:
Midwest Medical Supply
MedStorm IV Guard IV Dressing, Breathable Foam Dressing, Curaplex #36002MS 12123 $ 0.237
Transparent Film Dressing, Tegaderm, 4" x 4 3/4", Frame Style, 50/bx 12124 $ 0.82
B BRAUN Introcan Safety IV Catheter, Universal bevel needle, Passive design for 12125 $ 1.47
automatic safety activation, Color-coded packaging, 14gauge x 2"
B BRAUN Introcan Safety IV Catheter, Universal bevel needle, Passive design for 12126 $ 1.47
automatic safety activation, Color-coded packaging, 16gauge x 1 1/4"
B BRAUN Introcan Safety IV Catheter, Universal bevel needle, Passive design for 12127 $ 1.47
automatic safety activation, Color-coded packaging, 18gauge x 1 1/4"
B BRAUN Introcan Safety IV Catheter, Universal bevel needle, Passive design for 12128 $ 1.47
automatic safety activation, Color-coded packaging, 20gauge x 1 1/4"
B BRAUN Introcan Safety IV Catheter, Universal bevel needle, Passive design for 12129 $ 1.47
automatic safety activation, Color-coded packaging, 22gauge x 1"
18g x 1 1/2" Needle Only 100/bx 12130 $ 2.27
20g x 1 1/2" Needle Only 100/bx 12131 $ 3.79
229 x 1 1/2" Needle Only 100/bx 12132 $ 3.79
23g x 1" Needle Only 100/bx 12133 $ 3.79
1cc 259 x 5/8" Syringe & Needle 100/bx 12134 $ 9.32
3cc Syringe, Luer lock 12135 $ 4.04
5cc 22g x 1" Syringe & Needle 100/bx 12136 $ 21.24
10cc Syringe Luer Lock 100/bx 12137 $ 7.65
30cc Syringe Luer Lock 30/bx 12138 $ 11.70
60cc Syringe Luer Lock 30/bx 12139 $ 17.47
60cc Catheter Tip Syringe, 20z 12140 $ 14.56
Vacutainer Holder 12141 $ 0.045
Vacutainer Luer Adapter 100/bx 12142 $ 11.07
Latex Free Tourniquet, 1" x 18", 25 per roll, color = Blue 12143 $ 0.3325
Glucometer Test Strips for Abbott OptimumEZ glucose meter, capillary, 100 strip/bx 12144 $ 44.32
Control solution, tri-level, 1 row 1 mid 1 high per box for OptimumEZ or Precision| 12145 $ 10.21
XTRA
Maxi Drip Set, 82" 10GTTWY/Bravo 24, Pre-slit Port, Removable 7" Extension, 50/bx 12146 $ 1.65




Section 2: 1V/Syringes/Blood (cont'd) Lawson Unit
Item # Price
Vendor:
Midwest Medical Supply
Mini Drop Basic Administration Set with One Injection Site, (60 Drops/mL) Control| 12147 $ 1.39
Clamp, injection site 28" above distal end, two-piece male luer lock. Priming Volume:
12mL, Length: 66 in.
9% Sodium Chloride Injection USP-1000ml, 12/cs 12148 $ 2.18
9% Sodium Chloride Injection USP-500ml, 24/cs 12149 $ 2.36
9% Sodium Chloride Injection USP-250ml, 24/cs 12150 $ 2.25
9% Sodium Chloride for Irrigation, 500mL 12151 $ 2.17
Sterile Water for Irrigation, 500mL 12152 $ 2.13
Safeline Injection Site: split septum access with two-piece male luer lock. Priming| 12153 $ 0.91
Volume: 0.25mL
Smallbore Extension Set with bonded Ultrasite Injection site, Length: 7 in, Priming| 12154 $ 1.27
Volume: 0.6mL (approx)
Section 3: Bandage/Splints/Tape Lawson Unit
Item # Price
Vendor:
Midwest Medical Supply
2" x 5yd Bandage, Self-Adherent, , individually packaged 12155 $ 0.58
4" x 5yd Bandage, Self-Adherent, , individually packaged 12156 $ 1.02
Combat Application Tourniquet (CAT), One-handed Tourniquet Utilizing Windlass 12157 $ 24.81
System, Tactical Black
Occlusive, non-adhering dressing, impregnated with white Petrolatum, 3"x 9" 50/bx 12158 $ 28.23
Small Oval Eye Pad 50/bx 12159 $ 3.43
4x4 Non Sterile, non-woven, 4ply, 200/pkg 12160 $ 2.00
4x4 Sterile 12 ply - 10/tray 12161 $ 0.59
4 1/2" x 4.1yd 6 ply Non Sterile Gauze Roll 12162 $ 0.43
4 1/2" x 4.1yd 6 ply Sterile Gauze Roll 12163 $ 0.61
36" x 51" Triangular Bandage 12164 $ 0.19
8" x 10" Abdominal Pad, 20/tray 12165 $ 2.47
1" x 3" Adhesive Strip Bandage 50/bx 12166 $ 0.54
Burn Sheet Sterile 60" x 96" 12167 $ 1.48
Trauma Dressing Sterile 10" x 30" 12168 $ 0.73
Rapid Heat Instant Heat Pack, Pull Apart Style, 6/bx 12169 $ 1.29
Rapid Cold Instant Cold Pack, Pull Apart Style, 24/cs 12170 $ 1.24
Ferno KED forehead/Chin Strap Replacement set of 2 12171 $ 5.76
54" Padded Board Splint 12172 $ 3.85
3M Transpore Tape 1" x 10yd 12/bx 12173 $ 10.09
1" x 10yd Paper Tape, hypo-allergenic 12174 $ 3.51
2" x 10yd Waterproof Tape Kendall #3267 6/bx 12175 $ 16.89
Flex-All splint, orange, bendable foam and aluminum splint, 4" x 36" rolled 12176 $ 2.95
One piece foil bunting with hood. Latex Free 17.5”x30” 18 micron/.70 gauge, Sterile 12177 $ 4.04




Section 4: EKG Lawson Unit
Item # Price

Vendor:

Rescind Award due to Sole Source and Authorized Distributor Errors

Section 5: EKG Cables Lawson Unit
Item # Price

Vendor:

Midwest Medical Supply

LifePack12 Power Adapter Extension Cable Physio Control #11110-000051 12184 $ 11742

LifePack12 12-Lead ECG trunk cable with 4-wire limb leads, 5' Physio Control #11110-| 12185 $ 309.25

000018

LifePack12 12-Lead ECG Patient Cable, 6-Wire Precordial Lead Attachment, Physio 12186 $ 124.30

Control #11110-000022

LifePackl2 QUIK-COMBO Therapy Cable for use with LifePackl2| 12187 $ 32310

defibrillator/monitor, Physio Control #11110-000040

Masimo SET LNC-4 LNCS Patient Cable, 4-foot reusable connector cable, Physio 12188 $ 140.05

Control #11171-000024

Masimo SET LNCS DCIP Reusable Sensor, Multiuse sensor for patients 10-50kg,| 12189 $ 164.25

Physio Control #11171-000018

Masimo SET LNCS DCI Adult Reusable Sensor, Multiuse sensor for patients >30kg, 12190 $ 153.33

Physio Control #11171-000017

MNC-1 Adapter Cable (4 foot), allows LifePack 12 defibrillator/monitor with Masimo| 12191 $ 430.10

SpO2 to connect to Nellcor sensors, Physio Control #11996-000198

NELLCOR SpO2 Sensor, DS100A, Adult reusable, Physio Control #11996-000060 12192 $ 112.15

NELLCOR SpO2 Cable Extension, DEC-4, Reusable, Physio Control #11110-000042 12193 $ 38.05

NELLCOR Oxisensor Il Disposable Pediatric SpO2 Sensor, Physio Control #11996-| 12194 $ 14.24

000116

NELLCOR Oxisensor Il Disposable Infant SpO2 Sensor, Physio Control #11996-] 12195 $ 18.50

000115

NIBP XLarge Adult Cuff for LifePack 15, reusable, Physio Control #11160-000009 12196 $ 41.29

NIBP Large Adult Cuff for LifePack 15, reusable, Physio Control #11160-000007 12197 $ 28.39

NIBP Adult Cuff for LifePack 15, reusable, Physio Control #11160-000005 12198 $ 25.80

NIBP Pediatric Cuff for LifePack 15, reusable, Physio Control #11160-000003 12199 $ 20.65

NIBP Infant Cuff for LifePack 15, reusable, 6x18cm, Physio Control #11160-000001 12200 $ 18.06

NIBP Hose, 9 feet, reusable, Physio Control #21300-007299 12201 $ 50.67

Extension Cable for AC/DC Power Adapter, Physio Control #11140-000080 12202 $ 252.04

Replacement Right Angle Power Cable for AC/DC Power Adapter, Physio Control| 12203 $ 252.04

#11140-000081

Lifepack 15 defibrillator/monitor to PC USB Port cable, Physio Control #11996-000288 12204 $ 24482

Lifepack 15 Quik-Combo Therapy Cable, Physio Control #11113-000004 12205 323.10

Lifepack 15 Masimo Set Red LNCS Patient Cable 4ft, Physio Control #11996-000323 12206 140.05

Lifepack 15 NIBP Tubing 9ft, Physio Control #21300-007299 12207 |$  50.67

Lifepack 15 Pedi SPO2 Sensor Disposable, Physio Control #11171-000020 12208 |$ 13.61

Lifepack 15 Infant SPO2 Sensor Disposable, Physio Control #11171-000031 12209 |$ 13.59




Section 6: Microflex Freeform SE Latex Free Powder Free Nitrile Exam Gloves

Vendor:
Bound Tree Medical

Lawson
Item #

Unit
Price

Microflex Freeform SE Nitrile Exam Gloves, Powderfree Exam Gloves, 100/bx,
10bx/cs, 2.8 mil Cuff Thickness, 3.5 mil Palm Thickness, 5.1 mil Finger Thickness,
Tensile Strength = 32 before aging (31 After aging), Elasticity = 500% Before Aging
(400% after aging), Pinhole Defect Rate = 1.5, Extra Small

12210

7.15

Microflex Freeform SE Nitrile Exam Gloves, Powderfree Exam Gloves, 100/bx,
10bx/cs, 2.8 mil Cuff Thickness, 3.5 mil Palm Thickness, 5.1 mil Finger Thickness,
Tensile Strength = 32 before aging (31 After aging), Elasticity = 500% Before Aging
(400% after aging), Pinhole Defect Rate = 1.5, Small

12211

7.15

Microflex Freeform SE Nitrile Exam Gloves, Powderfree Exam Gloves, 100/bx,
10bx/cs, 2.8 mil Cuff Thickness, 3.5 mil Palm Thickness, 5.1 mil Finger Thickness,
Tensile Strength = 32 before aging (31 After aging), Elasticity = 500% Before Aging
(400% after aging), Pinhole Defect Rate = 1.5, Medium

12212

7.15

Microflex Freeform SE Nitrile Exam Gloves, Powderfree Exam Gloves, 100/bx,
10bx/cs, 2.8 mil Cuff Thickness, 3.5 mil Palm Thickness, 5.1 mil Finger Thickness,
Tensile Strength = 32 before aging (31 After aging), Elasticity = 500% Before Aging
(400% after aging), Pinhole Defect Rate = 1.5, Large

12213

7.15

Microflex Freeform SE Nitrile Exam Gloves, Powderfree Exam Gloves, 100/bx,
10bx/cs, 2.8 mil Cuff Thickness, 3.5 mil Palm Thickness, 5.1 mil Finger Thickness,
Tensile Strength = 32 before aging (31 After aging), Elasticity = 500% Before Aging
(400% after aging), Pinhole Defect Rate = 1.5, Extra Large

12214

7.15

Section 7: Microflex Freeform EC Latex Free Powder Free Nitrile Exam Gloves

Vendor:
Bound Tree Medical

Lawson
Item #

Unit
Price

Microflex Freeform EC Nitrile Exam Gloves, Powderfree Exam Gloves, 50/bx, 10bx/cs,
3.5 mil Cuff Thickness, 4.7 mil Palm Thickness, 6.3 mil Finger Thickness, Tensile
Strength = 31 before aging (27 After aging), Elasticity = 500% Before Aging (500%
after aging), Pinhole Defect Rate = 1.5, Small

12215

5.70

Microflex Freeform EC Nitrile Exam Gloves, Powderfree Exam Gloves, 50/bx, 10bx/cs,
3.5 mil Cuff Thickness, 4.7 mil Palm Thickness, 6.3 mil Finger Thickness, Tensile
Strength = 31 before aging (27 After aging), Elasticity = 500% Before Aging (500%
after aging), Pinhole Defect Rate = 1.5, Medium

12216

5.70

Microflex Freeform EC Nitrile Exam Gloves, Powderfree Exam Gloves, 50/bx, 10bx/cs,
3.5 mil Cuff Thickness, 4.7 mil Palm Thickness, 6.3 mil Finger Thickness, Tensile
Strength = 31 before aging (27 After aging), Elasticity = 500% Before Aging (500%
after aging), Pinhole Defect Rate = 1.5, Large

12217

5.70

Microflex Freeform EC Nitrile Exam Gloves, Powderfree Exam Gloves, 50/bx, 10bx/cs,
3.5 mil Cuff Thickness, 4.7 mil Palm Thickness, 6.3 mil Finger Thickness, Tensile
Strength = 31 before aging (27 After aging), Elasticity = 500% Before Aging (500%
after aging), Pinhole Defect Rate = 1.5, Extra Large

12218

5.70

Microflex Freeform EC Nitrile Exam Gloves, Powderfree Exam Gloves, 50/bx, 10bx/cs,
3.5 mil Cuff Thickness, 4.7 mil Palm Thickness, 6.3 mil Finger Thickness, Tensile
Strength = 31 before aging (27 After aging), Elasticity = 500% Before Aging (500%
after aging), Pinhole Defect Rate = 1.5, Extra Extra Large

12219

5.70




Section 8: Sterile Gloves Lawson Unit
Item # Price

Vendor:

Rescind Award due to Sole Source and Authorized Distributor Errors

Section 9: AMBU PERFIT Cervical Collars Lawson Unit
Item # Price

Vendor:

Bound Tree Medical

Infant 12223 3 2.77

Pediatric 12224 3 2.77

Regular 12225 $ 2.77

Neckless 12226 3 2.77

Short 12227 3 2.77

Tall 12228 3 2.77

Perfit ACE Adjustable Cervical Collar, 16 setting (Neckless to Tall) 12229 $ 4.20

Perfit Mini ACE Adjustable Cervical Collar, 12 settings (Infant to Neckless) 12230 $ 4.20

Section 10: Head Immobilizers Lawson Unit
Item # Price

Vendor:

Henry Schein Inc.

AMBU Head Wedge Disposable Head Immobilizer, water-resistant, radiolucent, CT and 12231 $ 3.61

MRI compatible, include 2 head straps. No substitutions.

Laerdal Sta-Blok Head Immobilizer. Single use disposable device, radiolucent,| 12232 $ 3.70

Adjustable standard Velcro padded strap, latex free




Section 11: Miscellaneous Supplies Lawson Unit
Item # Price
Vendor:
Midwest Medical Supply
Disposable OB Kit, Soft Packaging 12233 $ 4.68
Alcohol Prep Pads, Medium Size TRIAD 200/bx 12234 $ 1.25
Bite Stick made of high density polyethylene 12235 $ 0.29
Bulb Syringe, 20z size 12236 $ 0.33
Emesis Bags, single use, Clear, Graduate, 1000cc, latex free, rigid collar, automatic seal 12237 $ 0.39
Hydrogen Peroxide 160z Plastic bottle 12238 $ 0.56
Sterile Lubricating Jelly, 59, 72/bx 12239 $ 0.0786
Oxygen Cylinder Handwheel, Metal 12240 $ 12.28
Large Oxygen Cylinder Wrench (aluminum) 12241 $ 4.76
Encono Paramedic Shears Drk Blue 7 1/2" 12242 $ 0.68
Disposable Penlight 12243 $ 0.55
Single use push button activated, spring loaded, retractable Lancet, 100/bx 12244 $ 7.50
Chloraprep 3mL Applicator, 2% Chlorhexidine Gluconate and 70% Isopropyl Alcohol 12245 $ 1.42
METTAG Triage Tags, with Bar code, single part 50/pk 12246 $ 42.55
Safety control seals, Pull Tite (numbered), 100/pkg 12247 $ 17.97
Razor, Medline Fixed Head, 100/bx 12248 $ 37.78
Disposable Polyester Patient Blanket, 50x84", Blue or Grey 12249 $ 4.48
Oxygen "D" Cylinder Gasket, Brass w/Rubber Center 12250 $ 0.4760
Disposable Probe Cover for SureTemp Plus Thermometer, 25/bx 12251 $ 0.86
Heavy Duty Ring Cutter 12252 $ 11.64
Section 12: Infection Control Lawson Unit
Item # Price
Vendor:
Henry Schein Inc.
Bemis bio hazard box wall safe type Bemis #150-020 12253 $ 3.60
Wrap around goggles with indirect shield-vent 24/cs 12254 $ 2.32
Clear lens safety glasses, anti-fog, contemporary styling, ANSI Z87.1 compliant 12255 $ 2.64
Fluid shield mask with clear visor, anti-fog, 2" wrap around, ear loops 25/bx 12256 $ 8.06
Inovel medical N95 respirator, all sizes, must meet CDC guidelines for tuberculosis 12257 $ 0.87
exposure control in addition to NIOSH and CDC standards for N95 protection against
airbourne pathogens 24/pk
3M Particulate Respirator and Surgical Mask 1860/1860S 12258 $ 0.80
3M Particulate Respirator, 8210 12259 $ 0.94




Section 13: Capitals Lawson Unit
Item # Price
Vendor:
Bound Tree Medical
Lifepack 12 basic carry case, to include Shoulder strip, right pouch, left pouch, and front| 12260 $ 260.56
cover, Physio Control #11260-00030
Lifepack 12 back pouch for carry case, Phylsio Control #11260-000029 12261 $ 70.65
Lifepack 12 top pouch for carry case, Physio Control #11220-000028 12262 $ 45.27
Liftpack 12 replacement should strap, Physio Control #11260-000037 12263 $ 28.80
Aneroid Sphygmomanometer, infant, Nylon cuff, minimum 10 vyear calibration| 12264 $ 5.99
Warranty, with zippered carry case
Aneroid Sphygomomanometer, pedi, Nylon cuff, latex, minimum 10 year Calibration| 12265 $ 5.99
warranty, with zippered carry case
Aneroid Sphygomomanometer, adult, Nylon cuff, latex, minimum 10 year Calibration| 12266 $ 5.99
warranty, with zippered
Aneroid Sphygomomanometer, large adult, Nylon cuff, latex, minimum 10 year| 12267 $ 5.99
Calibration warranty, with zippered carry case
Aneroid Sphygomomanometer, thigh, Nylon cuff, latex, minimum 10 year Calibration| 12268 $ 5.99
warranty, with zippered carry case
Adult full arm splint Fracture-Pak 12269 $ 2461
Adult full leg splint Fracture-Pak 12270 $ 44.58
Ankle/Elbow splint Fracture-Pak 12271 $ 2461
Pedi full arm splint Fracture-Pak 12272 $ 23.48
Pedi full leg splint Fracture-Pak 12273 $ 35.05
Greenline/D disposable fiber optic Laryngoscope handle, medium 12274 $ 34.54
Oxygen flow meter with Ohmeda QC Adapter 1-15LPM 12275 $ 33.96
ADScope 603 Stethoscope, Navy Blue, Stainless Steel, 21", w/additional eartips and| 12276 $ 27.37
diaphragm
CPAP starter kit promo wW/CPAP unit, 1 breathing circuit with harness, back pack,| 12277 $ 1,215.07
Medium mask
Oxygen/Ventillator bag, yellow, D size, ProPak, #SA:06 12278 $ 166.86
Ohmeda Male and Ohmeda Female quick connect w/6” hose 12279 $ 64.24
Thermometer, electronic, SureTemp Plus Model 690 12280 $ 259.95
Probe and well Kit, rectal 4’, for SureTempPlus 690 thermometer 12281 $ 79.89
Probe and well kit, oral, 4’, for SureTempcPlus 690 themometer 12282 $ 259.95
Restraint strap seat belt buckle loop end, Black, 2 piece, 5’ 12283 $ 7.34
Restraint straps chest system, black, nylon, Metal push button, loop ends 12284 $ 33.53
POSEY Locking Twice-as-Tough CUFF WRIST Restraint with lock on connecting| 12285 $ 24.49
strap, adjustable, machine washable
POSEY Locking Twice-as-Tough Ankle Restraint with lock on cuff and connecting| 12286 $ 25.29

strap, adjustable, machine washable




Section 13: Capitals (cont'd) Lawson Unit
Item # Price
Vendor:
Bound Tree Medical
Oxygen cylinder with toggle, aluminum, D size 12287 $ 47.76
Oxygen regulator/pressure reducer, brass, CGA 540 2800-R-2 12288 $ 72.02
Oxygen regulator, 1 DISS 1BARB 0-25 LPM 12289 $ 67.21
Megamover plus transport unit, 40x80 Nonwoven ply gret w/backboard pockets, 1500 Ib| 12290 $ 26.14
capacity
Break-apart stretcher, aluminum, w/3 Patient restraint straps, minimum load Capacity] 12291 $ 27525
400 Ib
LP15 Standard Carry Case with Right & Left Pouches, Physio Control #11577-000002 12292 $ 254.68
LP15 Rear Pouch for carry case, Physio Control #11260-000039 12293 $ 66.26
LP15 Shoulder Strap, Physio Control #11577-000001 12294 $ 30.82
LUCAS 2 Disposable Suction Cup, 3/pk, Physio Control #11576-000046 12295 $ 11848
LUCAS Patient Strap, Physio Control #11576-000050 12296 $ 88.74
LUCAS Stabilization Strap, Physio Control #21996-000064 12297 $ 82.14
LUCAS Standard Back Plate, Physio Control #21996-000044 12298 $ 29514
Replacement Ankle Hitch for QD3 & QD4 Traction 12299 $ 15.24
Oxygen cylinder with toggle, aluminum, C size 12300 $ 45.74
S-Scort “ten” replacement battery, SN 3000 and below 12301 $ 41.64
S-Scort Quickdraw replacement 12V rechargeable battery, Sealed Lead Acid 12302 $ 67.37
Traction splint w/aluminum ratchet, Adult QD-4 12303 $ 199.00
Traction splint w/aluminum ratchet, child QD-3 12304 $ 199.00
Traction splint w/aluminum ratchet, Combination QD-3 and QD-4 12305 $ 402.82
Kendrick KODE 1 vest, green 12306 $ 50.85
S-Scort “ten” port suction unit w/charging shelf and power cord 12307 $ 1,238.98
S-Scort “ten” replacement battery, SN >3001 and above 12308 $ 41.64
S-Scort Quickdraw w/spare battery, rechargeable 12V sealed lead acid 12309 $ 68.44
Clipboard, 8.5” x 14” 6/cs Style-A holder 12310 $ 24.96
LA Rescue cervical collar bag, 24”L x 11”H x 5"W 12311 $ 16.96
Trauma/Air management bag Ill, 26” x 18.5” x 12.5”, blue, Ferno #5111 12312 $ 25248
S-Scort “ten” replacement battery, SN 3001 and higher 12313 $ 41.64




Section 14: Medication Lawson Unit
Vendors must provide a Transaction Report with all prescription drug shipments.| 1tém # Price
The Transaction Report must contain all information required by the Drug Supply

Chain Security Act as outlined by the FDA.

Vendor:

Bound Tree Medical

Adenosine 6mg/2mL (3mg/mL) 2mL Single dose 12314 $ 4.24
Adenosine 12mg/4mL (3mg/mL) 4mL Single dose 12315 $ 11.48
Acetaminophen 15mL Infant Drops (80mg per 0.8mL) 12316 $ 2.48
Amiodarone, 150mg, 3mL Vial 12317 $ 1.94
Aspirin 81mg Tablets 36/bottle 12318 $ 1.50
Atropine Sulfate 18g x 1 1/2", 0.1mg/mL, 10mL Prefilled Syringe with protected needle 12319 $ 18.10
Atrovent Solution 0.5mg, 2.5mL 12320 $ 4.27
Cardizem 25mg, 5mL Vial 12321 $ 2.89
Diphenhydramine 50mg/mL, 1mL Vial 12322 $ 1.16
Dextrose USP 50%, 189 protected needle, 25grams (0.5g/mL) 12323 $ 12.24
Diazepam Injection 10mg (5mg/mL) 2mL Single Dose 12324 $ 43.58
Dopamine HCL in 5% Dextrose, 500mL IV Bag-800mg 12325 $ 27.95
Epinephrine 1:1000, 1mg/mL, 1mL Single dose 12326 $ 2.62
Epinephrine 1:1,000, 30mg, 30mL Multi-dose Vial 12327 $ 38.98
Epinephrine 1:10,000, 18g, 1/2" (0.1mg/mL) 10mL Prefill Syringe with protected needle 12328 $ 6.34
Amidate (Etomidate Injection), 20mg (2mg/mL), 10mL Single Dose Ampule 12329 $ 8.89
Fentanyl Citrate Injection USP, 250mcg (0.05mg per mL) in 5mL luer lock syringe 12330 $ 46.86
Glucagon 1mg Lilly Kit Red Box 2050A 12331 $ 27848
Glutose 37.5g Unit dose tube 12332 $ 3.68
Heparin Sodium 5000u, 1mL Carpuject 12333 $ 2.82
Ibuprofen Oral Suspension 100mg, 5 mL 12334 $ 37.65
C3 Ketamine 5mg/ml 10ml 10/bx / controlled 12335 $ 46.86
Lasix 40mg, 10mg/mL in 4mL Prefill Needleless Syringe 12336 $ 5.26
Lidocaine 2% with male luer lock prefilled syringe, 100mg/5mL 12337 $ 4.46
Lidocaine 2g in 500mL D5W 12338 $ 7.64
Lidocaine 2%, 20mL Multidose Vial 12339 $ 2.14
Magnesium Sulfate 50%, 1g/2mL Vial 12340 $ 1.98
Metoprolol 5mg, 5mL Vial 12341 $ 1.48
Midazolam 2mg, 2mL single dose 12342 $ 32.05
Morphine Sulfate Injection, USP 1mg/mL, 10mL single dose 12343 $ 24.68
Naloxone 2mg/2mL - 2mL Pre-filled Syringe 12344 $ 48.13
Nitroglycerin Qintment, 2%, 30g Tube 12345 $ 44.78
Nitrolingual Spray, 4.1g, 400mcg per Spray, 90 sprays per can 12346 $ 155.00
Nitrostat, 0.4mg Sublingual Tabs, 25 per bottle 12347 $ 17.68




Section 14: Medication (cont'd) Lawson Unit
Vendors must provide a Transaction Report with all prescription drug shipments.| Item # Price
The Transaction Report must contain all information required by the Drug Supply

Chain Security Act as outlined by the FDA.

Vendor:

Bound Tree Medical

Pepsid 20mg Tablet, Unit Dose 12348 $ 3.75
Albuterol Sulfate, USP Inhalation Solution, 0.083%, 2.5mg/3mL (0.83mg/mL), 25/bx 12349 $ 3.68
Rocuronium 10mg/mL, 10mL Vial 12350 $ 7.24
Sodium Bicarb 8.4%, 50mEqg, 50mL Prefilled luer lock syringe 12351 $ 12.88
0.9% Sodium Chloride, 5mL in 12mL luer lock syringe 12352 $ 0.40
Solumedrol 125mg, 2mL Acto-vial 12353 $ 8.68
Succinylcholine 200mg, 10mL vial 12354 $ 24.34
Tetracaine Hydrochloride Ophthalmic Solution, 1/2%, 1mL Single Dose Units, 12/bx 12355 $ 9.68
Thiamine 100mg/mL in 2mL Single dose vial 12356 $ 14.12
Vasostrict 20 unit, 1mL vial 12357 $ 148.86
Carpuject Injector 12358 $ 0.02
Ondansetron 4mg 2ml VIAL 25EA/BX 4BX/CS 12359 $ 0.74
Mucosal Automation Device, Nasal/Oral, Latex free, 3mL Syringe 12360 $ 6.56
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