HeLrmaN ForDp

August 15, 2015

Ms. Debbie Kaminski

Fort Bend County Purchasing
301 Jackson St. Suite 300
Richmond, TX 77469

RE: Vehicle Pricing Bid # 15-028

Helfman Ford will be pleased to extend (rollover) the current
pricing for all vehicles for 2016 models on this Bid with the
exception of the F150 and Taurus models. Ford is still producing
2015 units and has not announced 2016 model pricing for these
2 lines yet. As soon as Ford releases them, | expect to be able to
continue current pricing as well and will confirm to you.

Helfman Ford is proud to serve our county and hopes this will
be acceptable. Please let me know if there are any questions.

Thank you,

Bill Chrisman
Fleet Manager

715/9240.3673 12220 SOUTHWEST FRWY. e
STAFFORD, TEXAS 77477 EAX 7130240-1821



Tabulation

Purchase of Vehicles

Bid 15-028

Awarded 10/14/14: Low bidder per item as highlighted
Renewed through 9/30/2016

Description Caldwell Classic Helfman Helfman Meador Randall Tommie

Country Chevrolet Dodge Ford Dodge Reed's Vaughn
Chevrolet | Sugar Land Houston Stafford Fort Worth [Prestige Ford Motors
Caldwell Garland Houston

Vehicle 4: Non-Police Package 4- $18,342.00 | Disqualified: No Bid $16,550.00 No Bid $17,300.00 No Bid

Door Sedan Not as

specified

Vehicle 11: Truck, 3/4 ton, Extended | $25,640.00 | $24,692.00 No Bid $22,765.00 No Bid $23,200.00 $23,789.77

Cab, SWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power

(windows, locks), TTP

Vehicle 12: Truck, 3/4 ton, Extended | $25,640.00 | $24,692.00 No Bid $22,850.00 No Bid $23,300.00 | $23,885.77

Cab, SWB, Cloth Split Bench, Power

(windows, locks), TTP

Vehicle 13: Truck, 3/4 ton, Extended | $25,490.00 $24,598.00 No Bid $22,100.00 No Bid $22,600.00 $23,227.67

Cab, LWB, Vinyl Split Bench, No

Power, TTP

Vehicle 15: Truck, 1 ton, 4-Door $28,545.00 | $27,327.00 No Bid $26,175.00 | Disqualified: | $26,850.00 | $27,451.77

Crew Cab, LWB, Vinyl Bench & Not as

Flooring, Power (windows,lock), TTP specified

Vehicle 19: Ford, Explorer Police No Bid No Bid No Bid $24,000.00 No Bid $24,950.00 No Bid

Inceptor Utility, Cloth, Power (seat,

windows, locks, mirrors), No

Spotlight, No Backup Camera

Vehicle 23: Ford, Explorer (or equal), No Bid No Bid No Bid $24,650.00 No Bid $25,400.00 | $29,012.56

Cloth, Power (windows, locks), TTP
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