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CenturyAsphalt,LTD

PO Box 187 .7 Houston, TX 77001 ./ 56303 Navigation Boulevard ./ Houston, TX 77011 ./ 713-292-2868 ./ Fax 713-292-2885

August 21, 2015

Ms.Cheryl Krejci, CPPB

Fort Bend County Purchasing Department
4520 Reading Road, Suite A

Rosenberg, Texas 77471

RE: Bid 15-053 Price Increase
Dear Ms. Krejci:
In accordance with Paragraph 1.35 in the above mentioned bid, Century Asphalt hereby requests a price increase on

Hot Mix Asphalt for Fort Bend County.

This price increase is being driven by two factors: First, Century’s aggregate supplier, Martin Marietta Materials,
recently announced and applied price increases for all crushed stone products delivered via rail into their Rosenberg
Terminal. Secondly, Century’s operating costs have risen significantly due to the indefinite suspension of natural
gas flow to our production facility. Century was notified by our natural gas supplier, James Construction Group,
that the public utility gas line which feeds our production facility has been indefinitely shut down because of right of
way encroachment issues, thereby forcing us to use a much more expensive fuel for operating the facility.

I have attached a letter from our aggregate supplier as well as notification from the pipeline owner as justification
for the following price increases.

Current Pricing

o Material Rosenberg
THD #292 Black Base without RAP $50.00/ton
THD #292 Black Base with RAP $42.50/ton
THD #340 Type D without RAP $62.00/ton
[ THD #340 Type D with RAP $48.50/ton
New Pricing
e — Material | Rosenberg Percent Increased
THD #292 Black Base without RAP $54.65/ton 9.3%
_THD #292 Black Base with RAP $46.90/ton 10.4%
THD #340 | Type D without RAP $66.75/ton 7.7% |
THD #340 | Type D with RAP $53.00/ton 9.3% |
We value the relationship that we have with Fort Bend County and look forward to a continued working
relationship.

Regards,

hillip
Vice President/General Manager
pking@centuryasphalt.com

CC: Trison International Inc.
Enclosed

www.centuryasphalt.com




Awarded Commissioners Court 3/10/15: Award to all bidders meeting specifications

Fort Bend County Tabulation

Bid 15-053
Term Contract for Purchase and Hauling of Earthen Type Road Materials

Term: April 1, 2015 through March 31, 2016

*Amended 9.01.15

*Asphalt Stabilized Base, THD #292, Black Base without RAP, Price Per Ton

Lawson 11936- American | Century Cherry Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt Crushed Greene Stabilized North Marietta | Division of | Division of | Materials County
Lawson 11937- Concrete Materials | America James James Asphalt
laydown Const. Const.
Plant 56.00 *54.65 54.75
Plant
Plant
Plant to Jobsite-1st 3.00 3.25 3.00
mile
Each add'l mile 0.20 0.20 0.20
Laydown No Bid 14.00 20.00 25.00
Plant Location Mo City| Rosenberg Rosenberg
Minimum $5.25 haul 800 tons

& 800 tons




*Asphalt Stabilized Base, THD #292, Black Base with RAP, Price Per Ton

Lawson 11938- American | Century Cherry Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt Crushed Greene | Stabilized North Marietta | Division of | Division of | Materials County
Lawson 11939- Materials | America James James Asphalt
laydown Const. Const.
Plant 51.00 *46.90 46.50
Plant
Plant
Plant to Jobsite-1st 3.00 3.25 3.00
mile

Each add'l mile 0.20 0.20 20.00
Laydown No Bid 14.00 20.00 25.00
Plant Location Mo City| Rosenberg Rosenberg
Minimum $5.25 haul 800 tons

& 800 tons
Cement Stabilized Sand, THD & PT #400.5 Portland Cement, Type I, 2 sack minimum, Price Per Ton
Lawson 11940- American | Century Cherry Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt Crushed Greene | Stabilized North Marietta | Division of | Division of | Materials County
Materials | America James James Asphalt
Const. Const.

Plant 18.00 23.35
Plant to Jobsite-1st 2.50 3.08
mile

Each add'l mile 0.25 0.25
Laydown
Plant Location Richmond Richmond
Per 1/2 sack 2.50 2.75

cement




Flexible Base, must be free of foreign materils (asphalt, base, dirt, wire or any uncommon items), Type A", Grade ""1", Crushed Concrete, Price Per Ton

Lawson 11941- American | Century Cherry Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt Crushed Greene Stabilized North Marietta | Division of | Division of | Materials County
Lawson 11942- Materials | America James James Asphalt
laydown Const. Const.
Plant 15.90 18.00 20.00
Plant to Jobsite-1st 3.00 2.90 2.50
mile
Each add'l mile 0.20 0.20 0.25
Laydown No bid No bid No bid 20.00 25.00
Plant Location Mo City Katy Fresno
Minimum $5.00 haul 500 tons

Flexible Base, must be free of foreign materils (asphalt, base, dirt, wire or any uncommon items), Type ""A", Grade ""1", Crushed Concrete with 3% cement
added, Price Per Ton

Lawson 11943- American | Century Cherry Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt Crushed Greene Stabilized North Marietta | Division of | Division of | Materials County
Materials | America James James Asphalt
Const. Const.
Plant 29.00
Plant to Jobsite-1st 2.50
mile
Each add'l mile 0.25
Laydown No bid
Plant Location Richmond

Minimum




Gravel, River Unwashed, 5/8'" Diameter Maximum, Price Per Yard

Lawson 11944- American | Century Cherry Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt Crushed Greene | Stabilized North Marietta | Division of | Division of | Materials County
Materials | America James James Asphalt
Const. Const.

Plant 18.00 14.50
Plant to Jobsite-1st 3.30 3.00
mile

Each add'l mile 0.26 0.21
Plant Location Garwood Wallis

*Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement, THD #340, Type D without RAP, Price Per Ton

Lawson 11945- American | Century Cherry Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt Crushed Greene Stabilized North Marietta | Division of | Division of | Materials County
Lawson 11946- Materials | America James James Asphalt
laydown Const. Const.
Plant 63.00 *66.75 60.00
Plant
Plant
Plant to Jobsite-1st 3.00 3.25 3.00
mile

Each add'l mile 0.20 0.20 0.20
Laydown No bid 14.00 20.00 25.00
Plant Location Mo City| Rosenberg Rosenberg
Minimum $5.25 haul 800 tons

& 800 tons




*Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement, THD #340, Type D with RAP, Price Per Ton

Lawson 11947- American | Century Cherry Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt Crushed Greene Stabilized North Marietta | Division of | Division of | Materials County
Lawson 11948- Materials | America James James Asphalt
laydown Const. Const.
Plant 57.50 *53.00 54.00
Plant
Plant
Plant to Jobsite-1st 3.00 3.25 3.00
mile

Each add'l mile 0.20 0.20 0.20
Laydown No bid 14.00 20.00 25.00
Plant Location Mo City| Rosenberg Rosenberg
Minimum $5.25 haul 800 tons

& 800 tons
Hot Mix-Cold Laid, Asphaltic Concrete Pavement, Type D, THD #350, Price Per Ton
Lawson 11949- American | Century Cherry Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt Crushed Greene | Stabilized North Marietta | Division of | Division of | Materials County
Materials | America James James Asphalt
Const. Const.

Plant 110.00
Plant to Jobsite-1st 3.00
mile

Each add'l mile 0.15
Laydown 0.20
Plant Location Rosenberg

Minimum




Precoated Coverstone, PB-3, Price Per Ton

Lawson 11950- American | Century Cherry Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt Crushed Greene | Stabilized North Marietta | Division of | Division of | Materials County
Lawson 11951- Materials | America James James Asphalt
laydown Const. Const.
Plant 69.25 19.00
Plant
Plant to Jobsite-1st 3.00 0.16
mile

Each add'l mile 0.20 0.16
Laydown 25.00
Plant Location Rosenberg Dabney
Minimum 500 tons

Precoated Coverstone, PB-4 & PB-5, Price Per Ton

Lawson 11952- American | Century Cherry Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt Crushed Greene | Stabilized North Marietta | Division of | Division of | Materials County
Lawson 11953- Materials | America James James Asphalt
laydown Const. Const.
Plant 69.25 20.00
Plant
Plant to Jobsite-1st 3.00 0.16
mile

Each add'l mile 0.20 0.16
Laydown 25.00
Plant Location Rosenberg Dabney
Minimum 500 tons




Recycled Asphalt, Screened, 3" Diameter Maximum, Price Per Ton

Lawson 11954- American | Century Cherry Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt Crushed Greene | Stabilized North Marietta | Division of | Division of | Materials County
Materials | America James James Asphalt
Const. Const.
Plant 30.00
Plant to Jobsite-1st 2.50
mile
Each add'l mile 0.25
Laydown
Plant Location Fresno
Minimum
Type A Hydrated Lime, THD #264, 90.0% Ca(OH) 2 Min., Delivered in Closed Tankers, Price Per Ton
Lawson 11955- American | Century Cherry Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt Crushed Greene | Stabilized North Marietta | Division of | Division of | Materials County
Materials | America James James Asphalt
Const. Const.
Delivered and 152.00

applied




Pulverizing Existing Asphalt and/or Base Road , Price Per Foot

Lawson number | American | Century Cherry Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller

beside each item Materials | Asphalt Crushed Greene | Stabilized North Marietta | Division of | Division of | Materials County
Materials | America James James Asphalt

Const. Const.

Up to 2" Depth 1.55 2.00

11956

Up to 4" Depth 2.55 3.00

11957

Up to 6" Depth 3.55 4.00

11958

Up to 8" Depth 4.55 5.00

11959

Up to 10" Depth 5.55 6.00

11960

Up to 12" Depth 6.55 7.00

11961

Up to 14" Depth 7.55 8.00

11962

Pulverizing 4.05 4.50

existing 11963

Transported by 50.00 100.00

FBC 11964

Transported by 10.00 50.00

Contractors

vehicles 11965




Field Sand, Price Per Ton

Lawson 11966- American | Century Cherry Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt Crushed Greene | Stabilized North Marietta | Division of | Division of | Materials County
Materials | America James James Asphalt
Const. Const.
Plant 7.00
Plant to Jobsite-1st No bid
mile
Each add'l mile No bid
Plant Location Simonton
Fly Ash, Price Per Ton
American | Century Cherry Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
Materials | Asphalt Crushed Greene | Stabilized North Marietta | Division of | Division of | Materials County
Materials | America James James Asphalt
Const. Const.

Plant

Plant to Jobsite-1st
mile

Each add'l mile

Plant Location

Installation

Minimum




Texas ASPPM Grade IV Cold Mix - Road repair material, Price Per Ton

Lawson 11967- American | Century Cherry Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt Crushed Greene | Stabilized North Marietta | Division of | Division of | Materials County
Materials | America James James Asphalt
Const. Const.
Plant 90.00
Delivered to jobsite
Plant to Jobsite-1st 0.23
mile
Each add'l mile 0.23
Laydown
Plant Location Hempstead
Lime and Lime Slurry - #264, Price Per Ton
Lawson 11968- American | Century Cherry Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt Crushed Greene | Stabilized North Marietta | Division of | Division of | Materials County
Materials | America James James Asphalt
Const. Const.
31% Dry Solids 152.00
35% Dry Solids 152.00
46% Dry Solids No Bid
Fly Ash Stabilized Road Mix 50/50, Price Per Ton
American | Century Cherry Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
Materials | Asphalt Crushed Greene | Stabilized North Marietta | Division of | Division of | Materials County
Materials | America James James Asphalt
Const. Const.

Plant

Plant to Jobsite-1st
mile

Each add'l mile

Plant Location

Installation




Asphalt Aggregate, limestone Type D, 7/16" by #4 Graduation, Price Per Ton

Lawson 11969 American | Century Cherry Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt Crushed Greene | Stabilized North Marietta | Division of | Division of | Materials County
Materials | America James James Asphalt
Const. Const.

Plant 35.00 25.50
Plant to Jobsite-1st 4.05 No Bid
mile

Each add'l mile 0.26 No Bid
Plant Location Rosenberg Mykawa
Comment End Dump D/F Blend

Type C, Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement: THD #341, Class A Aggregates with PG7622 Qil, Price Per Ton

Lawson 11970- American | Century Cherry Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt Crushed Greene | Stabilized North Marietta | Division of | Division of | Materials County
Lawson 11971- Materials | America James James Asphalt
laydown Const. Const.
Plant 95.00 72.00 90.00
Plant to Jobsite-1st 3.00 3.25 3.00
mile

Each add'l mile 0.20 0.20 0.20
Laydown No bid 14.00 20.00 25.00 | Rosenberg
Plant Location Mo City| Rosenberg
Minimum $5.25 haul 800 tons

& 800 tons




623 Traprock, Grade 3, THD #302, Price Per Ton

Lawson 11972- American | Century Cherry Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt Crushed Greene | Stabilized North Marietta | Division of | Division of | Materials County
Materials | America James James Asphalt
Const. Const.

Plant 42.00
Plant to Jobsite-1st No bid
mile

Each add'l mile No bid
Laydown No bid
Plant Location Stafford
Minimum

623 Traprock, Grade 5, THD #302, Price Per Ton
Lawson 11973- American | Century Cherry Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt Crushed Greene Stabilized North Marietta | Division of | Division of | Materials County
Materials | America James James Asphalt
Const. Const.

Plant 42.00
Plant to Jobsite-1st No bid
mile

Each add'l mile No bid
Laydown No bid
Plant Location Stafford

Minimum




Bullrock, 3" x 5", Price Per Ton

Lawson 11974- American | Century Cherry Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt Crushed Greene | Stabilized North Marietta | Division of | Division of | Materials County
Materials | America James James Asphalt
Const. Const.

Plant 20.50 25.50 35.00 29.00
Plant to Jobsite-1st 2.90 3.50 4.05 No bid
mile

Each add'l mile 0.20 0.25 0.26 No bid
Laydown No bid No bid No bid
Plant Location Katy Fresno Rosenberg Mykawa
Installation No bid 20.00 No bid No bid
Minimum $5.00 haul

Rip Rap, Grade 1, 12" to 18", Price Per Ton
Lawson 11975- American | Century Cherry Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt Crushed Greene | Stabilized North Marietta | Division of | Division of | Materials County
Materials | America James James Asphalt
Const. Const.

Plant 26.00 29.75 43.00
Plant to Jobsite-1st 2.90 2.50 No bid
mile

Each add'l mile 0.20 0.25 No bid
Installation No bid No bid 20.00 No bid
Plant Location Katy| Holmes Rd Mykawa
Minimum $5.00 haul
Comment 8" -18'
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