

2014 Vehicle Order
Bid 14-016
Commissioners Court 08/05/2014

Vehicle #	Quantity	Department	Replacement/ Addition	Each	Total	Funding
1: Tahoe	1	Sheriff's Office	Replacement	\$27,949.00	\$27,949.00	Insurance funds from units R-046, R-027 and R-018.

**Tabulation
Bid 14-016
Purchase of Vehicles**

Awarded Commissioners Court 10/22/13: Low bidder per item as highlighted

Description	Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldwell	Caldwell Country Ford Caldwell	Dallas Dodge Dallas	Grapevine Dodge Grapevine	Helfman Dodge Houston	Helfman Ford Stafford	Meador Dodge Fort Worth	Randall Reed's Prestige Ford Garland
Vehicle 1: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe with spotlight and dual battery	\$27,949.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Vehicle 2: Chevrolet PPV Caprice with spotlight	\$27,040.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Vehicle 3: Ford Police Inceptor	No Bid	\$23,244.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$22,429.00	No Bid	\$24,436.00
Vehicle 4: Non-Police Package 4-Door Sedan	\$17,946.00	\$16,296.00	No Bid	Does not meet specifications for wheelbase	No Bid	\$16,399.00 within 3% from a local vendor pursuant to §271.905	No Bid	\$16,775.00
Vehicle 5: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, Crew Cab, SWB, Cloth Buckets, Power (seat, windows, locks, mirrors), TTP	\$28,858.00	\$22,919.00	No Bid	\$27,146.00	No Bid	\$24,475.00	\$26,246.00	\$24,860.00