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IN THE MATTER OF TRANSFERRING OF BUDGET SURPLUS OF FORT BEND COUNTY

FOR THE YEAR 2013
. Jud iy . .
On this the 25 day of 2012 , the Commissioners' Court, with the following members being present:

Robert E. Hebert - County Judge

Richard Morrison - Commissioner Precinct #1
Grady Prestage - Commissioner Precinct #2
Andy Meyers - Commissioner Precinct #3
James Patterson - Commissioner Precinct #4

The following proceedings were had, to-writ,

THAT WHEREAS, theretofore, on September 11, 2012, the Court heard and approved the budget for the year 2013 for Fort Bend
County; and

WHEREAS, on proper application, the Commissioners' Court has transferred an existing budget surplus to a budget of a similar kind
and fund. The transfer does not increase the total of the budget.

The following transfers to said budget are hereby authorized:

Department Name: COUNTY COURT AT LAW NO. 1 Accounting Unit: 100416100

TRANSFER TO:

ACCOUNT NAME ACCOUNT NUMBER AMOUNT

IT 65000 $ 1,500

TOTAL TRANSFERRED TO: $ 1,500

TRANSFER FROM:

ACCOUNT NAME ACCOUNT NUMBER AMOUNT

FEES & SERVICES 63000 $ 1,500
TOTAL TRANSFERRED FROM: 3 | 1,500

EXPLANATION: HP 5000N printer in the courtroom is no longer working. Fuse burned out - to old for replacement

parts. Probate Auditor's printer is not working and is not repairable. IT was able to connect her to an older printer
(purchased in approx. 1993). Quote from IT department is attached for both printer requests.
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Department Head; Date: 17-Jul-13
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Green, Regina

From: Janczak, Sandra

Sent: Wednesday, July 17, 2013 9:51 AM
To: Green, Regina

Subject: Task 46598 Printer quote

Regina, take a look at this printer. The quote is at the bottom of the page. Let me know what you think of this one. It
has the additional paper tray for the legal.

http://www.shopping.hp.com/en US/home-office/-/products/Printers/HP-

Laser]et/CE749A?umpid=ex r11400 us/en/commprint/IPG/ ps b CE749ABG]/SKULaser]etCE749ABG]Phrase&k
clickid=AMS|13|64759|68d5b431-582a-f6a9-0b33-0000076352¢9

From: Arturo Lopez [mailto:Arturo.Lopez@TechDepot.com]
Sent: Wednesday, July 17, 2013 9:47 AM

To: Janczak, Sandra

Subject: Re: Printer quote

Hello Sandra,

Good morning, thank you for the information. Please review following quote and let me know if there are any
questions or anything else is needed.

TEEHDEPOT Product Quote

AN OFFICE DEPOT COMPANY

Tech Depot appreciates this opportunity to provide your organization this product(s) quote.
Tech Depot strives to make your buying experience straightforward and streamlined by
offering intelligent product choices, top brands, and competitive prices, with the support you

demand.

17-Jul-2013

S8 B13074452 | (855) 337-6811

Sandra Janczak
Fort Bend County Clerk
301 Jackson

Ste 533

Richmond, TX 77469

Auditor's Office
Fort Bend County
301 Jackson
Purchase Order
Richmond, TX 77469

S§7775999 | CE749A#BGJ | HP LaserJet PRO P1606DN -

printer - B/W - laser (Prices

Effective through 7-27-2013)
Contract Number: R5113




56605830 Q6264A | HP USB cable - 6 ft contract 1
Number: R5113

S§7759230 CE278A | HP 78A - BLACK PRINT 1
CARTRIDGE FOR LASERJET

P1566/P1606 contract Number:
R5113

Subtotal

TAX (applicable states only)

SHIPPING & HANDLING [Standard Ground] [§
TOTAL

04-188-3971

06-1526627

Thank you once again for your consideration and feel free to contact me with any questions.

If this quote meets your requirements and you are set to purchase, please click the link below:

http://www.techdepot.com/pro/3.asp?c=pq&r=Ir&s=7049842

Quote is subject to Tech Depot’s Standard Terms and Conditions. To view our terms click here,

This transmission may contain confidential or proprietary information and is intended solely for the use of the person to whom it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient, you are
hereby notified that the distribution, copying or other unauthorized use of this facsimile or any information contained herein is prohibited. If you receive this transmission in error, please notify
us immediately at the phone number listed above and return it to us by mail (at our expense) at the address listed above. Thank you,

Thanks,
Art

On Wed, Jul 17, 2013 at 7:03 AM, Janczak, Sandra <Sandra.Janczak@fortbendcountytx.gov> wrote:

In order to fit under her desk the printer cannot be taller than 15 % “

From: Arturo Lopez [mailto:Arturo.Lopez@TechDepot.com]
Sent: Tuesday, July 16, 2013 4:32 PM

To: Janczak, Sandra

Subject: Re: Printer quote

Sandra,



