
 Section  A to Z Tire  American 
Tire 

 Beasley Tire  Jee 
Wholesale 

 Southern 
Tire 

 Strouhal 
Tire 

 Tire Centers  Wingfoot 

 Section 1:                        
Tubes 

 $     7,070.99  $     7,642.38  $   10,520.00  $     6,767.99  Disq: Did not 
bid all items 

 No Bid  Disq: Did not 
bid all items 

 Section 2:                        
Michelin 

 Disq: Bid Sub  $   19,300.00  $   16,700.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $   18,525.50 

 Section 3: 
Bridgestone/Firestone 

 Disq: Bid Sub  $   58,149.00  $   51,700.00  No Bid  $   60,710.00  No Bid  No Bid 

 Section 4: 
Continental/General  

 Disq: Bid Sub  Disq: Did not 
bid all items 

 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 Section 5:                        
Goodyear  

 $ 399,796.00  $ 389,428.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 Section 6:                        
Michelin  

 Disq: Bid Sub  Disq: Pricing not 
thru 9/13 

 $ 181,500.00  No Bid  No Bid  Disq: Did not 
bid all items 

 $ 182,350.30 

 Section 7:                        
BF Goodrich  

 Disq: Bid Sub  Disq: Pricing not 
thru 9/13 

 $   20,510.00  No Bid  No Bid  $   19,998.60  $   19,998.60 

 Section 8:                        
Uniroyal 

 Disq: Bid Sub  $   42,447.60  $   43,660.00  No Bid  No Bid  Disq: Did not 
bid all items 

 $   43,632.60 

 Section 9: 
Bridgestone/Firestone 

 Disq: Bid Sub  $ 181,120.92  $ 174,618.00  No Bid  $ 187,312.92  No Bid  No Bid 

 Section 10:                      
Goodyear  

 $ 118,453.90  $ 116,522.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 Fort Bend County Tabulation 
 BID 13-002 

 Term Contract for Tires and Tubes 

 Term:  1 October 2012 through 30 September 2013 

 Disqualified 
entire bid for 
altering terms 
and conditions 

 Recommendation: Low bidder per section  



 Section  A to Z Tire  American 
Tire 

 Beasley Tire  Jee 
Wholesale 

 Southern 
Tire 

 Strouhal 
Tire 

 Tire Centers  Wingfoot 

 Section 11:                      
Generic 

 $   47,243.92  $   40,344.82  $   38,818.00  $   51,832.80  $   41,735.22  No Bid  $   69,461.56 

 Section 12:                      
Michelin 

 Disq: Bid Sub  Disq: Pricing not 
thru 9/13 

 $     1,388.00  No Bid  No Bid  $     1,428.44  $     1,353.24 

 Section 13:                      
BF Goodrich 

 Disq: Bid Sub  No Bid  $     1,020.00  No Bid  No Bid  $     1,018.56  $     1,018.56 

 Section 14: 
Bridgestone/Firestone 

 Disq: Bid Sub  $     5,536.08  $     4,352.00  No Bid  $     5,426.24  No Bid  No Bid 

 Section 15: 
Continental/General  

 Disq: Bid Sub  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $     9,374.80 

 Section 16:                      
Michelin  

 Disq: Bid Sub  Disq: Did not 
bid all items 

 $ 126,308.00  No Bid  No Bid  Disq: Did not 
bid all items 

 $ 129,668.58 

 Section 17:                      
BF Goodrich 

 Disq: Bid Sub  No Bid  $     4,080.00  No Bid  No Bid  $     4,082.00  $     4,082.00 

 Section 18: 
Bridgestone/Firestone 

 Disq: Bid Sub  Disq: Did not 
bid all items 

 $   31,194.00  No Bid  Disq: Did not 
bid all items 

 No Bid  No Bid 

 Section 19: 
Continental/General  

 $   39,600.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $   45,526.76 

 Section 20:                      
Goodyear  

 Disq: Bid Sub  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 Section 21:                      
Generic 

 $   36,759.10  No Bid  $   43,758.00  Disq: Did not 
bid all items 

 $   48,233.02  No Bid  No Bid 

 Section 22:                      
Michelin  

 Disq: Bid Sub  No Bid  $   95,674.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  Disq: Did not 
bid all items 

 Section 23: 
BridgestoneFirestone 

 $   43,610.98  No Bid  $   52,626.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 Section 24:                      
Goodyear 

 Disq: Bid Sub  $   81,260.36  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 Section 25:                      
Titan 

 Disq: Bid Sub  No Bid  $   24,399.00  No Bid  $   22,843.00  No Bid  No Bid 



 Section  A to Z Tire  American 
Tire 

 Beasley Tire  Jee 
Wholesale 

 Southern 
Tire 

 Strouhal 
Tire 

 Tire Centers  Wingfoot 

 Section 26:                      
Generic 

 $   41,384.35  No Bid  $   65,092.00  $   37,331.80  $   50,397.00  No Bid  No Bid 

 Section 27:                      
Michelin 

 Disq: Bid Sub  No Bid  $ 257,632.00  No Bid  No Bid  Disq: Did not 
bid all items 

 $ 267,770.78 

 Section 28: 
Bridgestone/Firestone 

 Disq: Bid Sub  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $   45,072.14  No Bid  No Bid 

 Section 29: 
Bridgestone/Firestone 

 Disq: Bid Sub  Disq: Did not 
bid all items 

 No Bid  Disq: Did not 
bid all items 

 $   90,089.25  No Bid  No Bid 

 Section 30:                      
Generic 

 $   65,799.35  Disq: Did not 
bid all items 

 No Bid  Disq: Did not 
bid all items 

 $ 134,859.39  No Bid  Disq: Did not 
bid all items 

 Section 31:                      
Galazy 

 Disq: Bid Sub  No Bid  $   19,838.00  Disq: Did not 
bid all items 

 $   25,900.00  No Bid  No Bid 

 Section 32: 
Continental/General 

 Disq: Bid Sub  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 Section 33:                      
Kelly 

 $     3,465.50  $     4,100.50  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 


	Recap

