MEMORANDUM

TO: Judge Robert Hebert
County Judge
FROM: Debbie Kaminski

Assistant Purchasing Agent

SUBJECT: Please sign the attached contract(s) approved in Commissioners Court
on September 07, 2010. Thank you.

DATE: September 15, 2010 COUNTY JUDGE
RECEIVED
SEP 17 2010
RETURN TO: Purchasing Department
Rosenberg Annex b
4520 Reading Road, Suite A
Rosenberg
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Fort Bend County Specification Download Acknowledgment

Invitation for Bid
Term Contract for Purchase of Tires and Tubes
BID 11-009

VENDORS MUST IMMEDIATELY RETURN THIS FORM BY FAX TO 281-341-8645

Vendor Responsibilities:

> Vendors are responsible to download and complete any addendums.
(Addendums will be posted on the Fort Bend County Website no later than 48 hours prior to
Bid Opening)
» Vendors will submit responses in accordance with requirements stated on cover of document.
» Vendors may not submit responses via email or fax.

Wingfoot Commercial Tire Systems, LLC

Legal Name of Contracting Company

Norbert Roewe, Center Manager

Contact Person

27705 Katy Freeway, Katy, Texas 77494

Complete Mailing Address
281-392-4000 281-392-1348

Telephone Number Facsimile Number

nroewe@wingfootct.com

Email Addzess

§/26 o

Signature Ddte



Fort Bend County, Texas
Invitation for Bid

Term Contract for the Purchase of Tires and Tubes

for Fort Bend County
BID 11-009
SUBMIT BIDS TO: SUBMIT NO LATER THAN:
Fort Bend County Thursday, August 26, 2010
Purchasing Department 1:30 PM (Central)
Rosenberg Annex
4520 Reading Road, Suite A
Rosenberg, TX 77471
MARK ENVELOPE:
**NOTE: BID 11-009
All correspondence must include the term Tires and Tubes
“Purchasing Department” in address to assist in
proper delivery

ALL BIDS MUST BE RECEIVED IN COUNTY PURCHASING OFFICE
BEFORE RECEIVING DATE AND TIME SPECIFIED.

BIDS RECEIVED WILL THEN BE OPENED AND PUBLICLY READ.
BIDS RECEIVED AFTER THE SPECIFIED TIME WILL BE RETURNED
UNOQPENED.

Results will not be given by phone. Fort Bend County is always conscious

Results will be provided to bidders in writing and extremely appreciative of your effort

after Commissioners Court award. in the preparation of this bid. Requests for
information must be in writing and directed
to:

Debbie Kaminski, CPPB

Assistant County Purchasing Agent
kaminskd{@ico.fort-bend.tx.us or
Fax:281-341-8645

Prepared: 07/29/10
Issued: 08/11/10




Fort Bend County Bid 11-009

Vendor Information

Wingfoot Commercial Tire Systems, LLC

Legal Name of Contracting Company

Federal ID Number (Company or Corporation) or Social Security Number (Individual)

281-392-4000 281-392-1348

Telephone Number Facsimile Number

Attention: Norbert Roewe, Center Manager
27705 Katy Freeway

Complete Mailing Address (for Correspondence)

Katy, TX 77494

City, State and Zip Code

Complete Remittance Address (if different from above)

City, State and Zip Code

Steve Wilton, Vice-President, Sales

Authorized Representative and Title (printed)

Local Representative: Norbert Roewe, Center Manager, nroewe@wingfootct.com
Authorized Signatory: Steve Wilton, Vice-President, Sales , swilton@wingfootct.com

Initials of Bidder: (2,



Fort Bend County Bid 11-009

1.0

GENERAL REQUIREMENTS:

1.1

1.2

1.3

14

1.5

1.6

1.7

Read this entire document carefully. Follow all instructions. You are responsible
for fulfilling all requirements and specifications. Be sure you understand them.

General Requirements apply to all advertised bids, however, these may be
superseded, whole or in part, by the scope, special requirements, specifications,
special specifications or other data contained herein.

Governing Law: Bidder is advised that these requirements shall be fully governed
by the laws of the State of Texas and that Fort Bend County may request and rely
on advice, decisions and opinions of the Attorney General of Texas and the
County Attorney conceming any portion of these requirements.

Bid Form Completion: Fill out, sign, and return to the Fort Bend County
Purchasing Department ONE (1) complete bid form. An authorized
representative of the bidder must sign the Contract Sheet. The contract will be
binding only when signed by the County Judge, Fort Bend County and a purchase
order authorizing the item(s) desired has been issued. The use of liquid paper is
not acceptable and may result in the disqualification of bid. If an error is made,
vendor must draw a line through error and initial each change.

Bid Returns: Bidders must return all completed bids to the Fort Bend County
Purchasing Department at 4520 Reading Road, Suite A, Rosenberg, Texas no
later than 1:30 P.M. on the date specified. Late bids will not be accepted. Bids
must be submitted in a sealed envelope, addressed as follows: Fort Bend County
Purchasing Agent, Rosenberg Annex, 4520 Reading Road, Suite A, Rosenberg,
Texas 77471.

Governing Forms: In the event of any conflict between the terms and provisions
of these requirements and the specifications, the specifications shall govern. In
the event of any conflict of interpretation of any part of this overall document,
Fort Bend County's interpretation shall govern.

Addendums: When specifications are revised, the Fort Bend County Purchasing

Department will issue an addendum addressing the nature of the change. Bidders
must sign and include it in the returned bid package.

Initials of Bidder: 424 el



Fort Bend County Bid 11-009

1.8

1.9

1.10

1.12

1.13

Hold Harmless Agreement: Contractor shall indemnify and hold Fort Bend
County harmless from all claims for personal injury, death and/or property
damage arising from any cause whatsoever, resulting directly or indirectly from
contractor's performance. Contractor shall procure and maintain, with respect to
the subject matter of this bid, appropriate insurance coverage including, as a
minimum, public liability and property damage with adequate limits to cover
contractor’s liability as may arise directly or indirectly from work performed
under terms of this bid. Certification of such coverage must be provided to the
County upon request.

Waiver of Subrogation: Bidder and bidder's insurance carrier waive any and all
rights whatsoever with regard to subrogation against Fort Bend County as an
indirect party to any suit arising out of personal or property damages resulting
from bidder's performance under this agreement.

Severability: If any section, subsection, paragraph, sentence, clause, phrase or
word of these requirements or the specifications shall be held invalid, such
holding shall not affect the remaining portions of these requirements and the
specifications and it is hereby declared that such remaining portions would have
been included in these requirements and the specifications as though the invalid
portion had been omitted.

Bonds: If this bid requires submission of bid guarantee and performance bond,
there will be a separate page explaining those requirements. Bids submitted
without the required bid bond or cashier's checks are not acceptable.

Taxes: Fort Bend County is exempt from all federal excise, state and local taxes
unless otherwise stated in this document. Fort Bend County claims exemption
from all sales and/or use taxes under Chapter 20, Title 122a, Vernon's Texas Civil
Statutes, as amended. Texas Limited Sales Tax Exemption Certificates will be
furnished upon written request to the Fort Bend County Purchasing Department.

Fiscal Funding: A multi-year lease or lease/purchase arrangement (if requested
by the specifications), or any contract continuing as a result of an extension
option, must include fiscal funding out. If, for any reason, funds are not
appropriated to continue the lease or contract, said lease or contract shall become
null and void. After expiration of the lease, leased equipment shall be removed
by the bidder from the using department without penalty of any kind or form to
Fort Bend County. All charges and physical activity related to delivery,
installation, removal and redelivery shall be the responsibility of the bidder.

Initials of Bidder: !Zé



Fort Bend County Bid 11-009

1.14

1.15

1.16

1.17

1.18

Pricing: Prices for all goods and/or services shall be firm for the duration of this
contract and shall be stated on the bid sheet. Prices shall be all inclusive. No
price changes, additions, or subsequent qualifications will be honored during the
course of the contract. All prices must be written in ink or typewritten. Pricing
on all transportation, freight, and other charges are to be prepaid by the contractor
and included in the bid prices. If there are any additional charges of any kind,
other than those mentioned above, specified or unspecified, bidder MUST
indicate the items required and attendant costs or forfeit the right to payment for
such items.

Silence of Specifications: The apparent silence of specifications as to any detail,
or the apparent omission from it of a detailed description concerning any point,
shall be regarded as meaning that only the best commercial practice is to prevail
and that only material and workmanship of the finest quality are to be used. All
interpretations of specifications shall be made on the basis of this statement. The
items furnished under this contract shall be new, unused of the latest product in
production to commercial trade and shall be of the highest quality as to materials
used and workmanship. Manufacturer furnishing these items shall be experienced
in design and construction of such items and shall be an established supplier of
the item bid.

Supplemental Materials: Bidders are responsible for including all pertinent
product data in the returned bid package. Literature, brochures, data sheets,
specification information, completed forms requested as part of the bid package
and any other facts which may affect the evaluation and subsequent contract
award should be included. Materials such as legal documents and contractual
agreements, which the bidder wishes to include as a condition of the bid, must
also be in the returned bid package. Failure to include all necessary and proper
supplemental materials may be cause to reject the entire bid.

Material Safety Data Sheets: Under the "Hazardous Communication Act",
commonly known as the "Texas Right To Know Act", a bidder must provide to
County and using departments, with each delivery, material safety data sheets,
which are, applicable to hazardous substances defined in the Act. Bidders are
obligated to maintain a current, updated file in the Fort Bend County Purchasing
Department. Failure of the bidder to maintain such a file will be cause to reject
any bid applying thereto.

Name Brands: Specifications may reference name brands and model numbers. It
is not the intent of Fort Bend County to restrict these bids in such cases, but to
establish a desired quality level of merchandise or to meet a pre-established
standard due to like existing items. Bidders may offer items of equal stature and
the burden of proof of such stature rests with them. Fort Bend County shall act as
sole judge in determining equality and acceptability of products offered.

Initials of Bidder: //L/



Fort Bend County Bid 11-009

1.19

1.20

1.21

1.22

1.23

Color Selection: Determination of colors of materials is a right reserved by the
using department unless otherwise specified in the bid. Unspecified colors shall
be quoted as standard colors, not colors, which require up charges or special
handling. Unspecified fabrics or vinyl should be construed as medium grade. If
bidder fails to get color/material approvals prior to delivery of merchandise, the
using department may refuse to accept the items and demand correct shipment
without penalty, subject to other legal remedies.

Evaluation: Evaluation shall be used as a determinant as to which bid items or
services are the most efficient and/or most economical for the County. It shall be
based on all factors, which have a bearing on price and performance of the items
in the user environment. All bids are subject to tabulation by the Fort Bend
County Purchasing Department and recommendation to Fort Bend County
Commissioners Court. Compliance with all bid requirements, delivery and needs
of the using department are considerations in evaluating bids. Pricing is NOT the
only criteria for making a recommendation. The Fort Bend County Purchasing
Department reserves the right to contact any bidder, at any time, to clarify, verify
or request information with regard to any bid.

Inspections: Fort Bend County reserves the right to inspect any item(s) or service
location for compliance with specifications and requirements and needs of the
using department. If a bidder cannot furnish a sample of a bid item, where
applicable, for review, or fails to satisfactorily show an ability to perform, the
County can reject the bid as inadequate.

Testing: Fort Bend County reserves the right to test equipment, supplies, material
and goods bid for quality, compliance with specifications and ability to meet the
needs of the user. Demonstration units must be available for review. Should the
goods or services fail to meet requirements and/or be unavailable for evaluation,
the bid is subject to rejection.

Disqualification of Bidder: Upon signing this bid document, a bidder offering to
sell supplies, materials, services, or equipment to Fort Bend County certifies that
the bidder has not violated the antitrust laws of this state codified in section 15.01,
et seq., Business & Commerce Code, or the federal antitrust laws, and has not
communicated directly or indirectly the bid made to any competitor or any other
person engaged in such line of business. Any or all bids may be rejected if the
County believes that collusion exists among the bidders. Bids in which the prices
are obviously unbalanced may be rejected. If multiple bids are submitted by a
bidder and after the bids are opened, one of the bids is withdrawn, the result will
be that all of the bids submitted by that bidder will be withdrawn; however,
nothing herein prohibits a vendor from submitting multiple bids for different
products or services.

Initials of Bidder: /3~



Fort Bend County Bid 11-009

1.24

1.25

1.26

1.27

1.28

1.29

Awards: Fort Bend County reserves the right to award this contract on the basis
of lowest and best bid in accordance with the laws of the State of Texas, to waive
any formality or irregularity, to make awards to more than one bidder, to reject
any or all bids. In the event the lowest dollar bidder meeting specifications is not
awarded a contract, the bidder may appear before the Commissioners Court and
present evidence concerning his responsibility. An award is final only upon
formal execution by the Fort Bend County Commissioners Court or the Fort Bend
County Purchasing Agent. Fort Bend County reserves the right to withdraw any
award until execution by the proper authority.

Assignment: The successful vendor may not assign, sell or otherwise transfer this
contract without written permission of Fort Bend County Commissioners Court.

Term Contracts: If the contract is intended to cover a specific time period, said
time will be given in the specifications under scope.

Maintenance: Maintenance required for equipment bid should be available in
Fort Bend County by a manufacturer authorized maintenance facility. Costs for
this service shall be shown on the bid sheet as requested or on a separate sheet, as
required. If Fort Bend County opts to include maintenance, it shall be so stated in
the purchase order and said cost will be included. Service will commence only
upon expiration of applicable warranties and should be priced accordingly.

Contract Obligation: Fort Bend County Commissioners Court must award the
contract and the County Judge or other person authorized by the Fort Bend
County Commissioners Court must sign the contract before it becomes binding on
Fort Bend County or the bidders. Department heads are not authorized to sign
agreements for Fort Bend County. Binding agreements shall remain in effect
until all products and/or services covered by this purchase have been satisfactorily
delivered and accepted.

Title Transfer: Title and Risk of Loss of goods shall not pass to Fort Bend
County until Fort Bend County actually receives and takes possession of the
goods at the point or points of delivery. Receiving times may vary with the using
department. Generally, deliveries may be made between 8:30 a.m. and 4:00 p.m.,
Monday through Friday. Bidders are advised to consult the using department for
instructions. The place of delivery shall be shown under the "Special
Requirement” section of this bid document and/or on the Purchase Order as a
"Ship To:" address.

Initials of Bidder: A—~""



Fort Bend County Bid 11-009

1.30

1.31

1.32

1.33

1.34

Purchase Order and Delivery: The successful bidder shall not deliver products or
provide services without a Fort Bend County Purchase Order, signed by an
authorized agent of the Fort Bend County Purchasing Department. The fastest,
most reasonable delivery time shall be indicated by the bidder in the proper place
on the bid sheet. Any special information concerning delivery should also be
included, on a separate sheet, if necessary. All items shall be shipped F.O.B.
inside delivery unless otherwise stated in the specifications. This shall be
understood to include bringing merchandise to the appropriate room or place
designated by the using department. Every tender or delivery of goods must fully
comply with all provisions of these requirements and the specifications including
time, delivery and quality. Nonconformance shall constitute a breach, which must
be rectified prior to expiration of the time for performance. Failure to rectify
within the performance period will be considered cause to reject future deliveries
and cancellation of the contract by Fort Bend County without prejudice to other
remedies provided by law. Where delivery times are critical, Fort Bend County
reserves the right to award accordingly.

Contract Extension: Extensions may be made only by written agreement between
Fort Bend County and the bidder. Any price escalations are limited to those
stated by the bidder in the original bid.

Termination: Fort Bend County reserves the right to terminate the contract for
default if Seller breaches any of the terms therein, including warranties of bidder
or if the bidder becomes insolvent or commits acts of bankruptcy. Such right of
termination is in addition to and not in lieu of any other remedies, which Fort
Bend County may have in law or equity. Default may be construed as, but not
limited to, failure to deliver the proper goods and/or services within the proper
amount of time, and/or to properly perform any and all services required to Fort
Bend County's satisfaction and/or to meet all other obligations and requirements.
Contracts may be terminated without cause upon thirty (30) days written notice to
either party unless otherwise specified.

Recycled Materials: Fort Bend County encourages the use of products made of
recycled materials and shall give preference in purchasing to products made of
recycled materials if the products meet applicable specifications as to quantity and
quality. Fort Bend County will be the sole judge in determining product
preference application.

Interlocal Participation: Additional governmental entities, within Fort Bend

County, may purchase from this bid. Vendor agrees to accept purchase orders
from those participating entities and to invoice each entity separately.

Initials of Bidder:__ /17~



Fort Bend County Bid 11-009

2.0

1.35

Escalation Clause: Successful bidder may apply for a price increase to the Fort
Bend County Commissioners Court. Price increase will be the amount increased
to the vendor from his supplier. Written documentation of the increase must be
provided to the Purchasing Agent. No application for a price increase may be
submitted within the first four (4) months of this contract. Increases of more that
25% of the original bid price will not be considered.

TERMS AND CONDITIONS:

2.1

22

23

24

2.5

2.6

Seller to Package Goods: Seller will package goods in accordance with good
commercial practice. Each delivery container shall be clearly and permanently
marked as follows (a) Seller's name and address; (b) Consignee's name, address
and purchase order number and the bid number if applicable; (c) Container
number and total number of containers (e.g. box 1 of 4 boxes); and (d) the number
of the container bearing the packing slip. Seller shall bear cost of packaging
unless otherwise provided. Goods shall be suitably packed to secure lowest
transportation costs and to conform to requirements of common carriers and any
applicable specifications. Fort Bend County's count or weight shall be final and
conclusive on shipments not accompanied by packing list.

Shipment Under Reservation Prohibited: Seller is not authorized to ship goods
under reservation and no tender of a bill of lading will operate as a tender of
goods.

Title and Risk of Loss: The title and risk of loss of the goods shall not pass to the
County until a County employee actually receives and takes possession of the
goods at the point or points of delivery.

Delivery Terms: F.O.B. Destination Freight Prepaid, Inside Delivery, unless
delivery terms are specified otherwise on Purchase Order.

No Replacement of Defective Tender: Every tender or delivery of goods must
fully comply with all provisions of the Purchase Order as to time of delivery,
quality and the like. If a tender is made which does not fully conform, this shall
constitute a breach and Seller shall not have the right to substitute a conforming
tender.

Place of Delivery: The place of delivery shall be that set forth in the block of the
purchase order entitled "Ship To". Any change thereto shall be effective by
modification as provided for in Clause number 2.20 "Modifications", hereof. The
terms of this agreement are "no arrival, no sale", at the discretion of Fort Bend
County.

Initials of Bidder: /o~



Fort Bend County Bid 11-009

2.7

2.8

29

2.10

Invoices and Payments:

2.7.1 Seller shall submit separate invoices, in duplicate. Invoices shall indicate
the purchase order number and the bid number if applicable. Invoices
shall be itemized and transportation charges, if any, shall be listed
separately. A copy of the bill of lading, and the freight waybill when
applicable should be attached to the invoice.

2.7.2 Fort Bend County's obligation is payable only and solely from funds
available for the purpose of this purchase. Lack of funds shall render the
order null and void to the extent funds are not available and any delivered
but unpaid goods will be returned to Seller by the county.

2.7.3 Do not include Federal Excise, State, or City Sales Tax. Fort Bend
County is a tax-exempt governmental entity.

Gratuities: Fort Bend County may, by written notice to the Seller, cancel any
order without liability, if it is determined by the County that gratuities, in the form
of entertainment, gifts, or otherwise were offered or given by the Seller, or any
agent or representative of the Seller to any officer or employee of Fort Bend
County with a view toward securing an order. In the event an order is canceled
by the County pursuant to this provision, the County shall be entitled, in addition
to any other rights and remedies, to recover or withhold the amount of the cost
incurred by Seller in providing such gratuities.

Special Tools and Test Equipment: If the price stated on the face of an order
includes the cost of any special tooling or special test equipment fabricated or
required by Seller for the purpose of filing this order, such special tooling
equipment and any process sheets related thereto shall become the property of the
County and to the extent feasible shall be identified by the Seller as such.

Warranty/Price:

2.10.1 The price to be paid by the County shall be that contained in Seller's quote
or bid which Seller warrants to be no higher than Seller's current prices on
orders by others for products of the kind and specification covered by an
order for similar quantities under similar or like conditions and methods of
purchase. In the event Seller breaches this warranty the prices of the items
shall be reduced to the Seller's current prices on orders by others. Fort
Bend County may cancel this contract without liability.

Initials of Bidder: ﬂd

10



Fort Bend County Bid 11-009

2.11

2.12

2.13

2.14

2.10.2 The Seller warrants that no person or selling agency has been employed or
retained to solicit or secure any County order based upon any agreement
or understanding for commission, percentage, brokerage, or contingent fee
excepting bona fide employees of bona fide established commercial or
selling agencies maintained by the Seller for the purpose of securing
business. A breach or violation of this warranty gives the County the
right, in addition to any other right or rights, to cancel this contract
without liability.

Warranty Product: Seller shall not limit or exclude any implied warranties and
any attempt to do so shall render an order voidable at the option of the County.
Seller warrants that the goods furnished will conform to the specifications,
drawings, and description listed in the bid invitation and purchase order as
applicable, and to the sample(s) furnished by Seller if any. In the event of a
conflict between the specifications, drawings, and descriptions, the specifications
shall govern.

Safety Warranty: Seller warrants that the product sold to Fort Bend County shall
conform to the standards promulgated by the U.S. Department of Labor under the
Occupational Safety and Health Act of 1970. In the event the product does not
conform to OSHA standards, the County may return the product for correction or
replacement at the Seller's expense. In the event Seller fails to make the
appropriate correction within 10 days, correction made by the County will be at
Seller's expense. ’

No Warranty by Fort Bend County Against Infringements: As part of a contract
for sale Seller agrees to ascertain whether-goods manufactured in accordance with
the specifications will give rise to the rightful claim of any third person by way of
infringement. Fort Bend County makes no warranty that the production of goods
according to the specification will not give rise to such a claim and in no event
shall Fort Bend County be liable to Seller for indemnification in the event the
Seller is sued on the grounds of infringement or the like. If Seller is of the
opinion that an infringement will result, he will notify Fort Bend County to this
effect in writing within two days after the receiving Purchase Order. If the
County does not receive notice and is subsequently held liable for the
infringement, Seller will defend and save the County harmless. If Seller in good
faith ascertains that production of the goods in accordance with the specifications
will result in infringement, this contract shall be null and void except that the
County will pay Seller the reasonable cost of his search as to infringements.

Right of Inspection: The County shall have the right to inspect the goods at
delivery before accepting them.

Initials of Bidder: ___}IL/___



Fort Bend County Bid 11-009

2.15

2.16

2.17

2.18

2.19

2.20

Cancellation: Fort Bend County shall have the right to cancel for default all or
any part of the undelivered portion of an order if Seller breaches any of the terms
hereof including warranties of Seller, or if the Seller becomes insolvent or files
for protection under the bankruptcy laws. Such rights of cancellation are in
addition to and not in lieu of any other remedies, which Fort Bend County may
have in law or equity.

Termination: The performance of work under a Purchase Order may be
terminated in whole or in part by the County in accordance with this provision.
Termination of work there under shall be effected by the delivery to the Seller of
a "Notice of Termination" specifying the extent to which performance of work
under the order is terminated and the date upon which such termination becomes
effective. Such right of termination is in addition to and not in lieu of rights of
Fort Bend County set forth in Clause 15 herein.

Force Majeure: Force Majeure means a delay encountered by a party in the
performance of its obligations under this Agreement, which is caused by an event
beyond the reasonable control of that party. Without limiting the generality of the
foregoing, "Force Majeure" shall include but not be restricted to the following
types of events: acts of God or public enemy; acts of governmental or regulatory
authorities; fires, floods, epidemics or serious accidents; unusually severe weather
conditions; strikes, lockouts, or other labor disputes; and defaults by
subcontractors. In the event of a Force Majeure, the affected party shall not be
deemed to have violated its obligations under this Agreement, and the time for
performance of any obligations of that party shall be extended by a period of time
necessary to overcome the effects of the Force Majeure, provided that the
foregoing shall not prevent this Agreement from terminating in accordance with
the termination provisions. If any event constituting a Force Majeure occurs, the
affected party shall notify the other parties in writing, within twenty-four (24)
hours, and disclose the estimated length of delay, and cause of the delay.

Assignment-Delegation: No right or interest in an order shall be assigned or
delegation of any obligation made by Seller without the written permission of Fort
Bend County. Any attempted assignment or delegation by Seller shall be wholly
void and totally ineffective for all purposes unless made in conformity with this
paragraph.

Waiver: No claim or right arising out of a breach of any contract can be
discharged in whole or in part by a waiver or renunciation of the claim or right
unless the waived or renunciation is supported by consideration and is in writing
signed by the aggrieved party.

Modification: A Purchase Order can be modified or rescinded only by a writing
signed by both of the parties or their duly authorized agents.

Initials of Bidder: 4+
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Fort Bend County Bid 11-009

2.21

222

2.23

224

2.25

2.26

Parol Evidence: This writing is intended by the parties as a final expression of
their agreement and is intended also as a complete and exclusive statement of the
terms of this agreement. No course of prior dealings between the parties and no
usage of the trace shall be relevant to supplement or explain any terms rendered
under this agreement and shall not be relevant to determine the meaning of this
agreement even though the accepting or acquiescing party has knowledge of the
performance and opportunity for objection. Whenever a term defined by the
Uniform Commercial Code is used in this agreement, the definition contained in
the Code is to control.

Applicable Law: This agreement shall be governed by the Uniform Commercial
Code. Whenever the term "Uniform Commercial Code" is used it shall be
construed as meaning the Uniform Commercial Code as adopted in the State of
Texas and in effective on the date of the purchase order.

Advertising: Seller shall not advertise or publish, without the County's prior
consent the fact that Fort Bend County has entered into any contract, except to the
extent necessary to comply with proper requests for information from an
authorized representative of the federal, state, or local government.

Right to Assurance: Whenever the County in good faith has reason to question
the other party's intent to perform. The County may demand that the other party
give written assurance of his intent to perform. In the event that a demand is
made and no assurance is given within five (5) days, the County may treat this
failure as an anticipatory repudiation of the contract.

Venue: Both parties agree that venue for any litigation arising from this contract
shall lie in Richmond, Fort Bend County, Texas.

Prohibition Against Personal Interest in Contracts: No officer or employee of the
County shall have a financial interest, direct or indirect, in any contract with the
County, or shall be financially interested, directly or indirectly, in the sale to the
County of any land, materials, supplies, or service, except on behalf of the County
as an officer or employee. Any willful violation of this section shall constitute
malfeasance in office, and any officer or employee guilty thereof shall be subject
to disciplinary action under applicable laws, statutes and codes of the State of
Texas. Any violation of this section, with the knowledge, expressed or implied of
the person or corporation contracting with the County shall render the contract
involved voidable by the County Commissioners Court.

30 SCOPE:

It is the intent of Fort Bend County to contract with one (1) or more vendors to provide tires and
tubes to Fort Bend County, which meet or exceed the specifications contained herein.

Initials of Bidder: ___A/‘L~
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Fort Bend County Bid 11-009

4.0 PERIOD OF CONTRACT:

This contract is for the period 1 October 2010 through 30 September 2011, renewable annually
for four (4) years (through 30 September 2015) under the same terms and conditions if mutually
agreeable by both parties. This contract may be terminated by either party for any reason by
giving thirty (30) days written notice of the intent to terminate.

5.0  BID FORM COMPLETION:

Fill out, initial each page, SIGN CONTRACT SHEET, and return to the Fort Bend County
Purchasing Department ONE (1) complete bid form. An authorized representative of the
bidder MUST sign the contract sheet. The contract will be binding only when signed by the
County Judge, Fort Bend County and a purchase order authorizing the item(s) desired has been
issued. The use of liquid paper is NOT acceptable and may result in the disqualification of bid.
If an error is made, vendor MUST draw a line through error and initial each change.

6.0 GENERAL:
6.1 Vendor must bid on all items in section for bid to be considered.

6.2 Quantities listed are estimates only. Fort Bend County does not guarantee the
quantities stated will be purchased.

6.3  No minimum orders, by quantity or dollar amount.
6.4  All prices are F.O.B. Fort Bend County.
7.0 DELIVERY:

7.1 Vendor must complete delivery within two (2) working days after receipt
of purchase order unless otherwise stated.

7.2 Inthose extremely rare cases where a Department needs a particular tire(s)
immediately, Fort Bend County reserves the right to purchase that tire(s) on the
open market without endangering this contract.

7.3 The successful bidder shall not deliver products or provide services as part of this
contract without a Purchase Order issued by the Fort Bend County Purchasing
Agent.

7.4  Fort Bend County reserves the right to add or delete delivery locations as needed.

7.5 All deliveries must be made and completed between 8:00 AM and 3:00 PM,
Monday thru Friday.

7.6  No deliveries on County holidays.

Initials of Bidder: éa
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7.7 Deliveries will be made to the following departments:

Road and Bridge Road and Bridge

201 Payne Lane 12919 ', Dairy Ashford
Crabb Texas 77469 Sugar Land Texas 77478
Road and Bridge Road and Bridge

3743 School Street 19310 Beechnut
Needville Texas 77461 Richmond Texas 77469
Drainage District Vehicle Maintenance
1022 Blume Road 230 Legion Drive
Rosenberg Texas 77471 Richmond Texas 77469

8.0 VENDOR SELECTION:
This contract will be awarded to the lowest and best bid per section.
9.0 POINT OF CONTACT:

Point of contact will be Debbie Kaminski, CPPB, Assistant County Purchasing Agent at (281)
341-8643 or kaminskd@co.fort-bend.tx.us.

Initials of Bidder: 4y A
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10.0 SPECIFICATIONS:

SECTION 01: TUBES (MUST BE FIRST QUALITY)

Description

7.50-18 Tube with TR15 stem

Unit Est.

Price Qty.  Extended Price
7.50R16 Tube with TR15 stem $ X 25 =$
7.50R16 Tube with TR150 stem $ X 25 =3

$ X 5 =$
9.00R20 Tubes with TR443 stem $ X 5 =$
10.00R20 Tubes with TR444 stem $ X 20 =3
14.00R24 Tubes with TR220A stem B X 10 =3
11L-15/16 Tubes with TR15CW stem $ X 6 =$
18.4-30 Tubes with TR218A stem $ X 30 =$
12.4-24 Tubes with TR218A stem $ X 6 =$
18.4R38 Tubes with TR218A stem $ X 6 =$
KR 14/15 Tubes with TR13 stem $ X 25 =5
20.5R25 Tubes with SP1000 stem B X 5 =$
13.00R24 Tubes with TR220A stem $ X 8 =$
13.6X24 Tubes cupples TR218A $ X 8 =$
14.9R24 Tubes with TR218A stem $ X 8 =3
10.00X16 Tubes with TRISCW stem $ X 8 =3
11.00X16 Tubes with TR15CW stem A X 8 =$
12X16.5 Tubes with TR1ISCW stem $ X 4 =$
7.50R15 Brass stem tubes roller tube with TR440 $ X 12 =$
23.1X26 Tubes cupples TR218A $ X 4 =$
16.9/18.4X34 Tubes cupples TR218A 3 X 4 =$
480/400X8 Tubes cupples TR87 $ X 6 =$
600/690X9 Brass stem tubes cupples TR440 $ X 4 =$

$ X 6 =$

8.25R 15 Brass stem tubes cupples TR444

Initials of Bidder: ﬁ_/_
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SECTION 01: (Cont’d)

Unit Est.

Description Price Qty. Extended Price
7.00X 12 Brass stem tubes cupples TR440 $ X 4

FR 13/14 tube $ X 24

11.25-24 tubés $ X 4

16 tubes TR13 $ X 10

13 x 500-8 tubes with stem for lawnmower tire $ X 2

23 x 1050-12 tubes with stem for lawnmower tire $ X 2

18 x 750-8 tubes with stem for lawnmower tire $ X 2

16 x 750-8 tubes with stem for lawnmower tire $ X 2

TOTAL FOR SECTION 01:

SECTION 02: MICHELIN BRAND ONLY.

Unit Est.
Description Price Qty. Extended Price
P225/60R16 Pursuit V-rated MXV4/Pilot Sport A/S+ $ X 50 =%
P235/55/R17 Pursuit V-rated Primary MP Pilot Sport A/S+  § X 50 =$
TOTAL FOR SECTION 02: g NoBid

SECTION 03: BRIDGESTONE/FIRESTONE BRAND ONLY.

Unit Est.
Description Price Oty. Extended Price
P225/60R16 PV41 Pursuit v-rated 340AA $ X 100 =$
TOTAL FOR SECTION 03: ¢ NoBid

17
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SECTION 04: CONTINENTAL/GENERAL BRAND ONLY.

Unit Est.
Description Price Oty.  Extended Price
P225/60R16 XP-2000 Pursuit v-rated $ X 100 =3
P225/60R18 Continental Pro Contact 3 X 100 =3

TOTAL FOR SECTION 04: $ No Bid

SECTION 05: GOODYEAR BRAND ONLY.

Unit Est.
Description Price Otv. Extended Price
P225/60R16 Pursuit v-rated $7250 x 1100 =$79,750.00
P235/55R17 Eagle RSA Pursuit v-rated $9650 x 500 =g 48:250.00

TOTAL FOR SECTION 05: $ 128,000.00

SECTION 06: MICHELIN ONLY

Unit Est.
Description Price Oty. Extended Price
P225/75R15 LTX M/S ORWL $ X 10 =$
LT235/75R15 LTX M/S 6 ply $ X 32 =$
P235/75R15 XL LTX A/T 2 $ X 32 =3
LT235/85R16 LTX A/T2 10 ply 3 X 20 =$
LT235/85R16 LTX M/S 2 $ X 20 =3
LT235/85R16 XPS Rib 10 ply $ X 20 =$
LT235/85R16 XPS Traction 10 ply $ X 10 =3
P245/75R16 LTX M/S 2 $ X 10 =3
LT245/75R16 LTX A/S 10 ply $ X 50 =3
LT245/75R16 LTX A/T2 10 ply $ X 50 =%
LT245/75R16 LTX M/S 2 $ X 20 =3

18
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SECTION 06: (cont’d)

Unit Est.
Description Price Oty. Extended.Price
P255/70R16 LTX M/S $ X 50
LT265/75R16 LTX M/S 2 10 ply 3 X 20
LT265/75R16 LTX A/S 10 ply $ X 10
P235/75R16 LTX M/S 2 $ X 10
P235/75R16 LTX M/S 2 XL $ X 4
LT245/75R17 LTX M/S 2 10 ply $ X 10
LT245/75R17 LTX A/T $ X 10
P245/75R16 LTX A/T2 ORWL 3 X 10
P205/75R14 Harmony $ X 10
LT275/65R18 LTX A/T2 10 ply $ X 40
LT275/65R18 LTX M/S 2 10 ply 3 X 40
LT225/75R16 LTX M/S 10 ply $ X 20
LT225/75R16 LTX A/T2 10 ply $ X 20
ST175/80R13 $ X 10

TOTAL FOR SECTION 06: g NoBid

SECTION 07: BF GOODRICH ONLY

Unit Est.
Description Price Otv. Extended Price
LT245/75R17 Rugged Trail T/A 10 ply 3 X 30 =§
LT245/75R16 Commercial T/A 10 ply $ X 10 =3
LT245/75R17 Commercial T/A 10 ply 3 X 10 =3
P235/75R16 XL Long Trail T/A Tour $ X 10 =3
P245/75R16 Long Trail T/A Tour $ X 10 =$
LT275/65R18 T/A 10 ply h) X 40 =$
ST175/80R13 $ X 10 =%

19
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Description

LT235/75R15 HD 6 ply
LT235/75R15 AWT II 6 ply
LT235/85R16 HD/H 10 ply
LT235/85R16 HD 10 ply
LT245/75R16 HD/H 10 ply
LT245/75R16 HD 10 ply

LT245/75R16 ADT 10 ply

LT265/75R16 HD/H 10 ply

ST175/80R13

Description

L.T225/75R16 Transforce HT

LT215/85R16 Transforce HT

TOTAL FOR SECTION 07: s Mo Bid

SECTION 08: UNIROYAL ONLY

Unit Est.

Price Otv.  Extended Price

$ X 20 =$

$ X 20 =$

$ X 20 =$

$ X 20 =$

$ X 50 =$

$ X 50 =3

$ X 20 =% .
P255/70R16 Laredo Cross Country $ X 50 =5 . B

$ | X 20 =3 |

s X 10 =$ ‘
TOTAL FOR SECTION 08: 5_NNo Bid

SECTION 09: FIRESTONE/BRIDGESTONE ONLY

Unit Est.

Price Oty. Extended Price
LT235/75R15 Transforce HT 6 ply $ X 20 =5/
LT235/75R15 Destination MT 6 ply $ X 20 =$_ |

$ X 16 =5_ |
LT225/75R16 Destination MT $ X 16 =$
LT245/75R16 Transforce HT 10 ply $ X 20 =$
LT245/75R16 Destination MT 10 ply $ X 20 =3
LT245/75R17 Transforce HT 10 ply $ X 10 =3
L'T235/85R16 Transforce HT 10 ply $ X 20 =$

$ X 16 =$
L.T215/85R16 Destination MT $ X 16 =$

20
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SECTION 09: (Cont’d)

Unit Est.
Description Price Qty.  Extended Price
1.T235/80/17 Firestone HT $ X 100 =$
LT235/85R16 Destination MT 10 ply $ X 20 =%
P205/60R16 Firestone FR380 $ X 100 =5
L.T235/85R16 Transforce AT 10 ply $ X 20 =3
P225/60R16 Firestone FR380 $ X 100 =3
P255/70R16 A/T Destination AT $ X 32 =3
9.50R16.5 Transforce HT 10 ply $ X 10 =$
L.T235/75R16 Transforce HT 10 ply $ X 20 =$
LT275/70R18 Transforce AT 10 ply $ X 20 =3
LT275/70R18 Transforce HT $ X 50 =3
LT265/70R17 Transforce AT 10 ply $ X 80 =$
L.T265/70R17 Destination MT 10 ply $ X 80 =$
LT245/75R17 Transforce HT 10 ply $ X 200 =$
P255/65R17 Destination LE $ X 40 =3 -
P265/75R16 Destination AT $ X 40 = |
P215/60R16 FR380 $ X 160 =$
P235/70R16 Dueler HT $ X 40 =$ ;
P265/70R16 Destination LE $ X 40 =$

TOTAL FOR SECTION 09: g No Bid

SECTION 10: GOODYEAR ONLY

Unit Est.
Description Price Qty.  Extended Price
P215/65R16 Eagle LS $ é?é 09/X 10 =% M
P255/65R16 Eagle LS s 2UBX 10 s 7/

L.T235/75R15 Wrangler MT/R 6 ply

21
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SECTION 10: (Cont’d) |

[l

Est.

| Unit
Description : Price Oty.  Extended Price
P235/75R15 Wrangler RT/S IXL s 7bd¥x 20 =5_[5A3. ce
P2SS/70R1S Eagle GTTL s92-b¥x 100 =3 926Y4. 22
P235/75R16 Wrangler ST viv s.8363x 20 =3 4 70 6o
LT235/85R16 Wrangler HT 1|o ply sFO0 x 20 =5 ), 780.,°2
LT235/85R 16 Wrangler MT/ER 10 ply si37.01x 20 =s 54020
LT245/75R16 Wrangler HT lfoad range E $9.0ox 100 =§ ﬂ oo, 2
P205/60R16 Eagle GT s lx 100 =5 b, q4é @
1.T245/75R16 Wrangler MT/iR 10 ply s13%2bx 20 =5 2eL85 25
P225/60R16 Eagle GT | 57 ‘/: d2x 300 =$5.22306 F
LT245/75R16 Wrangler AT/S 10 ply sﬁx 0 =5 2515 ¥
P245/75R16 Wrangler RT/S $ /0697 20 = 2./139. 42
LT245/75R16 Wrangler RT/S 10 ply $/60,02x 10 =5_J|, 000, 7%
LT265/75R16 Wrangler RT/Si 10 ply $/07.25x 60 =s_&,4935. &
LT265/75R16 Wrangler MT/?R 8 ply MIBYx 0 -5 437522
P255/70R16 Wrangler RT/S s§86Tx 0 =5 7990 32
LT245/70R17 Wrangler MT/ER 10 ply $/HEeS(x 10 =5 _/, $es, %
P265/70R17 Wrangler RT/S sjoliyd x 8 =s_ FO9. z
P265/70R17 Wrangler AT/S s/241x 10 =s_L124 72
LT265/70R17 Wrangler AT/SS 6 ply sISO¥] x 10 =s_)SDY1C
LT265/70R17 Wrangler MT/:R 6 ply $ lé'-,@bx 10 = /, 0 4 62
750 x 16 Workhorse Rib § ply s/08-Hx 12 ~s_J, 30/ 7”@
7.00 x 15 Workhorse l 5. 9758 x 30 =5 g2, 74 7 7
LT275/65R18 Wrangler AT/%, VSB 10 ply sl7giox 10 =s_), 5 £1.%
LT275/65R 18 Wrangler AT/S OWL 10ply . s18300x 10 =s_[ 840, 2

136X 10 =5 358

P275/65R18 Wrangler SR-A OWL SL

22
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TOTAL FOR SECTION 10:

SECTION 11: LIST BRAND OFFERED:

$ /917, (&“f’p’b

(Bid the equivalent. Tires listed are Firestone brand.)

Description

Description

225/70R19.5 XZE 14 Ply

Unit Est.

Price Oty.  Extended Price
LT235/75R15 Transforce HT 6 ply 3 X 20
LT235/75R15 Destination MT 6 ply $ X 20
LT225/75R16 Transforce HT 10 ply 3 X 16
LT225/75R16 Destination MT 10 ply b X 16
LT245/75R16 Transforce HT 10 ply $ X 20
LT245/75R16 Destination MT 10 ply $ X 20
L'T245/75R17 Transforce HT 10 ply $ X 10
LT235/85R16 Transforce HT 10 ply $ X 20
LT215/85R16 Transforce HT10 ply $ X 16
LT235/85R16 Destination MT 10 ply $ X 20
L. T235/85R16 Tranforce AT 10 ply $ X 20
P255/70R16 Destination AT 10 ply $ X 32
9.50R16.5 Transforce HT 10 ply $ X 10
LT265/70R17 Destination MT 10 ply $ X 80

TOTAL FOR SECTION 11: g_No Bid

SECTION 12: MICHELIN BRAND ONLY.

Unit Est.

Price Oty.  Extended Price

$ X 4 =$

TOTAL FOR SECTION 12: g o Bid

23
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SECTION 13: BF GOODRICH BRAND ONLY.

Unit Est. p
Description Price Oty. Extended Prjé
225/70R19.5 ST230 14 Ply $ X 4 =$
No Bid
TOTAL FOR SECTION 13: $
SECTION 14: BRIDGESTONE/FIRESTONE BRAND ONLY.
Unit Est.
Description Price Oty. Extended Price
225/70R19.5 M724F 12 ply $ X 8 =$
225/70R19.5 M729F 12 ply $ X 8 =$
TOTAL FOR SECTION 14: g_NoBid
SECTION 15: CONTINENTAL/GENERAL BRAND ONLY.
Unit Est.
Description Price Oty. Extended Price
225/70R19.5 LMT 460 12 ply $ X 8 =$
225/70R19.5 LMT 450 12 ply $ X 8 =3
225/70R19.5 LMT 400 12 ply $ X 4 =$
225/70R19.5 HDR 14 ply $ X 8 =3
TOTAL FOR SECTION 15 g_No Bid
SECTION 16: MICHELIN BRAND ONLY.
Unit Est.
Description Price Oty. Extended Price
9.00R20 XZE2 $ X 6 =$
10.00R20 XZE2 hi-way $ X 16 =$
11R22.5 XZE 14 ply $ X 100 =$
11R22.5 MI XZY 16 ply $ X 12 =$
11R22.5 MI XZE 2 16 ply $ X 6 =3
Initials of Bidder: [4 o~
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SECTION 16: (Cont’d)

Unit Est.

Description Price Oty. Extended Price,
11R22.5 XDE MS 16 ply $ X 32 =$

12R22.5 XZE $ X 24 =3
255/70R22.5 XZE $ X 12 =$

385/65R22.5 x 24 18 ply XZY 3 $ X 6 =$

315/80 R22.5 XZA $ X 6 =$

225/70 R19.5 10 ply XZE $ X 6 =$

11R22.5 XZY3 3 X 12 =3

12R22.5 XZY3 $ X 12 =§

TOTAL FOR SECTION 16: s NoBid
SECTION 17: BF COODRICH BRAND ONLY
‘ Unit Est. /

Description Price Oty. __ Extended Price

11R22.5 DR675 16 ply $ X 10 =$ /

No Bid
TOTAL FOR SECTION 17: $

SECTION 18: BRIDGESTONE/FIRESTONE BRAND ONLY

Unit Est.
Description Price Oty. Extendeq Price
9.00-20 Transport 1 12 ply $ X 4 =$
9.00-20 S A Traction ND 12 ply $ X 4 =3
9.00R20 T546 14 ply $ X 4 =3
10.00-20 Transport 1 14 ply $ X 4 =3
10.00X20 S A Traction ND 14 ply $ X 4 =$
10.00R20 T559 14 ply $ X 4 =$
10.00R20 T819 16 ply $ X 4 =$
10.00R20 T831 16 ply $ X 4 -5

Initials of Bidder:K
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SECTION 18: (Cont’d)

Unit Est.
Description Price Oty. Extended Price
10.00R20 T546 16 ply $ X 4 =$
10R22.5 T559 12 ply $ X 4 =$
10R22.5 FD663 12 ply $ X 4 =$
11R22.5 T559 16 ply $ X 12 =$
11R22.5 T831 16 ply $ X 12 =$
11R22.5 T819 16 ply $ X 12 =$
12R22.5 T831 16 ply $ X 10 =$
TOTAL FOR SECTION 18: s_NoBid

SECTION 19: CONTINENTAL/GENERAL BRAND ONLY.

Description

11R22.5 HDO 16 ply
11R22.5 HDC 16 ply
11R22.5 HSR 16 ply
11R22.5 HSL 16 ply
11R22.5 HTL 14 ply

12R22.5 16 ply

Unit Est.

Price Qty.  Extended Price
$ X 12

$ X 12

$ X 12

$ X 12

$ X 12

$ X 20

TOTAL FOR SECTION 19: s_No Bid
SECTION 20: GOODYEAR BRAND ONLY.
Unit Est.
Price Qty. _ Extended Price

Description

9.00R20 G149 RSA 12 ply
9.00R20 G124 12 ply
10.00R20 G149 RSA 14 ply

10.00R20 G287 MSA 16 ply

26
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SECTION 20: (Cont’d)

Description

11R22.5 G177 16 ply

' 11R22.5 G314 12 ply

Unit Est.
Price Oty.  Extended Price
11R22.5 G287 MSA 16 ply $3YPL3x 100 =% 32":£é3' 00
11R22.5 G288 MSA 16 ply s392)/ x w0 -s_39, &1/, e°
$%x 12 =$ Z‘ 377.68
11R22.5 G395 LHS 14 ply s e X 12 =S 611 359,36
11R22.5 G395 LHS 16 ply s G 12 =S {Z! 75 /- b4
s.31920x 12 -=s_3,830.40
12R22.5 G149 MSA 16 ply $3/700 x s =s_/, 90a.00
315/80R22.5 G291 18 ply s 42886x 6 5 2,573 1k
s496S2x 4

385/65R22.5 G178SS 18 ply
TOTAL FOR SECTION:20:

SECTION 21: LIST BRAND OFFERED:.

-s_/,966.08

s [,QB,LJ’J’Q, 1z

(Bid the equivalent. Tires listed are Firestone brand.)

Unit Est.
Description Price Qty. _ Extended Price
9.00-20 Transport 1 12 ply $ X 4 =$ ZM'Q 6/‘ 00
9.00-20 S A Traction ND 12 ply. $ X 4 =§
9.00R20 T559 12 ply $ X 8 =$
9.00R20 T546 14 ply 3 X 8 =$
10.00-20 Transport I 14 ply $ X 4 =§
10.00-20 S A Traction ND 14 ply $ X 4 =$
10.00R20 T559 14 ply $ X 8 =5 -
10.00R20 T819 16 ply 5 X 12 =$
10.00R20 T831 16 ply -$ X 8 =3
10.00R20 T546 16 ply $ X 4 S
10R22.5 T559 12 ply $ X 4 =5 ]
10R22.5 FD663 12 ply $ X 4 =3

27
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SECTION 21: (Cont’d)

Unit Est.
Description Price Oty. Extended Prlce
11R22.5 T559 16 ply $ X 25
11R22.5 T831 16 ply $ X 12
11R22.5 T819 16 ply $ X 8
12R22.5 T831 16 ply $ X 10
TOTAL FOR SECTION 21: g No Bid
SECTION 22: MICHELIN BRAND ONLY.
Unit Est.
Description Price Oty.  Extended Prict
12.4-24 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply $ X 5 =$
13.6R24 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply $ X 5 =$
14.9R24 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply $ X 5 =$
18.4R30 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply $ X 4 =$
16.9R34 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply $ X 5 =$
18.4R38 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply $ X 5 =$
380/85R24 Power Radial 80 $ X 5 =$
18.4 R34 R-1W Radial 8 ply $ X S =$
23.1 — 26 10 ply tubeless $ X 10 =$
TOTAL FOR SECTION 22: $ No Bid
SECTION 23: BF GOODRICH BRAND ONLY.
Unit Est.
Description Price Oty.  Extended Prl
12.4-24 Power Gripper TL 8 ply $ X 12
13.6R24 Power Radial 80 $ X 5
14.9-24 R-1 Power Gripper TL 8 ply $ X 4
380/85R24 Power Radial 80 $ X 5

28
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SECTION 23: (Cont’d)

Unit Est.

Description Price QOty.  Extended Price
18.4-30 Power Gripper TL 8 ply b X 12 =$
16.9-34 R-1Power Gripper TL 8 ply $ X 5 =3
16.9R34 Power Radial 80 h) X 5 =$
18.4-34 R-1 Power Gripper TL 8 ply $ X 5 =§
18.4R34 Power Radial 80 $ X 5 =$ﬂ-[
18.4-38 R-1 Power Gripper TL 8 ply $ X 5 =$ {
18.4R38 Power Radial 80 $ X 5 =$ !
23.1 - 26 10 ply tubeless $ X 10 =$v-(_

TOTAL FOR SECTION 23: 5 _No Bid
SECTION 24: BRIDGESTONE/FIRESTONE BRAND ONLY

Unit Est.

Description Price Otv.  Extended Price
7.50-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib--F-2 8 ply $ X 4 =$
10.00-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib--F-2 8 ply $ X 8 =3
11.00X16 Champ Guide Grip 3Rib—F-2 8ply $ X 5 =3
11L-15 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib—F-2 8 ply $ X 8 =$
12.4-24 Super All Traction 23°—R-1 8 ply $ X 12 =$
340/85R24 Radial 6000—R-1W 8 ply $ X 5 =$
380/85R24 Radial 6000—R-1W 8 ply $ X 5 =3
18.4-30 Champ Spade Grip—R-2 6 ply $ X 4 =5_ i
18.4-30 Champ Spade Grip—R-2 10 ply 3 X 4 o T
16.9-34 Traction Field & Road—R-1 8§ ply b X 5 =3 1
18.4-34 Traction Field & Road—R-1 8 ply $ X 5 =$
18.4R38 Radial All Traction 23° 8 ply $ X 5 =$ S

TOTAL FOR SECTION 24: 3 No Bid

29
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SECTION 25: GOODYEAR BRAND ONLY.

Unit Est.
Description Price Qty.  Extended Price
7.50-16 Triple Rib HD TT 6 ply $ X 4 =$
11L-15 Triple Rib HD TT 8 ply $ X 12 =3
10.00-16 Triple Rib HD TT 8 ply $ X 4 =3
11.00-16 Triple Rib HD 8 ply TT $ X 4 =3
12.4-24 R1 Dura Torque TL 8 ply $ X 16 =3
13.6-24 R1 Dyna Torque I1 TT § ply $ X 5 =3
14.9R24 R-1W Super Traction Radial $ X 5 =$
18.4-30 R1 Dura Torque TT 8 ply $ X 24 =$
18.4-30 R-2 Special Sure Grip TDS 10 ply TL $ X 4 =3
16.9-34 R1 Dyna Torque I1 TT 8 ply $ X 6 =$
18.4-34 R1 Dura Torque TT 8 ply $ X 8 =3
18.4R38 R-1 Dyna Torque TL $ X 8 =$
23.1- 26 10 ply tubeless $ X 10 =3
TOTAL FOR SECTION 25: $
SECTION 26: TITAN BRAND ONLY.
Unit Est.
Description Price QOty.  Extended Price
11L-15SL Tru Trac Triple Rib TT F-2 8 ply $ X 12 =$
10.00-16SL Tru Trac Triple Rib F-2 TL 8 ply $ X 4 =3
11.00-16SL Tru Trac Triple Rib F-2 TL § ply $ X 4 =3
12.4-24 Hi Trac Lug R-1 TL 8 ply $ X 12 =3
18.4-30 Hi Trac Lug R-1 TL 8 ply 5 X 12 =$
13.6R24-128A8 Hi Trac Lug Radial R-1 $ X 5 =3
14.9R24-120A8 Hi Trac Lug Radial R-1 $ X 5 =3
TOTAL FOR SECTION 26: $

30
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SECTION 27: LIST BRAND OFFERED:

(Bid the equivalent. Tires listed are Firestone brand.)

Unit Est.
Description Price Oty. Extended Price
7.50-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply $ X 4 =$A B
10.00-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply $ X 4 =$
11.00-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply $ X 5 =3
11L-15 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply $ X 4 =$
12.4-24 Super All Traction 23° 8 ply $ X 12 =3
18.4-30 Traction F & R 8 ply $ X 12 =3
340/85R24 Radial 6000 R-1W 8 ply $ X 5 =$
380/85R24 Radial 6000 R-1W 8 ply $ X 5 =3
18.4-30 Champ Spade Grip 6 ply $ X 4 =$
18.4-30 Champ Spade Grip 10 ply $ X 4 =$
16.9-34 Traction Field & Road 8 ply $ X 5 =$ -
18.4-34 Traction Field & Road 8 ply $ X 5 =§ |
18.4R38 Radial All Traction 23° 8 ply $ X 5 =$ ;

TOTAL FOR SECTION 27: g_No Bid

SECTION 28: MICHELIN BRAND ONLY.

Unit Est.
Description Price Otv. Extended Price
29.5R25 MI XHA 2 star $ X 6 =$
1400R24 XGL $ X 10 =%
17.5R25 XTLA $ X 10 =$
20.5R25 XTLA 3 X 10 =3 1/
1300R24 XGLA $ X 10  =$ f/
29.5R25 M1 XHA 1 Star $ X 10 = f
750R15 MI XLC b X 10 =$
23.5R25 XHA 2 STXL $ X 10 =$ |

31
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TOTAL FOR SECTION 28:

$ No Bid

SECTION 29: BRIDGESTONE/FIRESTONE BRAND ONLY

Unit Est.
Description Price Qty.  Extended Price
7.50X15 Industrial 12 ply $ X 4 =$
6.00X9 Industrial 10 ply $ X 4 =3
8.25X15 Industrial 12 ply $ X 4 =$
7.00X12 Industrial 10 ply $ X 4 =3
4.80X8 Wheel barrow 2 ply $ X 4 =$
4.10/3.50-4 $ X 4 =3
8-14.5 Towmaster Super Hwy $ X 5 =$
12X16.5 Super traction $ X 8 =$
14/70-20 20 ply roller tire $ X 7 = |
15.5X25 SGGLO $ X 5 = !
17.5X25 GGG E2/L-2 $ X 5 =$_{
13.00X24 G-2 $ X 12 =% |
13.00R24 Bridgestone VUT $ X 8 =3 r;
TOTAL FOR SECTION 29: s o Bid
SECTION 30: BRIDGESTONE/FIRESTONE BRAND ONLY
Unit Est.
Description Price Oty.  Extended Price
14.00X24 G-2 3 X 12 =3
14.00R24 Bridgestone VUT $ X 8 =$
20.5X25 SGG E-2/L.-2 $ X 5 =3
23.5X25 SGG E-2/L-2 $ X 5 =$
29.5R25 E-3 22 ply $ X 6 =3
7.50X15 Industrial 12 ply $ X 4 -3
6.00X9 industrial 10 ply $ X 4 =$
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SECTION 30: (Cont’d)

Unit Est.

Description Price Qty.  Extended Price
8.25X15 industrial 12 ply $ X 4 =3
7.00X12 industrial 10 ply $ X 4 =$
4.80X8 Wheel barrow 2 ply $ X 4 =3

13 x 500-8 NHS Turf $ X 2 =3

23 x 1050-12 NHS Turf $ X 2 =$

18 x 750-8 Turf $ X 2 =3
7.50R16 Westlake CR859 LR G $ X 8 =$
13x650 6 turf 5 X 8 =$
13x500 6 turf $ X 8 =3

i
TOTAL FOR SECTION 30: g No Bid
SECTION 31: GOODYEAR BRAND ONLY.
Unit Est.
Description Price Oty.  Extended Price
15.5X25 Rock lug 12 ply TL $ X 5 =3
17.5X25 Rock lug 16 ply Tl $ X 5 =3
13.00X24 grader 12 ply TL SG6-2A $ X 8 =3
13.00R24 GS2BG2 $ X 5 =$
14.00X24 Grader 12 ply TL SGG-2A $ X 8 =3
20.5R25 1 GP2B6STL $ X 5 =3
14.00R24 GS2BG2TL $ X 6 =3
TOTAL FOR SECTION 31: $
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SECTION 32: LIST BRAND OFFERED:

(Bid the equivalent. Tires listed are Firestone brand.)

Description

7.50X15 Industrial 12 ply
6.00X9 Industrial 10 ply
8.25X15 Industrial 12 ply
7.00X12 Industrial 10 ply
4.80X8 Wheel barrow 2 ply

410/350-4

12X16.5 Super traction
14/70-20 20 ply roller tire
15.5X25 SGGLO

17.5X25 GGG E2/L-2
13.00X24 G-2

13.00R24 Bnidgestone VUT
14.00X24 G-2

14.00R24 Bridgestone VUT
20.5X25 SGG E-2/L-2
23.5X25 SGG E-2/L-2
29.5R25 E-3 22 ply
7.50X15 Industrial 12 ply
6.00X9 industrial 10 ply
8.25X15 industrial 12 ply
7.00X12 industrial 10 ply
4.80X8 Wheel barrow 2 ply

13 x 500-8 NHS Turf

Unit Est.

Price Otv. _ Extended Price/

$ X 4 =$

$ X 4 =

$ X 4 =3 —,*'/—

$ X 4 =5 ’f

$ X 4 =$ /

5 X 4 =8 _1/__
8-14.5 Towmaster Super Hwy $ X 5 =3 _:L_———

$ X 8 =$ __#____

$ X 7 =$

5 x 5 =/

$ X 5 Y

$ X 12 =$‘

$ X 8 =$____

$ X 12 =$

5 X 8 =5

$ X s -5

$ X 5 =$é___

$ X 4 =s};S

$ X 4 =$ ‘1

$ X 4 =$ 3

$ X 4 =$ |

$ X 4 =$

$ X 2 =3

$ X 2 =$

23 x 1050-12 NHS Turf
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SECTION 32: (Cont’d)

Extended Prig/

Unit Est.
Description Price Oty.
18 x 750-8 Turf $ X 2 =8
7.50R16 LRG Trailer tire $ X 8 =$
TOTAL FOR SECTION 32: No Bid
SECTION 33: GALAXY BRAND ONLY.
Unit Est.
Description Price Oty. Extended Price
14/70 —20 20 ply NHS for roller $ X 7 =$
14/70 —20 20 ply NHS for roller, blem $ X 7 =3
TOTAL FOR SECTION 33: g NNoBid
SECTION 34: BRIDGESTONE/FIRESTONE BRAND ONLY.
Unit Est. /
Description Price Oty. Extended Price
P235/55R17 z-rated pursuit tire $ X 500 =$ /
TOTAL FOR SECTION 34: s No Bid
SECTION 35: CONTINENTAL/GENERAL BRAND ONLY.
Unit Est.
Description Price Qty. Extended Pric/
LT245/75R17 10 ply $ X 10 =$
P235/75R16 10 ply $ X 10 =$
P245/75R16 10 ply $ X 10 =$
P205/75R14 10 ply $ X 10 =$
LT275/65R18 10 ply $ X 40 =$
LT275/65R18 all terrain $ X 40 =$
TOTAL FOR SECTION 35 5_No Bid
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CONTRACT SUEET
Bid¥11-009

THE STATE OF TEXAS
COUNTY OF FORT BEND

This memorandum of agreement made and entered inte on the (5 day of S&07% M 20/ &, by and between Fort

Bend County in the Staie of Texas (hereinafier designated County), acting herein by County Judge Robert Hebert, by virtue

of an order of Fort Bend County Commissioners Court, and W"/HGEOT [bﬁ/ﬂ?ﬁf’a"/‘/; /e -5}5"“4"'5
(eompany name) e

(hereinafter designated Contractor),

. WITNESSETH:

’fhe Contractor and the County agree that the bid and specifications for the Tires and tubes which are hereio zmn-ched and
made a part hereof, together with this instrtument and the bond (when required) shall constitute the full agreement and
contract benween pur_(ies and for furnishing the items set out and described; the County agrees to pay the prices stipulated in

the accepted bid.

It is further agreed that this contract shall not become binding or effcctive until signed by the parties heretoand a purchase

_order authorizing the items desired has been issued.

Executed at Richmond, Texas this day of 20

- By:

G-20-fp County Judge

By:

Signature of Contractor

T /‘éﬁé e KDEWE  Cowrer Movse

Printed Name and Title




