
Section A to Z Tire  American 
Tire 

 B & S 
Transport 

 GCR Tire 
Centers 

 Southern Tire  Strouhal Tire Wingfoot 
Commercial 

Tire
Section 1: Tubes $6,170.00 $6,327.53 $6,632.19 $7,440.10 No Bid No Bid
Section 2: Michelin Brand Disqualified No Bid No Bid $13,500.00 No Bid No Bid
Section 3: 
Bridgestone/Firestone Brand

Disqualified $7,226.00 $7,453.00 $7,200.00 No Bid No Bid

Section 4: 
Continental/General Brand

Disqualified $17,700.00 No Bid $17,700.00 No Bid No Bid

Section 5: Goodyear Brand Disqualified $124,979.00 $145,100.00 No Bid No Bid $128,000.00
Section 6: Michelin Brand Disqualified No Bid No Bid $70,882.00 $70,728.70 No Bid
Section 7: BF Goodrich 
Brand

Disqualified No Bid No Bid $12,610.00 $13,969.00 No Bid

Section 8: Uniroyal Brand Disqualified No Bid No Bid $25,110.00 $26,366.20 No Bid
Section 9: 
Bridgestone/Firestone Brand

Disqualified $118,063.64 $136,655.20 $103,836.70 No Bid No Bid

Section 10: Goodyear Brand Disqualified Disqualified No Bid No Bid No Bid $102,564.22
Section 11: Generic Disqualified $31,641.40 $36,703.28 $31,384.40 No Bid No Bid
Section 12: Michelin Brand Disqualified No Bid No Bid No Bid $944.56 No Bid
Section 13: BF Goodrich 
Brand

Disqualified No Bid No Bid No Bid $743.68 No Bid

Section 14: 
Bridgestone/Firestone Brand

Disqualified $3,132.80 $2,866.56 $2,704.00 No Bid No Bid

Recommendation: Low bidder per section  There's a tie for Section 4  

Disqualified: 
Altered bid 
terms and 
conditions

Fort Bend County Tabulation
BID 11-009

Term Contract for Tires and Tubes

Term:  1 October 2010 through 30 September 2011



Section A to Z Tire  American 
Tire 

 B & S 
Transport 

 GCR Tire 
Centers 

 Southern Tire  Strouhal Tire Wingfoot 
Commercial 

Tire
Section 15: 
Continental/General Brand

$4,264.00 No Bid Disqualified $4,688.00 No Bid No Bid

Section 16: Michelin Brand Disqualified No Bid No Bid No Bid $79,795.68 No Bid
Section 17: BF Goodrich 
Brand

Disqualified No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,780.50 No Bid

Section 18: 
Bridgestone/Firestone Brand

Disqualified Disqualified Disqualified $21,375.00 No Bid No Bid

Section 19: 
Continental/General Brand

$19,504.00 No Bid $21,704.48 $21,612.00 No Bid No Bid

Section 20: Goodyear Brand Disqualified No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $103,882.12
Section 21: Generic $29,095.00 Disqualified No Bid $29,670.00 No Bid No Bid
Section 22: Michelin Brand Disqualified No Bid No Bid No Bid $54,037.45 No Bid
Section 23: BF Goodrich 
Brand

Disqualified No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Section 24: 
Bridgeston/Firestone Brand

Disqualified $35,176.66 $34,053.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Section 25: Goodyear Brand Disqualified No Bid No Bid $71,602.00 No Bid No Bid
Section 26: Titan Brand Disqualified No Bid No Bid $20,610.00 No Bid No Bid
Section 27: Generic Disqualified $40,968.94 $38,922.72 $39,569.00 No Bid No Bid
Section 28: Michelin Brand Disqualified No Bid No Bid $159,880.00 $161,873.52 No Bid
Section 29: 
Bridgestone/Firestone Brand

Disqualified No Bid No Bid $29,519.40 No Bid No Bid

Section 30: 
Bridgestone/Firestone Brand

Disqualified No Bid No Bid $46,638.00 No Bid No Bid

Section 31: Goodyear Brand Disqualified No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Section 32: Generic $74,426.00 Disqualified No Bid $70,801.40 No Bid No Bid
Section 33: Galaxy Brand $15,421.00 No Bid No Bid $17,360.00 No Bid No Bid
Section 34: 
Bridgestone/Firestone Brand

Disqualified $42,630.00 No Bid $42,525.00 No Bid No Bid



Section A to Z Tire  American 
Tire 

 B & S 
Transport 

 GCR Tire 
Centers 

 Southern Tire  Strouhal Tire Wingfoot 
Commercial 

Tire
Section 35: 
Continental/General Brand

Disqualified No Bid No Bid $19,580.00 No Bid No Bid


	Recap

