
Company Section 1  
Lexmark

Section 2  
Ricoh

Section 3  
Canon    

Section 4  
Epson

Section 5  
Samsung

Section 6   
HP

Academic Supplier $1,460.04 $229.50 $268.34 $445.24 $196.00 $13,341.61
Advant Tech Solution $1,449.15 $212.76 $277.88 $446.92 $185.35 $14,710.56
CNI Office Supplies $1,346.15 No Bid $223.84 $410.39 $171.15 $13,185.30
CVR Computer Suplies $1,394.00 $100.00 $227.00 $456.00 $185.00 $12,005.00
DV Supply, Inc.
Global Associates Computers $1,468.50 $199.55 $110.10 $449.44 $104.47 $14,868.39
Global Gov/Ed Solutions, Inc. $1,461.62 $223.88 $272.80 $505.32 $185.33 Disq:Did not bid 

all items

Imaging Systems $1,608.07 $263.31 $488.38 $739.83 $237.48 $16,434.57
M & B Supplies, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12,305.34
MC Scott Construction, LP $2,221.98 $320.85 $435.39 $703.96 $268.14 $23,420.15
Marimon Business Systems $1,418.01 $261.92 $274.06 $430.13 $186.02 $13,993.91
Quill Corporation
Royal Consumer Information
Southern Computer Warehouse $1,449.67 No Bid $337.16 $552.27 $198.88 Disq:Did not bid 

all items

Staples Technology Solutions $1,419.40 $235.05 $284.90 $437.25 $179.36 $14,270.42
Supplies Now $1,414.87 $178.80 $270.69 $462.90 $202.95 $14,047.06
The Office Pal, Inc. $1,172.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12,474.96
The Tree House, Inc.
Tip Top Products, Inc. $1,414.15 $241.80 $284.45 $455.38 $189.05 $13,834.87
United Business Machines
V-Quest Office Machnies 
VTS Supplies $1,304.98 $142.03 $286.74 $457.04 $183.20 $13,978.71
W M Corp

Disqualified: Did not submit amended specification package.

Vendor withdrew bid
Disqualified: Did not submit amended specification package.

Disqualified: Did not submit amended specification package.

Recommendation: Low bidder per section                                                   
(The Office Pal for Section 1, CVR Computer Supplies for Section 2 and 6, Global Associates 

Computers for Sections 3 and 5 and CNI Office Supplies for Section 4)

Disqualified: Did not submit amended specification package.

Disqualified: Did not submit amended specification package.
Disqualified: Did not submit amended specification package.

Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 10-055

Toner and Ink Cartridges

Term: April 1, 2010 through March 31, 2010



Item Description Price per 
Cartridge

Vendor: The Office Pal, Inc.
Lexmark 15M1330 Black Print $57.00
Lexmark 10N0202 Black and Color Print $51.00
Lexmark 12A7462 Black High Yield $242.00
Lexmark 15G041Y Yellow $129.00
Lexmark 15M0120 Color Print  $49.50
Lexmark 64015HA High Yield Print $255.00
Lexmark 12A1970 Black Print $28.50
Lexmark 12A6835 High Yield Return $218.00
Lexmark 1382920 Optra S Return $142.00

Item Description Price per 
Cartridge

Ricoh GC21CH Cyan $20.00
Ricoh GC21MH Magenta $20.00
Ricoh GC21YH Yellow $20.00
Ricoh GC21KH Black $40.00

Section 1:  Lexmark Cartridges

Section 2:  Ricoh Cartridges
Vendor: CVR Computer Supplies



Item Description Price per 
Cartridge

Canon BCI-3eBK Black Ink Tank $2.19
Canon BCI-3eC Cyan Ink Tank $2.19
Canon BCI-3eM Magenta Ink Tank $2.19
Canon BCI-3eY Yellow Ink Tank $2.19
Canon BCI-6BK Black Ink Tank $2.80
Canon BCI-6C Cyan Ink Tank $2.80
Canon BCI-6M Magenta Ink Tank $2.80
Canon BCI-6Y Yellow Ink Tank $2.80
Canon BCI-15 Black Ink Tanks $3.65
Canon BCI-16 Tri-Color Ink Tank $3.65
Canon CLI-8BK Black Ink Tank $7.55
Canon CLI-8C Cyan Ink Tank $5.80
Canon CLI-8M Magenta Ink Tank $5.80
Canon CLI-8Y Yellow Ink Tank $5.80
Canon PGI-220 Blank Ink Tank $5.78
Canon CLI-221 4-Color Pack Black/Cyan/Magenta/Yellow Tank $13.77
Canon CLI-221BK Black Ink Tank $14.49
Canon CLI-221C Cyan Ink Tank $6.78
Canon CLI-221M Magenta Ink Tank $6.78
Canon CLI-221Y Yellow Ink Tank $6.78
Canon PGI-5BK Black Ink Tank $3.51

Section 3:  Canon Cartridges
Vendor: Global Associates Computers



Item Description Price per 
Cartridge

Epson S187093 Black Ink $16.80
Epson S189108 Black Ink $19.22
Epson S191089 Tricolor Ink    $19.22
Epson T028201 Black Ink $20.48
Epson T029201 Tri Color Ink $20.48
Epson T033120 Black Ink $8.93
Epson T033220 Cyan Ink $8.93
Epson T033320 Magenta Ink $8.93
Epson T033420 Yellow Ink $8.93
Epson T033520 Light Cyan Ink $8.93
Epson T033620 Light Magenta Ink $8.93
Epson T040120 Black Ink $20.48
Epson T041020 Tri Color Ink $20.48
Epson T069120 Black Ink $12.34
Epson T069220 Cyan Ink $9.53
Epson T069320 Magenta Ink $9.53
Epson T069420 Yellow Ink $9.53
Epson T069520 Multi Pack Ink Cartridge Cyan/Magenta/Yellow $28.60
Epson T078120 Black Ink $12.47
Epson T078220 Cyan Ink $9.53
Epson T078320 Magenta Ink $9.53
Epson T078420 Yellow Ink $9.53
Epson T078520 Light Cyan Ink $9.53
Epson T078620 Light Magenta Ink $9.53
Epson T096120 Black Ink $10.00
Epson T096220 Cyan Ink $10.00
Epson T096320 Vivid Magenta Ink $10.00
Epson T096420 Yellow Ink $10.00
Epson T096520 Light Cyan Ink $10.00
Epson T096620 Vivid Light Magenta Ink $10.00
Epson T096720 Light Black Ink $10.00
Epson T096820 Matte Black Ink $10.00
Epson T096920 Light, Light Black Ink $10.00

Vendor: CNI Office Supplies
Section 4:  Epson Cartridges



Item Description Price per 
Cartridge

Samsung, CLP-C300A Cyan Toner $16.89
Samsung, CLP-K300A Black Toner $19.75
Samsung, CLP-M300A Magenta Toner  $28.98
Samsung, CLP-W300A Waste Toner Container $20.99
Samsung, CLP-Y300A Yellow Toner   $17.86

Item Description Price per 
Cartridge

HP - 51625A Tri-color Ink $20.00
HP - 51626A Black ink $20.00
HP - 51629A Black Ink $20.00
HP - 51633M Black Ink $20.00
HP - 51640C Cyan Ink $20.00
HP - 51640M Magenta Ink $220.00
HP - 51640Y Yellow Ink $20.00
HP - 51641A Tri-color Ink $20.00
HP - 51645A Black Ink $30.00
HP - 51649A Tri-color Ink $20.00
HP - 6656AN Black Ink $20.00
HP - 92274A Black Laserjet $60.00
HP - 92298A Black Laserjet $70.00
HP - C1806A Black Dye Ink System $20.00
HP - C1807A Cyan Dye Ink System $20.00
HP - C1808A Magenta Dye Ink System $20.00
HP - C1809A Yellow Dye Ink System $20.00
HP - C1823D Tri-color Ink $30.00
HP - C3903A Black Laserjet $60.00
HP - C3906A Black Laserjet $40.00
HP - C3909A Black Laserjet $130.00
HP - C4092A Black Laserjet $60.00
HP - C4096A Black Laserjet $90.00
HP - C4127X Black Laserjet $120.00
HP - C4129X Black Laserjet $120.00
HP - C4149A Black Laserjet $70.00
HP - C4182X Black Laserjet $150.00
HP - C4150A Cyan Laserjet $120.00

Vendor: Global Associates Computers
Section 5: Samsung Cartridges

Vendor: CVR Computer Supplies
Section 6:  Hewlett Packard Cartridges



Item Description Price per 
Cartridge

HP - C4151A Magenta Laserjet $120.00
HP - C4152A Yellow Laserjet $120.00
HP - C4191A Black Laserjet $60.00
HP - C4192A Cyan Laserjet $70.00
HP - C4193A Magenta Laserjet $70.00
HP - C4194A Yellow Laserjet $70.00
HP - C4806A Yellow Ink $20.00
HP - C4810AN Black printhead $20.00
HP - C4811AN Cyan printhead $20.00
HP - C4812AN Magenta Printhead $30.00
HP - C4813AN Yellow Printhead $30.00
HP - C4836AN Cyan Ink $30.00
HP - C4837AN Magenta Ink $30.00
HP - C4838 AN Yellow Ink $30.00
HP - C4842A Yellow Ink $30.00
HP - C4843A Magenta Ink $30.00
HP - C4844A  Black Ink $40.00
HP - C4902AN Black Ink $20.00
HP - C4903AN Cyan Ink $20.00
HP - C4904AN Magenta Ink $20.00
HP - C4905AN Yellow Ink $40.00
HP - C4911A Cyan Inket $30.00
HP - C4912A Magenta Ink $30.00
HP - C4913A Yellow Ink $30.00
HP - C4920A Black Printhead/CP 1160 Color Printer Ink $30.00
HP - C4921A Blue Printhead/CP 1160 Color Printer Ink $30.00
HP - C4922A Magenta Printhead/CP 1160 Color Printer Ink $30.00
HP - C4923A Yellow Printhead/CP 1160 Color Printer Ink $30.00
HP - C4930A Black Dye Ink System $140.00
HP - C4931A Cyan Dye Ink $140.00
HP - C4932A Magenta Dye Ink $160.00
HP - C4933A Yellow Dye Ink $160.00
HP - C4934A Light Cyan Dye Ink $160.00
HP - C4935A Light Magenta Dye Ink $160.00
HP - C4951A Cyan printhead $100.00
HP - C4952A Magenta Designjet Printhead & Cleaner Model $100.00
HP - C4953A Yellow Designjet Printhead & Cleaner Model $100.00
HP - C4954A Light Cyan Designjet Printhead & Cleaner Model $100.00

Section 6:  Hewlett Packard Cartridges (Cont'd)
Vendor: CVR Computer Supplies



Item Description Price per 
Cartridge

HP - C4955A Light Magenta Designjet Printhead & Cleaner $100.00
HP - C5010DN Tri-color Ink $30.00
HP - C5011DN Black/Color Printer Ink $30.00
HP - C5023A Print Printhead $30.00
HP - C6578DN Tri-color Ink $40.00
HP - C6602A Black Inkjet $10.00
HP - C6614D Large Black Inkjet $30.00
HP - C6615DN Black Ink $30.00
HP - C6625A Tri-color Ink $20.00
HP - C6657AN Tri-color Ink $20.00
HP - C6658AN Photo Ink $35.00
HP - C7115A Black Toner $40.00
HP – C7115X Black Laserjet $70.00
HP - C8061X Black Laserjet $120.00
HP - C8543X  Black Laserjet $280.00
HP - C8550A Black Toner $120.00
HP - C8551A Cyan Toner $250.00
HP - C8552A Yellow Toner $250.00
HP - C8553A Magenta Toner $250.00
HP - C8721WN#140 Black Ink $20.00
HP - C8765WN#140 Black Ink $20.00
HP - C8766WN  Tri-Color Ink $20.00
HP - C8767WN#140 Black Ink $20.00
HP - C8771WN#140 Cyan Ink $20.00
HP - C8772WN Magenta Ink $20.00
HP - C8772WN(02) Magenta Photosmart $20.00
HP - C8773WN(02) Yellow Photosmart $20.00
HP - C8774WN#140 Light Cyan Ink $20.00
HP - C8775WN#140 Light Magenta Ink $20.00
HP - C8788FN#140 Inkjet combo package $20.00
HP - C9348FN#140 Black Ink $50.00
HP - C9361WN#140 Tri-Color Ink $20.00
HP - C9363WN  Tri-Color Ink $30.00
HP - C9364WN#140 Ink $30.00
HP - C9365AN#140 Blue Ink $20.00
HP - C9369WN#140 Inkjet $20.00
HP - C9381A Black/Yellow Printhead $30.00

Section 6:  Hewlett Packard Cartridges (Cont'd)
Vendor: CVR Computer Supplies



Item Description Price per 
Cartridge

HP - C9382A Cyan/Magenta Ink $30.00
HP - C9385AN#140 Black Ink $20.00
HP - C9386AN#140 Cyan Ink $20.00
HP - C9387AN#140 Magenta Ink $20.00
HP - C9388AN#140 Yellow Ink $20.00
HP - C9391AN#140 Cyan Ink $20.00
HP - C9392An#140 Magenta Ink $20.00
HP - C9393AN#140 Yellow Ink $20.00
HP - C9396AN#140 Black Ink $20.00
HP - C9700A Black Laserjet $20.00
HP - C9701A Cyan Laserjet $60.00
HP - C9702A Yellow Laserjet $60.00
HP - C9703A Magenta Laserjet $60.00
HP - C9720A Black Laserjet $160.00
HP - C9721A Cyan Laserjet $140.00
HP - C9722A Yellow Laserjet $200.00
HP - C9723A  Magenta Laserjet $200.00
HP - C9730A Black Laserjet $200.00
HP - C9731A Cyan Laserjet $300.00
HP - C9732A  Yellow Laserjet $300.00
HP - C9733A Magenta Laserjet $300.00
HP - CB316WN#140 Black Ink $10.00
HP - CB317WN#140 Black Ink $20.00
HP - CB321WN#140 Black Ink $10.00
HP - CB322WN#140 Black Ink $10.00
HP - CB335WN#140 Black Ink $10.00
HP - CB336WN#140 Black Ink $10.00
HP - CB337WN#140 Tricolor Ink Cyan/Magenta/Yellow $10.00
HP - CB338WN#140 Tricolor Ink Cyan/Magenta/Yellow $10.00
HP - CB435A Black Toner $60.00
HP - CB436A Black Toner $70.00
HP - CB540A Black Toner $70.00
HP - CB541A Cyan Toner $60.00
HP - CB542A Yellow Toner $60.00
HP - CB543A Magenta Toner $60.00
HP - CC364A Black Toner $140.00
HP - CC606FN#140 Color Inkjet Cyan/Magenta/Yellow $50.00
HP - CC640WN #140 Black Ink $20.00

Section 6:  Hewlett Packard Cartridges (Cont'd)
Vendor: CVR Computer Supplies



Item Description Price per 
Cartridge

HP - CC643WN#140 Tri-color Ink $20.00
HP - CC654AN#140 Black Ink $20.00
HP - CC656AN#140 Tri-color Ink $20.00
HP - CD971AN Black Ink $10.00
HP - CD972AN#140 Cyan Ink $10.00
HP - CD973AN#140 Magenta Ink $10.00
HP - CD974AN#140 Yellow Ink $20.00
HP - CD975AN#140 Black Ink $10.00
HP - CD976FN#140 Black Tri-Color Ink $30.00
HP - CD994FN#140 Cyan/Magenta/Yellow Ink $70.00
HP - CE505A Black Toner $60.00
HP - CH611FN#140 Color Ink $20.00
HP - CN066FN#140 Cyan/Magenta/Yellow Ink $60.00
HP - Q1338A Black Toner $140.00
HP - Q1339A Black Laserjet $90.00
HP - Q2610A Black Laserjet $90.00
HP - Q2612A Black Toner $70.00
HP - Q2624X Black Toner $60.00
HP – Q2670A Black Laserjet $140.00
HP - Q2671A Yellow Laserjet $100.00
HP - Q2672A Cyan Laserjet $100.00
HP - Q2673A Magenta Laserjet $100.00
HP - Q2681A Cyan Toner $100.00
HP - Q2682A Yellow Toner $100.00
HP - Q2683A Magenta Toner $100.00
HP - Q3960A Black Toner $40.00
HP – Q5942A Black Laserjet $120.00
HP - Q5945A Black Toner $120.00
HP - Q5949A Black Toner $60.00
HP - Q6000A Black Toner $60.00
HP - Q6001A Cyan Toner $60.00
HP - Q6002A Yellow Toner $60.00
HP - Q6003A Magenta Toner $60.00
HP - Q6470A Black Toner $100.00
HP - Q6511A Black Toner $90.00
HP - Q7551A Black Toner $90.00
HP - Q7551X Black Toner $120.00
HP - Q7553A Black Toner $50.00

Section 6:  Hewlett Packard Cartridges (Cont'd)
Vendor: CVR Computer Supplies



Item Description Price per 
Cartridge

HP - Q7581A Cyan Toner $100.00
HP - Q7582A Yellow Toner $100.00
HP - Q7583A Magenta Toner $100.00

Section 6:  Hewlett Packard Cartridges (Cont'd)
Vendor: CVR Computer Supplies


