Sent By: FBC SHERIFF'S FINANCE DIVISION; 281 341 4773; Feb-4-10 1:13PM; Page 1/7

To:

CO CLERK - At: 9,2813418697

FORT BEND COUNTY  FY 2010 :
- COMMISSIONERS COURT AGENDA REQUEST FORM
Return COmpIetcd Form by E-Maﬂ to: Agenda Coordinator, County Judge’s Office

72

Date Submitted: _February 4, 2010 Submitted By: Lou Ann Muilings
v : Department: Sheriffs Office
Court Agenda Date: Fobruary‘ja, 2010 Phone Number: 281 3414703

SUMMARY OF ITEM: Vehicle towing done without a Purchase Order

RENEWAL AGREEMENT/APPOINTMENT YES NO X
REVIEWED BY COUNTY ATTORNEY'S OFFICE: YES NO X

List Supporting Documents Attached: Invoice transmittals, invoices from Collision Clinic,
Inc. and memos from Investigator Dalia Simons and Captain Rodney Glendemng

FINANCIAL SUMMARY::
BUDGETED ITEM:  YES X j NO
FUNDNG SOURCE: Accounting Unit: 100560100/305560114 Account Number: 63000

Activity (If Applicable):

m:
» Completely fill out agenda form: incomplete forms will not be processaed.
» Agenda Request Forms should be submitted by e-mail, fax, or inter-office mail, and all back-up
information must be provided by Wednesday at 2:00 p.m. to all those listed below.
« All original back-up must be received in the County Judge's Office by 2:00 p.m. on Wednesday.
DISTRIBUTION:
Original Form Submitted with back up to County Judge's Office X (v when complotnd)

if by E-Mhuil to gepindonfPco.fort-hend.Dr.uys If by Fax to (281) 341-8809
Distribute copies with back-up to all listed below. If by fax, send to numbers below:

X Auditor (281-341-3774) X Comm. Pct. 1 (281-342-0587)
X Budget Officer  (281-344-3954) X Comm. Pct. 2 (281-403-8009)
X Facilities/Planning © (281-633-7022) X Comm. Pct. 3 (281-242-8080)
X Purchasing Agent - (281-341-8642) X Comm. Pct. 4 (281-380-9077)
X Information Technology (281-341-4528) X County Clerk (281-341-8697)
O Other: X County Atty  (281-341-4557)

RECOMMENDATION / ACTION REQUESTED:

Special Handling Réquested (specity).
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Sent By: FBC SHERIFF'S FINANCE DIVISION; 281 341 4773; Feb-4-10 1:13PM;

FORT BEND COUNTY AUDITOR

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE' INVOICE TRANSMITTAL

County Auditor Form 1016
(Rev. 11/07)

Page 2/7

. | R Vendor # 19555
305560114 | Vendor Name
T S Collision Clinic Inc.
Address
City
State Zip Code Date
02/04/10
involce #Invoice ;DataIDesc Amount
Invoice No. 015043 $ 150.00
Total
9 150.00

County Auditor's Use Only

CC Approval Date
Check Type |

Audited By

Received

Paid

Lo

uthorize

-

epartment Approval

Treasurer's Register Stamp and Number




Sent By: FBC SHERIFF'S FINANCE DIVISION; 281 341 4773; Feb-4-10 11:13PM; Page 3/7

FORT BEND COUNTY AUDITOR

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE. INVOICE TRANSMITTAL

County Auditor Form 1016
{Rev. 11/07)

S ' R Vendor # 195585
100560100 Vendor Name
o . R E Collision Clinlc Inc.
Address
P iave il Ladle e aaranied &
City
State Zip Code Date
02/04/10
Invoice #Invoice fDatoIDosc Amount
Invoice No. 015580 $ 150.00
Total
$ 150.00

County Auditor’s Use Only
CC Approval Date

Check Type 0«#14/ J/;.,‘.,W

Authornized Department Approval
Audited By :

Treasurer's Regiéter Stamp and Number

Received

Paid




Sent By: FBC SHERIFF'S FINANCE DIVISION;

281 341 4773; Feb-4-10 1:14PM; Page 4/7

015043
_ Collision Clinic
"4 HWR TOWING SERVICE

1024 FM 1092
Mo City, TX 77459 Beeper F ‘/' B‘f /\A
AN

2703 Rastus

Stafford, TX 77477 Time : .
Tel:(281) 261- 0124 Date /D 3 /7’_ 07
Owner i |

- 2

Modal and Make C?Q Me“‘”‘/ { Type I/ o F)

CHARGES:

o9
Wrooker Sorvice.... $ ly ‘
4 C7L F Drop Brive Shaft..
e et Ditch Jdb.... .......
-J..loonllm.wdﬂogullhn Tra n_""’--
Paid Ong. .
\lp Wrecker Servical  Other Charges.....
ve-|inter vehicle
Starage Charges...
Dollle Servica. . ...

Total Charges........ ( :SQ

Ml_go'smp Wraclkar Driver “ Sﬁb




Sent By: FBC SHERIFF'S FINANCE DIVISION;

I
-
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Sent By: FBC SHERIFF'S FINANCE DIVISION; 281 341 4773; Feb-4-10 1:14PM; Page 6/7

DATE: Déccmber 29, 2009

To: Finance

From: Détecti.ve D. Simons Robbery/Homicide

Ref: caSe #09-34782 / AGGRAVATED ASSAULT

The victi_m,~ vehicle was towed to the Fort Bend County Sherif’s Office
by Collission Clinic (281-261-0124) to 231 New Legion Dr, Richmond, Texas (0 process
and recover any evidence.

Thank you,

OWlsStns =

Detective D. Simons #162



Sent By: FBC SHERIFF'S FINANCE DIVISION; 281 341 4773; Feb-4-10 1:15PM; Page 7/7

Lou Ann Mullings

From: ~ Rodney Glendening [glendrod@co.fort-bend tx us)
Sent: Wednesday, February 03, 20105 19 PM

To: - Lou Ann Mullings

Subject: - Re: FW: Collision Clinic

This vehicle had a false compartment containing approximatley $275,000.00 of illeagl drug
money. The driver was arrested and the wrecker that was used "Collision Cliruc" was the
next wrecker on rotation, THis was not a special requests or a personal call for
Collision wrecker. It was merely the next one in line on the County:s rotating wrecker
system. The vehicle was towed from Fresno Texas to the storage lot un Legion Drive. The
vehicle was seized under Chapter 59 statue.

This 1s the common practice or procedure when an arrcst is made and theé vehicle is o he
siezed. It is towed Lo our storage lot to prevent the build up of storage fees. Thank

you, Rodney



