Fort Bend County Tabulation

BID 10-036
Term Contract for Tires and Tubes

Term: through 30 September 2010

Recommendation: Low bidder per section

Description Lawson| Ato Z Tire | American | Kauffman | Snider Tire [ Southern |Strouhal Tire
Number Tire Dist. Tire Tire Mart
Section 1: Goodyear Brand Only Disqualified No Bid No Bid No Bid
P225/60R16 Pursuit v-rated 5093 $72.50 $72.50
P235/55R17 Eagle RSA Pursuit v- 5094 $97.00 $96.50
rate
Total Section 1 $128,250.00 | $128,000.00
Section 2: Goodyear Brand Only Disqualified No Bid No Bid No Bid
P255/65R16 Eagle LS 5098 $114.75 $111.75
LT235/75R15 Wrangler MT/R 6 ply | 5080 $92.47 $99.58
(outline white letter)
P235/75R15 Wrangler RT/S XL 5095 $73.32 $69.00
P255/70R15 Eagle GT I 5099 $84.14 $81.92
P235/75R16 Wrangler ST BW 5096 $114.98 $88.50
LT235/85R16 Wrangler HT 10 ply 5081 $110.97 $108.05
LT235/85R16 Wrangler MT/R 10 5082 $129.44 $104.00
ply with Kevlar or DuraTrac, 10 ply
LT245/75R16 Wrangler HT load 5085 $121.19 $118.00
range E
LT245/75R16 Wrangler MT/R 10 5086 $134.19 $140.50
ply (outline white letter)
P245/75R16 Wrangler RT/S (outline| 5097 $109.53 $81.00

white letter)




Description Lawson| Ato Z Tire | American | Kauffman | Snider Tire [ Southern |Strouhal Tire
Number Tire Dist. Tire Tire Mart
Section 2: Goodyear Brand Only
(cont'd)
LT245/75R16 Wrangler RT/S 10 ply| 5087 $97.50 $95.00
(outline white letter
LT265/75R16 Wrangler RT/S 10 ply| 5091 $116.97 $114.00
(highway or all terrain, no mud)
LT265/75R16 Wrangler MT/R 8 ply| 5090 $145.60 $151.50
with Kevlar
P255/70R16 Wrangler RT/S 5100 $94.71 $88.67
LT245/70R17 Wrangler MT/R 10 5083 $156.53 $152.50
ply with Kevlar
P265/70R17 Wrangler AT/S 5101 $124.19 $116.27
LT265/70R17 Wrangler AT/S 6 ply | 5088 $144.63 $140.83
LT265/70R17 Wrangler MT/R 6 ply| 5089 $180.88 $176.12
with Kevlar
7.50 x 16 Workhorse Rib 8 ply 5077 $104.28 $101.53
7.00 x 15 Workhorse 5076 $97.41 $94.85
LT275/65R18 Wrangler AT/SVSB | 6384 $188.19 $183.24
10 ply
LT275/65R18 Wrangler AT/S OWL | 6385 $194.57 $189.45
10 ply
P275/65R18 Wrangler SR-A OWL 6386 $127.16 $12.82
SL
Total Section 2 $73,198.76 | $70,123.56
Section 3: B F Goodrich Brand Disqualified No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Only
225/70R19.5 ST230 14 Ply 5330 $175.92

Total Section 3

$703.68




Description Lawson| Ato Z Tire | American | Kauffman | Snider Tire [ Southern |Strouhal Tire
Number Tire Dist. Tire Tire Mart

Section 4: B F Goodrich Brand Disqualified No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Only
11R22.5 DR675 16 ply 5322 $278.05

Total Section 4 $2,780.50
Section 5: Goodyear Brand Only Disqualified No Bid No Bid No Bid
9.00R20 G149 RSA 12 ply 5079 $260.00 $235.00
9.00R20 G124 12 ply 5078 $248.00 $245.00
10.00R20 G149 RSA 14 ply 5058 $290.00 $264.00
10.00R20 G287 MSA 16 ply 5059 $289.50 $280.00
11R22.5 G287 MSA 16 ply 5061 $320.00 $292.00
11R22.5 G288 MSA 16 ply 5062 $365.00 $308.00
11R22.5 G177 16 ply 5060 $390.00 $318.00
11R22.5 G395 LHS 14 ply 5064 $334.00 $270.00
11R22.5 G395 LHS 16 ply 5065 $363.75 $275.00
12R22.5 G149 RSA 16 ply 5066 $371.00 $317.00
315/80R22.5 G291 18 ply 5074 $385.00 $365.00
385/65R22.5 G178SS 18 ply 5075 $456.00 $455.00

Total Section 5 $93,421.00 | $81,484.00
Section 6: Michelin Brand Only Disqualified No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12.4-24 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply | 5139 $517.02
13.6R24 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply [ 5151 $625.51
14.9R24 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply| 5161 $725.03
18.4R30 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply| 5190 $1,114.10
16.9R34 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply| 5177 $982.42
18.4R38 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply| 5194 $1,090.91
380/85R24 Power Radial 80 5216 $578.88




Description Lawson| Ato Z Tire | American | Kauffman | Snider Tire [ Southern |Strouhal Tire
Number Tire Dist. Tire Tire Mart

Section 6: Michelin Brand Only
(cont'd)
18.4R34 R-1W Radial 8 ply 6387 $849.98
23.1-26 10 ply tubeless 5208 $2,190.05

Total Section 6 $53,203.15
Section 7: B F Goodrich Brand Disqualified No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Only

12.4-24 Power Gripper TL 8 ply 5137
13.6R24 Power Radial 80 5150
14.9-24 R-1 Power Gripper TL 8 ply| 5160
380/85R24 Power Radial 80 5215
18.4-30 Power Gripper TL 8 ply 5183
16.9-34 R-1Power Gripper TL 8 ply | 5175
16.9R34 Power Radial 80 5176
18.4-34 R-1 Power Gripper TL 8 ply| 5188
18.4R34 Power Radial 80 5191
18.4-38 R-1 Power Gripper TL 8 ply| 5189
18.4R38 Power Radial 80 5192
23.1-26 10 ply tubeless 6388

Total Section 7




Description Lawson| Ato Z Tire | American | Kauffman | Snider Tire [ Southern |Strouhal Tire
Number Tire Dist. Tire Tire Mart

Section 8: Bridgestone/Firestone Disqualified No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand Only
10.00-16 Champ Guide Grip 3Rib F{ 5103 $297.94
11.00-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F{ 5117 $236.94
11L-15 Champ Guide Grip 3Rib F- | 5123 $179.76
12.4-24 Super All Traction 23° 8 ply| 5014 $465.44
340/85R24 Radial 6000-R-1W 8 ply | 5036 $979.43
380/85R24 Radial 6000-R-1W 8 ply | 5037 $1,106.76
18.4-30 Champ Spade Grip - R-2 6 5029 $1,604.33
ply
18.4-30 Champ Spade Grip - R-2 10| 5028 $1,604.33
ply
16.9-34 Traction Field & Road - R-1| 5024 $693.99
8 ply
18.4-34 Traction Field & Road - R-1| 5030 $751.65
8 ply
18.4R38 Radial All Traction 23° 8 5031 $1,118.06
ply

Total Section 8 $46,675.67
Section 9: Goodyear Brand Only Disqualified No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15.5X25 SGL DL 2A NY TL F/12 5071
17.5X25 Rock lug 16 ply Tl 5072
13.00X24 grader 12 ply TL SG6-2A| 5068
13.00R24 SGL 2A NY TL F/12 5067




Description Lawson| Ato Z Tire | American | Kauffman | Snider Tire [ Southern |Strouhal Tire
Number Tire Dist. Tire Tire Mart
Section 9: Goodyear Brand Only
(cont'd)
14.00X24 Grader 12 ply TL SGG- 5070
2A
20.5R25 1 GP2B6STL 5073
14.00R24 GS2BG2TL 5069
Total Section 9
Section 10: Michelin Brand Only- Disqualified No Bid No Bid
Tires Primarily for City of Sugar
Land
225/70R19.5 X XZE $199.00 $203.12 $205.00
315/80RR22.5 XZA Energy $463.00 $467.94 $400.00
385/65R22.5 XFE $465.00 $469.62 $467.50
425/65R22.5 XFE $472.00 $477.23 $475.00
425/65R22.5 XTE?2 $542.00 $546.67 $543.40
10R22.5 XDE M/S $283.00 $288.15 $288.75
11R22.5 XDN2 $330.00 $355.05 $334.95
11R22.5 XZE $267.00 $257.16 $273.00
11R22.5 XZE $267.00 $257.16 $285.00
11R22.5 XZE2 $277.00 $282.39 $296.00
12R22.5 XDN2 $350.00 $355.41 $355.00
12R22.5 XZE $335.00 $348.30 $348.00
Total Section 10 $49,736.00 | $50,581.96 $50,573.00




Description Lawson| Ato Z Tire | American | Kauffman | Snider Tire [ Southern |Strouhal Tire
Number Tire Dist. Tire Tire Mart
Section 11: Goodyear Brand Only- Disqualified No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tires Primarily for City of Sugar
Land
425/65R22.5 G286 $495.00
11R22.5 G149 $295.50
11R22.5 G661 $331.50
11R22.5 G150HAS $301.50
ST225/75R15 Marathon Radial $71.00
ST235/80R16 Marathon Radial $87.50
Total Section 11 $4,154.00
Section 12: B F Goodrich Brand Disqualified No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Only-Tires Primarily for City of
Sugar Land
425/65R22.5 LRL Radial ST565 $425.00
Total Section 12 $1,700.00
Section 13: Bridgestone Brand Disqualified No Bid No Bid No Bid
Only-Tires Primarily for City of
Sugar Land
315/80R22.5 M860 $377.49 $376.50
10R22.5 R250 $207.49 $199.50
11R22.5 V Steel MIX711 $244.49 $265.50
11R22.5 R250ED $227.49 $243.50
Total Section 13 $2,113.92 $2,170.00




Description Lawson| Ato Z Tire | American | Kauffman | Snider Tire [ Southern |Strouhal Tire
Number Tire Dist. Tire Tire Mart

Section 14: Generic-Tires No Bid
Primarily for City of Sugar Land
11L-16SL F-3 $109.00 $121.75 $99.00 $118.00 $145.00
19.5L-24 12 ply $375.00 $992.98 $425.00 $412.00 $400.00
16.9-24 R-4 $315.00 $620.76 $330.00 $370.00 $335.00
11L-16 $68.00 $165.00 $99.00 $88.00 $97.00
13.6-28 $225.00 $404.45 $225.00 $273.00 $245.00
6.50-16 $45.00 $69.95 $59.00 $64.00 $65.00

Total Section 14 $2,274.00 | $4,749.78 | $2,474.00 $2,650.00 | $2,574.00

A to Z: Disqualified on Sections 1 - 13: Did not bid required brands as specified.

Wingfoot: Disqualified on Sections 2 and 11: Did not bid all items in section as required.
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$239.00
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