Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 09-098
Furniture for Sienna Branch Library

Recommendation: Section 1: ATD American, Section 2: The Wells Group, Section 3: CRG
Funding: Library 100687888 64600 P687-02SIENNALB 32400

Section 1: Stacking Chairs and Tables

ltem

ATD
American

CRG

Intelligent
Interiors

McCoy

Office Design
Concepts

The Buckstaff
Company

The Wells
Group

Vanguard
Environments

Item: MR-1
Quantity: 275
Stacking chairs

$114.34

$89.25

Item: MR-2
Quantity: 10
Kl dolly

$187.48

$147.68

Item: MR-3
Quantity: 12
30" x 60" tables

$130.51

$544.92

Item: MR-4
Quantity: 5
36" x 72" tables

$193.24

$597.16

Item: MR-5
Quantity: 5
48" round

$291.97

$308.11

Item: MR-6
Quantity: 5
Bases for table

$244.11

$180.62

Item: MR-7
Quantity: 6
30" x 72" tables

$359.74

$317.54

Disqualified:
Did not submit
amended bid
as required.

$122.93

$203.05

$448.78

$482.93

$459.88

$270.00

$371.34

Disqualified:
Did not submit
amended bid
as required.

Disqualfied:
Did not bid all
items as
required

$110.00

$90.40

$320.00

$149.59

$215.00

$551.71

$280.00

$605.43

$195.00

$312.09

$130.00

$182.95

$240.00

$322.10




Item ATD CRG Intelligent McCoy Office Design|The Buckstafff The Wells Vanguard
American Interiors Concepts Company Group Environments

Item: MR-9 $167.41 $195.86| Disqualified: $227.08| Disqualified: | Disqualfied: $85.00 $196.96

Quantity: 1 Did not submit Did not submit|{ Did not bid all

Table base T amended bid amended bid items as

Item: MR-10 $214.92 $196.79| as required. $228.19| as required. required $195.00 $197.92

Quantity: 1

Table top

Item: MR-11 $101.13 $122.30 $116.34 $215.00 $120.91

Quantity: 30

24" x 72" folding

Item: MR-12 $123.07 $154.59 $147.07 $315.00 $152.85

Quantity: 10

30" x 72" folding

Item: MR-13 $154.96 $190.36 $181.10 $700.00 $186.10

Quantity: 4

Storage caddy

Mfg Spec'd or Sub Both Manufacturer Manufacturer Sub Manufacturer

Total Section 1: $45,956.23| $46,262.52| Disqualified $55,654.27| Disqualified | Disqualified | $53,260.00 $46,706.45

Section 2: Lounge Chairs, Sofas and Occasional Tables

Item: L-1 No Bid $1,023.08| Disqualified: $1,061.89| Disqualified: | Disqualfied: $915.00 $1,007.50

Quantity: 28 Did not submit Did not submit|{ Did not bid all

Single lounge chairs amended bid amended bid items as

Iltem: L-2 No Bid $1,000.35| as required. $1,019.21| as required. required $915.00 $991.64

Quantity: 8

Single lounge chairs

Item: L-3 No Bid $551.23 $619.21 $760.00 $654.89

Quantity: 4
Single lounge chairs




Item: L-4
Quantity: 1
Three place sofa

No Bid

$1,671.33

$1,725.06

$1,525.00

$1,656.44

ltem

ATD
American

CRG

Intelligent
Interiors

McCoy

Office Design
Concepts

The Buckstaff
Company

The Wells
Group

Vanguard
Environments

Item: L-5
Quantity: 1
Two place sofa

No Bid

$1,369.01

Item: L-6
Quantity: 18
Club table

No Bid

$379.30

Item: L-7
Quantity: 1
Coffee table

No Bid

$365.49

Disqualified:
Did not submit
amended bid
as required.

$1,429.88

$522.99

$503.78

Disqualified:
Did not submit
amended bid
as required.

Disqualfied:
Did not bid all
items as
required

$1,500.00

$1,372.73

$470.00

$384.19

$530.00

$370.19

Mfg Spec'd or Sub

Manufacturer

Manufacturer

Sub

Manufacturer

Total Section 2:

No Bid

$49,087.19

Disqualified

$53,435.98

Disqualified

Disqualified

$47,995.00

$50,450.19

Section 3: Task Chairs and Workroom and Office

Furniture

Item: WR-1
Quantity: 71
Task Chairs

No Bid

$213.79

Item: WR-2
Quantity: 72
Task Chairs

No Bid

$213.79

Item: WR-3
Quantity: 6
Tall swivel stool

No Bid

$246.14

Item: WR-4
Quantity: 12
Guest chairs

No Bid

$148.03

Disqualified:
Did not submit
amended bid
as required.

$392.41

No Bid

No Bid

$269.48

No Bid

$539.02

No Bid

$186.90

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Disqualfied:
Did not bid all
items as
required

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




Item: WR-5
Quantity: 20
Lateral files

No Bid

$367.70

Item: WR-6
Quantity: 4
Lateral files

No Bid

$420.36

$561.46

No Bid

$621.46

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

ltem

ATD
American

CRG

Intelligent
Interiors

McCoy

Office Design
Concepts

The Buckstaff
Company

The Wells
Group

Vanguard
Environments

Item: WR-7
Quantity: 2
Buildup lateral

No Bid

$590.42

Item: WR-8
Quantity: 1
48" x 102" table

No Bid

$4,894.82

Item: WR-9
Quantity: 1

Panel system for
circulation workroom

No Bid

$5,780.25

Item: WR-10
Quantity: 3
Desk-Double pedestal

No Bid

$590.29

Item: WR-11
Quantity: 7
Desk-Single pedestal

No Bid

$413.67

Item: WR-12
Quantity: 4
Desk-Single pedestal

No Bid

$446.45

Item: WR-13
Quantity: 4
Return for desk

No Bid

$342.04

Disqualified
Did not submit]
amended bid

$1,042.28

No Bid

as required.

$2,176.09

No Bid

$6,972.66

No Bid

$579.28

No Bid

$466.23

No Bid

$524.88

No Bid

$318.75

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Disqualfied:
Did not bid all
items as
required

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




Item: WR-14
Quantity: 30
Center drawers

No Bid

$38.55

Item: WR-15
Quantity: 5
Bookcases

No Bid

$247.29

$70.21

No Bid

$624.02

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

ltem

ATD
American

CRG

Intelligent
Interiors

McCoy

Office Design
Concepts

The Buckstaff
Company

The Wells
Group

Vanguard
Environments

Item: WR-16
Quantity: 1

Panel system for
reference workroom

No Bid

$7,171.40

Item: WR-17
Quantity: 5
Desk-Single pedestal

No Bid

$437.34

Item: WR-18
Quantity: 3
Bridge for desks

No Bid

$168.14

Item: WR-19
Quantity: 2
Return, pedestal

No Bid

$340.53

Item: WR-20
Quantity: 4
Overhead storage

No Bid

$219.74

Item: WR-21
Quantity: 3
Desk-Single pedestal

No Bid

$387.26

Item: WR-22
Quantity: 1
Desk-Double pedestal

No Bid

$535.06

Disqualified
Did not submit
amended bid
as required.

$15,528.19

No Bid

$487.90

No Bid

$149.60

No Bid

$362.53

No Bid

$404.18

No Bid

$496.40

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Disqualfied:
Did not bid all
items as
required

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




Item: WR-23 No Bid $54.03 $197.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Quantity: 4

Underline task light

Iltem: WR-24 No Bid $85.29 $106.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Quantity: 4

Tackboard

Item ATD CRG Intelligent McCoy Office Design|The Buckstafff The Wells Vanguard
American Interiors Concepts Company Group Environments

Item: WR-25 No Bid $161.14 $158.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Quantity: 1

Enviro plat

Mfg Spec'd or Sub Subs Manufacturer

Total Section 3: No Bid $78,767.79 | Disqualified | $114,242.03 No Bid No Bid Disqualified No Bid

CRG submitted a 2nd bid with substitute product but pricing was not on County form.




