SERE_OF OFFICE OF COUNTY PURCHASING AGENT
] SR Fort Bend County, Texas

Term Contract Renewal Form

S, BEN D

Solicitation #: Bid 24-040

Title: Term Contract for Purchase and Hauling Chemical Road Materials

Contracted Vendor: Cleveland Asphalt Products, Inc.

Mr. Moore,

Our contract with your company for the above referenced expires March 31, 2026. Contract provisions allow for
renewal of this contract if mutually agreeable.

If your company wishes to renew this contract through March 31, 2027 under the same terms and conditions, please
complete the information below and return this form along with a Form 1295 by e-mail to
melissa.stavinoha@fortbendcountytx.gov. Purchasing will then take the matter before the Commissioner’s Court of
Fort Bend County for their consideration. Please respond to this email by 5:00 pm, Tuesday, December 23, 2025.

X Yes, I agree to renewing our agreement with Fort Bend County under the same terms and conditions.

No, I do not wish to renew our agreement with Fort Bend County.
If Yes, please provide a new Form 1295 along with this renewal form by replying to this email. The Form 1295
must be new; previous 1295s are not permitted.

Effective January 1, 2016 all contracts executed by Commissioners Court, regardless of the dollar amount, will
require completion of Form 1295 "Certificate of Interested Parties", per the new Government Code Statute
§2252.908. All vendors submitting a response to a formal Bid, RFP, SOQ or any contracts, contract amendments,
extensions or renewals are required to complete the Form 1295 online through the State of Texas Ethics
Commission website. Please visit:

https://www.ethics.state.tx.us/filinginfo/1295/

On-line instructions:

Name of governmental entity is to read: Fort Bend County.

Identification number used by the governmental entity is: B24-040.

Description is to read: Purchase and Hauling Chemical Road Materials.

After receiving the Form 1295 with a new Certification Number and Date Filed, please print the form and
complete box 6, sign, then email the Form 1295 and this signed Term  Contract
Renewal Form to melissa.stavinoha@fortbendcountytx.gov. If your company is publicly traded you are
not required to complete this form.

g %t% @ % 12/29/2025
Signatuf€ of Authorized Representative Date

Clayton Moore, Sales Rep.
Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative




OFFICE OF COUNTY PURCHASING AGENT
Fort Bend County, Texas

Term Contract Renewal Form

Title: Term Contract for Purchase and Hauling Chemical Road Materials

Contracted Vendor: Martin Product Sales DBA Martin Asphalt Company

Ms. Espino,

Our contract with your company for the above referenced expires March 31, 2026. Contract provisions allow for
renewal of this contract if mutually agreeable.

[f your company wishes to renew this contract through March 31, 2027 under the same terms and conditions, please
complete the information below and return this form along with a Form 1295 by e-mail to
melissa.stavinoha@fortbendcountytx.gov. Purchasing will then take the matter before the Commissioner’s Court of
Fort Bend County for their consideration. Please respond to this email by 5:00 pm, Tuesday, December 23, 2025.

X Yes, [ agree to renewing our agreement with Fort Bend County under the same terms and conditions.

No, I do not wish to renew our agreement with Fort Bend County.
If Yes, please provide a new Form 1295 along with this renewal form by replying to this email. The Form 1295
must be new; previous 1295s are not permitted.

Effective January 1, 2016 all contracts executed by Commissioners Court, regardless of the dollar amount, will
require completion of Form 1295 "Certificate of Interested Parties", per the new Government Code Statute
§2252.908. All vendors submitting a response to a formal Bid, RFP, SOQ or any contracts, contract amendments,
extensions or renewals are required to complete the Form 1295 online through the State of Texas Ethics
Commission website. Please visit:

https://www.ethics.state.tx.us/filinginfo/1295/

On-line instructions:

Name of governmental entity is to read: Fort Bend County.

Identification number used by the governmental entity is: B24-040.

Description is to read: Purchase and Hauling Chemical Road Materials.

After receiving the Form 1295 with a new Certification Number and Date Filed, please print the form and
complete box 6, sign, then email the Form 1295 and this signed Term  Contract
Renewal Form to melissa.stavinoha@fortbendcountytx.gov. If your company is publicly traded you are
not required+o complete this form.

/U ﬁ\)/@ 12/18/2025

Signatun’e of @presemative Date
Victoria Espino, Sales Representative

Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative




OFFICE OF COUNTY PURCHASING AGENT
Fort Bend County, Texas

Term Contract Renewal Form

Solicitation #: Bid 24-040

Title: Term Contract for Purchase and Hauling Chemical Road Materials

Contracted Vendor: P Squared Emulsion Plants, LL.C

Mr. McGinnis,

Our contract with your company for the above referenced expires March 31, 2026. Contract provisions allow for
renewal of this contract if mutually agreeable.

[f your company wishes to renew this contract through March 31, 2027 under the same terms and conditions. please

complete the information below and return this form along with a Form 1295 by e-mail to

melissa.stavinoha@fortbendcountytx.gov. Purchasing will then take the matter before the Commissioner’s Court of
rtRend County for their consideration. Please respond to this email by 5:00 pm, Tuesday. December 23, 2025.

Yes, [ agree to renewing our agreement with Fort Bend County under the same terms and conditions.

No, I do not wish to renew our agreement with Fort Bend County. :
If Yes, please provide a new Form 1295 along with this renewal form by replying to this email. The Form 1295
must be new; previous 1295s are not permitted.

Effective January 1. 2016 all contracts executed by Commissioners Court, regardless of the dollar amount, will
require completion of Form 1295 "Certificate of Interested Parties". per the new Government Code Statute
§2252.908. All vendors submitting a response to a formal Bid, RFP, SOQ or any contracts, contract amendments,
extensions or renewals are required to complete the Form 1295 online through the State of Texas Ethics
Commission website. Please visit:

https://www.ethics.state.tx.us/filinginfo/1295/

On-line instructions:

Name of governmental entity is to read: Fort Bend County.

Identification number used by the governmental entity is: B24-040.

Description is to read: Purchase and Hauling Chemical Road Materials.

After receiving the Form 1295 with a new Certification Number and Date Filed, please print the form and
complete  box 6, sign, then email the Form 1295 and this signed Term Contract
Renewal Form to melissa.stavinoha@fortbendcountytx.gov. If your company is publicly traded you are
not required to complete this form.

4@\9&/‘7 1-/18/25

Signature of Authorized Representative Date

<ent MANNIC pedimerr 4 ceo

Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative




Awarded 3/26/2024: All Bidders Meeting Specifications

Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 24-040
Term Contract for Purchase and Hauling of Chemical Road Materials

Term: April 1, 2024 through March 31, 2025

Renewal Term Approved 1/28/2025: April 1, 2025 through March 31, 2026

CRS-2, Cationic Emulsion, Rapid Setting, THD #300 (price per gallon)

Delivery Points, Fees, and

Cleveland Asphalt

Martin Product Sales,

P Squared Emulsion

Minimum Quantity Products Inc. LLC Plants, LLC
Shepherd, TX dba Elm Mott, TX
Martin Asphalt Co.
Houston, TX
Minimum Gallon Quantity 5000 Gallons 5500 Gallons No Bid
Rosenberg $2.74 $2.66
Crabb $2.74 $2.66
Fresno $2.74 $2.66
Needville $2.74 $2.66
Richmond $2.74 $2.66
Plant $2.60 $2.50
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
each add'l mile
Restocking Fee 1/2 freight if delivery is
returned

Laydown Charge
Demurrage Charge $80.00/hr after 2 free $95.00/hr after 2 free

hours hours
Plant Location 100 Asphalt Lane, 300 ChristyPL, South

Shepherd, TX 77371

Houston, TX 77587

Prime Seal/Dust Control (price per gallon)

Fees and Minimum Cleveland Asphalt Martin Product Sales, P Squared Emulsion
Quantity Products Inc. LLC Plants, LLC
Shepherd, TX dba Elm Mott, TX
Martin Asphalt Co.
Houston, TX
Undiluted Delivered $2.74 No Bid $2.24
Diluted 12:1 Delivered $1.60 $1.97
Minimum Gallon Quantity 5000 Gallons 5000 Gallons
Demurrage Charge $80.00/hr after 2 free $80.00/hr after 2 free
hours hours

Waller County Asphalt, Inc. - disqualified due to providing incorrect pricing form




SS-1 Emulsion used for dust control (price per gallon)

Delivery Points, Fees, and Cleveland Asphalt Martin Product Sales, P Squared Emulsion
Minimum Quantity Products Inc. LLC Plants, LLC
Shepherd, TX dba Elm Mott, TX
Martin Asphalt Co.
Houston, TX
Minimum Gallon Quantity 5000 Gallons 5500 Gallons No Bid
Rosenberg $2.74 $2.66
Crabb $2.74 $2.66
Fresno $2.74 $2.66
Needville $2.74 $2.66
Richmond $2.74 $2.66
Plant $2.60 $2.50
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
each add'l mile
Restocking Fee 1/2 freight if delivery is
returned

Demurrage Charge $80.00/hr after 2 free $95.00/hr after 2 free

hours hours
Plant Location 100 Asphalt Lane, 300 Christy PL, South

Shepherd, TX 77371

Houston, TX 77587

P2 Road Stabilizer (price per gallon) or equal to:

Delivery Points, Fees, and Cleveland Asphalt Martin Product Sales, P Squared Emulsion
Minimum Quantity Products Inc. LLC Plants, LLC
Shepherd, TX dba Elm Mott, TX
Martin Asphalt Co.
Houston, TX
Minimum Gallon Quantity No Bid No Bid 5000 Gallons
Rosenberg $2.96
Crabb $2.96
Fresno $2.96
Needville $2.96
Richmond $2.96
Plant $2.68
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
each add'l mile

Restocking Fee $1.30
Demurrage Charge $80.00/hr after 2 free

hours

Plant Location

516 South McLennan
Loop, Elm Mott, TX
76640




Chip Seal Emulsion "CWE-2" (price per gallon)

Delivery Points, Fees, and Cleveland Asphalt Martin Product Sales, P Squared Emulsion
Minimum Quantity Products Inc. LLC Plants, LLC
Shepherd, TX dba Elm Mott, TX
Martin Asphalt Co.
Houston, TX
Minimum Gallon Quantity No Bid No Bid 5000 Gallons
Rosenberg $3.10
Crabb $3.10
Fresno $3.10
Needville $3.10
Richmond $3.10
Plant $3.01
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
each add'l mile
Restocking Fee $1.30
Laydown Charge
Demurrage Charge $80.00/hr after 2 free
hours
Plant Location 516 South McLennan
Loop, Elm Mott, TX
76640
ROC-P2 Road Over Coat
Delivery Points, Fees, and Cleveland Asphalt Martin Product Sales, P Squared Emulsion
Minimum Quantity Products Inc. LLC Plants, LLC
Shepherd, TX dba Elm Mott, TX
Martin Asphalt Co.
Houston, TX
Minimum Gallon Quantity No Bid No Bid 5000 Gallons
Rosenberg $3.10
Crabb $3.10
Fresno $3.10
Needville $3.10
Richmond $3.10
Plant $3.01
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
each add'l mile
Restocking Fee $1.30
Demurrage Charge $80.00/hr after 2 free
hours

Plant Location

516 South McLennan
Loop, Elm Mott, TX
76640

Waller County Asphalt, Inc. - disqualified due to providing incorrect pricing form
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