OFFICE OF COUNTY PURCHASING AGENT



Fort Bend County, Texas

Term Contract Renewal Form

Solicitation #: Bid 23-070

Title: Purchase of Vehicles for Fort Bend County

Contracted Vendor: Helfman Ford

Mr. Warren,

Our contract with your company for the above referenced expires September 30, 2025. Contract provisions allow for renewal of this contract if mutually agreeable.

If your company wishes to renew this contract through September 30, 2026 under the same terms and conditions, please complete the information below and return this form along with a Form 1295 by e-mail to Melissa. Stavinoha@fortbendcountytx.gov. Purchasing will then take the matter before the Commissioner's Court of Fort Bend County for their consideration. Please respond to this email by 5:00 pm, Monday, July 14, 2025.

Yes, I agree to renewing our agreement with Fort Bend County under the same terms and conditions. No, I do not wish to renew our agreement with Fort Bend County. If Yes, please provide a new Form 1295 along with this renewal form by replying to this email. The Form 1295 must be new; previous 1295s are not permitted.

Effective January 1, 2016 all contracts executed by Commissioners Court, regardless of the dollar amount, will require completion of Form 1295 "Certificate of Interested Parties", per the new Government Code Statute §2252.908. All vendors submitting a response to a formal Bid, RFP, SOQ or any contracts, contract amendments, extensions or renewals are required to complete the Form 1295 online through the State of Texas Ethics Commission website. Please visit:

https://www.ethics.state.tx.us/filinginfo/1295/

On-line instructions:

Name of governmental entity is to read: Fort Bend County.

Identification number used by the governmental entity is: B23-070.

Description is to read: Purchase of Vehicles.

After receiving the Form 1295 with a new Certification Number and Date Filed, please print the form and Form 1295 and this signed Term Contract box sign, then email the Renewal Form to Melissa. Stavinoha@fortbendcountytx.gov. If your company is publicly traded you are not required to complete this form.

Signature of Authorized Representative

7/12/2025

Swu W. EASLEY GSM
Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative

Tabulation

Bid 23-070 Purchase of Vehicles

Awarded 9/26/2023: Low bidder per vehicle as highlighted

Change order #1 approved in Court 10/24/23

Renewal Approved 11/12/2024: through September 30, 2025

Description	Helfman Ford
Vehicle 1: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe without console	No Bid
Vehicle 2: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe with console	No Bid
Vehicle 3: Non-Police Package 4-door sedan	No Bid
Vehicle 4: Truck, 1/2 ton, extended cab, SWB, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, power windows/locks, TTP, non aluminum bed floor	No Bid
Vehicle 5: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB, power windows/locks/mirrors, TTP, non aluminum bed floor	No Bid
Vehicle 6: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB with lockable hard cover, power windows/locks/mirrors, TTP, non aluminum bed floor	No Bid
Vehicle 7: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB, 4-wheel drive, vinyl, rear vinyl, power windows/locks, TTP, non aluminum bed floor	No Bid
Vehicle 8: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB, 4-wheel drive, hardcover, power windows/locks, TTP, non aluminum bed floor	No Bid
Vehicle 9: Truck, 3/4 ton, regular cab, LWB, split bench, power windows/locks, trailer towing mirrors, front tow hooks, front ground clearance min 9.6 inch, locking rear differential, integrated trailer brake system, limited slip rear axle, TTP, non aluminum bed floor	No Bid
Vehicle 10: Truck, 3/4 ton, extended cab, LWB, split bench, front ground clearance 10.12 inch, power windows/locks, trailer towing mirrors, locking rear differential, front tow hooks, integrated trailer brake system, limited slip rear axle, TTP, non aluminum bed floor	No Bid
Vehicle 11: Truck, 3/4 ton, regular cab, LWB, 4-wheel drive, split bench, front ground clearance 10.12 inch, power windows/locks, locking rear differential, front tow hooks, TTP, limited slip rear axle, non aluminum bed floor	No Bid
Vehicle 12: Truck, 3/4 ton, extended cab, LWB, split bench, power windows/locks, trailer towing mirrors, Integrated trailer brake system, locking rear differential, tow hooks, TTP, non aluminum bed floor	No Bid
Vehicle 13: Truck, 3/4 ton, 4 door crew cab, LWB, power windows/locks, trailer towing mirrors, front tow hooks, integrated trailer brake system, TTP, non aluminum bed floor	No Bid

Description	Helfman Ford
Vehicle 14: Truck, 3/4 ton, 4 door crew cab, 4X4, LWB, power window/locks, trailer towing mirrors, front	No Bid
tow hooks, integrated trailer brake system, TTP, non-aluminum bed floor	
Vehicle 15: Truck, 1 ton, 3500, regular cab, dually, diesel, 86" cab to axle, cab/chassis only, power	Did not meet
windows/locks, trailer towing mirrors	specifications
Vehicle 16: Truck, 1 ton, 3500, 4 door crew cab, LWB, rubber mats, power windows/locks, trailer towing	No Bid
mirrors, TTP, non aluminum bed floor	
Vehicle 17: Truck, 1 ton, 3500, regular cab, gasoline, 86" cab to axle, dually, cab/chassis only, power	Did not meet
windows/locks, trailer towing mirrors, TTP	specifications
Vehicle 18: Truck, 1 1/2 ton, 4500, regular cab, dually,86" cab to axle, cab/chassis only, powered	Did not meet
windows/locks, limited slip rear axle, front tow hooks, integrated trailer break system	specifications
Vehicle 19: Truck, 1 1/2 ton, 5500, 4x4, regular cab, gasoline, 60" cab to axle, dually, cab & chassis, power	\$55,674.64
windows/locks, trailer towing mirrors, front tow hooks, limited slip rear axle, TTP	
Vehicle 20: Ford Explorer or equal, cloth seats, power windows/door locks, rear air conditioning, TTP	\$41,915.00
	within 3% from a local vendor
Vehicle 21: Ford Explorer Police Inceptor utility, all wheel drive, heavy duty alternator, power driver's	\$49,103.16 within
seat/windows/door locks/mirrors	3% from a local vendor
Vehicle 22: Van, Cargo, 3/4 ton, extended length, V-6, vinyl flooring, power windows/locks, rear A/C, no	No Bid
back seat, side and rear windows, step bumper, TTP	140 Bld
Vehicle 23: Van, Cargo, 3/4 ton, extended length, bucket, passenger bench backseat with 3 person restraints,	No Bid
vinyl flooring, power windows/locks, rear A/C, side/rear door windows, step bumper, TTP	140 Blu
Vehicle 24: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB, cloth bucket, rear vinyl, power windows/locks/mirrors,	\$44,936.32
TTP, aluminum bed floor	\$44,930.32
· ·	
Vehicle 25: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB, bucket, rear vinyl, power windows/locks/mirrors, TTP,	\$46,036.32
lockable hard cover, aluminum bed floor	410.010.4
Vehicle 26: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB, 4-wheel drive, split bench, power windows/locks, TTP,	\$48,818.32
aluminum bed floor	
Vehicle 27: Truck, 3/4 ton, 4 door crew cab, LWB, 4-wheel drive, power windows/locks, trailer towing	\$49,939.64
mirrors, front tow hooks, integrated trailer break system, TTP, aluminum bed floor	
Vehicle 28: Truck, 1 ton, 3500, regular cab, dually, cab/chassis only, split bench, power window/locks,	\$47,585.64
trailer towing mirrows, limited slip rear axle, front tow hooks, integraged trailer brake system	*
6 ·· - , , · · · ·	
Vehicle 29: Truck, F-650, regular cab, dually, cab/chassis only, diesel, driver bucket/2-passenger bench,	\$83,420.00
pwer equipment group, air complressor, power window/locks, front tow hooks	ψου, 120.00
Vehicle 30: Van, 15 Passenger, 1 ton, extended length	No Bid