FORT BEND COUNTY

Travel Expense Reimbursement Report/Transmittal

- Name: . Marisol Ramos 7<¢§_SNhowr Vendor # v Department

Funding Source #1: - o 100435100 63200 " s v T I

: LToTTT (Accounting Unit) (Account Number) (Activity) ifapplicable (Reporting Category) it
LT o s S SO = -t <
““Funding Source #2: (if applicabley =~ 637007 e
(Accounting Unit) (Account Number) (Activity) if applicable (Reporting Category) if applicable
Purpose of Travel:  Jeff Justice Seminars "Ethics, Grammar, and Humor" Destination: Virtual
Date/Time

Date/Time Departure of FBC 7/19/2024 Arrival at FBC 7/19/2024

Means of Transportation [ ] Personal Vehide [ ]County Vehide  [JAirline [] Carpool Rental Car at Destination ~ [TJYes [J]No

Hotel Prepaid []Yes No Refund due from Hotel [J¥es [4]No Cash Receipt Deposit #

Any expenses reimbursed by another agency? (State) [Clves [Ano Agency:

Any expenses charged on the PCARD? [es No If Yes, list expenditures

Proof of payment must be attached for items prepaid by checkor on the Procurement Card (hotel, airfare, rental car, conf. registration etc.)

Merchant/Location/Description
Date(s) For Mileage Reimbursement list starting and ending destination Mileage Misc. Expenses

Per Diem Total (if applicable)

07/19/24 Seminar Registration 165.00
Total Miles -
x Mileage Rate 0.670
Out of State Approval Date by Commissioners' Court Subtotals $0.00 $199.00
(Attach copy of minutes with reimbursement) 63200 63200
Total Reimbursement $199.00

The undersigned hereby certifies that mileage and expenses listed above were incurred on official county business only, and that reimbursement

has not been received for any pgrt thereof.
Employee Signature: ) Date: 8/29/2024
= /
Department Head/ /WW (j%\/(/
Elected Official Signature [~ ( Date: 8/29/2024
g




' 20°5 OFF WHEN YOU PURCHASE TWO OR MORE COURSES!
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‘ T show order summary v $199.00

Order #6048
Thank you, Marisol!

Your order is complete

Order details

Contact information

Payment method

ending with 1039 - $199.00
Billing address
| !
Marisol Ramos
Order completed with shop 3 Learn more |
Continus shopping
Need help? Contact us

All rights reserved Court Reporters CEUS




RamosDC240, Mariso! .

e

- From:

Marisol Rarnos L o
Sent: Monday, July 22, 2024 10:17 AM S
To: RamosDC240, Marisol
Subject: Fwd: Order #6048 confirmed

Begin forwarded message:

From: Court Reporters CEUS <store+34832508426@t.shopifyemail.com>
Subject: Order #6048 confirmed
Date: July 16. 2024 at 5:47:31 PM CDT

To:
Reply-To: Court Reporters CEUS <jeff@jefijustice.com>
Court Reporters CEUS R —

Thank you for your purchase! If you have purchased from us
before please

login https://courses.courtrepor‘cersceus.com/users/sign_into
access your Course.

or Visit our store

Order summary

s i EThics, Grammar, Punctuation and Humor - 10

e ‘Hours (1.0 CEUs) x 1 $199.00

e i
e RGO,




Subtotal 7 $199.00 .
Shipping $0.00
Taxes $0.00

Total $19900 usb

Customer information

United States

Payment method

VISA  anding with 1039

If you have any questions, reply to this email or contact us at jeff@jeffjustice.com

B
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F{}R COURT REPORTERS

CERTIFICATE OF ATTENDANCE

JEFFJUSTICE

“Ethics, Grammar, and Humor”
(This program helps the court reporter master grammar and punctuation as well as various
situations that can arise and learn how to reduce stress.)

Reporter’'s Name: Marisel Ramaos
CSR#E: 8140
Address:

Date Completed: 2024-07-19

TX Program Number: CSR20230674
Program Provider: Jeff Justice
Location of Seminar: https://courtreportersceus.com

Sessions Attended:

Turn the Lights On - Ethics

Grammar and Punctuation Made Easy for Court Reporters
Balancing Life with Humor for Court Reporters

Ethics: 2.5 hours
Total Hours Attended: 10.0
Grade: PASS

I

Signature of Program Provider

2.5 hours (Ethics)
3.0 hours
4.5 hours

Jeff Justice « Jeff Justice Seminars

PO Box 52404 - Atlanta, GA 30355

Humor Resources Director » Corporate Comedy
ieff@jeffiustice.com + 404-312-3404 + courtreportersceus.com




FORT BEND COUNTY AUDITOR
ACCOUNTS PAYABLE

* Accounting Unit (9 digit)

100435100

Account (5 digi
63000

Grants & Pro;ects (If needed)
o ~ Activity

INDEFENSE
Account Category

CR Court Appointad Court Reporting Services v

INVOICE TRANSMITTAL

County Auditor Ferm 1016
(Rev.02/98)

Vendor Numbei

240TH COURT REPORTER

Description / Invoics Numbers

TEXAS OFFICE OF COURT ADMINISTRATION

JUDICIAL BRANCH CERTIFICATION

COMMISSION (JBCC)

ONLINE APP FOR COURT REPORTER

City
State Zip Code Date
1/3/2025
Amount
204.76
$ 204.76

County Auditor's Use Only
CC Approval Date

Check Type

Audited By

Authcnzed Department Approval

Received

Paid

_Treasurer's Register Stamp and Number




LoveDC240, Selena

From: RamosDC240, Marisol

Sent: Friday, November 8, 2024 1:41 PM

To: 240dc

Subject: FW: TX OCA JBCC Online Payment
Attachments: Inv_8140_TCRA00023607_MarisoI_Ramos.pdf

| have paid for my CSR renewal fee and my TCRA renewal.

. ;’!”} H
Marisol

From: jbec@txcourts.gov <jbcc@txcourts.gov>
Date: Friday, November 8, 2024 at 1:39 PM
To:

Subject: TX OCA JBCC Online Payment

Payment Receipt Confirmation

Your payment was successfully processed. You may print this receipt page for your records.

Receipt Contact Information

Contact Name JBC(.: Ophne
Applications
Contact Email jbcc@txcourts.gov
Contact Phone 512-475-4368
Contact Url NONE
Contact Address NONE
NONE

Transaction Summary

Description Amount
TX JBCC Online App $204.76
Texas.gov Price $204.76

Customer Information

Customer Name Marisol Ramos
Local Reference ID 212TX-343935
Receipt Date 11/8/2024
Receipt Time 01:38:50 PM CST

Payment Information
Payment Type Credit Card




Credit Card Type VISA
Credit Card Number ******1039
Order ID 730621024
Name on Credit

Card Marisol Ramos

Account Holder Information

Billing Address

Billing City, State

Billing Zip/Postal

Code

Country UsS

Phone

Number

This receipt has been emailed to the address
below.

Email marisol.ramosDC240@fortbendcountytx.gov
Address




FORT BEND COUNTY AUDITOR

County Auditor Form 1016
ACCOUNTS PAYABLE I NVO I C E TRAN S M ITTAL e ?;?e?/.rr82/98 )

7 Accounting Unit (9 digit)

Vendor Numbel

100435100
-count (5 digit : ‘Vendor Name|
63000 MARISOL RAMOS
Grants & Pro;ects (If needed) Address
. _ Activity
INDEFENSE 240TH COURT REPORTER
Account Category City
CR Court Appointed Court Reporting Services v
Statel Zip Code. Date
1/3/2025
Description / Invoice Numbers Amount
TCRA MEMBERSHIP RENEWAL 165.00
INVOICE #TCRA00023607

County Auditor's Use Only
CC Approval Date
Check Type

.\ Authérized Department Approval

Audited By

~ Treasurer's Register Stamp and Number .

Received

Paid




o

TCRA

| PO Box 2379, Athens, TX 75751
- 903-675-1806 / tcrahg@embargmail.com

Marisol Ramos
Fort Bend County - 240th District Court

Details of Invoice TCRAD0023607

INVOICE

Invoice Number TCRA00023607
Account Number 8140

Amount Due $0.00 due by 1/1/2025

Amount
Professional Membership - Professional Membership Renewal 1 $165.00
Marisol Ramos - Fort Bend County - 240th District Court
invoice Sub Total: 165.00
Activity Against This Invoice Amount
11/8/2024 $165.00 Payment by credit card XXXX1039 {$165.00)
Marisol Ramos - Fort Bend County - 240th District Court
$165.00 applied to this invoice
Activity Sub Total: ($165.00)
EmmmmmEE TotalDue:  $0.00]

1 Dues to TCRA are not deductible as a charitable contribution, but may be donated as an ordinary and necessary business expense. However, a portion of
dues is not deductible to the extent that TCRA engages in lobbying. The non-deductible portion of dues for each fiscal year is 49%.

| certify that the contact information | have submitted is correct and | hereby make application for membership in the Texas Court Reporters Association. |
pledge myself, if accepted, to abide by the requirements of the Bylaws and Code of Professional Conduct of the Association as they may be amended in the
future and to support and subscribe to the preservation and advancement of the field of verbatim reporting by the use of stenotype machine shorthand.

Invoice generated 11/08/2024 « Page 1 of 1




