IN THE MATTER OF TRANSFERRING OF BUDGET SURPLUS OF FORT BEND COUNTY

FOR THE YEAR 2025

On this the 11  dayof February 2024/2025 , the Commissioners' Court, with the following members being present:
KP George - County Judge
Vincent Morales - Commissioner Precinct #1
Grady Prestage - Commissioner Precinct #2
Andy Meyers - Commissioner Precinct #3
Dexter McCoy - Commissioner Precinct #4

The following proceedings were had, to-writ,

THAT WHEREAS, theretofore, on September 24, 2024, the Court heard and approved the budget for the year 2025 for Fort Bend County; and

WHEREAS, on proper application, the Commissioners' Court has transferred an existing budget surplus to a budget of a similar kind and fund. The
transfer does not increase the total of the budget.

The following transfers to said budget are hereby authorized:

Department Name: Texas A&M Agril.ife Extension Accounting Unit: 100665100
TRANSFER TO:
ACCOUNT NAME ACCOUNT NUMBER AMOUNT
Information Technology 65000 $ 5,320
TOTAL TRANSFERRED TO: $ 5,320

TRANSFER FROM:
ACCOUNT NAME ACCOUNT NUMBER AMOUNT
Non-Departmental Contingency 100409100-6650 $ 5,320

TOTAL TRANSFERRED FROM: $ 5,320
EXPLANATION: Requesting to pull from Contingency to replace the large-scale printer/scanner/copier in the Workroom
of our main building--#1032360. Original copier (Sharp MX-M464N) was purchased in Dec. 2017. Skelton rep stated the repair parts
are 10 longer available due to age of machine. After requesting quote for a new developer unit, we've received a quote for a new machine
altogether. Due to the heavy use for programming purposes, we are pushing to replace now as opposed to waiting for the FY26
budget cycle. RN _
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SALES QUOTE
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g COPIER SOLUTIONS Account No: SKE-FB15
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s Equipment)

Remittor 3930 FM 1960 Rel East Humble, TX 77338
Ph: {281) 402-9627 Web: www.platinumcopiers.com

Bill To: Fort Bend County Auditor's Office Ship To: Fort Bend County Extension Service
Attn: Accounts Payable Attn: Cheryl Krejci
309 S. 4th St., Suite #701 1402 Band Road, Suite #100
Richmond, TX 77469 Rosenberg, TX 77471

Christopher Hott Delivery ‘ 3/2/25
Add to County Service contract:
0.0069 per copy/print

BP-50M55 Lawson # 11563 - BP-50M55 (new) print/Scan/Copy 1.00 EA $4,260.00 0.00 $4,260.00
BPDE14 Lawson # 12418 - 3 X 550 SHEET PAPER DRAWERS 1.00 EA $510.00 0.00 $510.00
BPFN11 [ Lawson # 12419 Stapler/Finisher 1.00 EA $550.00 0.00 $550.00
PLEASE PAY FROM THIS INVOICE Subtotal $5,320.00

Overdue accounts will be charged a late payment fee .
of 1.5% per month until account is paid in full. Discount $0.00
Freight $0.00
Sales Tax . $0.00
Sales Order Total $5,320.00
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Wasicek, Cheryl

From: Chris Hott <chott@platinumcopiers.com>
Sent: Friday, January 31, 2025 11:06 AM

To: Wasicek, Cheryl

Subject: RE: Extension Services Lawson Copier Quote
Hi Cheryl,

Unfortunately, the parts are not available anymore due to the age of the equipment.

Thankyou,

Chris Hott

www.platinumcopiers.com | www.equipmybiz.com | Leave us a Review!
Office: 281-645-4036

Cell: 832-291-9899

° PLATINUN|SHARP

COPIER SOLUTION

Business Equipment) ’
CURRENT FREE PROMO - Ask me about setting up auto-toner shipment, auto-meter readings and more with Printanista.

From: Wasicek, Cheryl <Cheryl.Wasicek@fortbendcountytx.gov>
Sent: Friday, January 31, 2025 11:00 AM

To: Chris Hott <chott@platinumcopiers.com>

Subject: RE: Extension Services Lawson Copier Quote

Received. Thankyou. And at this point, email correspondence is best as I'll use it as backup/support for our request for
a replacement copier (if needed).

Is there any way you could simply replace the developer unit on our current machine? If so, what is the cost for that?
Please advise. Thank you.

Cheryl Wasicek, Ofc. Mgr.
FBC Extension
Ext. 37016

From: Chris Hott <chott@platinumcopiers.com>

Sent: Friday, January 31, 2025 10:54 AM

To: Wasicek, Cheryl <Cheryl.Wasicek@fortbendcountytx.gov>
Subject: Extension Services Lawson Copier Quote

Good Morning Cheryl,
Here is the quote to replace the copier at Extension Services. Sorry for the delay on getting this to you, and | will
call you shortly to make sure you got this and see if you had any other questions. Thanks.

Thank you,



Chris Hott

www.platinumcopiers.com | www.equipmybiz.com | Leave us a Review!
Office: 281-645-4036
Cell: 832-291-9899
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Business Equipment

CURRENT FREE PROMO - Ask me about setting up auto-toner shipment, auto-meter readings and more with Printanista.




