OFFICE OF COUNTY PURCHASING AGENT
Fort Bend County, Texas

Term Contract Renewal Form

Title: Term Contract for Purchase of Oil and Lubricants

Contracted Vendor: Atlantic Petroleum & Mineral Resources, Inc.

Mr. Nwosu,

Our contract with your company for the above referenced expires September 30, 2024. Contract provisions allow
for renewal of this contract if mutually agreeable.

If your company wishes to renew this contract through September 30, 2025 under the same terms and conditions,
please complete the information below and return this form along with a Form 1295 by e-mail to
brooke.lindemann@fortbendcountytx.gov. Purchasing will then take the matter before the Commissioner’s Court
of Fort Bend County for their consideration. Please respond to this email by 5:00 pm, Friday, July 5, 2024.

X Yes, I agree to renewing our agreement with Fort Bend County under the same terms and conditions.

No, I do not wish to renew our agreement with Fort Bend County.
If Yes, please provide a new Form 1295 along with this renewal form by replying to this email. The Form 1295
must be new; previous 1295s are not permitted.

Effective January 1, 2016 all contracts executed by Commissioners Court, regardless of the dollar amount, will
require completion of Form 1295 "Certificate of Interested Parties", per the new Government Code Statute
§2252.908. All vendors submitting a response to a formal Bid, RFP, SOQ or any contracts, contract amendments,
extensions or renewals are required to complete the Form 1295 online through the State of Texas Ethics
Commission website. Please visit:

https://www.ethics.state.tx.us/whatsnew/elf info form1295.htm.

On-line instructions:

Name of governmental entity is to read: Fort Bend County .

Identification number used by the governmental entity is: B23-056 .

Description is to read: Purchase of Oil and Lubricants

After receiving the Form 1295 with a new Certification Number and Date Filed, please print the form and
complete box 6, sign, then email the Form 1295 and this signed Term Contract Renewal Form
to brooke.lindemann@fortbendcountytx.gov. If your company is publicly traded you are not required to
complete this form.

2573 06-28-2024

Signature of Authorized Representative Date

ANTHONY NDAH PRESIDENT/CEO

Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative




OFFICE OF COUNTY PURCHASING AGENT
Fort Bend County, Texas

Term Contract Renewal Form

Title: Term Contract for Purchase of Qil and Lubricants

Contracted Vendor: Brenntag Lubricants LLC

Mr. Weatherly,

Our contract with your company for the above referenced expires _Sgpgel_rlb_er;l();}_o}ﬁ Contract provisions allow

for renewal of this contract if mutually agreeable.

If; your company wighes 1o renew this contract through September 30, 2025 under the same terms and conditions,
please complete the information below and return this form along with a Form 1295 by e-mail to

brooke.lindemann@fortbendcountytx. gov. Purchasing will then take the matter before the Commissioner’s Court

of P\'?)end County for their consideration. Please respond to this email by 5:00 pm, Friday, July 5, 2024.

Yes, I agree to renewing our agreement with Fort Bend County under the same terms and conditions.

No, 1 do not wish to renew our agreement with Fort Bend County.
If Yes, please provide a new Form 1295 along with this renewal form by replying to this email. The Form 1295
must be new; previous 1295s are not permitted.

Effective January 1, 2016 all contracts executed by Commissioners Court, regardless of the dollar amount, will
require completion of Form 1295 "Certificate of Interested Parties”, per the new Government Code Statute
§2252.908. All vendors submitting a response to a formal Bid, RFP, SOQ or any contracts, contract amendments,
extensions or renewals are required to complete the Form 1295 online through the State of Texas Ethics

Commission website. Please visit:

https://www.ethics state. tx.us/whatsnew/elf _info form1295 htm.

On-line instructions:

Name of governmental entity is to read: Fort Bend County .

Identification number used by the governmental entity 1s:  B23-056 .

Description is to read: Purchase of Oil and Lubricants .

After receiving the Form 1295 with a new Certification Number and Date Filed, please print the form and
complete box 6, sign, then email the Form 1295 and this signed Term Contract Renewal Form
to brooke.lindemann@fortbendcountytx. gov. If your company is publicly traded you are not required to

complete this form.
b /g /ot

Siknatué Gf Authorized RS presentative - e

fhe Lty ALMIT (dobs
Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative




OFFICE OF COUNTY PURCHASING AGENT
Fort Bend County, Texas

Term Contract Renewal Form

Title: Term Contract for Purchase of Oil and Lubricants

Contracted Vendor: Midtex Oil LP
Ms. Silva,

Our contract with your company for the above referenced expires September 30, 2024. Contract provisions allow
for renewal of this contract if mutually agreeable.

If your company wishes to renew this contract through September 30, 2025 under the same terms and conditions,
please complete the information below and return this form along with a Form 1295 by e-mail to
brooke.lindemann@fortbendcountytx.gov. Purchasing will then take the matter before the Commissioner’s Court
of Fort Bend County for their consideration. Please respond to this email by 5:00 pm, Friday, July 5, 2024.

\/ Yes, | agree to renewing our agreement with Fort Bend County under the same terms and conditions.

No, I do not wish to renew our agreement with Fort Bend County.
If Yes, please provide a new Form 1295 along with this renewal form by replying to this email. The Form 1295
must be new; previous 1295s are not permitted.

Effective January 1, 2016 all contracts executed by Commissioners Court, regardless of the dollar amount, will
require completion of Form 1295 "Certificate of Interested Parties”, per the new Government Code Statute
82252.908. All vendors submitting a response to a formal Bid, RFP, SOQ or any contracts, contract amendments,
extensions or renewals are required to complete the Form 1295 online through the State of Texas Ethics
Commission website. Please visit:

https://www.ethics.state.tx.us/whatsnew/elf info form1295.htm.

On-line instructions:

Name of governmental entity is to read: Fort Bend County .

Identification number used by the governmental entity is: B23-056 .

Description is to read: Purchase of Oil and Lubricants

After receiving the Form 1295 with a new Certification Number and Date Filed, please print the form and
complete box 6, sign, then email the Form 1295 and this signed Term Contract Renewal Form
to brooke.lindemann@fortbendcountytx.gov. If your company is publicly traded you are not required to
complete this form.

Dinera Sidra 07/16/2024

Signature of Authorized Representative Date

Dinora Silva Houston/BMT Area Sales Manager
Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative



mailto:cheryl.krejci@fortbendcountytx.gov
https://www.ethics.state.tx.us/whatsnew/elf_info_form1295.htm
mailto:cheryl.krejci@fortbendcountytx.gov

OFFICE OF COUNTY PURCHASING AGENT
Fort Bend County, Texas

Term Contract Renewal Form

Title: Term Contract for Purchase of Oil and Lubricants

Contracted Vendor: Q Environmental, Inc.

Mr. Dotiwala,

Our contract with your company for the above referenced expires September 30, 2024. Contract provisions allow
for renewal of this contract if mutually agreeable.

If your company wishes to renew this contract through September 30, 2025 under the same terms and conditions,
please complete the information below and return this form along with a Form 1295 by e-mail to
brooke.lindemann@fortbendcountytx.gov. Purchasing will then take the matter before the Commissioner’s Court
of Fort Bend County for their consideration. Please respond to this email by 5:00 pm, Friday, July 5, 2024.

X Yes, | agree to renewing our agreement with Fort Bend County under the same terms and conditions.

No, I do not wish to renew our agreement with Fort Bend County.
If Yes, please provide a new Form 1295 along with this renewal form by replying to this email. The Form 1295
must be new; previous 1295s are not permitted.

Effective January 1, 2016 all contracts executed by Commissioners Court, regardless of the dollar amount, will
require completion of Form 1295 "Certificate of Interested Parties”, per the new Government Code Statute
82252.908. All vendors submitting a response to a formal Bid, RFP, SOQ or any contracts, contract amendments,
extensions or renewals are required to complete the Form 1295 online through the State of Texas Ethics
Commission website. Please visit:

https://www.ethics.state.tx.us/whatsnew/elf info form1295.htm.

On-line instructions:

Name of governmental entity is to read: Fort Bend County .

Identification number used by the governmental entity is: B23-056 .

Description is to read: Purchase of Oil and Lubricants

After receiving the Form 1295 with a new Certification Number and Date Filed, please print the form and
complete box 6, sign, then email the Form 1295 and this signed Term Contract Renewal Form
to brooke.lindemann@fortbendcountytx.gov. If your company is publicly traded you are not required to
complete this form.

Signature of Authorized Representative Date

Kaemerz Dotiwala - President

Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative


mailto:cheryl.krejci@fortbendcountytx.gov
https://www.ethics.state.tx.us/whatsnew/elf_info_form1295.htm
mailto:cheryl.krejci@fortbendcountytx.gov

Fort Bend County Tabulation

BID 23-056

Term Contract for Qil and Lubricants

Term: through September 30, 2024

Awarded 6/27/2023: Low Bidder per Item

Section 10.1: CHEVRON PRODUCTS Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Houston, TX
SAE 10W30 CJ-4/SM Delo 400 XLE
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers 14318 Vendor withdrew | $ 161.82 NO BID Vendor withdrew | $ 150.15| Vendor withdrew
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle 12574 |bid after awarded on| ¢ 100.34 NO BID bid after awarded on| ¢ 51.15 | bid after awarded on
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 12575 7123 $ 166.26 NO BID 7/5/23 $ 255.75 6/28/23
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 12576 $ 1,983.44 NO BID $ 2,813.25
SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 Delo 400 Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers 1289 Vendor withdrew | $ 97.45 NO BID Vendor withdrew | $ 170.50( Vendor withdrew
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle 5341 |bid after awarded on| g 93.14 NO BID bid after awarded on| ¢ 41.25 | bid after awarded on
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 1290 7123 $ 149.95 NO BID 7/5/23 $ 206.25 6/28/23
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 5342 $ 2,315.73 NO BID $ 2,268.75
Per Gallon in Bulk 5343 $ 80.72 NO BID $ 32.45
SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 Delo 400 XLE Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers 14319 Vendor withdrew | $ 107.82 NO BID Vendor withdrew | $ 64.35( Vendor withdrew
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle 13809 |bid after awarded on| ¢ 32.73 NO BID bid after awarded on| ¢ 21.45 | bid after awarded on
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 13810 7123 $ 74.87 NO BID 7/5/23 $ 107.25 6/28/23
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 13811 $ 1,856.70 NO BID $ 1,179.75
Per Gallon in Bulk 13812 $ 28.37 NO BID $ 20.35

*Sun Coast Resources: Disqualified due to altering terms and conditions




Section 10.1: CHEVRON PRODUCTS (cont'd) Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Houston, TX
SAE 10 Delo 400
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 13813 Vendor withdrew | $ 148.49 NO BID Vendor withdrew | $ 109.45( Vendor withdrew
bid after awarded on bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 13814 71123 $ 2,224.07 NO BID 7/5/23 $ 1,203.95 6/28/23
SAE 30 Delo 400 Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Qil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Quart in Quart Container 1305 Vendor withdrew | $ 13.94 NO BID Vendor withdrew | $ 5.47| Vendor withdrew
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 1306  |bid after awarded on| g 146.99 NO BID bid after awarded on[ ¢ 109.45 | bid after awarded on
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 1307 7123 $ 2,010.00 NO BID 7/5/23 $ 1,203.95 6/28/23
SAE 50 Heavy Duty Drive Train (Meets Cat’s TO-4 Specifications) Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 1352 Vendor withdrew | $ 174.75 NO BID Vendor withdrew | $ 214.50 | Vendor withdrew
bid after awarded on bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 1353 7/11/23 $ 2,120.33 NO BID 7/5/23 $ 2,359.50 6/28/23
Hydraulic Oil 1SO-46 (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-268-S) Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 1330 Vendor withdrew | $ 112.49 NO BID Vendor withdrew | $ 253.00( Vendor withdrew
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 1331 bid after awarded on| ¢ 1,482.18 NO BID bid after awarded on[ ¢ 2,783.00 | bid after awarded on
Per Gallon in Bulk 1332 7123 $ 34.49 NO BID 7/5/23 $ 3245 6/28/23
Hydraulic Oil AW 68 (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-286-S) Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 1359 Vendor withdrew | $ 112.49 NO BID Vendor withdrew | $ 316.25| Vendor withdrew
bid after awarded on bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 1360 7/11/23 $ 997.43 NO BID 7/5/23 $ 3,478.75 6/28/23




Section 10.1: CHEVRON PRODUCTS (cont'd) Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex QOil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
TDH Hydraulic/Tractor Fluid (Case MS-1207, John Deere J20C)
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 5352 Vendor withdrew | $ 124.49 NO BID Vendor withdrew | $ 126.50 | Vendor withdrew
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 5353 bid after awarded on| ¢ 1,664.61 NO BID bid after awarded on| ¢ 1,391.50 | bid after awarded on
Per Gallon in Bulk 5354 7123 $ 37.49 NO BID 7/5/23 $ 2530 6/28/23
Grease Ultra-Duty EP2 Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 10, 140z Tubes 1380 Vendor withdrew | $ 64.49 NO BID Vendor withdrew | $ 49.50 | Vendor withdrew
Per 35# Container 1381  |bid after awarded on| ¢ 290.28 NO BID bid after awarded on[ ¢ 173.25 | bid after awarded on
Per 120# Container 1382 7123 $ 885.87 NO BID 7/5/23 $ 594.00 6/28/23
Gear Oil 85-140 GL-5 Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Qil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers 15830 Vendor withdrew | $ 173.99 NO BID Vendor withdrew | $ 75.90 Vendor withdrew
Per 354 Container 1383 bid after awarded on $ 178.74 NOBID bid after awarded on $ 22138 bid after awarded on
7/11/23 7/5/23 6/28/23
Gear Oil, Universal 85-140 GL-5 Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex QOil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per 35# Container 13336 Vendor withdrew | $ 178.74 NO BID Vendor withdrew | $ 287.79| Vendor withdrew
bid after awarded on bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
7/11/23 7/5/23 6/28/23




Section 10.2: MOBIL PRODUCTS Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
SAE 0W-20 — SP Mobil Special
Per Case of 12 Quart Containers 16209 Vendor withdrew | $ 143.64( $ 84.58 | Vendor withdrew | $ 165.00  Vendor withdrew
bid after awarded on bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
7/11/23 7/5/23 6/28/23
SAE 0W-30 SP Mobil Special Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quart Containers 16210 Vendor withdrew | $ 195.00( $ 102.75( Vendor withdrew | $ 165.00  Vendor withdrew
bid after awarded on bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
7/11/23 7/5/23 6/28/23
SAE 5W-20 — SP Mobil Special Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Qil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quart Containers 16211 Vendor withdrew | $ 143.64( $ 77.28 | Vendor withdrew | $ 92.27| Vendor withdrew
bid after awarded on bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
7/11/23 7/5/23 6/28/23
SAE 5W-30 — SP Mobil Special Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Qil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quart Containers 16212 Vendor withdrew | $ 148.86( $ 77.28 | Vendor withdrew | $ 104.94 Vendor withdrew
bid after awarded on bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
7/11/23 7/5/23 6/28/23
SAE 10W-30 — SP Mobil Special Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Per Case of 12 Quart Containers 16213 Vendor withdrew | $ 125.10( $ 77.28 | Vendor withdrew | $ 224.40( Vendor withdrew
bid after awarded on bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
7/11/23 7/5/23 6/28/23
SAE 10W-30 — CK-4 Mobil Delvac 1300 Super Synthetic Blend Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon jug 16214 Vendor withdrew | $ 21.63| $ 28.49 [ Vendor withdrew | $ 38.50 | Vendor withdrew
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 16215 |bid after awarded on| $ 178.92] $ 106.95 | bid after awarded on| $ 192.50 [bid after awarded on
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 16216 7/11/23 $ 1,389.65( $ 891.55 7/5/23 $ 2,117.50 6/28/23
SAE 10W-30 — Mobil Delvac Extreme Synthetic Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Qil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon jug 16217 Vendor withdrew | $ 2849( $ 30.57| Vendor withdrew | $ 32.95| Vendor withdrew
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 16218 |bid after awarded on| ¢ 182.88 $ 147.69 | bid after awarded on| ¢ 164.73 | bid after awarded on
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 16219 7123 $ 2.401.93| 1,325.50 7/5/23 $ 1,811.98 6/28/23




SAE 15W-40 — CK-4 Mobil Delvac 1300 Super Synthetic Blend Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon jug 16220 Vendor withdrew | $ 21.63( $ 28.49( Vendor withdrew | $ 32.95( Vendor withdrew
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 16221 |bid after awarded on| ¢ 96.00 $ 106.95 |bid after awarded on| ¢ 164.73 | bid after awarded on
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 16222 7123 $ 1,384.44] $ 891.55 75123 $ 1,811.98 6/28/23
SAE 15W-40 — Mobil Delvac Extreme Synthetic Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Qil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Houston, TX
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon jug 16174 Vendor withdrew | $ 32.99( $ 30.57| Vendor withdrew | $ 32.95| Vendor withdrew
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 16175 |bid after awarded on[ g 15450 $ 147.69 | bid after awarded on["g 164.73 |bid after awarded on
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 16176 71123 NO BID $ 1,325.50 715123 $ 1,811.98 6/28/23
SAE 10W - Mobiltrans HD Syn-Blend Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Qil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 16235 Vendor withdrew | $ 220.10| $ 116.30 | Vendor withdrew | $ 214.50 | Vendor withdrew
bid after awarded on bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 16236 7/11/23 $ 1,924.07( $ 1,114.02 7/5/23 $ 2,359.50 6/28/23
Section 10.2: MOBIL PRODUCTS (cont'd) Lawson 3LUSA,LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
SAE 50 — Mobiltrans HD (Meets Cat TO-4 Specification)
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 16177 Vendor withdrew | $ 275.13| $ 126.82| Vendor withdrew | $ 214.50 | Vendor withdrew
bid after awarded on bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 16178 7111/23 $ 1,954.41( $ 1,334.95 7/5/23 $ 2,359.50 6/28/23
SAE 50 - MT-1 Mobil Delvac 1 Synthetic Trans Fluid (Eaton Roadranger PS-164 Rev 7) | Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 16179 Vendor withdrew | $ 493.76 | $ 302.51| Vendor withdrew | $ 357.50| Vendor withdrew
bid after awarded on bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
7/11/23 7/5/23 6/28/23
1SO 46 — Mobil Nuto H 46 Hydraulic Oil (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-268-S) Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 16180 Vendor withdrew | $ 22350] $ 107.40 Vendor withdrew | $ 181.50 | Vendor withdrew
bid after awarded on bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 16181 7/11/23 $ 1,809.50 $ 690.25 7/5/23 $ 1,996.50 6/28/23




AWSG68 — Mobil Nuto H 68 Hydraulic Oil (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-268-S) Lawson 3LUSA,LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 16182 Vendor withdrew | $ 356.78| $ 107.40 Vendor withdrew | $ 235.95( Vendor withdrew
bid after awarded on bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 16183 7/11/23 $ 867.33| $ 690.25 7/5/23 $ 2,595.45 6/28/23
UTF — GL-4 Mobilfluid 424 Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Qil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 16184 Vendor withdrew | $ 202.31] $ 110.78 | Vendor withdrew | $ 203.50 | Vendor withdrew
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 16185 |bid after awarded on| ¢ 2,010.41] $ 810.15 | bid after awarded on{ ¢ 2,238.50 |bid after awarded on
Per Gallon in Bulk 16186 711723 NO BID $ 13.58 15123 $ 40.70 6/28/23
Section 10.2: MOBIL PRODUCTS (cont'd) Lawson 3LUSA,LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Grease NLGI GC-LB Mobil Centaur Moly2 Calcium Sulfate
Per Case of 10, 140z Tubes 16223 Vendor withdrew | $ 98.93| $ 59.46 | Vendor withdrew | $ 101.75| Vendor withdrew
Per 35# Container 16224 |bid after awarded on| g 323.07| $ 245.14 | bid after awarded on| ¢ 356.13 | bid after awarded on
Per 120# Container 16225 711/23 $ 758.70( $ 795.38 715123 $ 1,221.00 6/28/23
Gear Oil 80W-90 GL-5 Mobilube HD Plus Lawson 3LUSA,LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers 16226 Vendor withdrew | $ 150.62( $ 101.43 | Vendor withdrew | $ 168.30 | Vendor withdrew
- bid after awarded on bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
Per 35# Container 16227 7111/23 $ 12599 $ 179.71 7/5/23 $ 490.88 6/28/23
Gear Oil 85W-140 GL-5 Mobilube HD Plus Lawson 3LUSA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Qil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers 16228 Vendor withdrew | $ 279.45] $ 102.18 | Vendor withdrew | $ 168.30 | Vendor withdrew
- bid after awarded on bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
Per 35# Container 16229 7/11/23 $ 122.99( $ 194.78 7/5/23 $ 490.88 6/28/23
Synthetic Gear Oil 75W-90 Mobil 1 Lawson 3LUSA,LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers 16230 Vendor withdrew | $ 202.17| $ 139.68 | Vendor withdrew | $ 214.50( Vendor withdrew
- bid after awarded on bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
Per 35# Container 16231 7/11/23 $ 284.99| $ 321.55 7/5/23 $ 625.63 6/28/23
Synthetic Gear Oil 75W-140 Mobil 1 Lawson 3LUSA,LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers 16232 Vendor withdrew | $ 343.28| $ 191.46 ( Vendor withdrew | $ 320.10| Vendor withdrew
- bid after awarded on bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
Per 35# Container 16233 7/11/23 $ 449.99 NO BID 7/5/23 $ 933.63 6/28/23




Section 10.3: ANTIFREEZE
Subsection 10.3.1

Multi-Vehicle Antifreeze, concentrated Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex QOil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below ¥ Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Peak Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle 15831 Vendor withdrew | $ 2295( $ 12.90 NO BID $ 12.65| Vendor withdrew
bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 15832 7/11/23 $ 1,879.50( $ 639.10( $ 674.06( $ 695.75 6/28/23
Subsection 10.3.2
Multi-Vehicle Antifreeze, ready-to-use Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Qil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below ¥ Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Peak Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle 9032 Vendor withdrew | $ 28.49( $ 10.35 NO BID $ 10.45| Vendor withdrew
bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 15772 7/11/23 $ 1,059.27( $ 464.75 470.01] $ 574.75 6/28/23




Section 10.4: GENERIC
Subsection 10.4.1 Chevron Products or Equal to

SAE 10W30 CJ-4/SM Delo 400 XLE Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below \ Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.

CHEVRON, ROTELLA T5 SYN BLEND 10W30 CK-4 , THRIVE Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quart Containers 14320 Vendor withdrew | $ 97.49 NO BID NO BID $ 120.12| Vendor withdrew
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle 13822 |bid after awarded on| $ 51.74 NO BID NO BID $ 40.92 [bid after awarded on
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 13823 7/11/23 3$ 148.34 NO BID NO BID $ 204.60 6/28/23
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 13824 $ 1,983.44 NO BID $ 1,128.36| $ 2,250.60
SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 Delo 400 Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below W Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.

THRIVE, CHEVRON Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quart Containers 15833 Vendor withdrew | $ 97.49 NO BID NO BID $ 136.40| Vendor withdrew
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 15834 | bid after awarded on| $ 148.34 NO BID NO BID $ 165.00 [bid after awarded on
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 13835 7/11/23 $ 1,385.81 NO BID $ 1,052.90| $ 1,815.00 6/28/23
Per Gallon in Bulk 15836 $ 30.74 NO BID $ 1545( $ 25.96
SAE 30 Delo 400 Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below V¥ Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.

CHEVRON, SHELL ROTELLA T1 30WT Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quart Containers 14321 Vendor withdrew | $ 96.57 NO BID NO BID $ 136.40 ( Vendor withdrew
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 14103 |Pid after awarded on g 146.99 NO BID NO BID $ 165,00 | Pid after awarded on

7/11/23 6/28/23
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 14104 $ 1,691.67 NO BID $ 958.96  $ 1,815.00
SAE 50 Heavy Duty Drive Train (Meets Cat’s requiring TO-4 Fluids) Lawson 3L USA,LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Qil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below \/ Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.

PERFORMANCE PLUS Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX

Per Pail of 5 Gallons 13360 Vendor withdrew | $ 114.32 NO BID NO BID $ 171.60 | Vendor withdrew

bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 13361 7111/23 $ 1,269.60 NO BID $ 146421 $ 1,887.60 6/28/23
Hydraulic Oil 1SO-46 (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-268-S) Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below ¥ Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.

MAG 1, SHELL TELLUS S2MX46 Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 15837 Vendor withdrew | $ 149.99 NO BID NO BID $ 202.40| Vendor withdrew
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 1583g | bid after awarded on| g 1,554.93 NO BID $ 905.83| $ 2,145.00 | Pid after awarded on
Per Gallon in Bulk 15839 7z $ 74.28 NO BID $ 1354( $ 2,090.00 6/28/23




Subsection 10.4.1 Chevron Products or Equal to (cont'd)

Hydraulic Oil AW 68 (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-286-S) Lawson 3L USA,LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex QOil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below WV Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.

MAG 1, SHELL TELLUS S2MX68 Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX

Per Pail of 5 Gallons 15840 Vendor withdrew | $ 155.69 NO BID NO BID $ 253.00 | Vendor withdrew
bid after awarded on bid after awarded on

Per Drum of 55 Gallons 15841 711123 $ 1,647.00 NO BID 905.83 | $ 2,783.00 6/28/23

TDH Hydraulic/Tractor Fluid (Case MS-1207, John Deere J20C) Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex QOil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,

List brand below WV Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.

THRIVE, SHELL TELLUS S2MX68 Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 15842 Vendor withdrew | $ 150.77 NO BID NO BID $ 101.20 | Vendor withdrew
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 15843 | bid after awarded on[ ¢ 1,566.00 NO BID 1,019.44 | $ 1,113.20 | bid after awarded on
Per Gallon in Bulk 15844 7z $ 33.99 NO BID 1472] $ 20.24 €/28/23
Grease Ultra-Duty EP2 Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below ¥ Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.

Thrive Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 10, 140z Tubes 15782 Vendor withdrew | $ 64.49 NO BID NO BID $ 39.60 | Vendor withdrew
Per 35# Container 15783 |bid after awarded on[ ¢ 229.73 NO BID NO BID $ 138.60 | bid after awarded on
Per 120# Container 15784 Tinizs $ 704.43 NO BID NO BID $ 47520 6/28/23
Gear Oil 85-140 GL-5 Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below ¥ Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.

THRIVE Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per 35# Container 15785 Vendor withdrew | $ 285.74 NO BID NO BID $ 177.10| Vendor withdrew

bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
7/11/23 6/28/23
Gear Oil, Universal 85-140 GL-5 Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex QOil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below ¥ Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.

PHILLIPS 66 Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX

Per 35# Container 15786 Vendor withdrew | $ 179.85 NO BID NO BID $ 230.23| Vendor withdrew
bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
7/11/23 6/28/23




Subsection 10.4.2: Mobil Products or Equal to

SAE 0W-20 — SP Mobil Special Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Niimber Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
MOBIL Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers 16237 Vendor withdrew | $ 199.50( $ 84.58 NO BID $ 132.00( Vendor withdrew
bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
7/11/23 6/28/23
SAE 0W-30 SP Mobil Special Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
MOBIL Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers 16238 Vendor withdrew | $ 199.17( $ 102.75 NO BID $ 132.00( Vendor withdrew
bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
7/11/23 6/28/23
SAE 5W-20 — SP Mobil Special Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
THRIVE Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers 16239 Vendor withdrew | $ 143.64( $ 77.28 NO BID $ 73.81| Vendor withdrew
bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
7/11/23 6/28/23
SAE 5W-30 — SP Mobil Special Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
MOBIL Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers 16240 Vendor withdrew | $ 148.86( $ 77.28 NO BID $ 83.95( Vendor withdrew
bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
7/11/23 6/28/23
SAE 10W-30 — SP Mobil Special Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
MOBIL Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers 16241 Vendor withdrew | $ 175.50( $ 77.28 NO BID $ 179.52 Vendor withdrew
bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
7/11/23 6/28/23
SAE 10W-30 — CK-4 Mobil Delvac 1300 Super Synthetic Blend Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
MOBIL Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon jug 16242 Vendor withdrew | $ 43.49( $ 28.49 NO BID $ 30.80| Vendor withdrew
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 16243 |bid after awarded on{ 158.24 $ 106.95 NO BID $ 154.00 | bid after awarded on
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 16244 7111123 $ 1,37880] $ 89155] $ 1,052.90] $ 1,694.00 6/28/23
SAE 10W-30 — Mobil Delvac Extreme Synthetic Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
THRIVE & MOBIL Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon jug 16245 Vendor withdrew | $ 4349( $ 30.57 NO BID $ 26.36| Vendor withdrew
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 16246 |bid after awarded on| g 21897 $ 147.69 NO BID $ 131.78 | bid after awarded on
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 16247 711723 $ 1,87358] $ 1,325.50 NO BID $ 1,452.00 6/28/23




Subsection 10.4.2: Mobil Products or Equal to (cont'd)

SAE 15W-40 — CK-4 Mobil Delvac 1300 Super Synthetic Blend Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
THRIVE & MOBIL Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon jug 16248 Vendor withdrew | $ 44.99( $ 28.49 NO BID $ 26.36| Vendor withdrew
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 16249  |bid after awarded on| § 134.99( $ 106.95 NO BID $ 131.78 | bid after awarded on
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 16250 711123 $ 1,04850| $ 89155 $ 1,052.90| $ 1,452.00 6/28/23
SAE 15W-40 — Mobil Delvac Extreme Synthetic Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
THRIVE & MOBIL Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon jug 16251 Vendor withdrew | $ 3371 $ 30.57 NO BID $ 26.36 [ Vendor withdrew
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 16252  |bid after awarded on| $ 15450 $ 147.69 NO BID $ 131.78 | bid after awarded on
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 16253 7/11/23 $ 1,374.32] $ 1,32550 | $ 1,467.93| $ 1,457.50 6/28/23
SAE 10W - Mobiltrans HD Syn-Blend Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
MOBIL & SHELL Spirax S4 CX 10W Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 16187 Vendor withdrew | $ 323.13] $ 116.30 NO BID $ 171.60( Vendor withdrew
bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 16188 71123 $ 1,924.07( $ 1,114.02| $ 939.71( $ 1,892.00 6/28/23
SAE 50 — Mobiltrans HD (Meets Cat TO-4 Specification) Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex QOil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
MOBIL, SINOPEC Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 16189 Vendor withdrew | $ 275.13| $ 126.82 NO BID $ 170.50 | Vendor withdrew
bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 16190 7/11/23 $ 1,24850( $ 1,334.95| $ 1,464.21| $ 1,897.50 6/28/23
SAE 50 — MT-1 Mobil Delvac 1 Synthetic Trans Fluid (Eaton Roadranger PS-164 Rev ] Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
SINOPEC Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 16234 Vendor withdrew | $ 200.70| $ 302.51 NO BID $ 280.50 | Vendor withdrew
bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
7/11/23 6/28/23
1SO 46 — Mobil Nuto H 46 Hydraulic Oil (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-268-S) Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
MOBIL Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 16191 Vendor withdrew | $ 136.71( $ 107.40 NO BID $ 145.20( Vendor withdrew
bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 16192 71123 $ 1,308.42( $ 690.25( $ 905.83( $ 1,534.50 6/28/23
AW68 — Mobil Nuto H 68 Hydraulic Oil (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-268-S) Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Qil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
MOBIL Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 16193 Vendor withdrew | $ 136.71( $ 107.40 NO BID $ 185.90 | Vendor withdrew
bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 16194 7111/23 $ 1,308.42( $ 690.25( $ 905.83( $ 1,969.00 6/28/23




Subsection 10.4.2: Mobil Products or Equal to (cont'd)

UTF - GL-4 Mobilfluid 424 Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
MOBIL Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 16195 Vendor withdrew | $ 211.32 $ 110.78 NO BID $ 162.80 Vendor withdrew
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 16196  |bid after awarded on| ¢ 2,129.09( $ 810.15 1,019.44 | $ 1,790.80 | bid after awarded on
Per Gallon in Bulk 16197 71123 NO BID $ 1358 1472( % 32.56 6/28/23
Grease NLGI GC-LB Mobil Centaur Moly2 Calcium Sulfate Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
MOBIL CENTAUR Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 10, 140z Tubes 16198 Vendor withdrew | $ 97.80| $ 59.46 NO BID $ 81.40 Vendor withdrew
Per 35# Container 16199 |bid after awarded on[ g 321.35[ $ 245.14 NO BID $ 284.90 |bid after awarded on
Per 120% Container 16200 711723 $ 758.70| $ 795.38 NO BID $ 976.80 6/28/23
Gear Oil 80W-90 GL-5 Mobilube HD Plus Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex QOil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
MOBIL Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers 16201 Vendor withdrew | $ 270.87| $ 101.43 NO BID $ 134.64  Vendor withdrew
- bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
Per 35# Container 16202 7111/23 $ 203.81( $ 179.71 NO BID $ 392.70 6/28/23
Gear Oil 85W-140 GL-5 Mobilube HD Plus Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
MOBIL & LUCAS OIL Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers 16203 Vendor withdrew | $ 173.99| $ 102.18 NO BID $ 134.64 | Vendor withdrew
- bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
Per 35# Container 16204 7/11/23 $ 122.99| $ 194.78 NO BID $ 392.70 6/28/23
Synthetic Gear Oil 75W-90 Mobil 1 Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
MOBIL Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers 16205 Vendor withdrew | $ 173.99( $ 139.68 NO BID $ 171.60( Vendor withdrew
- bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
Per 35# Container 16206 7/11/23 $ 448.49| $ 321.55 NO BID $ 500.50 6/28/23
Synthetic Gear Oil 75W-140 Mobil 1 Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
MOBIL & LUCUS OIL/ULTRA1PLUS Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers 16207 Vendor withdrew | $ 238.88| $ 191.46 NO BID $ 256.08 [ Vendor withdrew
bid after awarded on bid after awarded on
Per 35# Container 16208 7/11/23 $ 235.47 NO BID NO BID $ 746.90 6/28/23

*Sun Coast Resources: Disqualified due to altering terms and conditions
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