Fort Bend County Tabulation

Bid 24-048

Term Contract for Purchase of Weed, Brush and Insect Control Chemicals

Term: through March 31, 2025

Awarded 5/14/2024: Lowest Bidder per item

*Tied items award drawn by Commisioners Court Members

Herbicides

Item #1: 2, 4-D Amine Full Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree

Aguatic Label, Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba

price per gallon dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, 1L Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners

Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX

2.5 gallon container 8879 No Bid $ 14.98 gal. No Bid $22.00 $18.00 $10.99 $15.98 / gallon No Bid No Bid $14.00

minimum order 2.5 gal. 5 gal 5 gallons 2.5 gallons 50 gal

returnable No Nut No No No

30 gallon container 8880 No Bid $ 14.28 gal. No Bid $22.00 $12.25 $10.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.50

minimum order 30 gal. 30 gal 30 gallons 120 gal

returnable No No No No

270 gallon container 10041 No Bid 14.00 gal. No Bid $22.00 $11.70 $10.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.00

minimum order 265 gal. container 265 gals 270 gallons 270 gal

returnable No Yes No No

Item #2: Arsenal EUP, Habitat, Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree

Polaris (Aquatic), Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba

price per gallon dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners

Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX

2.5 gallon container 8903 No Bid $ 63.85 gal. No Bid $59.50 $57.95 $62.25 $75.52 / gallon $88.00 No Bid $65.00

minimum order 2.5 gal. 5 gal 5 gallons 2.5 gallons 2.5 gallons 25 gal

returnable No No No No No

5 gallon container 9678 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $64.00 $75.52 / gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid

minimum order 5 gallons

returnable No

15 gallon container 8904 No Bid $63.48 gal. No Bid No Bid No Bid $63.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

minimum order 15 gal.

returnable No

30 gallon container 9679 No Bid $63.28 gal. No Bid No Bid No Bid $63.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $64.50

minimum order 30 gal. 120 gal

returnable No No

250 gallon container 9680 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $61.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

minimum order

returnable




Item #3: Dupont Oust Extra, Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
price per pound Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, 1L Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
4 pound container 8910 No Bid $ 25.88 Ib. No Bid $34.50 $30.95 $26.45 $47.35 / pound No Bid No Bid $30.00
minimum order 4 Ibs. 41b 4 pounds 4 pounds 64 Ib
12 pound container 8911 No Bid 25.88 Ib. No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.00
minimum order 12 Ibs. 48 Ib
25 pound container 9682 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order
Item #4: Escort, Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
price per Ounce Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
1 oz. container 8920 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.49 $2.01 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 8 0z
8 0z. container 9683 No Bid $2.28 oz. No Bid No Bid $2.49 $2.01 $2.97 / ounce No Bid No Bid $2.95
minimum order 8 oz. 80z 8 ounces 64 oz
16 oz. container 8921 No Bid $2.28 oz. No Bid $4.00 $2.49 $2.01 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.90
minimum order 16.0z. 1 case 16 oz 128 oz
64 oz. container 9684 No Bid $2.20 oz. No Bid $3.90 $2.49 $2.01 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 64 oz. 1 case 64 oz
Item #5: Garlon 3A, Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
price per gallon Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris | Expert LLC dba
dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
2.5 gallon container 8930 No Bid $60.30 gal. No Bid $62.75 $65.96 $42.00 $76.90 / gallon $88.00 $80.00 $62.00
minimum order 2.5 gal. 5 gal 5 gallons 2.5 gallons 1 container 2 containers 100 gal
returnable No No No No No No
5 gallon container 8931 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $44.00 $76.90 / gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 5 gallons
returnable No
30 gallon container 8932 No Bid $60.30 gal. No Bid $62.75 $65.96 $40.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $62.00
minimum order 30 gal. 30 gals 30 gallons 120 gal
returnable No No No No




Item #6: Garlon 4 Ultra, Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
price per gallon Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, 1L Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
2.5 gallon container 14140 No Bid $ 75.01 gal. No Bid $80.50 $84.67 $52.00 $49.26 / gallon No Bid $90.23 $76.75
minimum order 2.5 gal. 5 gal 5 gallons 2.5 gallons 2 containers 50 gal
returnable No No No No No No
Item #7: Glyphosate 41%+14% Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
Surfactant, Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris| Expert LLC dba
price per gallon dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
2.5 gallon container 8942 No Bid $ 16.18 gal. No Bid $16.85 $14.65 $12.65 $17.60 / gallon $17.75 $25.22 $14.50
minimum order 2.5 gal. 5 gal 5 gallons 2.5 gallons 1 2.5 container 2 containers 50 gal
returnable No No No No No No No
Brand Bid Ranger Pro Ranger Pro Ranger Pro GLYSTAR Ranger Pro Ranger Pro Ranger Pro Gly Star Plus
5 gallon container 10060 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.00 $17.60 / gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 5 gallons
returnable No
Brand Bid GLYSTAR Ranger Pro
30 gallon container 8943 No Bid $ 16.00 gal. No Bid $16.50 $14.05 $12.20 $16.90 / gallon $16.90 $20.67 $15.50
minimum order 30 gal. 30 gals 30 gallons 30 gallons 1 30 gal container $1.00 150 gal
returnable No No No No No No No
Brand Bid Ranger Pro Ranger Pro Ranger Pro GLYSTAR Ranger Pro Ranger Pro Ranger Pro Gly Star Plus
275 gallon container 10063 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order
returnable
Brand Bid GLYSTAR
265 gallon container 9688 No Bid $ 15.78 gal. No Bid $16.10 $13.56 $12.50 $16.30 / gallon $16.50 No Bid $15.25
minimum order 265 gal. 265 gals 265 gallons 265 gallons 1 tote 265 gal
returnable No Yes No No No No
Brand Bid Ranger Pro Ranger Pro Ranger Pro GLYSTAR Ranger Pro Ranger Pro Gly Star Plus
Item #8: MSMA 6 Plus 47.60% Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
Active, Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
price per gallon dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
2.5 gallon container 8953 No Bid $ 34.88 gal. No Bid $33.80 $29.98 $25.99 $38.88 / gallon $38.00 $48.00 No Bid
minimum order 2.5 gal. 5 gals 5 gallons 2.5 gallons 1 container 2 containers
returnable No No No No No No




Item #9: Milestone VM, Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
price per gallon Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, 1L Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
2.5 gallon container 8955 No Bid $ 329.00 gal. No Bid $329.00 $329.00 $329.00 $329.00 / gallon No Bid No Bid Vendor withdrew bid
minimum order 2.5 gal. 5 gals 5 gallons 2.5 gallons after awarded on
returnable No No No No 5/17/24
Item #10: Outrider, Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
price per ounce Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris| Expert LLC dba
dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
20 oz. container 8961 No Bid $15.20 oz No Bid $284.00 $287.23 $12.99 $19.40 / ounce No Bid $21.11 $14.00
minimum order 20 oz. 1 container 20 oz 20 ounces 10 Bottles 20 oz
Item #11: Pro-Mate Accuracy Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
30%, Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
price per quart dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
1 quart container 8966 No Bid $ 13.98 qt. No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 1 quart
returnable No / Bidding Elite Secure
Ultra
Item #12: Rodeo Herbicide, Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
price per gallon Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
2.5 gallon container 8971 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.57 AQUNEAT - $19.70 $30.96 / gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 5 gallons RODEO 2.5 gallons
DISCONTIUNED
returnable No No
Item #13: Roundup Pro Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape [ Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
Concentrate 50.2% Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
Isopropylamine Salt of Glyphosate- dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
complete with performance Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
technology surfactant, price e Enterprises, LLC X Atlanta, GA
per gallon Number Waller, TX
2.5 gallon container 8974 No Bid $21.48 gal. No Bid $19.85 $17.96 $20.55 $24.64 / gallon $25.00 $39.14 $20.00
minimum order 2.5 gal. 5 gals 5 gallons 2.5 gallons 1 container 2 containers 100 gal
returnable No No No No No No No
30 gallon container 8975 No Bid $21.00 gal. No Bid $19.20 $17.30 $19.75 $23.74 / gallon $23.50 No Bid $19.50
minimum order 30 gal. 30gals 30 gallons 30 gallons 1 container 120 gal
returnable No No No No No No




Item #14: Surfactant: Nonionic Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
Surfactant Load: 70% HLB Ratio: Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
12, Antifoam Index: 3, dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
price per gallon Shreveport, LA St. Charles, 1L Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC X Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
1 gallon container 8988 No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.85 $12.95 $22.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 4 gals 4 gallons
returnable No No
2.5 gallon container 8989 No Bid $ 18.98 gal. No Bid $15.55 $12.75 $21.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 2.5 gal. 5gals 5 gallons
returnable No No No
30 gallon container 8990 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.25 $19.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 30 gallons
returnable No
Brand Bid Elite Platinum Inlet Windsurf Pro
Item #15: Surfactant: Nonionic Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
Active Ingredient 96% Poly-1-P- Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris| Expert LLC dba
Menthene, dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
price per gallon Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC X Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
2.5 gallon container 8993 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order
returnable
Brand Bid EP90
Item #16: Tordon 22K, Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
price per gallon Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
2.5 gallon container 8994 No Bid $ 78.44 gal. No Bid $74.75 $68.75 $63.00 $66.60 / gallon No Bid No Bid $72.00
minimum order 2.5 gal. 5 gals 5 gallons 2.5 gallons 25 gal
returnable No No No No
5 gallon container 8996 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $63.00 $66.60 / gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 5 gallons
returnable No
30 gallon container 16137 No Bid $ 78.10 gal. No Bid No Bid No Bid $63.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $72.00
minimum order 30 gal. 120 gal
returnable No No
250 gallon container 10080 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $63.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

minimum order

returnable




Item #17: Opensight by Dow Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
AgroScience, Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
price per ounce dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, 1L Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
20 oz hottle container 9010 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.13 $6.12 $98.00 $6.125 / ounce No Bid No Bid $6.13
minimum order 1 case 20 oz 20 ounces 7.51bor 120 oz
Brand Bid Opensight Opensight Dow Opensight Opensight Opensight
1.25 pound container 9011 No Bid $98.00/ Ib. No Bid $6.13 $6.12 $98.00 $6.125 / ounce No Bid No Bid $6.13
minimum order 1 bottle 1 case 1.25 pounds 20 ounces / 1.25 Ibs 7.51bor 120 oz
Brand Bid Opensight Opensight Opensight Dow Opensight Opensight Opensight
10 pound container 9700 No Bid $98.00/ Ib. No Bid No Bid $6.12 $98.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.13
minimum order 10 Ibs. 10 pounds 101b
Brand Bid 1 bottle Dow Opensight Opensight
Item #18: DLZ-MSO Surfactant Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
Plus Drift, No Subs Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris | Expert LLC dba
price per gallon dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
2.5 gallon container 10461 No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.50 No Bid *$15.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 5 gals
returnable No
*Disqualified this item does not allow subs
Item #19: Hardball, 2,4-D Acid, Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
No Subs Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
price per gallon dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
2.5 gallon container 10462 No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.00 No Bid *$25.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 5 gals
returnable No
30 gallon container 10463 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid *$22.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order
returnable
*Disqualified this item does not allow subs
Item #20: Plateau, Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
price per gallon Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
1 gallon container 11505 No Bid $118.44 No Bid $112.00 $133.00 $100.05 $136.90 / gallon $147.00 $170.00 $119.00
minimum order 1 gal. 1 case 4 gallons 2.5 gallons 1 container 2 containers 4 gal
returnable No No No No No No




Item #21: Droplex Xtra, No Subs Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
price per gallon Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, 1L Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
2.5 gallon container 13127 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.00 *$24.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 5 gallons
returnable No
*Disqualified this item does not allow subs
Item #22: Vastlan, Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
price per gallon Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris| Expert LLC dba
dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
2.5 gallon container 13128 No Bid $ 105.00/ gal. No Bid $105.00 $105.00 $105.00 $105.00 / gallon No Bid No Bid Vendor withdrew bid
minimum order 2.5 gal after awarded on
5/17/24
30 gallon container 13129 No Bid $ 105.00/ gal. No Bid $105.00 $105.00 $105.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid Vendor withdrew bid
minimum order 1 container 2.5 or 30 gal. 30 gal 5 gallons after awarded on
returnable No No No No 5/17/24
Item #23: Trycera Selective Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
Herbicide, No Subs Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
price per gallon dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
2.5 gallon container 13121 No Bid No Bid No Bid $90.00 No Bid *$80.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 5 gals
returnable No
265 gallon container 14356 No Bid No Bid No Bid $83.00 No Bid *$78.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order $265.00
returnable Yes
*Disqualified this item does not allow subs
Item #24: Dow Frequency, Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
Bareground Herbicide, Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris | Expert LLC dba
price per gallon dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
1 gallon container 10474 No Bid $679.00 No Bid $606.43 No Bid $606.03 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 1 gal. 1 case
returnable No No
Item #25: AquaKing Plus, 95% Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
Active Spreaded-Activator with Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris| Expert LLC dba
Buffering Agents for Aquatic Use, dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
price per gallon Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
2.5 gallon container 10471 No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.50/Induce pH $25.00 $21.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 5 gals 5 gallons
returnable No No




Item #26: Turbulance, Surfactant, Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
Crop Oil Concentrate, Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
price per gallon dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, 1L Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
2.5 gallon container 10472 No Bid No Bid No Bid $37.50/ Dynamic $35.00 $20.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 5 gals 5 gallons
returnable No No
Item #27: Roundup Custom Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
price per gallon Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
2.5 gallon container 14141 No Bid $ 24.44/ gal. No Bid $24.80 $22.57 $22.99 $30.96 / gallon No Bid $40.00 $26.00
minimum order 2.5 gal. 5 gals 5 gallons 2.5 gallons 2 containers 50 gal
Brand Bid Roundup Custom Roundup Custom Round Up Custom Roundup Custom RoundUp Custom Roundup Custom
returnable No No No No No No
Item #28: Method 240SL, Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
price per gallon Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
2.5 gallon container 13126 No Bid $ 357.12/ gal. No Bid $357.12 $357.12 Vendor withdrew bid $357.12 / gallon No Bid $440.00 $357.12
minimum order 2.5 gal. 5 gals 5 gallons after awarded on 2.5 gallons 2 containers 2.5 gal
5/20/24
20 gallon container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Vendor withdrew bid No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid
minimum order after awarded on
Brand Bid Method 240 SL Method 240SL Method 240SL 5/20/24 Method 240SL Method 240SL Method 240SL
Item #29: Derigo (by Bayer Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
Environmental Science), Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris| Expert LLC dba
price per ounce dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
60 ounce container 14142 No Bid $9.69 oz. No Bid $9.69 $9.69 $9.69 $9.69 / ounce No Bid No Bid $9.69
minimum order 60 oz. 1 case 60 oz 60 oz 60 0z
Brand Bid Derigo Derigo Derigo Envu Derigo Derigo Derigo




Item #30: Telar XP (by Bayer Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
Environmental Science), Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
price per ounce dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, 1L Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
16 ounce container 14144 No Bid $ 14.60 oz. No Bid $17.20 $13.97 $13.45 $20.32 / ounce No Bid No Bid $13.50
minimum order 8 0z. container 1 case 16 oz 8 0z 64 oz
Brand Bid Telar XP Telar XP Telar XP Envu Telar XP Telar XP Telar
Item #31: EcOMIGHT Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
price per gallon Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris| Expert LLC dba
dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
1 gallon container 16138 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order
2.5 gallon container 16139 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order
55 gallon container 16140 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order
Brand Bid
Item #32: 1% Solution, Drift Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
Control Agent, Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
price per gallon dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, 1L Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
1 gallon container 10468 No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.00/Accuracy No Bid $11.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 1 case
returnable No
2.5 gallon container 10469 No Bid $10.88/ gal. No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 2.5 gal.
returnable No
Item #33: Droplex, Deposition Aid Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
and Drift Control Agent, Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
price per gallon dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
A387 Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
1 gallon container 10470 No Bid No Bid No Bid $51.00/Justified $55.00 $28.99 $38.36 / gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 5gal 4 gallons 2.5 gallons
returnable No No No
Item #34: Liberate by Loveland Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
Products, Inc., Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris | Expert LLC dba
price per gallon dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, 1L Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
2.5 gallon container 12054 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.99 $39.80 / gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid

minimum order

2.5 gallons

returnable

No




Item #35: Esplanade, No Subs Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
price per gallon Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, 1L Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
1 gallon container 16141 No Bid No Bid No Bid $415.36/quart No Bid $1,509.12 $415.36 / quart No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 1 case 1 quart / 32 ounces
returnable No No
2.5 gallon container 16142 No Bid 1,509.12/ gal. No Bid $1,509.12 $1,509.12 $1,509.12 $1,509.12 / gallon No Bid $1,820.43 $1,509.12
minimum order 2.5 gal. 5 gals 2.5 gallons 2.5 gallons 1 container 2.5 gal
returnable No No No No No No
Item #36: TerraVue, No Subs Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
price per ounce Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris| Expert LLC dba
dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
20 ounce container 16143 No Bid $104.00/ Ib. No Bid $6.50 No Bid, container size $6.50/0z $6.5625 / ounce No Bid No Bid No Bid
not available
minimum order 1 bottle / 1.1 Ib. 1 case 70.4 ounces / 4.4 Ibs
returnable No No No
10 pound container 16144 No Bid $104.00/ Ib. No Bid No Bid $6.50 104.00/1b $6.5625 / ounce No Bid No Bid $6.50
minimum order 1 bottle / 10 Ibs. 10 pounds 70.4 ounces / 4.4 lbs 20 Ib
returnable No No No No
Insecticides
Item #37: Altosid Briquettes Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape [ Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
(Mosquito Larvicide and Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
Pupicide), price per case dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
1 case/400 8890 No Bid No Bid $536.00 No Bid $692.48 No Bid $536.00 / case No Bid $536.00 No Bid
minimum order 1 case 1 case 1 case 1 case
Item #38: Altosid XR (Mosquito Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape [ Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
Larvicide and Pupicide), Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
price per case dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, 1L Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
1 case/220 8891 No Bid No Bid $842.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $842.60 / case No Bid $842.60 No Bid
minimum order 1 case 1 case 1 case
Item #39: Big Foot Dye SS, Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
price per quart Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
1 quart container 8905 No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.45 $11.25 No Bid $25.35 / quart No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 1 case 12 quarts 1 quart




Item #40: Evoluer 4-4 ULV Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
(Permethrin 4% Piperonyl Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
Butoxide 4%) or equivalent, dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
price per gallon Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
2.5 gallon container 8922 $27.35/gal No Bid No Bid No Bid $29.00 No Bid $36.90 / gallon No Bid $27.27 No Bid
minimum order 5 gallon (2x2.5 gl 5 gallons 2.5 gallons 2 units
case)
returnable No No No No
Brand Bid PermaSease 4-4 Perm- X 4-4 Perm-X UL 4-4 Kontrol 4-4
5 gallon container 8923 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $36.90 / gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 5 gallons
returnable No
Brand Bid Perm-X UL 4-4
15 gallon container 10050 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order
returnable
Brand Bid
30 gallon container 8924 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $48.16 / gallon No Bid $27.27 No Bid
minimum order 30 gallons 1 unit
returnable Yes No
Brand Bid Permanone RTU Kontrol 4-4
55 gallon container 8925 $26.94/gal No Bid $1,870.00 No Bid $24.42 No Bid $28.00 / gallon No Bid $27.27 No Bid
minimum order 55 gallon drum 1 each 55 gallon drum 55 gallons 55 gallons 1 unit
returnable No No No Yes No
Brand Bid PermaSease 4-4 Perm-X 4-4 Perm- X 4-4 Perm-X UL 4-4 Kontrol 4-4
250 gallon container 8926 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order
returnable
Brand Bid
275 gallon container 8927 $25.93/gal No Bid $9,350.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.60 / gallon No Bid $27.27 No Bid
minimum order 275 gallon tote 1 each 275 gallon tote 275 gallons 1 unit
returnable No No Yes Yes
Brand Bid PermaSease 4-4 Perm-X 4-4 Perm-X UL 4-4 Kontrol 4-4
Item #41: Mosquitomist One ULV Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
price per gallon Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris| Expert LLC dba
dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
30 gallon container 8958 No Bid No Bid $2,634.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 1 each 30 gallon drum
returnable Yes
55 gallon container 8959 No Bid No Bid $4,781.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 1 each 55 gallon drum
returnable Yes
275 gallon container 8960 No Bid No Bid $22,550.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 1 each 275 gallon S/S
tote
returnable Yes




Item #42: PyreNone 25-5 Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
(Pyrethrins 5% Piperonyl Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
Butoxide 25%), price per gallon dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, 1L Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
2.5 gallon container 8968 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order
returnable
5 gallon container 8969 $246.15/gal No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $250.00 No Bid $218.96 No Bid
minimum order 5 gallon pail 5 gal 1 unit
returnable Not returnable -Brand No No
Evergreen 5-25 Gound
30 gallon container 8970 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $245.00 No Bid $218.96 No Bid
minimum order 30 gal 1 unit
returnable No No
55 gallon container 16426 $229.00/gal No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $230.00 No Bid $211.47 No Bid
minimum order 55 gallon drum 55 gal 1 unit
returnable Not returnable -Brand No No
Evergreen 5-25 Gound
Item #43 Duet by Clarke Mosquito Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
Control, Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris| Expert LLC dba
price per gallon dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Lason Shreveport, LA St. Charles, 1L Helenfi Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Number Entirf)ﬂsves_,r\l_/LC TX Atlanta, GA
2.5 gallon container 9005 No Bid No Bid $550.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $277.50 / gallon No Bid $98.14 No Bid
minimum order 1 each 2-1/2 gallon jug 2.5 gallons 2 units
returnable No No No
Brand Bid Duet DeltaGard and Zenivex E4
5 gallon container 9006 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $277.50 / gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 5 gallons
returnable No
Brand Bid DeltaGard and
30 gallon container 9007 No Bid No Bid $6,388.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid $270.50 / gallon No Bid $95.04 No Bid
minimum order 1 each 30 gallon drum 30 gallons 1 unit
returnable Yes Yes Yes
Brand Bid Duet DeltaGard and Zenivex E4
55 gallon container 9008 No Bid No Bid $11,211.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 1 each 55 gallon drum
returnable Yes
Brand Bid Duet
275 gallon container 9009 No Bid No Bid $55,787.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $268.50 / gallon No Bid $88.50 No Bid
minimum order 1 each 275 gallon S/S 250 gallons 1 unit
tote
returnable Yes Yes Yes
Brand Bid Duet DeltaGard and Zenivex E4




Item #44: Mosquito Master 4-12, Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
price per gallon Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, 1L Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
30 gallon container 11859 No Bid No Bid $2,320.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 1 each 30 gallon drum
55 gallon container 16145 No Bid No Bid $4,198.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 1 each 55 gallon drum
275 gallon container 16146 No Bid No Bid $21,348.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 1 each 275 gallon S/S
tote
Item #45: Natular DT Tablet Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
Residential, 600/case, Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
price per case dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
600 tablet case 14139 No Bid No Bid $346.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 1 case
Item #46: Dibrom (Naled), Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
price per gallon Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris| Expert LLC dba
dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC X Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
2.5 gallon container 16397 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $277.50 / gallon No Bid $90.00 No Bid
minimum order 2.5 gallons 2 units
returnable No
Brand Bid Imperium Fyfanon ULV
5 gallon container 16398 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $277.50 / gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 5 gallons
returnable
Brand Bid Imperium
15 gallon container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order
returnable
Brand Bid
30 gallon container 16399 $281.54/gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $270.50 / gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 30 gallon drum 30 gallons
returnable No Yes
Brand Bid Dibrom Concentrate Imperium
55 gallon container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order
returnable
Brand Bid
250 gallon container 16400 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $268.50 / gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 250 gallons
returnable Yes
Brand Bid Imperium
275 gallon container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

minimum order

returnable

Brand Bid




Item #47: Fyfanon EW (40.9% Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
malathion), Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
price per gallon dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution

L ason Shreveport, LA St. Charles, 1L Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners

Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number \Alalloy TV
2.5 gallon container 16395 $74.32/gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 2.5 gallon jug
returnable No
Brand Bid Fyfanon EW ULV
5 gallon container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order
returnable
Brand Bid
15 gallon container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order
returnable
Brand Bid
30 gallon container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order
returnable
Brand Bid
55 gallon container 16396 $70.32/gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 50 gallons (note: 50
gallons in a 55 gl
drum)
returnable Yes - min. 10 drums
Brand Bid Fyfanon EW ULV
250 gallon container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order
returnable
Brand Bid
275 gallon container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order
returnable
Brand Bid
Item #48: Vectobac WDG, Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
price per gallon Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris| Expert LLC dba
dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
L ason Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number \Alalloyr TV
2.5 gallon container 16401 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.50 / pound No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 25 pounds
returnable No
Brand Bid Fallout WDG
5 gallon container 16402 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.50 / pound No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 25 pounds
returnable No
Brand Bid Fallout WDG
15 gallon container 16403 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.50 / pound No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 25 pounds
returnable No
Brand Bid Fallout WDG
30 gallon container 16404 $45.13/Ib No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.50 / pound No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 25 Ib drum 25 pounds
returnable No No
Brand Bid Vectobac WDG Fallout WDG
OMRI

55 gallon container 16405 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.50 / pound No Bid $36.23 No Bid
minimum order 25 pounds 1 unit
returnable No No
Brand Bid Fallout WDG AquaBac WDG 3000
250 gallon container 16406 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.50 / pound No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 25 pounds
returnable No
Brand Bid Fallout WDG
275 gallon container 16407 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.50 / pound No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 25 pounds
returnable No
Brand Bid Fallout WDG




Item #49: Altosid Liquid SR-20, Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
price per gallon Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba

dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution

Shreveport, LA St. Charles, 1L Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
2.5 gallon container 16408 No Bid No Bid $2,620.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,048.20 / gallon No Bid $1,048.20 No Bid
minimum order 2 X 2-1/2 gallon case 5 gallons 2 units
returnable No No No
Brand Bid ALTOSID SR-20 Altosid Liquid Altosid Liquid SR-20
Concentrate SR-20
5 gallon container 16409 No Bid No Bid $5,241.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,048.20 / gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order leach2 X 2-1/2 5 gallons
gallon case
returnable No No
Brand Bid ALTOSID SR-20 Altosid Liquid
Concentrate SR-20

15 gallon container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order
returnable
Brand Bid
30 gallon container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order
returnable
Brand Bid
55 gallon container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order
returnable
Brand Bid
250 gallon container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order
returnable
Brand Bid
275 gallon container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order
returnable
Brand Bid
Item #50: Vctobac 12AS, Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
price per gallon Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba

dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution

Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
2.5 gallon container 16410 $39.95/gal No Bid No Bid No Bid $53.50 No Bid $34.30 / gallon No Bid $46.15 No Bid
minimum order 5 gallons (2x2.5 gl 5 gallons 2.5 gallons 2 units
case)

returnable No No No No
Brand Bid Vectobac 12AS Vectobac 12AS Fallout LQ AquaBac XT
30 gallon container 16411 $39.95/gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.30 / gallon No Bid $46.15 No Bid
minimum order 30 gallon drum 30 gallons 1 unit
returnable No No No
Brand Bid Vectobac 12AS Fallout LQ AquaBac XT
264 gallon container 16412 $39.95/gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.30 / gallon No Bid $46.15 No Bid
minimum order 264 gallon tote 250 gallons 1 unit ( 250 gals)
returnable No No No
Brand Bid Vectobac 12AS Fallout LQ AquaBac XT




Item #51: Sumilarv 0.5G WSP, Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
price per bag Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, 1L Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
1 KG bag No Bid No Bid $481.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid $64.61 / 1 kg bag (40 No Bid $64.61 No Bid
16413 pouches)
minimum order case/10P/50X10g 1 kg bag (40 1 unit
pouches)
returnable No No No
Brand Bid NATULAR G30 WSP Sumilarv WSP Sumilarv 0.5 WSP
5 KG bag 16414 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $233.20 / 5 kg bag No Bid $233.20 No Bid
minimum order 2 x 5kg bags (one 1 unit
case)
returnable No No
Brand Bid Sumilarv 0.5G Sumilarv 0.5 g
Item #52: AquaPerm-X UL 30-30 Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
(30% Permethrin, 30% Piperonyl Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
Butoxide), dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
price per gallon Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
2.5 gallon container 16415 No Bid No Bid $370.00 No Bid $299.95 No Bid $130.00/gallon No Bid $139.23 No Bid
minimum order 2X2-1/2 gallon case 5 gallons 2.5 gallons 2 unit
returnable No No No No
Brand Bid Aqua Perm-X UL 30- Aqua Perm-X UL 30- AquaPerm-X UL or
Aqua Perm-X 30-30 30 30 Agua Kontrol
5 gallon container 16416 No Bid No Bid $740.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $130.00 / gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order 2X2-1/2 gallon case 5 gallons
returnable No No
Brand Bid Aqua Perm-X UL 30-
Aqua Perm-X 30-30 30
15 gallon container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order
returnable
Brand Bid
30 gallon container 16417 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $130.00 / gallon No Bid $139.23 No Bid
minimum order 30 gallons 1 unit
returnable Yes No
Brand Bid Aqua-Reslin Aqua Kontrol
55 gallon container 16418 No Bid No Bid $8,140.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $124.00 / gallon No Bid $139.23 No Bid
minimum order 1 each 55 gallon drum 55 gallons 1 unit
returnable No Yes No
Brand Bid Aqua Perm-X UL 30- Aqua Perm-X UL
Agqua Perm-X 30-30 30
250 gallon container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order
returnable
Brand Bid
275 gallon container 16419 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $139.23 No Bid
minimum order 1 unit
returnable Yes
Brand Bid Aqua Kontrol

(special request)




Item #53: Perm-X UL 31-66 (31% Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
Permethrin, 66% Piperonyl Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris| Expert LLC dba
Butoxide), dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
price per gallon Shreveport, LA St. Charles, 1L Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX
2.5 gallon container 16420 $145.00/gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $142.00 / gallon No Bid $149.96 No Bid
minimum order 5 gallons (2x2.5 gl 1 gallon 2 units
case)
returnable No No No
Brand Bid PermaSease 31-67 Permanone 31-66 Kontrol 31-67
5 gallon container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order
returnable
Brand Bid
15 gallon container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order
returnable
Brand Bid
30 gallon container 16421 $145.00/gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $140.00 / gallon No Bid $149.96 No Bid
minimum order 30 gallon drum 30 gallons 1 unit
returnable No Yes No
Brand Bid PermaSease 31-67 Permanone 31-66 Kontrol 31-67orPerm
X UL 31-66
55 gallon container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order
returnable
Brand Bid
250 gallon container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order
returnable
Brand Bid
275 gallon container 16422 $145.00/gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $140.00 / gallon No Bid $149.96 No Bid
minimum order 275 gl tote 275 gallons 1 unit
returnable No Yes No
Brand Bid PermaSease 31-67 Permanone 31-66 Perm-X UL 31-66
Item #54: Smmit Mosquito Dunks Adapco LLC. Red River Specialties Clarke Mosquito Marubeni America | Heritage Landscape | Nutrien Ag Solutions Rentokil North | SiteOne Landscape| ES OPCO USA Asplundh Tree
(Bti, 10.31%0), Lake Mary, FL LLC Control Products, Corporation Supply Group Houston, TX America dba Supply LLC dba Veseris [ Expert LLC dba
price per dunk dba Azelis A&ES Inc. dba McKinney, TX Target Specialty Chicago, IL Chicago, IL VM Distribution
Shreveport, LA St. Charles, IL Helena Agri- Products Houston, Partners
Lason Enterprises, LLC TX Atlanta, GA
Number Waller, TX

2 Pack 16423 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.32 / 2-pack No Bid $5.15 No Bid
minimum order 12 x 2-packs (one 12 units

case)
returnable No No
Brand Bid Summit Mosquito Summit

Dunks
6 Pack 16424 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.74 | 6-pack No Bid $8.19 No Bid
minimum order 12 x 6-packs (one 12 units

case)
returnable No No
Brand Bid Summit Mosquito Summit

Dunks
12 Pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
minimum order
returnable
Brand Bid
20 Pack 16425 No Bid No Bid $21.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00 / 20-pack $0.80 $20.00 No Bid
minimum order 5 each - 20 pack 5 x 20-pack (one 5 units

case) Pack of 20
returnable No No No
Brand Bid SUMMIT BTI Summit Mosquito AMVAC

Dunks
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