Fort Bend County Tabulation

BID 23-056

Term Contract for Oil and Lubricants

Term: through September 30, 2024

Recommended: Low Bidder per Item

Section 10.1: CHEVRON PRODUCTS Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Houston, TX
SAE 10W30 CJ-4/SM Delo 400 XLE
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers 14318 NO BID $ 161.82 NO BID NO BID $ 150.15 NO BID
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle 12574 NO BID $ 100.34 NO BID NO BID $ 51.15 NO BID
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 12575 $ 126.50 | $ 166.26 NO BID NO BID $ 255.75 NO BID
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 12576 $ 1,329.30( $ 1,983.44 NO BID $ 1,128.36 [ $ 2,813.25 NO BID
SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 Delo 400 Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers 1289 NO BID $ 97.45 NO BID NO BID $ 170.50 NO BID
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle 5341 NO BID $ 93.14 NO BID NO BID $ 41.25 NO BID
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 1290 $ 110.20| $ 149.95 NO BID NO BID $ 206.25 NO BID
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 5342 $ 1,130.00( $ 2,315.73 NO BID $ 1,052.90 $ 2,268.75 NO BID
Per Gallon in Bulk 5343 $ 17.40| $ 80.72 NO BID $ 1545] $ 32.45 NO BID
SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 Delo 400 XLE Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers 14319 NO BID $ 107.82 NO BID NO BID $ 64.35 NO BID
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle 13809 NO BID $ 32.73 NO BID NO BID $ 21.45 NO BID
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 13810 $ 12550 $ 74.87 NO BID NO BID $ 107.25 NO BID
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 13811 $ 1,329.00( $ 1,856.70 NO BID $ 1,052.90( $ 1,179.75 NO BID
Per Gallon in Bulk 13812 $ 19.84| $ 28.37 NO BID $ 1545] $ 20.35 NO BID

*Sun Coast Resources: Disqualified due to altering terms and conditions




Section 10.1: CHEVRON PRODUCTS (cont'd) Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Qil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
SAE 10 Delo 400
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 13813 NO BID $ 148.49 NO BID NO BID $ 109.45 NO BID
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 13814 NO BID $ 2,224.07 NO BID $ 958.96 [ $ 1,203.95 NO BID
SAE 30 Delo 400 Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Quart in Quart Container 1305 NO BID $ 13.94 NO BID NO BID $ 5.47 NO BID
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 1306 105.00 [ $ 146.99 NO BID NO BID $ 109.45 NO BID
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 1307 1,110.00( $ 2,010.00 NO BID $ 958.96 [ $ 1,203.95 NO BID
SAE 50 Heavy Duty Drive Train (Meets Cat’s TO-4 Specifications) Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 1352 99.25( $ 174.75 NO BID NO BID $ 214.50 NO BID
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 1353 1,01845| $ 2,120.33 NO BID $ 1,46421( $ 2,359.50 NO BID
Hydraulic Oil 1SO-46 (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-268-S) Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 1330 98.60 | $ 112.49 NO BID NO BID $ 253.00 NO BID
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 1331 898.30( $ 1,482.18 NO BID $ 905.83( $ 2,783.00 NO BID
Per Gallon in Bulk 1332 1764 $ 34.49 NO BID $ 1354] $ 32.45 NO BID
Hydraulic Oil AW 68 (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-286-S) Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 1359 95.71( $ 112.49 NO BID NO BID $ 316.25 NO BID
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 1360 989.30( $ 997.43 NO BID $ 905.83( $ 3,478.75 NO BID




Section 10.1: CHEVRON PRODUCTS (cont'd) Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Qil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
TDH Hydraulic/Tractor Fluid (Case MS-1207, John Deere J20C)
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 5352 $ 112.86 | $ 124.49 NO BID NO BID $ 126.50 NO BID
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 5353 $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,664.61 NO BID $ 1,019.44( $ 1,391.50 NO BID
Per Gallon in Bulk 5354 $ 16.32| $ 37.49 NO BID 14721 $ 25.30 NO BID
Grease Ultra-Duty EP2 Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 10, 140z Tubes 1380 $ 19550 | $ 64.49 NO BID NO BID $ 49.50 NO BID
Per 35# Container 1381 $ 19550 | $ 290.28 NO BID NO BID $ 173.25 NO BID
Per 120# Container 1382 $ 682.00( $ 885.87 NO BID NO BID $ 594.00 NO BID
Gear Oil 85-140 GL-5 Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers 15830 NO BID $ 173.99 NO BID NO BID $ 75.90 NO BID
Per 35# Container 1383 $ 232.00( $ 178.74 NO BID NO BID $ 221.38 NO BID
Gear Oil, Universal 85-140 GL-5 Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per 35# Container 13336 $ 232.00( $ 178.74 NO BID NO BID $ 287.79 NO BID




Section 10.2: MOBIL PRODUCTS Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Qil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
SAE 0W-20 — SP Mobil Special
Per Case of 12 Quart Containers NO BID $ 143.64| $ 84.58 NO BID $ 165.00 NO BID
SAE 0W-30 SP Mobil Special Lawson 3LUSA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quart Containers NO BID $ 195.00( $ 102.75 NO BID $ 165.00 NO BID
SAE 5W-20 — SP Mobil Special Lawson 3LUSA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quart Containers NO BID $ 143.64| $ 77.28 NO BID $ 92.27 NO BID
SAE 5W-30 — SP Mobil Special Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quart Containers NO BID $ 148.86| $ 77.28 NO BID $ 104.94 NO BID
SAE 10W-30 — SP Mobil Special Lawson 3LUSA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Per Case of 12 Quart Containers NO BID $ 125.10( $ 77.28 NO BID $ 224.40 NO BID
SAE 10W-30 — CK-4 Mobil Delvac 1300 Super Synthetic Blend Lawson 3LUSA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon jug NO BID $ 21.63| $ 28.49 NO BID $ 38.50 NO BID
Per Pail of 5 Gallons NO BID $ 178.92( $ 106.95 NO BID $ 192.50 NO BID
Per Drum of 55 Gallons $ 1,650.25( $ 1,389.65] $ 89155 $ 1,128.36[ $ 2,117.50 NO BID
SAE 10W-30 — Mobil Delvac Extreme Synthetic Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon jug NO BID $ 28.49]| $ 30.57 NO BID $ 32.95 NO BID
Per Pail of 5 Gallons NO BID $ 182.88( $ 147.69 NO BID $ 164.73 NO BID
Per Drum of 55 Gallons $ 1,781.25( $ 2,401.93| $ 1,325.50 NO BID $ 1,811.98 NO BID
SAE 15W-40 — CK-4 Mobil Delvac 1300 Super Synthetic Blend Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon jug NO BID $ 21.63| $ 28.49 NO BID $ 32.95 NO BID
Per Pail of 5 Gallons $ 121.05| $ 96.00] $ 106.95 NO BID $ 164.73 NO BID
Per Drum of 55 Gallons $ 1,058.25( $ 1,384.44] $ 89155 $ 1,052.90( $ 1,811.98 NO BID
SAE 15W-40 — Mobil Delvac Extreme Synthetic Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Houston. TX
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon jug NO BID $ 32.99( $ 30.57 NO BID $ 32.95 NO BID
Per Pail of 5 Gallons NO BID $ 154.50( $ 147.69 NO BID $ 164.73 NO BID
Per Drum of 55 Gallons $ 1,104.95 NO BID $ 1,32550( $ 1,490.68| $ 1,811.98 NO BID
SAE 10W - Mobiltrans HD Syn-Blend Lawson 3LUSA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons NO BID $ 220.10] $ 116.30 NO BID $ 214.50 NO BID
Per Drum of 55 Gallons NO BID $ 1,924.07] $ 1,114.02( $ 949.71( $ 2,359.50 NO BID




Section 10.2: MOBIL PRODUCTS (cont'd) Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
SAE 50 — Mobiltrans HD (Meets Cat TO-4 Specification)
Per Pail of 5 Gallons NO BID $ 275.13]| $ 126.82 NO BID $ 214.50 NO BID
Per Drum of 55 Gallons $ 1,058.75| $ 1,95441] $ 1,334.95( $ 1,46421( $ 2,359.50 NO BID
SAE 50 — MT-1 Mobil Delvac 1 Synthetic Trans Fluid (Eaton Roadranger PS-164 Rev 7) Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons $ 270.25| $ 493.76] $ 302.51 NO BID $ 357.50 NO BID
1SO 46 — Mobil Nuto H 46 Hydraulic Oil (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-268-S) Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons $ 78.05[ $ 22350] $ 107.40 NO BID $ 181.50 NO BID
Per Drum of 55 Gallons $ 77440 $ 1,809.50] $ 690.25| $ 905.83( $ 1,996.50 NO BID
AWG68 — Mobil Nuto H 68 Hydraulic Oil (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-268-S) Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons $ 78.05[ $ 356.78| $ 107.40 NO BID $ 235.95 NO BID
Per Drum of 55 Gallons $ 77440 $ 867.33]| $ 690.25| $ 905.83( $ 2,595.45 NO BID
UTF — GL-4 Mobilfluid 424 Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons $ 90.30( $ 202.31] $ 110.78 NO BID $ 203.50 NO BID
Per Drum of 55 Gallons $ 1,041.70( $ 2,01041] $ 810.15( $ 1019044 $ 2,238.50 NO BID
Per Gallon in Bulk NO BID NO BID $ 1358] $ 14721 $ 40.70 NO BID




Section 10.2: MOBIL PRODUCTS (cont'd) Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Grease NLGI GC-LB Mobil Centaur Moly2 Calcium Sulfate
Per Case of 10, 140z Tubes NO BID $ 98.93] $ 59.46 NO BID $ 101.75 NO BID
Per 35# Container NO BID $ 323.07] $ 245.14 NO BID $ 356.13 NO BID
Per 120# Container NO BID $ 758.70| $ 795.38 NO BID $ 1,221.00 NO BID
Gear Oil 80W-90 GL-5 Mobilube HD Plus Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers NO BID $ 150.62( $ 101.43 NO BID $ 168.30 NO BID
Per 35# Container $ 148.20 | $ 125.99( $ 179.71 NO BID $ 490.88 NO BID
Gear Oil 85W-140 GL-5 Mobilube HD Plus Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers NO BID $ 279.45| $ 102.18 NO BID $ 168.30 NO BID
Per 35# Container $ 164.50| $ 122.99( $ 194.78 NO BID $ 490.88 NO BID
Synthetic Gear Oil 75W-90 Mobil 1 Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers NO BID $ 202.17] $ 139.68 NO BID $ 214.50 NO BID
Per 35# Container NO BID $ 284.99] $ 321.55 NO BID $ 625.63 NO BID
Synthetic Gear Oil 75W-140 Mobil 1 Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers NO BID $ 343.28] $ 1901.46 NO BID $ 320.10 NO BID
Per 35# Container NO BID $ 449.99 NO BID NO BID $ 933.63 NO BID




Section 10.3: ANTIFREEZE
Subsection 10.3.1

Multi-Vehicle Antifreeze, concentrated Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below ¥ Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.

HD ELC 50/50 Red Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle 15831 $ 17.60| $ 2295 $ 12.90 NO BID $ 12.65] $ 12.13
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 15832 $ 901.40( $ 1,879.50] $ 639.10 674.06 [ $ 695.75[ $ 575.00

Subsection 10.3.2
Multi-Vehicle Antifreeze, ready-to-use Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below ¥ Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.

Peak Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle 9032 $ 1850 $ 28.49( $ 10.35 NO BID $ 1045| $ 12.13
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 15772 $ 76130 $ 1,059.27] $ 464.75 470.01( $ 574.75( $ 575.00




Section 10.4: GENERIC
Subsection 10.4.1 Chevron Products or Equal to

SAE 10W30 CJ-4/SM Delo 400 XLE Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Qil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below WV Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Moffitt Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quart Containers 14320 NO BID $ 97.49 NO BID NO BID $ 120.12] $ 52.90
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle 13822 39.00( $ 51.74 NO BID NO BID $ 40.92( $ 17.25
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 13823 125.00| $ 148.34 NO BID NO BID $ 20460( $ 80.50
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 13824 120324 $ 1,983.44 NO BID $ 1,128.36( $ 2,250.60] $ 891.25
SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 Delo 400 Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Vv Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Moffitt & SPECOIL HD 15/40 Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quart Containers 15833 NO BID $ 97.49 NO BID NO BID $ 136.40| $ 52.90
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 15834 82.25| $ 148.34 NO BID NO BID $ 165.00| $ 80.50
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 13835 82530 $ 1,385.81 NO BID $ 1,052.90 $ 1,815.00 $ 891.25
Per Gallon in Bulk 15836 12.95| $ 30.74 NO BID $ 1545( $ 25.96] $ 12.53
SAE 30 Delo 400 Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Qil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below ¥ Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Moffitt Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quart Containers 14321 NO BID $ 96.57 NO BID NO BID $ 136.40| $ 51.75
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 14103 124.30| $ 146.99 NO BID NO BID $ 165.00| $ 75.00
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 14104 1,153.23( $ 1,691.67 NO BID $ 958.96 [ $ 1,815.00( $ 822.25
SAE 50 Heavy Duty Drive Train (Meets Cat’s requiring TO-4 Fluids) Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
List brand below WV Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Moffitt Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 13360 11024 $ 114.32 NO BID NO BID $ 171.60| $ 80.50
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 13361 1,070.00 | $ 1,269.60 NO BID $ 1,46421( $ 1,887.60( $ 891.25
Hydraulic Oil 1SO-46 (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-268-S) Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Qil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below ¥ Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
SPECOIL AW 46 & Moffitt Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 15837 58.80( $ 149.99 NO BID NO BID $ 20240 $ 59.80
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 15838 662.14| $ 1,554.93 NO BID $ 905.83( $ 2,145.00] $ 626.75
Per Gallon in Bulk 15839 9.85| $ 74.28 NO BID $ 1354] $ 2,090.00] $ 9.37




Subsection 10.4.1 Chevron Products or Equal to (cont'd)

Hydraulic Oil AW 68 (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-286-S) Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Qil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below ¥ Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.

SPECOIL AW 68 & Moffitt Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 15840 $ 58.80( $ 155.69 NO BID NO BID $ 253.00( $ 59.80
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 15841 $ 662.14| $ 1,647.00 NO BID 905.83[ $ 2,783.00] $ 626.75
TDH Hydraulic/Tractor Fluid (Case MS-1207, John Deere J20C) Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Qil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below ¥ Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.

SPECOIL UNIVERSAL HYD TRANS Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 15842 $ 66.40( $ 150.77 NO BID NO BID $ 101.20] $ 73.60
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 15843 $ 62050 $ 1,566.00 NO BID $ 1,01944( $ 1,113.20( $ 776.25
Per Gallon in Bulk 15844 $ 10.27| $ 33.99 NO BID 14721 $ 20.24( $ 11.90
Grease Ultra-Duty EP2 Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below WV Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.

Thrive Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 10, 140z Tubes 15782 $ 168.35| $ 64.49 NO BID NO BID $ 39.60( $ 55.20
Per 35# Container 15783 $ 160.35| $ 229.73 NO BID NO BID $ 138.60| $ 215.00
Per 120# Container 15784 $ 583.99( $ 704.43 NO BID NO BID $ 47520 $ 837.00
Gear Oil 85-140 GL-5 Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below WV Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.

Moffitt Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per 35# Container 15785 $ 100.35]| $ 285.74 NO BID NO BID $ 17710 $ 82.80
Gear Oil, Universal 85-140 GL-5 Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below WV Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.

Moffitt Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per 35# Container 15786 $ 100.35] $ 179.85 NO BID NO BID $ 230.23[ $ 82.80




Subsection 10.4.2: Mobil Products or Equal to

SAE 0W-20 — SP Mobil Special Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Moffitt Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers NO BID $ 199.50( $ 84.58 NO BID $ 132.00] $ 74.75
SAE 0W-30 SP Mobil Special Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Moffitt Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers NO BID $ 199.17| $ 102.75 NO BID $ 132.00| $ 82.80
SAE 5W-20 — SP Mobil Special Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Moffitt Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers NO BID $ 143.64( $ 77.28 NO BID $ 7381 $ 51.75
SAE 5W-30 - SP Mobil Special Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Qil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Moffitt Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers NO BID $ 148.86| $ 77.28 NO BID $ 83.95| $ 51.75
SAE 10W-30 — SP Mobil Special Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Moffitt Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers NO BID $ 175.50| $ 77.28 NO BID $ 179.52| $ 51.75
SAE 10W-30 — CK-4 Mobil Delvac 1300 Super Synthetic Blend Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Mobil & Moffitt Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon jug $ 4426 $ 43.49] $ 28.49 NO BID $ 30.80( $ 73.60
Per Pail of 5 Gallons $ 127341 $ 158.24( $ 106.95 NO BID $ 154.00] $ 80.50
Per Drum of 55 Gallons $ 1,255.24( $ 1,378.80] $ 89155 $ 1,052.90( $ 1,694.00( $ 891.25
SAE 10W-30 — Mobil Delvac Extreme Synthetic Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Qil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Thrive & Moffitt Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon jug NO BID $ 43.49] $ 30.57 NO BID $ 26.36[ $ 73.60
Per Pail of 5 Gallons NO BID $ 218.97] $ 147.69 NO BID $ 131.78] $ 80.50
Per Drum of 55 Gallons $ 152371 $ 1,873.58| $ 1,325.50 NO BID $ 1,452.00( $ 891.25




Subsection 10.4.2: Mobil Products or Equal to (cont'd)

SAE 15W-40 — CK-4 Mobil Delvac 1300 Super Synthetic Blend Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Qil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.

Thrive & Moffitt Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon jug 20.38( $ 44.99] $ 28.49 NO BID $ 26.36[ $ 73.60
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 112.00| $ 134.99( $ 106.95 NO BID $ 13178 $ 80.50
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 1,165.85( $ 1,04850] $ 89155( $ 1,052.90( $ 1,452.00( $ 891.25
SAE 15W-40 — Mobil Delvac Extreme Synthetic Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.

Thrive & Moffitt Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon jug NO BID $ 33.71( $ 30.57 NO BID $ 26.36| $ 73.60
Per Pail of 5 Gallons NO BID $ 154.50( $ 147.69 NO BID $ 131.78] $ 80.50
Per Drum of 55 Gallons NO BID $ 1,374.32] $ 1,32550( $ 1,467.93[ $ 145750 $ 891.25
SAE 10W - Mobiltrans HD Syn-Blend Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Qil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Moffitt Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 110.32| $ 323.13]| $ 116.30 NO BID $ 17160 $ 86.25
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 1,193.20( $ 1,924.07] $ 1,114.02( $ 939.71( $ 1,892.00( $ 851.00
SAE 50 — Mobiltrans HD (Meets Cat TO-4 Specification) Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP | Q Environmental, [ The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Moffitt Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 99.25( $ 275.13]| $ 126.82 NO BID $ 17050| $ 80.50
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 1,01845( $ 1,24850] $ 1,334.95[ $ 1,46421( $ 1,897.50( $ 891.25
SAE 50 — MT-1 Mobil Delvac 1 Synthetic Trans Fluid (Eaton Roadranger PS-164 Rev 7] Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Qil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Sinopec Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons NO BID $ 200.70] $ 302.51 NO BID $ 28050 $ 1,178.75
1SO 46 — Mobil Nuto H 46 Hydraulic Oil (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-268-S) Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
SPECOIL AW 46 & Moffitt Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 58.50( $ 136.71( $ 107.40 NO BID $ 14520] $ 59.80
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 662.14 [ $ 1,308.42| $ 690.25( $ 905.83[ $ 153450 $ 626.75
AWG68 — Mobil Nuto H 68 Hydraulic Qil (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-268-S) Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Qil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
SPECOIL AW 68 & Moffitt Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 58.50( $ 136.71] $ 107.40 NO BID $ 185.90| $ 59.80
Per Drum of 55 Gallons 662.14 [ $ 1,308.42] $ 690.25[ $ 905.83[ $ 1,969.00 | $ 626.75




Subsection 10.4.2: Mobil Products or Equal to (cont'd)

UTF — GL-4 Mobilfluid 424 Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Qil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Moffitt Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Pail of 5 Gallons $ 95.00( $ 211.32] $ 110.78 NO BID $ 162.80| $ 73.60
Per Drum of 55 Gallons $ 1,144.00( $ 2,129.09] $ 810.15( $ 1,01944( $ 1,790.80( $ 776.25
Per Gallon in Bulk $ 16.32 NO BID $ 1358] $ 14721 $ 32.56( $ 11.90
Grease NLGI GC-LB Mobil Centaur Moly2 Calcium Sulfate Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.

Mobil & CASTROL CONTRACTORS SPECIAL 3% MOLY Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 10, 140z Tubes $ 7050 $ 97.80( $ 59.46 NO BID $ 81.40( $ 59.80
Per 35# Container $ 198.65| $ 321.35] $ 245.14 NO BID $ 28490 $ 247.25
Per 120# Container $ 72056 | $ 758.70] $ 795.38 NO BID $ 976.80| $ 862.50
Gear Oil 80W-90 GL-5 Mobilube HD Plus Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Qil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Moffitt Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers NO BID $ 270.87] $ 101.43 NO BID $ 134.64| $ 60.95
Per 35# Container $ 106.55| $ 203.81] $ 179.71 NO BID $ 39270 $ 82.80
Gear Oil 85W-140 GL-5 Mobilube HD Plus Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Moffitt Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers NO BID $ 173.99( $ 102.18 NO BID $ 134.64| $ 60.95
Per 35# Container $ 106.55| $ 122.99( $ 194.78 NO BID $ 392.70| $ 82.80
Synthetic Gear Oil 75W-90 Mobil 1 Lawson 3L USA, LLC | Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Qil, LP | Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Moffitt Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers NO BID $ 173.99( $ 139.68 NO BID $ 171.60| $ 86.25
Per 35# Container $ 205.20| $ 448.49] $ 321.55 NO BID $ 50050 $ 120.75
Synthetic Gear Oil 75W-140 Mobil 1 Lawson 3L USA, LLC Atlantic Petroleum Brenntag Midtex Oil, LP Q Environmental, | The Plaza Group,
List brand below Number Houston, TX & Mineral Lubricants, LLC Conroe, TX Inc. Inc.
Moffitt Resources, Inc Houston, TX Houston, TX Houston, TX
Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers NO BID $ 238.88] $ 191.46 NO BID $ 256.08| $ 97.75
Per 35# Container NO BID $ 235.47 NO BID NO BID $ 74690 $ 135.70

*Sun Coast Resources: Disqualified due to altering terms and conditions




	Sheet1

