Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 23-048
Helicopter Sustainment Part 2 for Homeland Security and Emergency Management

Recommendation: low bidder per section

Funding: Homeland Security Grant Program/SWAT/Helicopter Sustainment

Description

Quantity

ATYViro Tech Inc.
Missouri City, TX

Luminator Holding L.P.
dba
Luminator Aerospace
Plano, TX

RAMS Aviation Company
Inc.
Plantersville, TX

Helicopter Services, Inc.
Spring, TX

Temple Electronics
Company, Inc.
Arcola, TX

Unit Price

Extended
Total

Unit Price

Extended
Total

Unit Price

Extended
Total

Unit Price

Extended
Total

Unit Price

Extended
Total

11.1 Orion Searchlights, 2 each,
HSL.1600.BA.1 with IR

136,470.76

$136,470.76

$ 156,917.99

$ 156,917.99

$ 116,000.00

$ 116,000.00

Grand Total of Section 11.1 Searchlights

$136,470.76

$ 156,917.99

$ 116,000.00

No Bid

No Bid

11.2 Installation

11.2.1.1 Install one (1) Orion
Spotlight only in Helicopter
N218FB. There is no current
spotlight. Needs Dovetail

and bottom mount

No Bid

$ 9,360.00

§ 9,360.00

No Bid

$  9,000.00

$ 9,000.00

$ 18,250.00

$ 18,250.00

11.2.1.2 Remove current
Spectrolab spotlight and all
wiring. Install one (1) new Orion
Spotlight in Helicopter N259FB
(use existing dovetail and bottom
mount)

No Bid

$  6,000.00

§  6,000.00

No Bid

$ 9,000.00

$ 9,000.00

$ 23,800.00

$ 23,800.00

11.2.2 Install one (1) Vislink,
64HDX-5-NOMPEG2-NOIP-B3-
NA-HDS-LPA-HDX-RC1-NV
Downlink Transmitter in rear cargo
area and controller in front control
panel

No Bid

$§  5,760.00

§ 5,760.00

No Bid

$ 13,500.00

$ 13,500.00

§ 9,625.00

§ 9,625.00

11.2.3 Remove all wiring from
helicopter N259FB, ARS600C and
install one (1) Shotover ARS-750U
in dash (consists of two (2)
modules per helicopter) for use
with Wescam MX-10

No Bid

$ 8,400.00

$ 8,400.00

No Bid

$ 13,500.00

$ 13,500.00

$ 14,750.00

§ 14,750.00




Description

Quantity

ATViro Tech Inc.
Missouri City, TX

Helicopter Services, Inc.
Spring, TX

Luminator Holding L.P.

Luminator Aerospace
Plano, TX

RAMS Aviation Company
Inc.
Plantersville, TX

Temple Electronics
Company, Inc.
Arcola, TX

Unit Price

Extended
Total

Unit Price

Extended
Total

Unit Price

Extended
Total

Unit Price

Extended
Total

Unit Price

Extended
Total

11.2 Installation (cont'd)

11.2.4 Remove current monitor
(bracket remains) and install one
(1) new Macro-Blue MB12W
Monitor and rewire for SDI input
from ARS750 computers

No Bid

$ 4,800.00

§ 4,800.00

No Bid

$  7,500.00

$  7,500.00

§ 1,000.00

§ 1,000.00

11.2.5 Remove current gauge
clusters and install two (2) new
sets of Electronics International
CGR-30C Cluster Gauge
Replacements one (1) in each of
two (2) helicopters to fit in both
dashes

No Bid

$  2,400.00

$  4,800.00

No Bid

$  3,000.00

$  6,000.00

$§ 11,564.00

$ 23,128.00

11.2.6 Installation only of two (2)
sets of two (2) Powersonix 600
Watt Dual Horn Part # PSAIR22A
in rear cargo area with rear door
modifications for the speakers

No Bid

$§  8,160.00

§ 16,320.00

No Bid

$ 3,000.00

$  6,000.00

§ 14,000.00

§ 28,000.00

Grand Total of Section 11.2 Installation

No Bid

$ 55,440.00

No Bid

$ 64,500.00

$118,553.00




	Detail Pricing

