
Unit Price Extended 
Total

Unit Price Extended 
Total

Unit Price Extended 
Total

10.1  Vislink, 64HDX-5-NOMPEG2-NOIP-
B3-NA-HDS-LPA-HDX-RC1-NV Downlink 
Transmitter

1 $70,894.45 $70,894.45 $60,000.00 $60,000.00

Grand Total of Section 10.1 $70,894.48 $60,000.00

10.2  Orion Searchlights, HSL.1600.BA.1 
with IR
Grand Total of Section 10.2

10.3  Shotover ARS-750U 1 $58,555.55 $58,555.55

Grand Total of Section 10.3 $58,555.55

10.4  Macro-Blue MB12W Monitor 1 $17,955.00 $17,955.00

Grand Total of Section 10.4 $17,955.00

10.5  START PAC Model 3328 Special 
(110V)

1 $8,094.67 $8,094.67

Grand Total of Section 10.5 $8,094.67

10.6  Electronics International CGR-30C 
Cluster Gauge Replacements 

1 $6,686.67 $6,686.67 $8,128.00 $8,128.00

Grand Total of Section 10.6 $6,686.67 $8,128.00

10.7  Powersonix 600 watt dual horn Part # 
PSAIR22A

1 $53,255.73 $53,255.73

Grand Total of Section 10.7 $53,255.73

10.8 Installation Item removed

Churchill Navigation, Inc., Macro Blue Inc., and Luminator Holding - Disqualified due to not providing addendum #1 pricing sheets.

No Bid

No Bid

Item removed

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Helicopter Services, Inc.              
Spring, TX

Quantity Temple Electronics 
Company, Inc.                 

Arcola, TX

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 23-037

Helicopter Sustainment Project for Homeland Security and Emergency Management

Recommendation:  Remove and rebid Sections 10.2 and 10.8 due to revisions to specifications and                                                                                           
award remaining to low bidder per Section

Funding:  Homeland Security Grant Program/SWAT/Helicopter Sustainment

Description Vislink LLC                    
Mt. Olive, NJ
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