
Herbicides
Item #1: 2, 4-D Amine Full Aquatic 
Label,                                                      
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

2.5 gallon container  No Bid $24.85  No Bid $28.50 $18.49 $24.50 
minimum order 2.5 gal 25 gal  2.5 gal 
returnable No No  No 
30 gallon container  No Bid $24.00  No Bid $28.50 $18.49 $25.60 
minimum order 1 drum 30 gal  30 gal 
returnable No No  No 
270 gallon container  No Bid $23.85  No Bid $27.75 $18.49 $23.20 
minimum order 1 tote 265 gal  270 gal 
returnable No Yes  No 

Item #2: Arsenal EUP, Habitat, 
Polaris (Aquatic),                                         
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

2.5 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $71.77 $67.00 $84.50 
minimum order 5 gal  2.5 gal 
returnable No  No 
5 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $67.00 $84.50 
minimum order  5 gal 
returnable
15 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $67.00  No Bid 
minimum order
returnable
30 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $67.00  No Bid 
minimum order
returnable
250 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $67.00  No Bid 
minimum order
returnable
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Term Contract for Purchase of Weed, Brush and Insect Control Chemicals

Term:  April 1, 2023 through March 31, 2024

Recommendation:  Lowest Bidder per item



Item #3: Dupont Oust Extra,                                                        
price per pound                                                                                   

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

4 pound container  No Bid $32.89  No Bid $36.00 $28.05 $53.00 
minimum order 4 lbs 4 lbs  4 lbs 
12 pound container  No Bid $32.89  No Bid  No Bid $28.05  No Bid 
minimum order 12 lb
25 pound container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $28.05  No Bid 
minimum order

Item #4: Escort,                                                    
price per Ounce                                                                                    

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

1 oz. container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $2.09  No Bid 
minimum order
8 oz. container  No Bid $2.98  No Bid $3.75 $2.09  No Bid 
minimum order 1 bottle 1 case
16 oz. container  No Bid $2.98  No Bid $3.75 $2.09 $6.10 
minimum order 1 bottle 1 case  16 oz 
64 oz. container  No Bid $2.88  No Bid  No Bid $2.09  No Bid 
minimum order 1 bottle

Item #5: Garlon 3A,                                                          
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

2.5 gallon container  No Bid $62.00  No Bid $62.75 $45.09 $86.50 
minimum order 2.5 gal 20 gal  2.5 gal 
returnable No No  No 
5 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $45.09 $86.50 
minimum order  5 gal 
returnable  No 
30 gallon container  No Bid $62.00  No Bid $57.25 $45.09  No Bid 
minimum order 1 drum 30 gal
returnable No No



Item #6: Garlon 4 Ultra,                                                            
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

2.5 gallon container  No Bid $76.75  No Bid $80.50 $54.09 $111.50 
minimum order 2.5 gal 20 gal  2.5 gal 
returnable No No  No 

Item #7:  Glyphosate 41%+14% 
Surfactant,                                                   
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

2.5 gallon container  No Bid $23.45  No Bid $27.25 $18.24 $33.60 
minimum order  2.5 gal 20 gal  2.5 gal 
returnable  No No  No 
Brand Bid  Credit 41 Extra Ranger Pro Credit 41 Extra  Ranger Pro 
5 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $18.24 $33.60 
minimum order  5 gal 
returnable  No 
Brand Bid Credit 41 Extra  Ranger Pro 
30 gallon container  No Bid $23.20  No Bid $25.40 $18.24 $30.56 
minimum order  1 drum 30 gal  30 gal 
returnable  No No  No  
Brand Bid  Credit 41 Extra Ranger Pro Credit 41 Extra  Ranger Pro 
275 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $24.45 $18.24  No Bid 
minimum order 265 gal
returnable Yes
Brand Bid Ranger Pro Credit 41 Extra
265 gallon container  No Bid $23.00  No Bid  No Bid $18.24 $29.39 
minimum order  1 tote  265 gal 
returnable  No  No  
Brand Bid  Credit 41 Extra Credit 41 Extra  Ranger Pro 



Item #8: MSMA 6 Plus 47.60% 
Active,
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

2.5 gallon container  No Bid $36.98  No Bid $36.80 $29.00 $34.00 
minimum order 2.5 gal 20 gal  5 gal 
returnable No No  No 

Item #9:  Milestone VM,                                                   
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

2.5 gallon container  No Bid $325.00  No Bid $325.00 $325.00 $325.00 
minimum order 2.5 gal 2.5 gal  2.5 gal 
returnable No No  No 

Item #10:  Outrider,
price per ounce                                                                                   

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

20 oz. container  No Bid $14.89  No Bid $300.00 $15.01  No Bid 
minimum order 1 bottle 1 container

Item #11:  Pro-Mate Accuracy 
30%,
price per quart

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

1 quart container  No Bid $13.48  No Bid $11.00 $23.00  No Bid 
minimum order 1 quart 1 case
returnable No/ Bidding Elite Secure 

Ultra
No



Item #12:  Rodeo Herbicide,                                                                          
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

2.5 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $33.10 $35.99 $54.86 
minimum order 20 gal  2.5 gal 
returnable No  No 

Item #13: Roundup Pro 
Concentrate 50.2% 
Isopropylamine Salt of Glyphosate-
complete with performance 
technology surfactant,             price 
per gallon       

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

2.5 gallon container  No Bid $32.98  No Bid $30.20 $31.95 $41.02 
minimum order 2.5 gal 20 gal  2.5 gal 
returnable No No  No 
30 gallon container  No Bid $32.45  No Bid $27.75 $31.95 $38.02 
minimum order  1 drum 30 gal  30 gal 
returnable  No No  No 

Item #14: Surfactant: Nonionic 
Surfactant Load: 70% HLB Ratio: 
12, Antifoam Index: 3,                   
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

1 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $19.50 $18.99  No Bid 
minimum order  1 case 
returnable  No 
2.5 gallon container  No Bid $34.28  No Bid $19.50 $18.99  No Bid 
minimum order 2.5 gal 1 case
returnable No/Bidding Elite 

Platinum
No

30 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $18.99  No Bid 
minimum order
returnable
Brand Bid Inlet LI 700



Item #15: Surfactant: Nonionic 
Active Ingredient 96% Poly-1-P-
Menthene,
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

2.5 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $11.99  No Bid 
minimum order
returnable
Brand Bid MSO

Item #16: Tordon 22K,                                                                   
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

2.5 gallon container  No Bid $65.48  No Bid $75.40 $70.00  No Bid 
minimum order 2.5 gal 5 gal
returnable No No
5 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $70.00  No Bid 
minimum order
returnable
30 gallon container  No Bid $65.00  No Bid $75.40 $70.00  No Bid 
minimum order 1 drum  30 gal 
returnable No  No 
250 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $70.00  No Bid 
minimum order
returnable

Item #17:  Opensight by Dow 
AgroScience,
price per ounce                                            

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

20 oz bottle container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $120.938 $5.940 $6.047 
minimum order 1 case 20 oz
Brand Bid Opensight Opensight
1.25 pound container  No Bid $96.75  No Bid $120.938 $5.940 $6.047 
minimum order 1 bottle 1 case 1.25 lbs
Brand Bid Opensight Opensight Opensight
10 pound container  No Bid $96.75  No Bid  No Bid $5.940  No Bid 
minimum order 1 bottle
Brand Bid  Opensight  Opensight 



Item #18:  DLZ-MSO Surfactant 
Plus Drift, No Subs
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

2.5 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $23.40  No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order 1 case
returnable No

Item #19:  Hardball, 2,4-D Acid, 
No Subs
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

2.5 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $39.50  No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order 20 gal
returnable No
30 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $39.50  No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order 30 gal
returnable No

Item #20:  Plateau,                                                 
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

1 gallon container  No Bid $128.48  No Bid $123.00 $104.99  No Bid 
minimum order 1 gal 1 case
returnable No No

Item #21:  Droplex Xtra,  No Subs                                                                                         
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

2.5 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid   No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order
returnable



Item #22:  Vastlan,                                                  
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

2.5 gallon container  No Bid $102.00  No Bid $102.00 $102.00 $102.00 
minimum order  2.5 gal  2.5 gal 
30 gallon container  No Bid $102.00  No Bid $102.00 $102.00  No Bid 
minimum order 1 drum 30 gal
returnable No No  No 

Item #23:  Trycera Selective 
Herbicide,  No Subs
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

2.5 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $90.00  No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order 1 case
returnable No
265 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $83.00  No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order 265 gal
returnable Yes

Item #24:  Dow Frequency, 
Bareground Herbicide,
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

1 gallon container  No Bid $625.00  No Bid  No Bid $650.00  No Bid 
minimum order 1 gal
returnable No

Item #25:  AquaKing Plus, 95% 
Active Spreaded-Activator with 
Buffering Agents for Aquatic Use,                                                                    
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

2.5 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid   No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order
returnable



Item #26:  Turbulance, Surfactant, 
Crop Oil Concentrate,
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

2.5 gallon container  No Bid $34.68  No Bid  No Bid  $19.09  No Bid 
minimum order 2.5 gal
returnable No/ Bidding Elite 

Pinnacle

Item #27:  Roundup Custom                                                                
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

2.5 gallon container  No Bid $28.95  No Bid $33.10 $36.00 $44.90 
minimum order 2.5 gal 20 gal  2.5 gal 
Brand Bid Aquaneat Roundup Custom  Roundup Custom 
returnable No No  No 

Item #28:  Method 240SL,                                               
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

2.5 gallon container  No Bid $343.04  No Bid $343.04 $343.04 $343.04 
minimum order 2.5 gal 1 case  2.5 gal 
20 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $343.04  No Bid 
minimum order
Brand Bid Method 240SL  Method 240 SL 

Item #29:  Derigo (by Bayer 
Environmental Science),
price per ounce

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

60 ounce container  No Bid $9.45  No Bid $9.00 $9.00 $9.45 
minimum order 60 oz bottle 1 case  60 oz 
Brand Bid Derigo Derigo  Derigo 



Item #30:  Telar XP (by Bayer 
Environmental Science),
price per ounce

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

16 ounce container  No Bid $14.68  No Bid $14.50 $17.44 $22.35 
minimum order 16 oz bottle 1 case  8 oz 
Brand Bid Telar XP Telar XP Telar XP  Telar XP 

Item #31:  EcoMIGHT
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

1 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order
2.5 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order
55 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order
Brand Bid

Item #32:  1% Solution, Drift 
Control Agent,                                               
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

1 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $18.95/qt  No Bid 
minimum order
returnable
2.5 gallon container  No Bid $13.48  No Bid  No Bid  $18.95/qt  No Bid 
minimum order  2.5 gal 
returnable  No 

Item #33:  Droplex, Deposition Aid 
and Drift Control Agent,                    
price per gallon
A387

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

1 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid   No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order
returnable



Item #34:  Liberate by Loveland 
Products, Inc.,                                             
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

2.5 gallon container  No Bid $39.95  No Bid  No Bid  $20.00  No Bid 
minimum order 2.5 gal
returnable No/Bidding RRSI 

Enhance

Item #35:  Esplanade, No Subs                                             
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

1 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $395.54 $1,437.44  No Bid 
minimum order per Quart
returnable No
2.5 gallon container  No Bid $1,437.44  No Bid $1,437.44 $1,437.44 $1,437.44 
minimum order 2.5 gal 1 case  2.5 gal 
returnable No No  No 

Item #36:  TerraVue, No Subs                                             
price per ounce                                                                                 

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

20 ounce container  No Bid $100.00  No Bid $6.25 $6.25  No Bid 
minimum order 1 bottle 1 case
returnable No No
10 pound  container  No Bid $100.00  No Bid $6.25 $6.25 $6.405 
minimum order 1 bottle 1 case  $4.4 lbs 
returnable No No  No 



Insecticides
Item #37: Altosid Briquettes 
(Mosquito Larvicide and 
Pupicide),          price per case                                    

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

1 case/400  No Bid  No Bid $520.00  No Bid   No Bid $520.00 
minimum order  1 case  1 case 

Item #38: Altosid XR (Mosquito 
Larvicide and Pupicide),
price per carton

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

1 case/220  No Bid  No Bid $818.40  No Bid   No Bid $818.40 
minimum order  1 case  1 case 

Item #39: Big Foot Dye SS,                                                  
price per quart

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

1 quart container  No Bid $12.95  No Bid  No Bid   No Bid $16.50 
minimum order  12 quarts 



Item #40: Evoluer 4-4 ULV 
(Permethrin 4% Piperonyl 
Butoxide 4%) or equivalent,                                              
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

2.5 gallon container $40.15  No Bid  $73.40  No Bid   No Bid  $31.00 
minimum order 5 gallon pail  2, 2.5 gal jug  2.5 gal 
returnable No  No  No 
Brand Bid PermaSease 4-4  Perm- X UL 4-4  Perm- X UL 4-4 
5 gallon container $40.15  No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid  $31.00 
minimum order 5 gallon pail  5 GAL 
returnable No  No 
Brand Bid PermaSease 4-4  Perm- X UL 4-4 
15 gallon container  No Bid   No Bid   No Bid  No Bid   No Bid   No Bid 
minimum order
returnable
Brand Bid
30 gallon container  No Bid   No Bid  $743.10  No Bid   No Bid  $28.80 
minimum order  1, 30 gal drum  30 GAL 
returnable  No  No 
Brand Bid  Perm- X UL 4-4  Perm- X UL 4-4 
55 gallon container $40.61  No Bid  $1,357.90  No Bid   No Bid  $26.00 
minimum order 55 gallon drum  55 gal 
returnable No  No  No 
Brand Bid PermaSease 4-4  Perm- X UL 4-4  Perm- X UL 4-4 
250 gallon container  No Bid   No Bid   No Bid  No Bid   No Bid   No Bid  
minimum order
returnable
Brand Bid
275 gallon container $36.55  No Bid  $6,506.50  No Bid   No Bid  $26.50 
minimum order 275 gallon tote  1, 275 gal tote  275 gal 
returnable No  No   Yes 
Brand Bid PermaSease 4-4  Perm- X UL 4-4  Perm- X UL 4-4 



Item #41: Mosquitomist One ULV                                                               
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

30 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid $3,076.50  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order  1, 30 gal drum 
returnable  Yes 
55 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid $5,706.80  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order  1 , 55 gal drum 
returnable  Yes 
275 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid $26,917.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order  1, 275 gal tote 
returnable  Yes 

Item #42: PyreNone 25-5 
(Pyrethrins 5% Piperonyl 
Butoxide 25%),  price per gallon                                                                         

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

2.5 gallon container  No bid  No bid  No bid  No bid  No bid  No Bid 
minimum order
returnable
5 gallon container $275.00  No bid  No bid  No bid  No bid $243.00 
minimum order 5 gallon pail  5 gal 
returnable  No 
30 gallon container  No bid  No bid $10,082.88  No bid  No bid $240.00 
minimum order  1, 30 gal drum  30 gal 
returnable  No   No 
55 gallon container $265.00  No bid $17,874.12  No bid  No bid $226.00 
minimum order 55 gallon drum  1, 55 gal drum  55 gal 
returnable  Yes  No 



Item #43 Duet by Clarke Mosquito 
Control,                                              
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

2.5 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid $524.26  No Bid  No Bid $254.00 
minimum order  1, 2.5 gal jug  2.5 gal 
returnable  No  No 
Brand Bid  Duet  DeltaGard / Imperium 
5 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $254.00 
minimum order  5 gal 
returnable  No  
Brand Bid  DeltaGard / Imperium 
30 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid $6,143.04  No Bid  No Bid $249.00 
minimum order  1, 30 gal drum  30 gal 
returnable  Yes  Yes 
Brand Bid  Duet  DeltaGard / Imperium 
55 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid $10,780.44  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order  1, 55 gal drum 
returnable  Yes 
Brand Bid  Duet 
275 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid $53,642.60  No Bid  No Bid $247.00 
minimum order  1, 275 gal tote  250 gal 
returnable  Yes  Yes 
Brand Bid  Duet  DeltaGard / Imperium 

Item #44:  Mosquito Master 4-12,                                                           
price per gallon

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

30 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid $2,191.68  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order  1, 30 gal drum 
55 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid $4,049.32  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order  1, 55 gal drum 
275 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid $20,596.40  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order  1, 275 gal tote 

Item #45:  Natular DT Tablet 
Residential, 600/case,                               
price per case                                   

Adapco LLC.                                  
Lake Mary, FL

Red River Specialties 
LLC   dba   Azelis 

A&ES  Shreveport, LA

 Clarke Mosquito 
Control Products, Inc.                                

St. Charles, IL 

Marubeni America 
Corporation                                   

dba
Helena Agri-

Enterprises, LLC                                
Waller, TX

Nutrien Ag Solutions    
Houston, TX

 Rentokil North 
America dba                                                     

Target Specialty 
Products  Houston, TX 

600 tablet case  No Bid  No Bid $361.00  No Bid   No Bid $646.10 
minimum order  1 case  1 case (SumiLarv WSP) 


	Tabulation

