Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 23-028
Term Contract for Purchase and Hauling of Chemical Road Materials

Term: April 1, 2023 through March 31, 2024

Recommendation: All Bidders Meeting Specifications

CRS-2, Cationic Emulsion, Rapid Setting, THD #300 (price per gallon)

Delivery Points, Fees, and Cleveland Asphalt Martin Product Sales, P Squared Emulsion
Minimum Quantity Products Inc. LLC Plants, LLC
Shepherd, TX dba Elm Mott, TX
Martin Asphalt Co.
Houston, TX
Minimum Gallon Quantity 5000 Gallons 5500 Gallons No Bid
Rosenberg $2.74 $2.64
Crabhb $2.74 $2.64
Fresno $2.74 $2.64
Needville $2.74 $2.64
Richmond $2.74 $2.64
Plant $2.60 $2.50
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
each add'l mile
Restocking Fee 1/2 freight if delivery is
returned
Laydown Charge
Demurrage Charge $80.00/hr after 2 free $70.00/hr after 2 free
hours hours
Plant Location 100 Asphalt Lane, 300 ChristyPL, South
Shepherd, TX 77371 Houston, TX

Prime Seal/Dust Control (price per gallon)

Fees and Minimum Cleveland Asphalt Martin Product Sales, P Squared Emulsion
Quantity Products Inc. LLC Plants, LLC
Shepherd, TX dba Elm Mott, TX
Martin Asphalt Co.
Houston, TX
Undiluted Delivered $2.74 No Bid $2.24
Diluted 12:1 Delivered $1.60 $1.97
Minimum Gallon Quantity 5000 Gallons 5000 Gallons
Demurrage Charge $80.00/hr after 2 free $80.00/hr after 2 free
hours hours




SS-1 Emulsion used for dust control (price per gallon)

Delivery Points, Fees, and

Cleveland Asphalt

Martin Product Sales,

P Squared Emulsion

Minimum Quantity Products Inc. LLC Plants, LLC
Shepherd, TX dba Elm Mott, TX
Martin Asphalt Co.
Houston, TX
Minimum Gallon Quantity 5000 Gallons 5500 Gallons No Bid
Rosenberg $2.74 $2.64
Crabb $2.74 $2.64
Fresno $2.74 $2.64
Needville $2.74 $2.64
Richmond $2.74 $2.64
Plant $2.60 $2.50
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
each add'l mile
Restocking Fee 1/2 freight if delivery is
returned
Demurrage Charge $80.00/hr after 2 free $70.00/hr after 2 free
hours hours
Plant Location 100 Asphalt Lane, 300 Christy PL, South
Shepherd, TX 77371 Houston, TX

P2 Road Stabilizer (price per gallon) or equal to:

Delivery Points, Fees, and

Cleveland Asphalt

Martin Product Sales,

P Squared Emulsion

Minimum Quantity Products Inc. LLC Plants, LLC
Shepherd, TX dba Elm Mott, TX
Martin Asphalt Co.
Houston, TX
Minimum Gallon Quantity No Bid No Bid 5000 Gallons
Rosenberg $2.96
Crabb $2.96
Fresno $2.96
Needville $2.96
Richmond $2.96
Plant $2.68
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
each add'l mile

Restocking Fee $1.30
Demurrage Charge $80.00/hr after 2 free

hours

Plant Location

516 South McLennan
Loop, EIm Mott, TX 76640




Chip Seal Emulsion ""CWE-2" (price per gallon)

Delivery Points, Fees, and

Cleveland Asphalt

Martin Product Sales,

P Squared Emulsion

Minimum Quantity Products Inc. LLC Plants, LLC
Shepherd, TX dba Elm Mott, TX
Martin Asphalt Co.
Houston, TX
Minimum Gallon Quantity No Bid No Bid 5000 Gallons
Rosenberg $3.29
Crabb $3.29
Fresno $3.29
Needville $3.29
Richmond $3.29
Plant $3.01
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
each add'l mile

Restocking Fee $1.30
Laydown Charge
Demurrage Charge $80.00/hr after 2 free

hours
Plant Location 516 South McLennan

Loop, EIm Mott, TX 76640
ROC-P2 Road Over Coat
Delivery Points, Fees, and Cleveland Asphalt Martin Product Sales, P Squared Emulsion
Minimum Quantity Products Inc. LLC Plants, LLC
Shepherd, TX dba Elm Mott, TX
Martin Asphalt Co.
Houston, TX
Minimum Gallon Quantity No Bid No Bid 5000 Gallons
Rosenberg $3.10
Crabhb $3.10
Fresno $3.10
Needville $3.10
Richmond $3.10
Plant $3.01
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
each add'l mile

Restocking Fee $1.30
Demurrage Charge $80.00/hr after 2 free

hours

Plant Location

516 South McLennan
Loop, EIm Mott, TX 76640




	Detail Pricing

