Tabulation
Bid 22-081
Purchase of Vehicles

Low bidder per vehicle as highlighted

Description Caldwell Helfman Ford | Lake Country Rockdale Silsbee Ford Inc.
Country Inc Chevrolet Country Ford
Chevrolet
Vehicle 1: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe without console $39,775.00 No Bid $37,574.75 No Bid No Bid
Vehicle 2: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe with console $40,780.00 No Bid $38,211.25 No Bid No Bid
Vehicle 3: Non-Police Package 4-door sedan $19,870.00 No Bid $24,127.25 No Bid No Bid
Vehicle 4: Truck, 1/2 ton, extended cab, SWB, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, rubber flooring no carpet, $35,760.00 No Bid $29,223.20 No Bid No Bid
power windows/locks, TTP, non aluminum bed floor
Vehicle 5: Truck, 1/2 ton, extended cab, SWB, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, power windows/locks, TTP, non $35,760.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
aluminum bed floor
Vehicle 6: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB, cloth, rear cloth, power windows/locks/mirrors, TTP, non $37,770.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
aluminum bed floor
Vehicle 7: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, power $37,915.00 No Bid $34,380.10 No Bid No Bid
windows/locks/mirrors, front tow hooks, limited slip rear axle, TTP, non aluminum bed floor
Vehicle 8: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB with hard cover, cloth, rear cloth, power $39,675.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
windows/locks/mirrors, TTP, lockable hard cover, non aluminum bed floor
Vehicle 9: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB with hard cover, cloth split bench, rear cloth, power $39,925.00 No Bid $35,854.35 No Bid No Bid
windows/locks, TTP, tow hooks, limited slip rear axle, lockable hard cover, non aluminum bed
Vehicle 10: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB, 4-wheel drive, vinyl, rear vinyl, power windows/locks, $39,770.00 No Bid $36,018.60 No Bid No Bid
TTP, non aluminum bed floor
Vehicle 11: Truck, 1/2 ton, crew cab, LWB, 4-wheel drive, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, power $48,792.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
windows/locks, front tow hooks, TTP, limited slip rear axle, 7.89" min ground clearance, non aluminum bed
floor
Vehicle 12: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, LWB with hard cover, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, power $44,775.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
windows/locks/mirrors, TTP, non aluminum bed floor, lockable hard cover
Vehicle 13: Truck, 1/2 ton, regular cab, LWB, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, power windows/locks, TTP, non $33,970.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
aluminum bed floor
Vehicle 14: Truck, 3/4 ton, regular cab, LWB, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, power windows/locks, trailer $37,550.00 No Bid $37,211.50 No Bid No Bid
towing mirrors, front tow hooks, front ground clearance min 9.6 inch, locking rear differential, integrated
trailer brake system, limited slip rear axle, TTP, non aluminum bed floor
Vehicle 15: Truck, 3/4 ton, extended cab, LWB, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, front ground clearance 10.12 $38,450.00 No Bid $36,695.50 No Bid No Bid
inch, power windows/locks, trailer towing mirrors, locking rear differential, front tow hooks, integrated
trailer brake system, limited slip rear axle, TTP, non aluminum bed floor
Vehicle 16: Truck, 3/4 ton, regular cab, LWB, 4-wheel drive, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, front ground $39,775.00 No Bid $38,832.25 No Bid No Bid

clearance 10.12 inch, power windows/locks, locking rear differential, front tow hooks, TTP, limited slip rear
axle, non aluminum bed floor




Description Caldwell Helfman Ford | Lake Country Rockdale Silsbee Ford Inc.
Country Inc Chevrolet Country Ford
Chevrolet
Vehicle 17: Truck, 3/4 ton, extended cab, LWB, 4 wheel drive, cloth bucket, no full console, rear cloth, $40,935.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
power windows/locks/towing mirrors, TTP, limited slip rear axle, integrated brake system & controller, non
aluminum bed floor
Vehicle 18: Truck, 3/4 ton, extended cab, LWB, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, power windows/locks, trailer $38,940.00 No Bid $36,695.50 No Bid No Bid
towing mirrors, Integrated trailer brake system, locking rear differential, tow hooks, TTP, non aluminum bed
floor
Vehicle 19: Truck, 3/4 ton, 4 door crew cab, LWB, cloth, rear cloth, power windows/locks, trailer towing $40,840.00 No Bid $38,989.50 No Bid No Bid
mirrors, front tow hooks, integrated trailer brake system, TTP, non aluminum bed floor
Vehicle 20: Truck, 1 ton, 3500, regular cab, dually, 4 wheel drive, diesel engine, cab/chassis only, vinyl split $50,470.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
bench, power windows/locks, trailer towing mirrors, limited slip rear axel, front tow hooks, integrated trailer
brake system
Vehicle 21: Truck, 1 ton, 3500, 4 door crew cab, LWB, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, rubber mats, power $41,675.00 No Bid $41,578.80 No Bid No bid
windows/locks, trailer towing mirrors, TTP, non aluminum bed floor
Vehicle 22: Truck, 1 1/2 ton, 4500, regular cab, dually, cab/chassis only, vinyl split bench, powered $51,770.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid
windows/locks, limited slip rear axle, front tow hooks, integrated trailer break system , wheelbase 137.5"
minimum
Vehicle 23: Truck, 1 1/2 ton, 5500, 4x4, regular cab, diesel, 60" cab to axle, dually, cab & chassis, vinyl $55,775.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid
split bench, power windows/locks, trailer towing mirrors, front tow hooks, limited slip rear axle, TTP
Vehicle 24: Ford Explorer or equal, cloth seats, power windows/door locks, rear air conditioning, TTP No Bid $35,957.00 No Bid $31,775.00 $35,048.00
Vehicle 25: Ford Explorer Police Inceptor utility, all wheel drive, heavy duty alternator, cloth, power driver's No Bid No Bid No Bid $36,450.00 $39,298.75
seat/windows/door locks/mirrors
Vehicle 26: Van, Cargo, 3/4 ton, extended length, V-8, vinyl seating, vinyl flooring, power windows/locks, $34,880.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
rear A/C, no back seat, side and rear windows, step bumper, TTP
Vehicle 27: Van, Cargo, 3/4 ton, extended length, bucket cloth, passenger cloth bench backseat with 3 $37,520.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
person restraints, vinyl flooring, power windows/locks, rear A/C, side/rear door windows, step bumper, TTP
Vehicle 28: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB, cloth bucket, cloth bucket, rear vinyl, power No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
windows/locks/mirrors, TTP, aluminum bed floor
Vehicle 29: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB, hard cover, cloth bucket, rear vinyl, power No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
windows/locks/mirrors, TTP, lockable hard cover, aluminum bed floor
Vehicle 30: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB with hard cover, cloth split bench, rear vinyl, power No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
windows/locks, TTP, tow hooks, limited slip rear axle, lockable hard cover, aluminum bed floor
Vehicle 31: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB, cloth split bench, rear vinyl, power windows/locks, TTP, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
tow hooks, limited slip rear axle, aluminum bed floor
Vehicle 32: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB, 4-wheel drive, cloth split bench, rear vinyl, power No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
windows/locks, TTP, aluminum bed floor
Vehicle 33: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, LWB with hard cover, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, power No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
windows/locks/mirrors, TTP, lockable hard cover, aluminum bed floor
Vehicle 34: Truck, 3/4 ton, regular cab, LWB, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, power windows/locks, trailer No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

towing mirrors, TTP, front tow hooks, locking rear differential, integrated trailer brake system, limited slip
rear axle, aluminum bed floor




Description Caldwell Helfman Ford | Lake Country Rockdale Silsbee Ford Inc.
Country Inc Chevrolet Country Ford
Chevrolet
Vehicle 35: Truck, 3/4 ton, extended cab, LWB, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, power windows/locks, TTP, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
trailer towing mirrors, front tow hooks, limited slip, locking rear differential, integrated trailer break system,
aluminum bed floor
Vehicle 36: Truck, 3/4 ton, regular cab, LWB, 4-wheel drive, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, power No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
windows/locks, locking rear differential, TTP, front tow hooks, limited slip rear axle, aluminum bed floor
Vehicle 37: Truck, 3/4 ton, 4 door crew cab, LWB, cloth, rear vinyl, power windows/locks, trailer towing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
mirrors, front tow hooks, integrated trailer break system, TTP, aluminum bed floor
Vehicle 38: Van, Cargo, 3/4 ton, extended length, V-8, vinyl seating, vinyl flooring, power windows/locks, $34,880.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
rear A/C, no back seat, side and rear windows, step bumper, TTP
Vehicle 39: Ambulance cab and chassis, regular cab, diesel engine, vinyl split bench, vinyl flooring, power No Bid $60,577.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
windows/locks. rear sliding window
Vehicle 40: Truck, 1 ton, 3500, regular cab, dually, cab/chassis only, vinyl split bench, power $38,770.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
window/locks, trailer towing mirrows, limited slip rear axle, front tow hooks, integraged trailer brake system
Vehicle 41: Truck, F-650, regular cab, dually, cab/chassis only, diesel, vinyl seating, driver bucket/2- No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
passenger bench, pwer equipment group, air complressor, power window/locks, front tow hooks
Vehicle 42: Truck, 3/4 ton, 4 door crew cab, 4X4, LWB, cloth, rear cloth, power window/locks, trailer $44,660.00 No Bid $41,459.50 No Bid No Bid
towing mirrors, front tow hooks, integrated trailer brake system, TTP, non-aluminum bed floor
Vehicle 43: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB, 4 wheel drive, lockable hardcover, cloth, rear cloth, $44,630.00 No Bid $37,393.60 No Bid No Bid
power windows/locks/mirrors, front tow hooks, TTP, non-aluminum bed floor
Vehicle 44: Truck, 3/4 ton, extended cab, SWB, cloth split bench, power windows/locks, locking rear $38,890.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
differential, integrated trailer brake system, TTP, non-aluminum bed floor
Vehicle 45: Truck, 3/4 ton, 4 door crew cab, LWB, vinyl, rear vinyl, limited slip rear axle, power $40,840.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
windows/locks, trailer towing mirrors, front tow hooks, locking rear differential, integrated trailer brake
system, TTP, non-aluminum bed floor
Vehicle 46: Van, Cargo, 3/4 ton, front bucket vinyl, vinyl flooring front and rear (cargo area), power $33,220.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
windows/locks, rear A/C, step bumper, TTP
Vehicle 47: Van, 15 Passenger, 1 ton, extended length, front bucket cloth, vinyl rear seats, keyless entry, $39,445.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $54,042.60
power windows/locks, rear A/C, running boards, rear park assist, TTP
Vehicle 48: 1/2 Ton Suburban or Equal, front vinyl split bench, 2nd & 3rd rows vinyl, H2G, vinyl flooring, $57,775.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

no carpet, deactivate all theft deterrent, delete daytime running lights & automatic head lights, power
windows/locks, rear A/C, remote kevless entry, dual batteries K4B, tow hooks, TTP




