



310 MORTON STREET STE. 276 RICHMOND, TX. 77469

January 5, 2022

Fort Bend County Purchasing
301 Jackson Street, Suite 201
Richmond, Tx. 77469

ATTN: Ms. Cheryl Krejci

Re: 717 Construction Services, LLC request for price escalation on Bid 20-044

Dear Ms. Krejci,

Due to the increase cost from our suppliers, we ask that we be allowed to increase our prices as outlined in Section 1, paragraph 1.35 Escalation Clause, and supported by the attached letters from suppliers for 2 items on Bid 20-044.

Description	Bid Price	% Increase	New Price
Slabjacking, Drilling price per linear foot	\$25.00	25%	\$31.25
Slabjacking, Grout price per cubic foot	\$16.50	9%	\$17.99

Thank you for your consideration,

Sincerely,

Marc Alvarez, President
717 Construction Services, LLC.

Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 20-044
Term Contract for Concrete Lifting

Term: April 1, 2020 through March 31, 2021

Awarded 02/25/20: All Bidders Meeting Specifications

Renewal Term Approved 01/05/21: April 1, 2021 through March 31, 2022

Description	Lawson Number	717 Construction Services, LLC, Richmond	Aftermath Structural Repair LLC, Magnolia	Leveled Concrete, Houston	Superior Grouting Services, Inc., Houston	Uretex USA, Inc., Tomball				
							Form 1295			
		Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes				
Unit Bid Price										
Polyurethane, price per pound	14098	No Bid	\$	8.50	\$	4.85	\$	9.70	\$	4.70
Compaction Grouting, Drilling price per linear	14099	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	\$	130.00		No Bid
Compaction Grouting, Grout price per cubic foot	14100	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	\$	10.00		No Bid
Slabjacking, Drilling price per linear foot	14101	\$	25.00	No Bid		No Bid	\$	60.00		No Bid
Slabjacking, Grout price per cubic foot	14102	\$	16.50	No Bid		No Bid	\$	18.00		No Bid