
Section 10.1: CHEVRON PRODUCTS         

 $                    62.18  No Bid 
 $                    19.18  $                    28.80 
 $                    97.24  $                  141.35 
 $                  962.39  $               1,304.60 

 A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne  

 Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.   

 $                    60.80  $                    85.32 
 $                    17.43  $                    26.22 
 $                    88.14  $                  134.50 
 $                  862.20  $               1,240.25 
 $                    14.17  $                    18.73 

 A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne  

 Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.   

 $                    42.18  No Bid 
 $                    20.73  $                    28.80 
 $                    91.39  $                  141.35 
 $                  898.04  $               1,304.60 
 $                    15.35  $                    19.75 

Recommendation:  Low Bidder per Item

Fort Bend County Tabulation

Term Contract for Oil and Lubricants

BID 22-038

Term:  January 1, 2022 through June 30,2022

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          
Houston

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

Houston

SAE 10W30 CJ-4/SM Delo 400 XLE

SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 Delo 400

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons
Per Gallon in Bulk 

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle
Per Pail of 5 Gallons 
Per Drum of 55 Gallons

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle
Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons

Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle

SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 Delo 400 XLE

Per Gallon in Bulk 



Section 10.1: CHEVRON PRODUCTS (cont'd)        A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

 $                    83.07  $                  123.65 
 $                  806.52  $               1,473.45 

 A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne  

 Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.   

 $                      5.91  $                      6.89 
 $                    86.45  $                  109.20 
 $                  863.72  $               1,201.20 

 A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne  

 Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.   

 $                    93.54  $                  115.66 
 $                  872.30  $               1,062.60 

 A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne  

 Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.   

 $                    68.71  $                    94.75 
 $                  648.51  $                  865.70 
 $                    10.82  $                    12.76 

 A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne  

 Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.   

 $                    70.01  $                    94.75 
 $                  662.81  $                  865.70 

Per Drum of 55 Gallons

Per Quart in Quart Container

SAE 30 Delo 400

SAE 10 Delo 400
Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons

Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons

Hydraulic Oil ISO-46 (Denison HF-2, Vickers I-268-S)

Per Pail of 5 Gallons

Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons

SAE 50 Heavy Duty Drive Train (Meets Cat’s TO-4 Specifications)

Per Pail of 5 Gallons

Per Drum of 55 Gallons
Per Gallon in Bulk 

Hydraulic Oil AW 68 (Denison HF-2, Vickers I-286-S)



Section 10.1: CHEVRON PRODUCTS (cont'd)        A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

 $                    84.05  $                  112.50 
 $                  817.26  $               1,032.90 
 $                    13.88  $                    15.43 

Grease Ultra-Duty EP2  A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne  

 Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.   

 $                    36.74  $                  247.75 
 $                  139.69  $                  328.65 
 $                  455.56  $                  834.00 

 A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne  

 Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.   

 $                    57.28  No Bid 
 $                    87.38  $                  180.60 

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

 $                    87.38  $                  180.60 Per 35# Container

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

Gear Oil, Universal 85-140 GL-5

Per 35# Container

Gear Oil 85-140 GL-5

TDH Hydraulic/Tractor Fluid (Case MS-1207, John Deere J20C)
Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons
Per Gallon in Bulk 

Per Case of 10, 14oz Tubes

Per 120# Container
Per 35# Container



Section 10.2: CONOCO/PHILLIPS      

 $                    63.98 No Bid 

 A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne  

 Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.   

 $                    63.98 No Bid 

 A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne  

 Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.   

 $                    63.98 No Bid 

 A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne  

 Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.   

No Bid No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 

 $               1,251.25 No Bid 
 $                    30.31 No Bid 

 A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne  

 Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.   

 $                    83.89 No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 

 $                  136.82 No Bid 
 $                  946.72 No Bid 
 $                    25.06 No Bid 

 A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne  

 Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.   

 $                  127.06 No Bid 
 $               1,369.50 No Bid 

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

Per Pail of 5 Gallons

SAE 10W 76 T5X 10

Per Drum of 55 Gallons

Per Gallon in Bulk 

Per Case of 12 Quart Containers
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Pail

Per Gallon in Bulk 

Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons

SAE 5W-20 SM, GF-4  76 Super Synthetic Blend Motor Oil

SAE 10W-30 Guardol FE

Per Case of 12 Quart Containers
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Pail

SAE 5W-30 SM, GF-4 76 Super Synthetic Blend Motor Oil

Per Case of 12 Quart Containers

SAE 10W-30 SM, GF-4 76 Super Synthetic Blend Motor Oil

SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 SM Guardol ECT Synthetic Blend

Per Case of 12 Quart Containers

Per Drum of 55 Gallons

Per Case of 12 Quart Containers

Per Pail of 5 Gallons



Section 10.2: CONOCO/PHILLIPS (cont'd)      A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

No Bid No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 

 A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne  

 Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.   

 $                    95.00 No Bid 
 $               1,214.42 No Bid 

 A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne  

 Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.   

No Bid No Bid 

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

No Bid No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

 $                    71.71 No Bid 
 $                  695.74 No Bid 

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

 $                    75.01 No Bid 
 $                  718.87 No Bid 

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

 $                    90.63 No Bid 
 $                  929.75 No Bid 
 $                    15.56 No Bid 

Per Drum of 55 Gallons

Per Pail of 5 Gallons

Per Pail of 5 Gallons

Per Drum of 55 Gallons

Per Gallon in Bulk 

Hydraulic Oil ISO-46 (Denison HF-2, Vickers I-268-S)

Per Pail of 5 Gallons

Synthetic Transoil 50 GL-1/MP-1 (Eaton Roadranger PS-164 Rev 7)

Mercon V Automatic Transmission Fluid  

Per Case of 12 Quart Containers

Hydraulic Oil AW 68 (Denison HF-2, Vickers I-286-S)

TDH Oil Hydraulic/Tractor Fluid (Case MS-1207, John Deere J20C)

Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons

Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons

Per Pail of 5 Gallons

SAE 30 76 T5X 30

SAE 50 Heavy Duty Drive Train 76 HT-4 50 (Meets Cat’s TO-4 Specification)

Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons



Section 10.2: CONOCO/PHILLIPS (cont'd)      A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

 $                    75.64 No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

No Bid No Bid 
 $                  136.71 No Bid 
 $                  509.87 No Bid 

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

No Bid No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

No Bid No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

 $                    85.20 No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

No Bid No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 

Gear Oil 75W-140 Synthetic A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba              

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

No Bid No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 

Per Case of 10, 14oz Tubes

Per 35# Container

Per 35# Container

Gear Oil 85-140 GL-5/MP-1 76MP Gear Lube

Per 35# Container
Per 120# Container

Grease NLGI GC-LB Calcium Sulfonate

Per 35# Container

ATF+4 Transmission Fluid  

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

Gear Oil 75W-90 Synthetic 

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

Per Pail of 5 Gallons

Per Pail of 5 Gallons

Per Pail of 5 Gallons

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

Dexron VI Automatic Transmission Fluid

Per 120# Container

Mercon VI Automatic Transmission Fluid  

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers



Section 10.3: ANTIFREEZE
Subsection 10.3.1
Multi-Vehicle Antifreeze, concentrated
List brand below 

Havoline Universal 100%
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle  $                    12.44 $                    18.13 
Per Drum of 55 Gallons  $                  719.29 $                  921.25 

Multi-Vehicle Antifreeze, ready-to-use
List brand below 

DuraMax All Makes 50/50
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle  $                      7.78  $                    14.23 
Per Drum of 55 Gallons  $                  484.77 $                  619.30 

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

Subsection 10.3.2



Subsection 10.4.1 Chevron Products or Equal to

SAE 10W30 CJ-4/SM Delo 400 XLE
List brand below 

Chevron Delo 400XLE 10W-30
No Bid No Bid 

 $                    19.18 No Bid 
 $                    97.24 $                    76.10 
 $                  962.39 $                  689.70 

List brand below 
AllFleet  Premuim syn blend 15W-40,CK-4

 $                    46.41 No Bid 
 $                    64.09 $                    87.60 
 $                  597.74 $                  798.05 
 $                      9.89 $                    11.69 

List brand below 
Chevron Delo 404 30/Chevron Ursa Super + 30

 $                    35.46 No Bid 
 $                    86.45 No Bid 
 $                  893.72 No Bid 

List brand below 
Chevron Delo TorqForce 50

 $                    93.54 $                    94.85 
 $                  872.30 $                  866.25 

List brand below 
AllFleet Premium AW hydraulic Oil 46

 $                    51.94 $                    70.65 
 $                  464.04 $                  638.55 
 $                      7.46 $                      9.15 

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons

SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 Delo 400

Hydraulic Oil ISO-46 (Denison HF-2, Vickers I-268-S)

Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons
Per Gallon in Bulk 

Per Case of 12 Quart Containers
Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons

SAE 50 Heavy Duty Drive Train (Meets Cat’s requiring TO-4 Fluids)

Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons

SAE 30 Delo 400

Per Case of 12 Quart Containers

Per Case of 12 Quart Containers
Per Pail of 5 Gallons

Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle

Section 10.4: GENERIC 

Per Drum of 55 Gallons
Per Gallon in Bulk 



Subsection 10.4.1 Chevron Products or Equal to (cont'd)

List brand below 
AllFleet Premium AW hydraulic Oil 68

 $                    53.04 $                    70.65 
 $                  476.19 $                  638.55 

List brand below 
 ARM Tractor Hydraulic Fluid

 $                    35.88 $                    76.60 
 $                  357.50 $                  694.10 
 $                      5.53  $                    10.54 

Grease Ultra-Duty EP2

List brand below 
Chevron Ultra-Duty EP-2 

 $                    36.74 No Bid 
 $                  139.69 No Bid 
 $                  455.52 No Bid 

List brand below 
Chevron Delo Gear EP-5 85W-140

 $                    87.38 No Bid 

List brand below 
Chevron Delo Gear EP-5 85W-140

 $                    87.38 No Bid 

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

Per Gallon in Bulk 

Per Case of 10, 14oz Tubes
Per 35# Container
Per 120# Container

Gear Oil 85-140 GL-5

Per 35# Container

Per 35# Container

Gear Oil, Universal 85-140 GL-5

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Per Drum of 55 Gallons

Hydraulic Oil AW 68 (Denison HF-2, Vickers I-286-S)

Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons

TDH Hydraulic/Tractor Fluid (Case MS-1207, John Deere J20C)

Per Pail of 5 Gallons



Subsection 10.4.2:  Conoco/Phillips or Equal to 

List brand below 
DuraMax Syn  Blend 5W-20 SN

 $                    37.36 $                    76.92 

List brand below 
DuraMax syn Blend 5W-30 SN

 $                    37.36 No Bid 

List brand below 
DuraMax syn Blend 10W-30 SN

 $                    37.05 No Bid 

List brand below 
AllFleet Syn Blend CJ-5 SN 15W-40

 $                    46.41 No Bid 
 $                      9.70 No Bid 
 $                    64.09 No Bid 
 $                  597.74 No Bid 

List brand below 
Chevron Ursa Super + 10W

 $                    83.07 No Bid 
 $                  806.52 No Bid 

List brand below 
Chevron Delo 400 30

 $                    86.45 No Bid 
 $                  863.72 No Bid 

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Pail
Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons

SAE 10W 76 T5X 10

SAE 30 76 T5X 30

Per Pail of 5 Gallons

Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons

Per Drum of 55 Gallons

SAE 10W-30 SM, GF-4 76 Super Synthetic Blend Motor Oil

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 SM Guardol ECT Synthetic Blend

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

SAE 5W-20 SM, GF-4  76 Super Synthetic Blend Motor Oil

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

SAE 5W-30 SM, GF-4 76 Super Synthetic Blend Motor Oil

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          



Subsection 10.4.2: Conoco/Phillips or Equal to (cont'd)  

List brand below 
Chevron Delo TorqForce 50

 $                    93.54 $                    94.85 
 $                  872.30 $                  866.25 

List brand below 

N/A No Bid 

List brand below 
DuraMax Global Synthetic ATF

 $                    51.01 No Bid 
 $                    62.34 No Bid 

List brand below 
AllFleet Premium AW Hyd Oil 46

 $                    51.94 No Bid 
 $                  464.04 No Bid 

List brand below 
AllFleet Premium AW Hyd Oil 68

 $                    53.04 No Bid 
 $                  476.19 No Bid 

List brand below 
ARM Tractor Hyd Fluid

 $                    35.88 No Bid 
 $                  357.50 No Bid 
 $                      5.53 No Bid 

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

Mercon V Automatic Transmission Fluid  A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Per Drum of 55 Gallons

TDH Oil Hydraulic/Tractor Fluid (Case MS-1207, John Deere J20C)

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers
Per Pail of 5 Gallons                   

SAE 50 Heavy Duty Drive Train 76 HT-4 50 (Meets Cat’s TO-4 Specification)

Per Pail of 5 Gallons
Per Drum of 55 Gallons

Synthetic Transoil 50 GL-1/MP-1 (Eaton Roadranger PS-164 Rev 7)

Per Pail of 5 Gallons

Per Pail of 5 Gallons                   
Per Drum of 55 Gallons
Per Gallon in Bulk 

Hydraulic Oil ISO-46 (Denison HF-2, Vickers I-268-S)

Per Pail of 5 Gallons                   
Per Drum of 55 Gallons

Hydraulic Oil AW 68 (Denison HF-2, Vickers I-286-S)

Per Pail of 5 Gallons                   



Subsection 10.4.2: Conoco/Phillips or Equal to (cont'd)  

List brand below 
Phillips 66 Omniguard 460 #2 Grease

 $                    75.64 No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 

List brand below 
Chevron Delo Gear EP-5 85W-140

 $                    87.38 No Bid 
No Bid No Bid 

List brand below 
DuraMax Global Synthetic ATF

 $                    51.01 No Bid 

List brand below 
DuraMax Global Synthetic ATF

 $                    51.01 No Bid 

List brand below 
DuraMax Global Synthetic ATF

 $                    51.01 No Bid 

List brand below 

No Bid No Bid 

Gear Oil 75W-140 Synthetic 

List brand below 

No Bid No Bid 

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          

Sun Coast 
Resources Inc.  

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

Gear Oil 85-140 GL-5/MP-1 76MP Gear Lube

Per 35# Container
Per 120# Container

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

Gear Oil 75W-90 Synthetic 

ATF+4 Transmission Fluid  

Per Case of 12 Quarts in Quart Containers

Dexron VI Automatic Transmission Fluid

Grease NLGI GC-LB Calcium Sulfonate

Per Case of 10, 14oz Tubes
Per 35# Container
Per 120# Container

Mercon VI Automatic Transmission Fluid  

A.J.Hurt,Jr.,Inc. 
dba               

Reladyne          


