
August    26, 2021Invoice Date:
100056299Project #:
1956217Invoice #:

Purchase Order No. 154994

Crabb River Road/FM 762 Utility Coordination and Verification Services299 x28Project Description:
Invoice Comments:

May  01, 2021 to July      31, 2021Invoicing Period:

CurrentBasic Services

171.00Rate Labor

171.00Total Invoice

USD 171.00Total Due this Invoice

225,491.17Contract Amount:
212,327.61Previous Billed:
212,498.61Billed to Date

12,992.56Contract Balance:

Fort Bend County 
Attn: County Auditor 
301 Jackson Street
Richmond, TX 77469

Remit to:
Atkins North America, Inc

PO Box 409357
Atlanta, GA 30384-9357

PO 154994
DMS
REC 593239

AGENDA



Project Number 100056299
Fort Bend County Invoice Number 1956217
Crabb Rvr Rd Utility Coord299 Date August    26, 2021

Current

Name Category Hours Bill Rate Total

TASK: A.01.L-Labor
      Moss, Michael C Sr. Utility Coordinator 1.00 114.00 114.00
      Schrader, Daniel J Sr. Utility Coordinator 0.50 114.00 57.00
TASK TOTAL 1.50 171.00

TOTAL 1.50 171.00



Project Number 100056299
Fort Bend County Invoice Number 1956217
Crabb Rvr Rd Utility Coord299 Date 26-AUG-21

Task-Employee Date Regular OT Total
TASK: A.01.L-Labor 
   Moss, Michael C

28-JUN-21 0.50 0.00 0.50
30-JUL-21 0.50 0.00 0.50

SUBTOTAL Moss, Michael C 1.00 0.00 1.00
   Schrader, Daniel J

16-JUL-21 0.50 0.00 0.50
SUBTOTAL Schrader, Daniel J 0.50 0.00 0.50
SUBTOTAL TASK 1.50 0.00 1.50
TOTAL 1.50 0.00 1.50



1

Svatek, Donna

From: Compton, Jarrod L <Jarrod.Compton@atkinsglobal.com>
Sent: Tuesday, August 31, 2021 5:07 PM
To: Svatek, Donna; Stluka, Craig A; ENGInvoices
Cc: Schrader, Daniel; Peterson, Jillian; Moss, Michael C
Subject: RE: Crabb River Road Invoice 33

Donna, 
 
We do not anticipate that this will be our final invoice.  We are still working with TxDOT to finalize the reimbursement to 
the county. 
 

Jarrod Compton SIT  
Technical Manager, Right-of-Way and Utility Management  
North America  
Engineering, Design and Project Management  

 2815294264     
 

  8175833877     
 

 
 

 

 
200 Westlake Park Blvd, Suite 1100, Houston, Texas 77079  

 

Company 
       

 

From: Svatek, Donna <Donna.Svatek@fortbendcountytx.gov>  
Sent: Monday, August 30, 2021 7:06 AM 
To: Stluka, Craig A <Craig.Stluka@atkinsglobal.com>; ENGInvoices <ENGInvoices@fortbendcountytx.gov> 
Cc: Compton, Jarrod L <Jarrod.Compton@atkinsglobal.com>; Schrader, Daniel <Daniel.Schrader@atkinsglobal.com>; 
Peterson, Jillian <Jillian.Peterson@fortbendcountytx.gov> 
Subject: RE: Crabb River Road Invoice 33 
 
Craig, 
 
Following up to see if this will be the final invoice for the Crabb River Road project.  Please advise. 
 
 
Thank you 
Donna Svatek 
Fort Bend County Engineering 




