
Item #1:  DLZ-MSO Surfactant Plus Drift,                   
No Subs                                                                                   
price per gallon                                                                                                                           

 Helena Agri 
Enterprises 

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply

2.5 gallon container  $                    22.50  No Bid 
minimum order  25 gallons 
returnable  No 

Item #2:  Hardball, 2,4-D Acid,                                      
No Subs                                                                      
price per gallon                                                                                                                           

 Helena Agri 
Enterprises 

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply

2.5 gallon container  $                    35.00  No Bid 
minimum order  25 gallons 
returnable  No 
30 gallon container  $                    35.00  No Bid 
minimum order  30 gallons 
returnable  No 

Item #3:  Droplex Xtra,                                                   
No Subs                                                                                         
price per gallon                                                                                                                           

 Helena Agri 
Enterprises 

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply

2.5 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order
returnable

Item #4:  Vastlan,                                                                                       
price per gallon                                                                                                                           

 Helena Agri 
Enterprises 

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply

2.5 gallon container  $                    89.60  No Bid 
30 gallon container  $                    89.60  No Bid 
minimum order  30 gallons 
returnable  No 

Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 21-073

Term Contract for Purchase of Herbicides

Term:  for the period through March 31, 2022

Recommendation:  Low Bidder per Item 



Item #5:  Trycera Selective Herbicide,                                    
No Subs                                                                                       
price per gallon                                                                                                                           

 Helena Agri 
Enterprises 

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply

2.5 gallon container  $                    85.00  No Bid 
minimum order  25 gallons 
returnable  No 
265 gallon container  $                    76.00  No Bid 
minimum order  265 gallons 
returnable  Yes 

Item #6:  EcoMIGHT,                                                       
No Subs                                                                        
price per gallon                                                            

 Helena Agri 
Enterprises 

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply

1 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order
2.5 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order
55 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order
Brand Bid

Item #7:  DLZ-MSO Surfactant Plus Drift,                    
or equal to                                                                            
price per gallon                                                                                                                           

 Helena Agri 
Enterprises 

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply

2.5 gallon container  $                    22.50  No Bid 
minimum order  25 gallons N/A
returnable  No No

Item #8:  Hardball, 2,4-D Acid,                                         
or equal to                                                                 
price per gallon                                                                                                                           

 Helena Agri 
Enterprises 

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply

2.5 gallon container  $                    35.00  $                    68.60 
minimum order  25 gallons (1) Lesco Three 

Way
returnable  No No
30 gallon container  $                    35.00  $                  784.13 
minimum order  30 gallons (1)Lesco Three Way

returnable  No No



Item #9:  Droplex Xtra,                                                     
or equal to                                                                                         
price per gallon                                                                                                                           

 Helena Agri 
Enterprises 

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply

2.5 gallon container  $                    20.00  No Bid 
minimum order  25 gallons 
returnable  No 

Item #10:  Vastlan,                                                             
or equal to                                                                                      
price per gallon                                                                                                                           

 Helena Agri 
Enterprises 

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply

2.5 gallon container  $                    89.60  $                  186.81 
30 gallon container  $                    89.60  $               2,203.84 
minimum order  30 gallons 1.00 
returnable  No Lesco Triclopyr

Item #11:  Trycera Selective Herbicide,                             
or equal to                                                                                      
price per gallon                                                                                                                           

 Helena Agri 
Enterprises 

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply

2.5 gallon container  $                    85.00  No Bid 
minimum order  25 gallons 
returnable  No 
265 gallon container  $                    76.00  No Bid 
minimum order  265 gallons 
returnable  Yes 

Item #12:  EcoMIGHT,                                                         
or equal to                                                                        
price per gallon                                                            

 Helena Agri 
Enterprises 

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply

1 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order
2.5 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order
55 gallon container  No Bid  No Bid 
minimum order
Brand Bid
Winfield Solutions dba Winfield United - Vendor withdrew bid response.
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