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Svatek, Donna

From: Bob Baker <bob.baker@aigtechnical.com>
Sent: Monday, May 03, 2021 12:01 PM
To: Eglinton, Sean
Cc: Crawford, Wesley; Svatek, Donna; Harris, Britten; ENGInvoices
Subject: FW: Ft Bend March Revised
Attachments: Ft Bend March Revised.pdf

Sean, 
The attached invoice from Middleton Brown has been reviewed and is recommended for payment.  Thanks, Bob 
 
Robert E. Baker 
Sr. Construction Manager 

 
M: (281) 682‐7116 |O: (832) 243‐1475 
bob.baker@aigtechnical.com 

 
 
 

From: dcallaway@middletonbrown.net <dcallaway@middletonbrown.net>  
Sent: Tuesday, April 20, 2021 11:37 AM 
To: Bob Baker <bob.baker@aigtechnical.com> 
Subject: RE: Ft Bend March Revised 
 
Bob –  
It’s an oversight on our part, Jim’s rate should have been at $32.00 per hour.  We will correct with Jim.  Please see the 
revised invoice. 
Thanks for your assistance. 
DMC 
 

From: Bob Baker <bob.baker@aigtechnical.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, April 20, 2021 10:50 AM 
To: dcallaway@middletonbrown.net 
Subject: RE: Ft Bend March Revised 
 
Donna, 
The maximum raw rate in the contract is $32.00 per hour.  Your invoice should be the actual rate ($31.00) times the 2.45 
multiplier plus expenses. 
Thanks, Bob   
 

From: dcallaway@middletonbrown.net <dcallaway@middletonbrown.net>  
Sent: Tuesday, April 20, 2021 10:44 AM 
To: Bob Baker <bob.baker@aigtechnical.com> 
Subject: RE: Ft Bend March Revised 
 
Bob –  
 




