EXTENSION OF SERVICES PER BID 20-091
COVID-19 STAFFING SERVICES FOR FORT BEND HEATH AND HUMAN SERVICES

AUDITOR’S CERTIFICATE

| hereby certify that funds are available in the amount of $ to
accomplish and pay the obligation of Fort Bend County under this contract for services provided
for month of January.

Robert Ed Sturdivant

Date

i:\agreements\2020 agreements\auditor\biditem extension til cares.docx



Fort Bend County Tabulation

Bid 20-091

COVID-19 Staffing Services

Awarded 07/07/20: all bidders meeting specs
(Funding: COVID-19 Grants)

Staffing Hours Description Angel BizTek Donald L. The Fed Guardian Harris- Lane- Octagon | Pro-Touch [ROI Insight|  Staf- Staffing Texas Training | Tryfacta, Inc.
Staffing, | People Inc, Mooney Reserves | Staffing | Healthcare Jones Staffing | Consulting, | Nurse, Inc. {Group LLC,| factory | Solutions | Manage- and Pleasanton,
San Portland, Enterprises Network, LLC, Providers, Staffing Inc., LLC, dba Arch LLC, Inc., ment Leadership CA
Antonio, OR LLC Inc. LaPlace, Inc., & Houston, | Galveston, | Protouch | Staffing Los Houston, | Division, | Consulting
TX dba dba LA Brentwood, | Recruiting TX TX Staffing, | Consulting [ Angeles, TX Inc., LLC,
Nurses Etc | ExecuTeam TN Katy, Frisco, & CA TMD Houston,
Staffing, Staffing, X X Houston, Staffing, TX
San Antonio, [ Houston, X Houston,
X X X
Form 1295
Item Staffing Positions Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
12.1 |Data Entry Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price |Bid Price| Bid Price Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price [ Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price
per each per each per each per each | per each per each per each | pereach | pereach per each per each | pereach | pereach [ pereach per each per each
Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour
Normal Buisiness| $ 3750 $ 22.00( $ 2550 $  18.90( Vendor No Bid $ 1995 $ 2023|$ 2550|$% 2500(% 2112(¢$ 1781|$ 32.00(3% 16.80|$ 1965 $ 24.60
Hours Withdrew
Monday through
Friday
8:00AM through
5:00PM
Evening Hours| $ 3750 $ 22.00| $ 25501 $  21.60 No Bid $ 1995 $ 2266 $ 2550| % 2500($ 2178 $ 19.81|$ 32.00(3% 1820| % 2358($ 2551
Monday through
Friday
6:00PM through
11:30PM
Weekend Hours| $ 3750 $ 22.00( $ 25501 $  21.60 No Bid $ 1995| % 2367 $ 2550| % 2800($ 2244($ 26.72|$% 3500($ 1820| % 2358($ 25.51
Saturday through
Sunday
8:00AM through
2:00PM
Holiday Hours| $ 56.25( $ 22.00 No Bid $ 2850 No Bid $ 2993 $ 2266 $ 2550 $3750- [ $ 4224 $ 26.72|$ 3500( 3% 3360| % 3930(%$ 2551
$42.00




Item Staffing Positions Angel BizTek Donald L. The Fed Guardian Harris- Lane- Octagon | Pro-Touch | ROI Insight|  Staf- Staffing Texas Training |[Tryfacta, Inc.
Staffing, | People Inc, Mooney Reserves | Staffing | Healthcare Jones Staffing | Consulting, | Nurse, Inc. {Group LLC,| factory | Solutions | Manage- and Pleasanton,
San Portland, Enterprises Network, LLC, Providers, Staffing Inc., LLC, dba Houston |LLC, Los Inc., ment Leadership CA
Antonio, OR LLC Inc. LaPlace, Inc., & HoustonT | Galveston, | Protouch TX Angeles, | Houston, | Division, | Consulting
TX dba dba LA Brentwood | Recruiting X TX Staffing, CA TX Inc., LLC,
Nurses Etc | ExecuTeam TN Katy, Frisco, TMD Houston,
Staffing, Staffing, TX TX Staffing, TX
San Antonio, | Houston, Houston,
X TX X
12.2 |Lead Contact Tracer Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price |Bid Price| Bid Price Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price
per each per each per each per each | per each per each per each | pereach | pereach per each per each | pereach | pereach | pereach per each per each
Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour
Normal Buisiness| $ 73.00| $ 28.00( $ 30.00( $ 51.30( Vendor No Bid $ 2128 $ 31321 $ 9375|$% 4500($ 5747 $ 3699|$% 49.00($ 1960 $ 2358| $ 35.07
Hours Withdrew
Monday through
Friday
8:00AM through
5:00PM
Evening Hours| $ 73.00( $ 28.00| $ 30.00( $ 54.00 No Bid $ 2128 % 35.08|$ 9375|$% 4500($ 5813 % 3899|% 49.00($ 2100 % 2620(¢% 36.37
Monday through
Friday
6:00PM through
11:30PM
Weekend Hours[ $  73.00] $ 28.00( $ 30.00] $ 54.00 No Bid $ 2128 $ 3664 $ 9375| % 4700($ 5879 $ 5549|$% 52.00($ 21.00|% 2620 % 36.37
Saturday through
Sunday
8:00AM through
2:00PM
Holiday Hours| $ 109.50| $ 28.00( $ 4500( $ 76.95 No Bid $ 3192 $ 3508| $ 93.75| $67.50- [ $ 11495 $ 5549|$ 52.00( $ 3920 $ 47.16| $ 36.37

$70.50




Item Staffing Positions Angel BizTek Donald L. The Fed Guardian Harris- Lane- Octagon | Pro-Touch | ROI Insight|  Staf- Staffing Texas Training |[Tryfacta, Inc.
Staffing, | People Inc, Mooney Reserves | Staffing | Healthcare Jones Staffing | Consulting, | Nurse, Inc. {Group LLC,| factory | Solutions | Manage- and Pleasanton,
San Portland, Enterprises Network, LLC, Providers, Staffing Inc., LLC, dba Houston |LLC, Los Inc., ment Leadership CA
Antonio, OR LLC Inc. LaPlace, Inc., & HoustonT | Galveston, | Protouch TX Angeles, | Houston, | Division, | Consulting
TX dba dba LA Brentwood | Recruiting X TX Staffing, CA TX Inc., LLC,
Nurses Etc | ExecuTeam TN Katy, Frisco, TMD Houston,
Staffing, Staffing, TX TX Staffing, TX
San Antonio, [ Houston, Houston,
X TX X
12.3 | RN Nurse Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price |Bid Price| Bid Price Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price
per each per each per each per each | per each per each per each | pereach | pereach per each per each | pereach | pereach [ pereach per each per each
Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour
Normal Buisiness| $  67.00| NoBid | $ 57.00( $ 54.00( Vendor | $ 65.00] NoBid | $ 3263 $ 125.00( $ 60.00] $ 46.20| $ 5069 $ 60.00| NoBid NoBid | $ 49.71
Hours Withdrew
Monday through
Friday
8:00AM through
5:00PM
Evening Hours| $ 67.00 NoBid | $ 57.001 $ 56.70 $ 65.00] NoBid | $ 3655 $ 125.00( $ 60.00] $ 46.86| $ 52.69($ 60.00| NoBid NoBid | $ 51.55
Monday through
Friday
6:00PM through
11:30PM
Weekend Hours| $ 67.00] NoBid | $ 57.00| $ 56.70 $ 66.00| NoBid | $ 3818 $ 125.00( $ 62.00] $ 4752| $ 76.04($ 65.00| NoBid NoBid | $ 51.55
Saturday through
Sunday
8:00AM through
2:00PM
Holiday Hours| $ 100.50( NoBid | $ 85,50 $  81.00 $ 9750 NoBid | $ 3655 $ 12500 $90.00- | $ 9240 $ 76.04($ 65.00] NoBid NoBid | $ 51.55

$93.00




Item Staffing Positions Angel BizTek Donald L. The Fed Guardian Harris- Lane- Octagon | Pro-Touch | ROI Insight|  Staf- Staffing Texas Training |[Tryfacta, Inc.
Staffing, | People Inc, Mooney Reserves | Staffing | Healthcare Jones Staffing | Consulting, | Nurse, Inc. {Group LLC,| factory | Solutions | Manage- and Pleasanton,
San Portland, Enterprises Network, LLC, Providers, Staffing Inc., LLC, dba Houston |LLC, Los Inc., ment Leadership CA
Antonio, OR LLC Inc. LaPlace, Inc., & HoustonT | Galveston, | Protouch TX Angeles, | Houston, | Division, | Consulting
TX dba dba LA Brentwood | Recruiting X TX Staffing, CA TX Inc., LLC,
Nurses Etc | ExecuTeam TN Katy, Frisco, TMD Houston,
Staffing, Staffing, TX TX Staffing, TX
San Antonio, [ Houston, Houston,
X TX X
12.3 |LVN Nurse Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price |Bid Price| Bid Price Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price
per each per each per each per each | per each per each per each | pereach | pereach per each per each | pereach | pereach [ pereach per each per each
Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour
Normal Buisiness| $  56.00| NoBid | $ 4200| $ 37.80| Vendor | $ 55.00| NoBid | $ 2480 $ 8500($ 4500|$ 33.00]$ 3425($% 53.00| NoBid NoBid | $ 30.02
Hours Withdrew
Monday through
Friday
8:00AM through
5:00PM
Evening Hours| $ 56.00f NoBid | $ 42.00( $ 4050 $ 55.00| NoBid | $ 2778 $ 85.00($ 45.00|$ 33.66| % 36.25($% 53.00| NoBid NoBid | $ 31.14
Monday through
Friday
6:00PM through
11:30PM
Weekend Hours[ $ 56.00| NoBid [ $ 42.00] $ 4050 $ 56.00f NoBid | $ 29.02|$ 8500 % 4700]$ 3432| % 51.38($% 58.00] NoBid NoBid | $ 31.14
Saturday through
Sunday
8:00AM through
2:00PM
Holiday Hours| $ 84.00( NoBid | $ 63.00] $ 56.70 $ 8250 NoBid | $ 27.78| $ 85.00| $6750- | $ 66.00] $ 51.38($ 58.00] NoBid NoBid | $ 31.14

$70.50




Item Staffing Positions Angel BizTek Donald L. The Fed Guardian Harris- Lane- Octagon | Pro-Touch | ROI Insight|  Staf- Staffing Texas Training |[Tryfacta, Inc.
Staffing, | People Inc, Mooney Reserves | Staffing | Healthcare Jones Staffing | Consulting, | Nurse, Inc. {Group LLC,| factory | Solutions | Manage- and Pleasanton,
San Portland, Enterprises Network, LLC, Providers, Staffing Inc., LLC, dba Houston |LLC, Los Inc., ment Leadership CA
Antonio, OR LLC Inc. LaPlace, Inc., & HoustonT | Galveston, | Protouch TX Angeles, | Houston, | Division, | Consulting
TX dba dba LA Brentwood | Recruiting X TX Staffing, CA TX Inc., LLC,
Nurses Etc | ExecuTeam TN Katy, Frisco, TMD Houston,
Staffing, Staffing, TX TX Staffing, TX
San Antonio, [ Houston, Houston,
X TX X
12.4  |Infection Control Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price |Bid Price| Bid Price Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price
Practitioner per each per each per each per each | per each per each per each | pereach | pereach per each per each | pereach | pereach [ pereach per each per each
Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour
Normal Buisiness| $ 67.00] NoBid [ $ 60.00] $ 51.30| Vendor No Bid NoBid | $ 52.20| $ 129.00( $ 61.00] $ 5895 $ 6576(% 60.00( No Bid NoBid | $ 66.01
Hours Withdrew
Monday through
Friday
8:00AM through
5:00PM
Evening Hours| $ 67.00 NoBid | $ 60.00] $ 54.00 No Bid NoBid | $ 5846 $ 129.00( $ 61.00]$ 5961 $ 67.76($ 60.00[ No Bid NoBid | $ 68.46
Monday through
Friday
6:00PM through
11:30PM
Weekend Hours| $ 67.00] NoBid | $ 60.00| $ 54.00 No Bid NoBid | $ 61.07| $ 129.00( $ 63.00] $ 6027 $ 9864($ 68.00[ NoBid NoBid | $ 68.46
Saturday through
Sunday
8:00AM through
2:00PM
Holiday Hours| $ 100.50( NoBid | $ 90.001 $ 81.00 No Bid NoBid | $ 5846 $ 129.00( $91.50- | $ 117.90| $ 98.64($ 68.00( No Bid NoBid | $ 68.46

$94.50




Item Staffing Positions Angel BizTek Donald L. The Fed Guardian Harris- Lane- Octagon | Pro-Touch | ROI Insight|  Staf- Staffing Texas Training |[Tryfacta, Inc.
Staffing, | People Inc, Mooney Reserves | Staffing | Healthcare Jones Staffing | Consulting, | Nurse, Inc. {Group LLC,| factory | Solutions | Manage- and Pleasanton,
San Portland, Enterprises Network, LLC, Providers, Staffing Inc., LLC, dba Houston |LLC, Los Inc., ment Leadership CA
Antonio, OR LLC Inc. LaPlace, Inc., & HoustonT | Galveston, | Protouch TX Angeles, | Houston, | Division, | Consulting
TX dba dba LA Brentwood | Recruiting X TX Staffing, CA TX Inc., LLC,
Nurses Etc | ExecuTeam TN Katy, Frisco, TMD Houston,
Staffing, Staffing, TX TX Staffing, TX
San Antonio, [ Houston, Houston,
X TX X
12.5 |Medical Assistant Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price |Bid Price| Bid Price Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price
per each per each per each per each | per each per each per each | pereach | pereach per each per each | pereach | pereach [ pereach per each per each
Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour
Normal Buisiness| $  37.50| NoBid | $ 27.00( $ 27.00( Vendor | $ 30.00| NoBid | $ 2284 $ 2250($ 29.00]$ 2244 % 2877($% 32.00| NoBid NoBid | $ 25.62
Hours Withdrew
Monday through
Friday
8:00AM through
5:00PM
Evening Hours| $ 37.50 NoBid | $ 27.001 $ 29.70 $ 30.00| NoBid | $ 2558 $ 2250($ 29.00]$ 2310|$%$ 30.77($ 32.00| NoBid NoBid | $ 26.56
Monday through
Friday
6:00PM through
11:30PM
Weekend Hours[ $ 3750 NoBid | $ 27.000 $ 29.70 $ 31.00| NoBid | $ 26.72| $ 2250($ 31.00]$ 2376| % 43.16($ 3500| NoBid NoBid | $ 26.56
Saturday through
Sunday
8:00AM through
2:00PM
Holiday Hours| $ 56.25( NoBid | $ 4050 $  40.50 $ 4500 NoBid | $ 2558 $ 2250 $4350- | $ 4488| $ 43.16|$ 3500 NoBid NoBid | $ 26.56

$46.50




Item Staffing Positions Angel BizTek Donald L. The Fed Guardian Harris- Lane- Octagon | Pro-Touch | ROI Insight|  Staf- Staffing Texas Training |[Tryfacta, Inc.
Staffing, | People Inc, Mooney Reserves | Staffing | Healthcare Jones Staffing | Consulting, | Nurse, Inc. {Group LLC,| factory | Solutions | Manage- and Pleasanton,
San Portland, Enterprises Network, LLC, Providers, Staffing Inc., LLC, dba Houston |LLC, Los Inc., ment Leadership CA
Antonio, OR LLC Inc. LaPlace, Inc., & HoustonT | Galveston, | Protouch TX Angeles, | Houston, | Division, | Consulting
TX dba dba LA Brentwood | Recruiting X TX Staffing, CA TX Inc., LLC,
Nurses Etc | ExecuTeam TN Katy, Frisco, TMD Houston,
Staffing, Staffing, TX TX Staffing, TX
San Antonio, [ Houston, Houston,
X TX X
12.6  |Pharmacist Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price |Bid Price| Bid Price Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price
per each per each per each per each | per each per each per each | pereach | pereach per each per each | pereach | pereach [ pereach per each per each
Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour
Normal Buisiness| $ 233.50| NoBid [ $ 85.001 $ 78.30| Vendor No Bid NoBid | $ 67.86| $ 140.00( NoBid | $ 8787 $ 87.68($ 100.00( No Bid NoBid | $ 95.72
Hours Withdrew
Monday through
Friday
8:00AM through
5:00PM
Evening Hours| $ 23350 NoBid | $ 85.001 $ 81.00 No Bid NoBid | $ 76.00| $ 140.00( NoBid | $ 8853 $ 89.68($ 100.00( No Bid NoBid | $ 99.27
Monday through
Friday
6:00PM through
11:30PM
Weekend Hours| $ 233.50| NoBid | $ 85.001 $ 81.00 No Bid NoBid | $ 79.40| $ 140.00( NoBid | $ 89.19| $131.52($ 110.00( No Bid NoBid | $ 99.27
Saturday through
Sunday
8:00AM through
2:00PM
Holiday Hours| $ 350.25( NoBid | $ 12750 $ 117.45 No Bid NoBid | $ 76.00| $ 140.00( NoBid | $ 175.74| $131.52($ 110.00( No Bid NoBid | $ 99.27




Item Staffing Positions Angel BizTek Donald L. The Fed Guardian Harris- Lane- Octagon | Pro-Touch | ROI Insight|  Staf- Staffing Texas Training |[Tryfacta, Inc.
Staffing, | People Inc, Mooney Reserves | Staffing | Healthcare Jones Staffing | Consulting, | Nurse, Inc. {Group LLC,| factory | Solutions | Manage- and Pleasanton,
San Portland, Enterprises Network, LLC, Providers, Staffing Inc., LLC, dba Houston |LLC, Los Inc., ment Leadership CA
Antonio, OR LLC Inc. LaPlace, Inc., & HoustonT | Galveston, | Protouch TX Angeles, | Houston, | Division, | Consulting
TX dba dba LA Brentwood | Recruiting X TX Staffing, CA TX Inc., LLC,
Nurses Etc | ExecuTeam TN Katy, Frisco, TMD Houston,
Staffing, Staffing, TX TX Staffing, TX
San Antonio, [ Houston, Houston,
X TX X
12.7 |Physician Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price |Bid Price| Bid Price Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price [ Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price
per each per each per each per each | per each per each per each | pereach | pereach per each per each | pereach | pereach [ pereach per each per each
Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour
Normal Buisiness| $ 310.00| NoBid | $ 147.00] $ 101.25| Vendor No Bid NoBid | $ 91.35| $ 250.00( NoBid | $ 209.88| $137.00( $ 175.00( No Bid NoBid [$  153.73
Hours Withdrew
Monday through
Friday
8:00AM through
5:00PM
Evening Hours| $ 310.00f NoBid | $ 147.00] $ 103.95 No Bid NoBid | $102.31| $ 250.00( NoBid | $ 210.54| $139.00( $ 175.00( No Bid NoBid [$  159.43
Monday through
Friday
6:00PM through
11:30PM
Weekend Hours| $ 310.00f NoBid | $ 147.00| $ 103.95 No Bid NoBid | $106.88| $ 250.00( NoBid | $ 211.20| $20550( $ 200.00( No Bid NoBid |$  159.43
Saturday through
Sunday
8:00AM through
2:00PM
Holiday Hours| $ 465.00( NoBid | $ 220.50| $ 205.04 No Bid NoBid | $102.31| $ 250.00( NoBid | $ 419.76| $20550( $ 200.00( No Bid NoBid [$  159.43




Item Staffing Positions Angel BizTek Donald L. The Fed Guardian Harris- Lane- Octagon | Pro-Touch | ROI Insight|  Staf- Staffing Texas Training |[Tryfacta, Inc.
Staffing, | People Inc, Mooney Reserves | Staffing | Healthcare Jones Staffing | Consulting, | Nurse, Inc. {Group LLC,| factory | Solutions | Manage- and Pleasanton,
San Portland, Enterprises Network, LLC, Providers, Staffing Inc., LLC, dba Houston |LLC, Los Inc., ment Leadership CA
Antonio, OR LLC Inc. LaPlace, Inc., & HoustonT | Galveston, | Protouch TX Angeles, | Houston, | Division, | Consulting
TX dba dba LA Brentwood | Recruiting X TX Staffing, CA TX Inc., LLC,
Nurses Etc | ExecuTeam TN Katy, Frisco, TMD Houston,
Staffing, Staffing, TX TX Staffing, TX
San Antonio, [ Houston, Houston,
X TX X
12.8 [Call Center Agent Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price |Bid Price| Bid Price Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price [ Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price
per each per each per each per each | per each per each per each | pereach | pereach per each per each | pereach | pereach [ pereach per each per each
Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour
Normal Buisiness| $ 37.50| $ 25.00( $ 22501 $ 18.90( Vendor No Bid $ 1729 $ 1827 $ 2475|$% 2300($ 1980($ 26.03|$% 32.00($ 1960 $ 2882 ¢$ 24.37
Hours Withdrew
Monday through
Friday
8:00AM through
5:00PM
Evening Hours| $ 37501 $ 25.00( $ 22501 $  20.25 No Bid $ 1729 $ 2046 $ 2475| % 23.00($ 2046($ 28.03|$% 32.00(% 21.00| % 28.00(¢% 25.27
Monday through
Friday
6:00PM through
11:30PM
Weekend Hours| $ 37.50| $ 25.00( $ 22501 $  20.25 No Bid $ 1729 $ 2138|$ 2475|$% 2500($ 2112 $ 3905|% 35.00($ 21001 % 2882|% 25.27
Saturday through
Sunday
8:00AM through
2:00PM
Holiday Hours| $ 56.25| $ 25.00( $ 33751 $ 28.35 No Bid $ 2594 $ 2046 $ 2475 $3450- [ $ 39.40( $ 39.05|% 35.00($ 39201 $ 4716 $ 25.27

$37.50




Item Staffing Positions Angel BizTek Donald L. The Fed Guardian Harris- Lane- Octagon | Pro-Touch | ROI Insight|  Staf- Staffing Texas Training |[Tryfacta, Inc.
Staffing, | People Inc, Mooney Reserves | Staffing | Healthcare Jones Staffing | Consulting, | Nurse, Inc. {Group LLC,| factory | Solutions | Manage- and Pleasanton,
San Portland, Enterprises Network, LLC, Providers, Staffing Inc., LLC, dba Houston |LLC, Los Inc., ment Leadership CA
Antonio, OR LLC Inc. LaPlace, Inc., & HoustonT | Galveston, | Protouch TX Angeles, | Houston, | Division, | Consulting
TX dba dba LA Brentwood | Recruiting X TX Staffing, CA TX Inc., LLC,
Nurses Etc | ExecuTeam TN Katy, Frisco, TMD Houston,
Staffing, Staffing, TX TX Staffing, TX
San Antonio, [ Houston, Houston,
X TX X
12.9 |Administrative Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price |Bid Price| Bid Price Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price
Assistant per each per each per each per each | per each per each per each | pereach | pereach per each per each | pereach | pereach [ pereach per each per each
Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour
Normal Buisiness| $ 37.50| $ 25.00( $ 24001 $ 21.60| Vendor No Bid $ 2128|$ 2083 $ 3000|$% 2600(% 2640($ 4795|% 3200(% 16.80| % 26.20( $ 22.63
Hours Withdrew
Monday through
Friday
8:00AM through
5:00PM
Evening Hours| $ 37501 $ 25.00( $ 24001 $  22.95 No Bid $ 2128| $ 2339($ 3000|$% 2600($% 2706($ 49.95|$% 3200($ 1820| % 3144(¢$ 23.46
Monday through
Friday
6:00PM through
11:30PM
Weekend Hours| $ 37.50| $ 25.00( $ 24001 $ 22,95 No Bid $ 2128 $ 2443|$ 3000|$% 2800($% 2772 $ 7193|$ 35.00($ 1820 $ 3144|$ 23.46
Saturday through
Sunday
8:00AM through
2:00PM
Holiday Hours| $ 56.25| $ 25.00( $ 36.00] $ 32.40 No Bid $ 3192 $ 2339 $ 30.00| $39.00- [ $ 5280 $ 71.93|$% 3500(% 3360| % 5240(¢% 23.46

$42.00




Item Staffing Positions Angel BizTek Donald L. The Fed Guardian Harris- Lane- Octagon | Pro-Touch | ROI Insight|  Staf- Staffing Texas Training |[Tryfacta, Inc.
Staffing, | People Inc, Mooney Reserves | Staffing | Healthcare Jones Staffing | Consulting, | Nurse, Inc. {Group LLC,| factory | Solutions | Manage- and Pleasanton,
San Portland, Enterprises Network, LLC, Providers, Staffing Inc., LLC, dba Houston |LLC, Los Inc., ment Leadership CA
Antonio, OR LLC Inc. LaPlace, Inc., & HoustonT | Galveston, | Protouch TX Angeles, | Houston, | Division, | Consulting
TX dba dba LA Brentwood | Recruiting X TX Staffing, CA TX Inc., LLC,
Nurses Etc | ExecuTeam TN Katy, Frisco, TMD Houston,
Staffing, Staffing, TX TX Staffing, TX
San Antonio, [ Houston, Houston,
X TX X
12.10 [Administrative Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price |Bid Price| Bid Price Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price
Support per each per each per each per each | per each per each per each | pereach | pereach per each per each | pereach | pereach [ pereach per each per each
Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour
Normal Buisiness| $ 37.50| $ 22.00( $ 22001 $ 18.90( Vendor No Bid $ 2128|$ 2219($ 2900|$ 2300($% 2112 $ 4110|$% 3200(% 16.80| % 2358 $ 22.63
Hours Withdrew
Monday through
Friday
8:00AM through
5:00PM
Evening Hours| $ 37501 $ 2200 $ 22001 $ 20.25 No Bid $ 2128| $ 2485($ 2900|$ 2300($% 2178 $ 4310|$% 3200($ 1820| % 2882 ¢$ 23.46
Monday through
Friday
6:00PM through
11:30PM
Weekend Hours| $ 3750 $ 22.00( $ 22001 $ 20.25 No Bid $ 2128 $ 2596 $ 29.00| % 2500($ 2244| $ 6165|% 3500 $ 1820 $ 2882|$ 23.46
Saturday through
Sunday
8:00AM through
2:00PM
Holiday Hours| $ 56.25| $ 22.00( $ 33.00] $ 28.35 No Bid $ 3192 $ 2485 $ 29.00| $3450- [ $ 4224 $ 61.65|% 3500($ 3360| % 5240(¢$ 23.46

$37.50




Item Staffing Positions Angel BizTek Donald L. The Fed Guardian Harris- Lane- Octagon | Pro-Touch | ROI Insight|  Staf- Staffing Texas Training |[Tryfacta, Inc.
Staffing, | People Inc, Mooney Reserves | Staffing | Healthcare Jones Staffing | Consulting, | Nurse, Inc. {Group LLC,| factory | Solutions | Manage- and Pleasanton,
San Portland, Enterprises Network, LLC, Providers, Staffing Inc., LLC, dba Houston |LLC, Los Inc., ment Leadership CA
Antonio, OR LLC Inc. LaPlace, Inc., & HoustonT | Galveston, | Protouch TX Angeles, | Houston, | Division, | Consulting
TX dba dba LA Brentwood | Recruiting X TX Staffing, CA TX Inc., LLC,
Nurses Etc | ExecuTeam TN Katy, Frisco, TMD Houston,
Staffing, Staffing, TX TX Staffing, TX
San Antonio, [ Houston, Houston,
X TX X
12.11 |GIS Specialist Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price |Bid Price| Bid Price Bid Price [ Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price
per each per each per each per each | per each per each per each | pereach | pereach per each per each | pereach | pereach [ pereach per each per each
Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour
Normal Buisiness| $ 56.00| $ 72.00( $ 57.00] $ 33.75| Vendor No Bid NoBid | $ 28.71| $ 43.00($ 41.00]$ 5260 $ 5891(% 49.00( NoBid NoBid | $ 39.79
Hours Withdrew
Monday through
Friday
8:00AM through
5:00PM
Evening Hours| $ 56.001 $ 72.00( $ 57.001 $ 35.10 No Bid NoBid | $ 32.16| $ 43.00($ 41.00]$ 5326 $ 6091(% 49.00( NoBid NoBid | $ 41.26
Monday through
Friday
6:00PM through
11:30PM
Weekend Hours[ $ 56.00] $ 72.00( $ 57.001 $ 35.10 No Bid NoBid | $ 3359| $ 43.00($ 43.00]$ 5392 ¢ 8837(% 5200 NoBid NoBid | $ 41.26
Saturday through
Sunday
8:00AM through
2:00PM
Holiday Hours| $ 84.001 $ 72.00( $ 85,50 $ 50.63 No Bid NoBid | $ 32.16| $ 43.00( $61.50- | $ 10520 $ 8837 $ 52.00( No Bid NoBid | $ 41.26

$64.50




Item Staffing Positions Angel BizTek Donald L. The Fed Guardian Harris- Lane- Octagon | Pro-Touch | ROI Insight|  Staf- Staffing Texas Training |[Tryfacta, Inc.
Staffing, | People Inc, Mooney Reserves | Staffing | Healthcare Jones Staffing | Consulting, | Nurse, Inc. {Group LLC,| factory | Solutions | Manage- and Pleasanton,
San Portland, Enterprises Network, LLC, Providers, Staffing Inc., LLC, dba Houston |LLC, Los Inc., ment Leadership CA
Antonio, OR LLC Inc. LaPlace, Inc., & HoustonT | Galveston, | Protouch TX Angeles, | Houston, | Division, | Consulting
TX dba dba LA Brentwood | Recruiting X TX Staffing, CA TX Inc., LLC,
Nurses Etc | ExecuTeam TN Katy, Frisco, TMD Houston,
Staffing, Staffing, TX TX Staffing, TX
San Antonio, [ Houston, Houston,
X TX X
12.12 |CDL Driver Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price |Bid Price| Bid Price Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price
per each per each per each per each | per each per each per each | pereach | pereach per each per each | pereach | pereach [ pereach per each per each
Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour
Normal Buisinessy NoBid | $ 35.00( $ 27.00] $ 37.80| Vendor No Bid NoBid | $ 2219| $ 56.00($ 39.00] $ 29.00( $ 4521($ 49.00( NoBid NoBid | $ 34.77
Hours Withdrew
Monday through
Friday
8:00AM through
5:00PM
Evening Hours| NoBid [ $ 3500( $ 27.001 $ 39.15 No Bid NoBid | $ 2485| $ 56.00($% 39.00]$ 2966 $ 47.21($ 49.00 NoBid NoBid | $ 36.05
Monday through
Friday
6:00PM through
11:30PM
Weekend Hours|] NoBid | $ 3500( $ 27001 $ 39.15 No Bid NoBid | $ 2596 $ 56.00($ 4100]$ 3032|¢% 6782($ 52.00| NoBid NoBid | $ 36.05
Saturday through
Sunday
8:00AM through
2:00PM
Holiday Hours| NoBid [ $ 3500]| $ 4050 $  56.70 No Bid NoBid | $ 2485| $ 56.00( $5850- | $ 58.00( $ 67.82($% 52.00( NoBid NoBid | $ 36.05

$61.50




Item Staffing Positions Angel BizTek Donald L. The Fed Guardian Harris- Lane- Octagon | Pro-Touch | ROI Insight|  Staf- Staffing Texas Training |[Tryfacta, Inc.
Staffing, | People Inc, Mooney Reserves | Staffing | Healthcare Jones Staffing | Consulting, | Nurse, Inc. {Group LLC,| factory | Solutions | Manage- and Pleasanton,
San Portland, Enterprises Network, LLC, Providers, Staffing Inc., LLC, dba Houston |LLC, Los Inc., ment Leadership CA
Antonio, OR LLC Inc. LaPlace, Inc., & HoustonT | Galveston, | Protouch TX Angeles, | Houston, | Division, | Consulting
TX dba dba LA Brentwood | Recruiting X TX Staffing, CA TX Inc., LLC,
Nurses Etc | ExecuTeam TN Katy, Frisco, TMD Houston,
Staffing, Staffing, TX TX Staffing, TX
San Antonio, [ Houston, Houston,
X TX X
12.13 |[Driver Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price |Bid Price| Bid Price Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price
per each per each per each per each | per each per each per each | pereach | pereach per each per each | pereach | pereach [ pereach per each per each
Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour
Normal Buisinessy NoBid | $ 26.00( $ 22501 $ 27.00| Vendor No Bid NoBid | $ 20.88| $ 56.00($ 22.00|$ 2112 $ 2055(% 32.00( NoBid NoBid | $ 31.75
Hours Withdrew
Monday through
Friday
8:00AM through
5:00PM
Evening Hours| NoBid | $ 26.00| $ 22501 $  28.35 No Bid NoBid | $ 2339| $ 56.00($% 2200|$ 2178 $ 2255(% 3200 NoBid NoBid | $ 32.92
Monday through
Friday
6:00PM through
11:30PM
Weekend Hours| NoBid | $ 26.00( $ 22501 $ 2835 No Bid NoBid | $ 2443($ 56.00($ 2400|$ 2244| % 3083($ 3500| NoBid NoBid | $ 32.92
Saturday through
Sunday
8:00AM through
2:00PM
Holiday Hours| NoBid [ $ 26.00| $ 33751 $ 40.50 No Bid NoBid | $ 23.39| $ 56.00( $33.00- | $ 4224 $ 30.83($ 3500 NoBid NoBid | $ 32.92

$36.00




Item Staffing Positions Angel BizTek Donald L. The Fed Guardian Harris- Lane- Octagon | Pro-Touch | ROI Insight|  Staf- Staffing Texas Training |[Tryfacta, Inc.
Staffing, | People Inc, Mooney Reserves | Staffing | Healthcare Jones Staffing | Consulting, | Nurse, Inc. {Group LLC,| factory | Solutions | Manage- and Pleasanton,
San Portland, Enterprises Network, LLC, Providers, Staffing Inc., LLC, dba Houston |LLC, Los Inc., ment Leadership CA
Antonio, OR LLC Inc. LaPlace, Inc., & HoustonT | Galveston, | Protouch TX Angeles, | Houston, | Division, | Consulting
TX dba dba LA Brentwood | Recruiting X TX Staffing, CA TX Inc., LLC,
Nurses Etc | ExecuTeam TN Katy, Frisco, TMD Houston,
Staffing, Staffing, TX TX Staffing, TX
San Antonio, [ Houston, Houston,
X TX X
12.14 [Biostatitician Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price |Bid Price| Bid Price Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price
per each per each per each per each | per each per each per each | pereach | pereach per each per each | pereach | pereach [ pereach per each per each
Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour
Normal Buisiness| $ 78.001 $ 70.00( $ 7350 $ 47.25| Vendor No Bid NoBid | $ 4568| $ 7500 $ 55.00|$% 51.28( % 8220(% 49.00( NoBid NoBid | $ 61.35
Hours Withdrew
Monday through
Friday
8:00AM through
5:00PM
Evening Hours| $ 78.001 $ 70.00( $ 7350 $  48.60 No Bid NoBid | $ 51.16| $ 7500 $ 55.00]$ 5194 $ 8420($% 49.00( NoBid NoBid | $ 63.62
Monday through
Friday
6:00PM through
11:30PM
Weekend Hours| $ 78.00] $ 70.00( $ 73501 $  48.60 No Bid NoBid | $ 5345($ 7500 % 5700] % 5260| $123.30($ 52.00| NoBid NoBid | $ 63.62
Saturday through
Sunday
8:00AM through
2:00PM
Holiday Hours| $ 117.00( $ 70.00| $ 110.25| $ 70.88 No Bid NoBid | $ 51.16| $ 75.00( $8250- | $ 102.56| $123.30($ 52.00( No Bid NoBid | $ 63.62

$85.50




Item Staffing Positions Angel BizTek Donald L. The Fed Guardian Harris- Lane- Octagon | Pro-Touch | ROI Insight|  Staf- Staffing Texas Training |[Tryfacta, Inc.
Staffing, | People Inc, Mooney Reserves | Staffing | Healthcare Jones Staffing | Consulting, | Nurse, Inc. {Group LLC,| factory | Solutions | Manage- and Pleasanton,
San Portland, Enterprises Network, LLC, Providers, Staffing Inc., LLC, dba Houston |LLC, Los Inc., ment Leadership CA
Antonio, OR LLC Inc. LaPlace, Inc., & HoustonT | Galveston, | Protouch X Angeles, | Houston, | Division, | Consulting
TX dba dba LA Brentwood | Recruiting X TX Staffing, CA TX Inc., LLC,
Nurses Etc | ExecuTeam TN Katy, Frisco, TMD Houston,
Staffing, Staffing, TX TX Staffing, TX
San Antonio, [ Houston, Houston,
X TX X
12.15 (Licensed Clinical Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price |Bid Price| Bid Price Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price Bid Price
Social Worker per each per each per each per each | per each per each per each | pereach | pereach per each per each | pereach | pereach [ pereach per each per each
Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour
Normal Buisiness| $ 73.001 $ 40.00( $ 57.00| $ 47.25| Vendor No Bid NoBid | $ 32.63| $ 6500 % 52.00|$ 4557 $ 4932($% 60.00[ NoBid NoBid | $ 50.33
Hours Withdrew
Monday through
Friday
8:00AM through
5:00PM
Evening Hours| $ 73.001 $ 40.00( $ 57.001 $ 48.60 No Bid NoBid | $ 3655| $ 6500 % 5200]$% 4623 $ 51.32($% 60.00[ NoBid NoBid | $ 52.19
Monday through
Friday
6:00PM through
11:30PM
Weekend Hours| $ 73.00] $ 40.00( $ 57.00| $ 48.60 No Bid NoBid | $ 3818 $ 6500(% 5400] % 4689| % 7398($ 65.00| NoBid NoBid | $ 52.19
Saturday through
Sunday
8:00AM through
2:00PM
Holiday Hours| $ 109.50( $ 40.00| $ 85,50 $ 70.86 No Bid NoBid | $ 36.55| $ 65.00( $78.00- | $ 9113 $ 7398($ 6500 NoBid NoBid | $ 52.19
$81.00
22nd Century Technologies, Inc. |Disqualified:  Did not provide pricing form as required.
4 Consulting Inc. Disqualified:  Did not provide required current proof of insurance.
The Burnett Companies Disqualified:  Did not provide pricing form as required.
Consolidated, Inc. dba Burnett
Specialists
Confidential Search Solutions, Disqualified:  Did not provide pricing form as required.
LLC
Crowder HR Consulting Firm, Disqualified:  Did not provide required proof of insurance. Did not provide pricing form as required.
LLC
Diskriter, Inc. Disqualified:  Did not provide pricing form as required.
GET Corp. Paroll Accounting & |Disqualified:  Did not provide required proof of insurance. Did not provide pricing form as required.
Tax dba GET Hire Staffing
Howroyd-Wright Employment | Disqualified: ~ Altered terms and conditions.

Agency, Inc.




Huckeye Health Services LLC Disqualified:  Did not provide required proof of insurance. Did not provide pricing form as required.
Medical Edge Recruitment LLC |Disqualified:  Did not provide required current proof of insurance.

Medix Staffing Soluctions, Inc.  [Disqualified:  Did not provide required proof of insurance. Did not provide all required forms.
Midtown Personnel, Inc. Disqualified:  Did not return entire bid contract.

PHD Resources & Taxes LLC Disqualified:  Did not provide pricing form as required.

Recruiting Source International, |Disqualified:  Did not provide pricing form as required.

LLC

Staff Today Inc. Disqualified:  Did not provide pricing form as required.

Smarter HR Solutions, LLC Disqualified:  Did not provide pricing form as required.

Smith & Dean, Inc. Disqualified:  Did not provide pricing form as required.

Spring Staffing Services LLC Disqualified:  Did not provide required proof of insurance.

St. Vincent DePaul Rehabilitation| Disqualified:  Did not provide pricing form as required.

Service of Texas, Inc. dba Peak

Performers

Superlanet Inc. Disqualified:  Did not provide pricing form as required.




	Detailed

