
Description Caldwell 

Country 

Chevrolet                      

Caldwell

Classic 

Chevrolet        

Sugar Land

Helfman 

Dodge Inc.                

Houston

Helfman Ford 

Inc.                

Stafford

Parkway 

Chevrolet      

Tomball

Ron Carter 

Autoworld        

Alvin

Form 1295 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Vehicle 1: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe without console $33,975.00 $34,379.00 No Bid No Bid $33,211.00 No Bid

Vehicle 2: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe with console $34,675.00 $34,989.00 No Bid No Bid $33,866.00 No Bid

Vehicle 3: Non-Police Package 4-door sedan $17,335.00 $17,949.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 4: Truck, 1/2 ton,extended cab, SWB , vinyl split bench, rubber flooring no carpet, 

power windows/locks/mirrors, TTP, non aluminum bed

$23,975.00 $24,274.00 No Bid No Bid $22,776.00 No Bid

Vehicle 5: Truck, 1/2 ton, extended cab, SWB, vinyl split bench, power windows/locks, TTP, 

non aluminum bed

$23,975.00 $24,389.00 No Bid No Bid $22,765.00 No Bid

Vehicle 6: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB, cloth bucket, power windows/locks, TTP, 

non aluminum bed

$26,775.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $24,710.00 No Bid

Vehicle 7: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB, vinyl split bench, power windows/locks, 

TTP, non aluminum bed

$26,225.00 $26,787.00 No Bid No Bid $24,710.00 No Bid

Vehicle 8: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB with hard cover, cloth bucket, no full 

console, power windows/locks, TTP, non aluminum bed

$27,979.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $25,885.00 No Bid

Vehicle 9: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB with hard cover, cloth split bench, power 

windows/locks/mirrors, TTP, non aluminum bed

$28,640.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $25,929.00 No Bid

Vehicle 10: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB, 4-wheel drive, vinyl bucket, power 

windows/locks, TTP, non aluminum bed

$28,720.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $27,183.00 No Bid

Vehicle 11: Truck, 1/2 ton, crewr cab, LWB, 4-wheel drive, vinyl split bench, power 

windows/locks, trailer towing mirrors, TTP, limited slip rear axle, 7.8" min front ground 

clearance, non aluminum bed

$28,975.00 $29,691.00 No Bid No Bid $27,809.00 No Bid

Vehicle 12: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, LWB with hard cover, vinyl split bench, power 

windows/locks, power windows/locks, TTP, non aluminum bed

$28,775.00 $27,996.00 No Bid No Bid $26,265.00 No Bid

Tabulation

Bid 21-018

Purchase of Vehicles

Recommended:  Low bidder per vehicle as highlighted
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Vehicle 13: Truck, 1/2 ton, regular cab, LWB, vinyl split bench, power windows/locks, TTP, 

non aluminum bed

$23,978.00 $24,311.00 No Bid No Bid $21,945.00 No Bid

Vehicle 14: Truck, 3/4 ton, regular cab, LWB, vinyl split bench, power windows/locks, trailer 

towing mirrors, limited slip rear axle, TTP, non aluminum bed

$27,335.00 $27,721            
within 3% from a 

local vendor

pursuant to 

§271.905

No Bid No Bid $26,919.00 No Bid

Vehicle 15: Truck, 3/4 ton, extended cab, LWB, vinyl split bench, power windows/locks, 

trailer towing mirrors, limited slip rear axle, TP, non aluminum bed

$27,975.00 $28,519.00 No Bid No Bid $27,264.00 No Bid

Vehicle 16: Truck, 3/4 ton, regular cab, LWB, 4-wheel drive, vinyl split bench, power 

windows/locks, TTP, limited slip rear axle, non aluminum bed

$28,997.00 $29,444.00 No Bid No Bid $27,036.00 No Bid

Vehicle 17: Truck, 3/4 ton, extended cab, LWB, 4 wheel drive, cloth bucket, no full console, 

rear cloth, power windows/locks, tow mirrors, TTP, limited slip rear axle, non aluminum bed

$29,988.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $29,229.00 No Bid

Vehicle 18: Truck, 3/4 ton, extended cab, LWB, vinyl split bench, power windows/locks, 

TTP, trailer towing mirrors, non aluminum bed

$27,975.00 $28,528.00 No Bid No Bid $27,264.00 No Bid

Vehicle 19: Truck, 3/4 ton, 4 door crew cab, LWB, cloth bucket, power windows/locks, TTP, 

triler towing mirrors, non aluminum bed

$29,945.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $29,113.00 No Bid

Vehicle 20:  Truck, 1 ton, 3500, regular cab, dually, 4 wheel drive, diesel engine, cab/chassis, 

vinyl split bench, power windows/locks

$38,540.00 $30,021.00 No Bid $41,178.00 No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 21:  Truck, 1 ton, 3500, 4 door crew cab, LWB, vinyl split bench, rubber mats, power 

windows/locks, TTP, non aluminum bed                                

$30,920.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 22:  Truck, 1 1/2 ton, 4500, regular cab, dually, cab/chassis, vinyl split bench, limited 

dlip rear axle                              

$43,975.00 No Bid No Bid $34,319.00 No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 23:  Truck, 1 1/2 ton, 5500, 4x4, regular cab, 60" cab to axle, dually, cab & chassis, 

vinyl split bench, power windows/locks, trailer towing mirrows, TTP                                   

$48,575.00 No Bid No Bid $35,730.00 No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 24: Ford Explorer, cloth seats, power windows/locks, TTP $28,775.00 No Bid No Bid $26,499.00 No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 25: ford Explorer Police Inceptor utility, all wheel drive No Bid No Bid No Bid $30,595.00 No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 26: Deleted per Addendum #1

Vehicle 27: Van, Cargo, 3/4 ton, extended length, vinyl seat, vinyl flooring, side and rear door 

windows

$26,775.00 $26,694.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 28: Van, Cargo, 3/4 ton, extended length, passenger cloth bench backseat with 3-

person restraints, vinyl flooring, side and rear door windows

$28,815.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $30,747.00

Vehicle 29: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB, cloth bucket, rear vinyl, power 

windows/locks/mirrors, TTP, aluminum bed

No Bid No Bid No Bid $27,995.00 No Bid No Bid
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Vehicle 30: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB with hard cover, cloth split bench, rear 

vinyl, power windows/locks/mirrors, TTP, aluminum bed

No Bid No Bid No Bid $32,670.00 No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 31: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, SWB, 4 wheel drive,  cloth split bench, rear 

vinyl, power windows/locks, TTP, aluminum bed

No Bid No Bid No Bid $30,280.00 No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 32: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4 door crew cab, LWB with hard cover, vinyl split bench, rear 

vinyl, power windows/locks, TTP, aluminum bed

No Bid No Bid No Bid $28,150.00 No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 33: Truck, 3/4 ton, regular cab, LWB, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl, power 

windows/locks, trailer towing mirrors, TTP, tow hooks limited slip, aluminum bed

No Bid No Bid No Bid $27,950.00 No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 34: Truck, 3/4 ton, extended cab, LWB, vinyl split bench, rear vinyl,  power 

windows/locks, trailer towing mirrors, TTP, tow hooks limited slip, aluminum bed

No Bid No Bid No Bid $26,190.00 No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 35: Truck, 3/4 ton, regular cab, LWB, 4 wheel drive, vinyl split bench, power 

windows/locks, TTP, tow hooks limited slip, aluminum bed

No Bid No Bid No Bid $27,975.00 No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 36: Truck, 3/4 ton, 4 door crew cab, LWB, vinyl split bench, power windows/locks, 

trailer towing mirrors, TTP, tow hooks, aluminum bed

No Bid No Bid No Bid $28,685.00 No Bid No bid

Vehicle 37: Ambulance cab and chassis, regular cab, vinyl split bench, power windows/locks No Bid No Bid $39,895.00 No Bid No Bid $40,967.00


