Fort Bend County Tabulation

Bid 20-082

Rescue and Chemical Detection Equipment

Recommendation: low bidder per item
Funding: Homeland Security and Emergency Management SWAT and HAZMAT Grants

Item Rescue Item Description Quantity Delta Fire & Safety Falcon Project Consultants [ FarrWest Environmental Metro Fire Apparatus
Number Port Neches, TX Houston, TX Supply Specialist
Schertz, TX Houston, TX
Form 1295
Yes Yes
Unit Bid Extended Unit Bid Extended Unit Bid Extended Unit Bid Extended
Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
1. HOLMATRO-158.052.201, GCU 5050 i EVO 3 2 Disqualified: Vendor withdrew No Bid $ 10,462.00| $ 20,924.00
CUTTER, OR APPROVED EQUAL Not equal to specified item.
2. HOLMATRO-158.052.205, GSP 5240 EVO 3 2 Disqualified: $ 13,406.40( $ 26,812.80 No Bid $ 10,600.00( $ 21,200.00
SPREADER, OR APPROVED EQUAL Not equal to specified item.
3. HOLMATRO-158.052.208, GRA 4331 EVO 3 RAM, 2 Disqualified: $ 10,150.80( $ 20,301.60 No Bid $ 8,036.00($ 16,072.00
OR APPROVED EQUAL Not equal to specified item.
4. HOLMATRO-150.182.209, BCH 2 GREENLINE 6 Disqualified: $ 51360|$%$ 3,081.60 No Bid $ 405.00|$ 2,430.00
CHARGER 100-120 VAC, OR APPROVED EQUAL Not equal to specified item.
5. HOLMATRO-151.000.307, BPA 286 GREENLINE 12 Disqualified: $ 756.00($ 9,072.00 No Bid $ 600.00|$ 7,200.00
BATTERY 28V 6.0 AH, OR APPROVED EQUAL Not equal to specified item.




Item
Number

Chemical Detection Item Description

Quantity

Delta Fire & Safety
Port Neches, TX

Falcon Project Consultants
Houston, TX

FarrWest Environmental

Supply
Schertz, TX

Metro Fire Apparatus
Specialist
Houston, TX

Unit Bid
Price

Extended
Price

Unit Bid
Price

Extended
Price

Unit Bid Extended
Price Price

Unit Bid Extended
Price Price

103-032-0002, FLIR GRIFFIN G510 GC/MS;
FIELD READY KIT

INCLUDES:

- G510 GC/MS W/ INTEGRATED HEATED
SAMPLE PROBE AND LIQUID INJECTOR

- (4) 2590 BATTERIES

- (24) HELIUM CARRIER GAS CARTRIDGES

- STANDARD TOOL KIT

- GSS L1T SOFTWARE W/ NIST 2017 LIBRARY
- INJECTOR MAINTENANCE KITS

- RUGGEDIZED TRANSPORT CASE

- 2-YRS ANNUAL SERVICE CONTRACT W/
PREVENTATIVE MAINTENANCE SERVICE

- 2-YRS REACHBACK SUPPORT AND
WARRANTY

- ON-SITE GC/MS OPERATOR TRAINING CLASS
FOR EACH SHIFT, OR APPROVED EQUAL

No Bid

$163,289.94| $ 163,289.94

$122,499.95| $ 122,499.95

No Bid

FW-G510-EXKIT, FLIR G510 ANNUL
CONSUMABLES AND SAMPLING KIT,
OR APPROVED EQUAL

No Bid

$ 1559.94($ 3,119.88

$ 1,199.95|$ 2,399.90

No Bid

606-001-0010, FLIR GRIFFIN G510 PSI PROBE.
INCLUDES CASE, ACCESSORY KIT AND
GERSTAL TWISTER KIT, OR APPROVED EQUAL

No Bid

Vendor withdrew

$ 9539.95|$ 9,539.95

No Bid




	Itemized

