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Manuel 
Calvillo 

Language                   
per Hour

100.00$   120.00$   100.00$   120.00$   120.00$   120.00$   120.00$   140.00$   150.00$   160.00$   150.00$   160.00$   120.00$   140.00$   

Language per 
Hour                                
After Minimum 
Hours

100.00$   120.00$   100.00$   120.00$   120.00$   120.00$   120.00$   140.00$   150.00$   160.00$   150.00$   160.00$   120.00$   140.00$   

Sign Language                 
per Hour 
Sign Language 
per Hour After 
Minimum Hours

Interpreters 
Unlimited

Language                   
per Hour

85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     

Language per 
Hour                                
After Minimum 
Hours

85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     

Sign Language                 
per Hour 

95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     

Sign Language 
per Hour After 
Minimum Hours

95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     

Form 
1295

Community Interpreting 
Services

Regular                                                                                                        
(with 24 hours notice)

Emergency                                                                   
(with less than 24 hours notice)

Emergency Disasters                                        
(with less than 12 hour notice)

Holidays

No Bid No Bid No Bid

Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 19-071

Language and Sign Language Interpreting Services

Recommendation:  All bidders meeting specifications

Spanish/English

Yes

Yes

No Bid

Term:  through March 31, 2020
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MasterWord 
Services Inc.

Language                   
per Hour

47.96$     65.95$     65.95$     65.95$     84.79$     84.79$     84.79$     84.79$     84.79$     84.79$     84.79$     84.79$     65.95$     65.95$     

Language per 
Hour                                
After Minimum 
Hours

47.96$     65.95$     65.95$     65.95$     84.79$     84.79$     84.79$     84.79$     84.79$     84.79$     84.79$     84.79$     65.95$     65.95$     

Sign Language                 
per Hour 

79.04$     102.75$   102.75$   102.75$   118.16$   118.16$   118.16$   118.16$   118.16$   118.16$   118.16$   118.16$   102.75$   102.75$   

Sign Language 
per Hour After 
Minimum Hours

63.23$     82.20$     82.20$     82.20$     94.53$     94.53$     94.53$     94.53$     94.53$     94.53$     94.53$     94.53$     82.20$     82.20$     

SD 
Translations 
LLC

Language                   
per Hour

75.00$     75.00$     75.00$     90.00$     75.00$     75.00$     75.00$     90.00$     75.00$     75.00$     75.00$     90.00$     90.00$     90.00$     

Language per 
Hour                                
After Minimum 
Hours

75.00$     75.00$     75.00$     90.00$     75.00$     75.00$     75.00$     90.00$     75.00$     75.00$     75.00$     90.00$     90.00$     90.00$     

Sign Language                 
per Hour 
Sign Language 
per Hour After 
Minimum Hours

Form 
1295

No Bid No Bid No Bid

 (cancellation fee applied per interpreter with less than 24-hours notice will generate a 2-hour cancelation fee)

Community Interpreting 
Services

Regular                                                                                                        
(with 24 hours notice)

Emergency                                                                   
(with less than 24 hours notice)

Emergency Disasters                                        
(with less than 12 hour notice)

Holidays

Spanish/English (cont'd)

 (cancellation fee applied per interpreter with less than 24-hours notice to the requested number of hours or a defined minimum, whichever is greater)

Yes

Yes

No Bid
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Interpreters 
Unlimited

85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     

85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     85.00$     

95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     

95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     95.00$     

Ibo, Ilocano, Ilongo, Indonesian, Italian, Japanese, Kamasaja, Kanarese, Kannada, Kapangpongan, Karen, Kinyarwanda, Kirundi, Konkani, Korean, Kurdish, Laotian, 
Latvian, Macedonian, Malay, Malayalam, Malaysian, Mandarin, Marathi, Mesquito, Mestaco, Mien, Minh, Mixteco, Moldavian, Mongolian, Nagamese, Nepali, 

Other Languages

Language                   
per Hour
Language per Hour                                
After Minimum Hours
Sign Language                 
per Hour 

Regular                                                                                                        
(with 24 hours notice)

Emergency                                                                   
(with less than 24 hours notice)

Emergency Disasters                                        
(with less than 12 hour notice)

Holidays

Russian, Samoan, Sephardic Konkan, Serbian, Shanghai Chinese, Sibuano, Sicilian, Sign Language (ASL), Sindhi, Sinhalese, Slovakian, Slovenian, Somali, Spanish, 

Community Interpreting Services

Sign Language per 
Hour After Minimum 
Hours

Language List: Afrikaans, Akan, Albanian, Amharic, Apakapa, Arabic (six dialects), Armenian, Ashkarik, Assyrian, Azerbaijani,  Basque, Bengali, Bosnian, Bularian, Burmese, 

Norwegian, Nuer, Oaxaco, Oromo, Pangasinan, Papiamento, Pashto, Persian, Polish, Pompango, Portuguese (Brazilian), Portuguese (European), Punjabi, Romanian, 

Cambodian, Cantonese, Catalan, Cebuano, Chamorro, Chiu Chow, Choktaw, Chuukese, Creole Croation, Czech,. Danish, Dari, Dutch, Estonian, Farsi, Fijian, 
Fijian-Hindi, Finnish, Flemish, French, Fukien Chinese, Georgian, German, Greek, Gujarati, Haitian Creole, Hakka, Hebrew, Hindi, Hmong, Hoiping Chinese, Hungarian,

Swahili, Swedish, Tagalog, Taiwanese, Tagrinyan, Tamil, Telugu, Thai, Toisan, Tongon, Tulu, Turkish, Ukranian, Urdu, Urghur, Vietnamese, Visayan and Yemeni
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MasterWord 
Services Inc.

55.16$     75.84$     75.84$     75.84$     97.51$     97.51$     97.51$     97.51$     97.51$     97.51$     97.51$     97.51$     75.84$     75.84$     

55.16$     75.84$     75.84$     75.84$     97.51$     97.51$     97.51$     97.51$     97.51$     97.51$     97.51$     97.51$     75.84$     75.84$     

79.04$     102.75$   102.75$   102.75$   118.16$   118.16$   118.16$   118.16$   118.16$   118.16$   118.16$   118.16$   102.75$   102.75$   

63.23$     82.20$     82.20$     82.20$     94.53$     94.53$     94.53$     94.53$     94.53$     94.53$     94.53$     94.53$     82.20$     82.20$     

SD 
Translations 
LLC

75.00$     75.00$     75.00$     90.00$     75.00$     75.00$     75.00$     90.00$     75.00$     75.00$     75.00$     90.00$     90.00$     90.00$     

75.00$     75.00$     75.00$     90.00$     75.00$     75.00$     75.00$     90.00$     75.00$     75.00$     75.00$     90.00$     90.00$     90.00$     

Romanian, Russian, Samoan, Senthang, Serbian, Shanghai, Shona, Sichuanese, Sicilian, Sinhala, Siyin, Slovak, Slovene, Somali, Somali Bantu, Soninke, Sorani, Russian,
Susu, Swahili, Swedish, Sylheti, Tagalog, Taishanese, Taiwanese, Tajik, Tamil, Telugu, Teochew, Thai, Tibetan, Tigrinya, Tongan, Tosk, Turkish, Twi, Ukranian,

Language List: Acholi, Afar , Afghani, Afrikaans, Akan, Akateko, Alaskan Inupiat, Albanian, Amharic, Anuak, Arabic, Armenian, Ashanti, Assyrian, Awngi, Azeri, Bahasa, 
Bamanankan, Bashkir, Basque, Bassa, Belarusian, Bengali, Bosnian, Bravanese, Bularian, Burmese, Carolinian, Catalan, Cebuano, Chamorro, Chaldean, Chamorro, 
Chin, Chinese Cantonese, Chinese Jiangsu, Chinese Mandarin, Chinese Taiwanese, Chinese Simplified (written), Chinese Traditional (written), Chuukese, Cora, 
Cotocoli, Croation, Czech,. Danish, Dari, Dinka, Dutch, Edo, Efik, Estonian, Ewe, Farsi, Finnish, Flemish, French, French Canadian, French Creole, French European, 
Fulde, Fulfulde (Fulani), Ga, Carre, Ge`ez (Ethiopia), Georgian, German, Grebo (Liberia), Greek, Guarani, Gujarati, Hainanese, Haitian Creole, Hakka (Chinese), Harari, 

Other Languages (cont'd)

Regular                                                                                                        
(with 24 hours notice)

 (cancellation fee applied per interpreter with less than 24-hours notice to the requested number of hours or a defined minimum, whichever is greater)

Language                   
per Hour
Language per Hour                                
After Minimum Hours
Sign Language                 
per Hour 
Sign Language per 
Hour After Minimum 
Hours

Community Interpreting Services

Language                   
per Hour

Language per Hour                                
After Minimum Hours
Sign Language                 
per Hour 
Sign Language per 
Hour After Minimum 
Hours

Emergency                                                                   
(with less than 24 hours notice)

Emergency Disasters                                        
(with less than 12 hour notice)

Holidays

Hassaniya, Hausa, Hebrew, Hiligaynon (Ilonggo), Hindi, Hmong, Hokkien, Hungarian, Ibo, Icelandic, Igbo, Ilocano, Indonesian, Italian, Iu Mien, Jamaican Creole,
Japanese, Jarai, Jula, K'iche', Kabuverdia, Kannada, Karen, Karen (Pwo), Karenni (Kayah), Kazakh, Khmer, Kikongo, Kikuyu, Kinyamulenge, Kinyarwanda, Kirundi, 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Luo, Maay-Maay, Macedonian, Maithili, Malay, Malayalam, Maltese, Mam, Mandingo, Marathi, , Mien, Minh, Mixteco, Moldavian, Mongolian, Montenegrin, Moore,
Mushunguli, Nahuati, Navajo, Nepali, Norwegian, Nuer, Oromiffa, Pashto, Patois, Pidgin, Pohnpeian, Polish, Portuguese, Pulaar, Punjabi, Q'anjob'al, Rohingya,

Kituba, Kizigua, Korean, Korean Hangeul (written), Kosraean, Krahn, Krio, Kunama, Kurdish, Kyrfyz, Lao, Latin, Latvian, Lingala, Lithuanian, Loma, Lorma, Luganda, 

Language List: Arabic, Portugese, Spanish and Urdu

Urdu, Uzbek, Vietnamese, Visayan, Wolof, Xhosa, Yiddish, Yoruba, Yupik and Zulu

 (cancellation fee applied per interpreter with less than 24-hours notice will generate a 2-hour cancelation fee)
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Manuel 
Calvillo 

100.00$   120.00$   100.00$   120.00$   120.00$   120.00$   120.00$   140.00$   150.00$   160.00$   150.00$   160.00$   120.00$   140.00$   

100.00$   120.00$   100.00$   120.00$   120.00$   120.00$   120.00$   140.00$   150.00$   160.00$   150.00$   160.00$   120.00$   140.00$   

MasterWord 
Services Inc.

74.89$     102.97$   102.97$   102.97$   132.39$   132.39$   132.39$   132.39$   132.39$   132.39$   132.39$   132.39$   102.97$   102.97$   

74.89$     102.97$   102.97$   102.97$   132.39$   132.39$   132.39$   132.39$   132.39$   132.39$   132.39$   132.39$   102.97$   102.97$   

134.37$   184.76$   184.76$   184.76$   237.55$   237.55$   237.55$   237.55$   237.55$   237.55$   237.55$   237.55$   184.76$   184.76$   

97.72$     134.37$   134.37$   134.37$   172.76$   172.76$   172.76$   172.76$   172.76$   172.76$   172.76$   172.76$   134.37$   134.37$   

Regular                                                                                                        
(with 24 hours notice)

Court Interpreting Services

Spanish/English

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Language                   
per Hour
Language per Hour                                
After Minimum Hours
Sign Language                 
per Hour 
Sign Language per 
Hour After Minimum 
Hours
Language                   
per Hour
Language per Hour                                
After Minimum Hours
Sign Language                 
per Hour 

Emergency                                                                   
(with less than 24 hours notice)

Emergency Disasters                                        
(with less than 12 hour notice)

Holidays

Sign Language per 
Hour After Minimum 
Hours
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MasterWord 
Services Inc.

85.19$     117.14$   117.14$   117.14$   150.60$   150.60$   150.60$   150.60$   150.60$   150.60$   150.60$   150.60$   117.14$   117.14$   

85.19$     117.14$   117.14$   117.14$   150.60$   150.60$   150.60$   150.60$   150.60$   150.60$   150.60$   150.60$   117.14$   117.14$   

140.44$   193.16$   193.16$   193.16$   248.35$   248.35$   248.35$   248.35$   248.35$   248.35$   248.35$   248.35$   193.16$   193.16$   

112.38$   154.53$   154.53$   154.53$   198.68$   198.68$   198.68$   198.68$   198.68$   198.68$   198.68$   198.68$   154.53$   154.53$   

 (cancellation fee applied per interpreter with less than 24-hours notice to the requested number of hours or a defined minimum, whichever is greater)

Language                   
per Hour
Language per Hour                                
After Minimum Hours
Sign Language                 
per Hour 
Sign Language per 
Hour After Minimum 
Hours

Language List: Arabic, *Bosnian/Croation/Serbian, Cantonese, French, Haitan-Creole, Hmong, Ilocano, Khmer, Korean, Laotian, Mandarin, * Marshallese, Polish, Portugese, Russian, 
*Turkish, Tagalog, and Vietnamese
* = Abbreviated Examination

Emergency                                                                   
(with less than 24 hours notice)

Emergency Disasters                                        
(with less than 12 hour notice)

Holidays

Other Languages

Court Interpreting Services Regular                                                                                                        
(with 24 hours notice)
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MasterWord 
Services Inc.

53.96$     74.20$     74.20$     74.20$     95.40$     95.40$     95.40$     95.40$     95.40$     95.40$     95.40$     95.40$     74.20$     74.20$     

53.96$     74.20$     74.20$     74.20$     95.40$     95.40$     95.40$     95.40$     95.40$     95.40$     95.40$     95.40$     74.20$     74.20$     

79.04$     102.75$   102.75$   102.75$   118.16$   118.16$   118.16$   118.16$   118.16$   118.16$   118.16$   118.16$   102.75$   102.75$   

63.23$     82.20$     82.20$     82.20$     94.53$     94.53$     94.53$     94.53$     94.53$     94.53$     94.53$     94.53$     82.20$     82.20$     

Interpretek - Did not provide proof of insurance.
Nightingale Interpreting Services Inc. - Did not provide all required proof of insurance.
Translation Source LTD - Did not provide pricing form addendum.
Visual Language Professionals, LLC - Did not provide required proof of insurance.

 (cancellation fee applied per interpreter with less than 24-hours notice to the requested number of hours or a defined minimum, whichever is greater)

Language                   
per Hour
Language per Hour                                
After Minimum Hours
Sign Language                 
per Hour 

Luo, Maay-Maay, Macedonian, Maithili, Malay, Malayalam, Maltese, Mam, Mandingo, Marathi, , Mien, Minh, Mixteco, Moldavian, Mongolian, Montenegrin, Moore,

 Urdu, Uzbek, Vietnamese, Visayan, Wolof, Xhosa, Yiddish, Yoruba, Yupik and Zulu

Chin, Chinese Cantonese, Chinese Jiangsu, Chinese Mandarin, Chinese Taiwanese, Chinese Simplified (written), Chinese Traditional (written), Chuukese, Cora, 
Cotocoli, Croation, Czech,. Danish, Dari, Dinka, Dutch, Edo, Efik, Estonian, Ewe, Farsi, Finnish, Flemish, French, French Canadian, French Creole, French European, 

Hassaniya, Hausa, Hebrew, Hiligaynon (Ilonggo), Hindi, Hmong, Hokkien, Hungarian, Ibo, Icelandic, Igbo, Ilocano, Indonesian, Italian, Iu Mien, Jamaican Creole,

Kituba, Kizigua, Korean, Korean Hangeul (written), Kosraean, Krahn, Krio, Kunama, Kurdish, Kyrfyz, Lao, Latin, Latvian, Lingala, Lithuanian, Loma, Lorma, Luganda, 

Mushunguli, Nahuati, Navajo, Nepali, Norwegian, Nuer, Oromiffa, Pashto, Patois, Pidgin, Pohnpeian, Polish, Portuguese, Pulaar, Punjabi, Q'anjob'al, Rohingya,
Romanian, Russian, Samoan, Senthang, Serbian, Shanghai, Shona, Sichuanese, Sicilian, Sinhala, Siyin, Slovak, Slovene, Somali, Somali Bantu, Soninke, Sorani, Russian,
Susu, Swahili, Swedish, Sylheti, Tagalog, Taishanese, Taiwanese, Tajik, Tamil, Telugu, Teochew, Thai, Tibetan, Tigrinya, Tongan, Tosk, Turkish, Twi, Ukranian,

Bamanankan, Bashkir, Basque, Bassa, Belarusian, Bengali, Bosnian, Bravanese, Bularian, Burmese, Carolinian, Catalan, Cebuano, Chamorro, Chaldean, Chamorro, 

Fulde, Fulfulde (Fulani), Ga, Carre, Ge`ez (Ethiopia), Georgian, German, Grebo (Liberia), Greek, Guarani, Gujarati, Hainanese, Haitian Creole, Hakka (Chinese), Harari, 

Japanese, Jarai, Jula, K'iche', Kabuverdia, Kannada, Karen, Karen (Pwo), Karenni (Kayah), Kazakh, Khmer, Kikongo, Kikuyu, Kinyamulenge, Kinyarwanda, Kirundi, 

Sign Language per 
Hour After Minimum 
Hours

Language List: Acholi, Afar , Afghani, Afrikaans, Akan, Akateko, Alaskan Inupiat, Albanian, Amharic, Anuak, Arabic, Armenian, Ashanti, Assyrian, Awngi, Azeri, Bahasa, 

Healthcare/Medical Interpreting 
Services

Regular                                                                                                        
(with 24 hours notice)

Emergency                                                                   
(with less than 24 hours notice)

Emergency Disasters                                        
(with less than 12 hour notice)

Holidays

Disqualified:

Other Languages
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